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Introduction 

India's agricultural economy is intertwined 
with the livestock sector, contributing 31.6% to the 
national agricultural GDP. Livestock rearing provides 
a critical source of income for marginal farmers and 
serves as an insurance policy against crop failure. As 
demand for animal products grows—particularly 
milk, where India produces nearly 22% of the global 
supply—the livestock sector faces significant 
challenges in meeting feed and fodder needs. The 
country grapples with a deficit of 23.4% in dry fodder 
and 11.24% in green fodder, driving up production 
costs, especially for small-scale livestock farmers. 
Entrepreneurship in fodder production presents a 
vital solution to these challenges. This chapter 
explores the scope of entrepreneurial opportunities in 
fodder production, covering technological 
interventions, marketing innovations, and policy 
frameworks to support aspiring entrepreneurs in the 
sector. 

The Importance of Fodder in Livestock Farming 

Fodder production is a critical component of 
livestock farming, where feed costs can account for as 
much as 65% of the total maintenance expenses of a 
dairy farm. Grazing lands in India are limited, with 
only 15 million hectares under permanent pastures 
and 9 million hectares dedicated to cultivated fodder 
crops. The country’s feed requirement is largely met 
by crop residues, which are often of low quality. 
However, the sector is not only constrained by 
availability but also by quality, as low nutritional 
value and digestibility directly impact livestock 
productivity. The livestock population in India has 
been steadily growing, particularly among crossbred 
female cattle (43.6% increase) and female buffaloes 
(12.7% increase) over the last decade. This growth 
underlines the critical need for consistent and 
nutritious fodder supplies. Thus, developing an 
entrepreneurial ecosystem for fodder production 
could simultaneously boost livestock productivity 
and create economic opportunities in rural India. 

Scope of Entrepreneurship in the Fodder Sector 

With more than 530 million livestock in India, 
the demand for quality fodder offers multiple 

entrepreneurial opportunities. From green fodder 
production to advanced post-harvest technologies, 
entrepreneurs can tap into various niches within the 
fodder value chain. 

1. Green Fodder Production 

Green fodder is the foundation of a nutritious 
livestock diet, especially for dairy farms. The market 

for green fodder is estimated to be around INR 30,000 
crores, driven primarily by increasing demand in 

urban and peri-urban dairies. However, India still 
faces a 35% deficit in green fodder availability. High-

yielding fodder crops, including multi-cut varieties of 
sorghum, maize, and Bajra Napier hybrid, can be 
cultivated commercially, especially in peri-urban 

regions where the demand for green fodder is high. 
Entrepreneurs can explore year-round green fodder 
production models by integrating crop rotation 
systems and leveraging intercropping practices. 

Additionally, the introduction of improved varieties 
of fodder grasses and legumes can help increase 
productivity, allowing for surplus production, even in 

limited land areas. 

2. Fodder Seed Production and Marketing 

Fodder seed production offers immense scope 

for entrepreneurship, given the rising demand for 
quality seeds. The Indian market for forage seeds is 
valued at INR 2000 crore and is expected to grow at a 
compound annual growth rate (CAGR) of 9%. 

However, the supply of quality fodder seeds is largely 
unmet, with only 20-25% of demand fulfilled by 
organized channels. The rest comes from informal 

sources, where quality is often compromised. 

Entrepreneurs can enter the seed production market 
by promoting quality-assured seeds of high-yielding 
varieties developed by agricultural research 

institutions such as ICAR and SAUs. Farmer Producer 
Organizations (FPOs) can play a vital role in seed 
production, distribution, and the establishment of 

seed villages or hubs. Entrepreneurs involved in the 
fodder seed industry can also offer services such as 
seed certification, quality testing, and e-platform 
marketing to ensure farmers have access to reliable 

planting materials. 
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3. Fodder Banks and Warehousing 

Fodder banks or warehousing services offer a 
solution for maintaining feed availability during lean 

periods or natural disasters. Various processed and 
enriched fodder products, including hay, silage, and 
complete feed blocks, can be stored in these facilities 
and marketed when green fodder is scarce. 

Warehousing also allows for services such as 
fumigation, quality testing, insurance, and logistics to 
ensure the stored fodder maintains its nutritional 

value. Given the frequent occurrence of natural 
calamities such as droughts and floods, entrepreneurs 
can target vulnerable regions by establishing fodder 

banks that cater to the immediate and long-term needs 

of livestock owners. This creates a market for reliable, 
preserved fodder products, improving the resilience 
of livestock farmers during adverse conditions. 

4. Silage Production 

Silage production is a widely practiced method 

of conserving green fodder by natural fermentation 
under anaerobic conditions. Silage can be stored in 
polythene bags or pits and sold to livestock farmers, 

ensuring a steady supply of high-nutrient feed even 
during the lean season. Entrepreneurs can produce 
and market silage made from maize, sorghum, or 

other green fodder crops, particularly in urban and 

peri-urban areas where demand for preserved feed is 
growing. Incorporating innovations such as baled 
silage, commonly practiced in European countries, 

presents a new business opportunity for Indian 
entrepreneurs. Baled silage offers an economical and 
convenient method for storing large volumes of 
fodder, ensuring consistent feed availability 

throughout the year. 

5. Haymaking Enterprises 

Haymaking is another form of fodder 
preservation that involves drying green forage to 

reduce moisture content. Hay can be stored for several 

months, making it an ideal feed product for lean 
periods. Entrepreneurs can produce and market hay 
during the flush season when fodder is abundant, and 
prices are lower, then sell it at higher prices during the 

dry season. The demand for hay is particularly high in 
regions where small-scale livestock farmers do not 
have access to sufficient green fodder during the 

summer months. By establishing haymaking 
enterprises, entrepreneurs can support local dairy 

farms and contribute to the overall sustainability of 

the livestock industry. 

6. Densified Feed Blocks 

Densified feed blocks, such as Total Mixed 
Ration (TMR) blocks, are compact, easy-to-store feed 
products that provide a balanced diet for livestock. 
These blocks are made by mixing various feed 
ingredients, including crop residues, grains, and 
minerals, and compressing them into a dense, 
nutritionally rich product. The market for feed blocks 
is growing, particularly among dairy farmers who 
seek convenient feeding options that minimize labor 
and storage costs. Entrepreneurs can produce and 
market these blocks, targeting regions where feed 
availability is inconsistent, and farmers need long-
term solutions to manage feed supplies. The added 
value from enriched feed blocks can help 
entrepreneurs command premium prices while 
improving livestock productivity for farmers. 

7. Non-Conventional Fodder Production 

Non-conventional fodder options such as 
hydroponically grown fodder, Azolla, and Moringa 
leaf meal offer innovative solutions for regions where 
land availability is limited. Hydroponic units, for 
example, can produce grain sprouts year-round, 
ensuring a constant supply of green fodder in 
inaccessible areas. Azolla, a protein-rich aquatic plant, 
is another low-cost, high-nutrition fodder option that 
can be grown in small, portable units and marketed to 
livestock farmers looking for sustainable feed 
alternatives. 

8. Knowledge Sharing Platforms 

In addition to e-markets, knowledge-sharing 
platforms that provide advisory services to farmers on 
fodder cultivation, preservation, and livestock 
nutrition can enhance the productivity of the sector. 
These platforms can deliver customized 
recommendations based on local conditions and 
market trends, empowering farmers to make 
informed decisions about their fodder needs. 

9. Mechanized Fodder Cultivation 

Mechanization plays an essential role in 
enhancing the productivity and efficiency of fodder 
production. Entrepreneurs can offer custom hiring 
services for machinery such as forage harvesters, grass 
seed collectors, feed block makers, and forage balers. 
The mechanization of fodder cultivation reduces labor 
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costs, improves the quality of the final product, and 
increases profitability for both farmers and 
entrepreneurs. 

10. Technological and Digital Innovations in Fodder 
Marketing 

Digital platforms offer innovative solutions for 
bridging the gap between fodder producers and 
consumers. Entrepreneurs can develop e-platforms 
that provide real-time market information, link fodder 
growers with buyers, and ensure timely delivery of 
fodder products to remote areas. Technological and 
digital innovations could help in transforming fodder 
marketing in India, addressing challenges such as 
uneven fodder availability, lack of awareness among 
farmers, and inefficient supply chains. Mobile 
applications and online platforms can connect fodder 
producers with livestock farmers, facilitating direct 
sales and reducing intermediaries. Technologies like 
Geographic Information Systems (GIS) and drones can 
help in fodder resource mapping, enabling better 
planning and distribution. Digital marketplaces such 
as eNAM and specialized fodder apps could promote 
transparency in pricing and ensure timely delivery. 
Additionally, the integration of IoT-based tools in 
supply chain management will help in improving 
storage and transportation, reducing wastage.  

Policy Recommendations and Support for Fodder 
Entrepreneurship 

Entrepreneurship in the fodder sector requires 
robust policy support from government institutions, 
private investors, and research organizations. Several 
initiatives, including the National Livestock Mission, 
provide financial and technical support to 
entrepreneurs in the feed and fodder sector. However, 
additional measures are needed to address the 
challenges facing the sector. The Government of India, 
through the National Livestock Mission (NLM), is 
actively promoting fodder crops as a viable cash crop 
by offering financial assistance for the seed production 
of high-yielding fodder varieties, thereby encouraging 
the diversification of agricultural areas towards 
fodder cultivation. NLM's Entrepreneurship 
Development Programme also supports the 
establishment of fodder blocks, hay baling, and silage 
production units, offering a 50% subsidy of up to ₹50 
lakh. Additionally, the Department of Agriculture & 
Farmers Welfare has appointed the National Dairy 
Development Board (NDDB) as the implementing 

agency under the scheme for the Formation and 
Promotion of 10,000 Farmer Producer Organizations 
(FPOs). Of these, 100 FPOs will be fodder-centric, with 
animal husbandry as a secondary activity. These 
"Fodder Plus FPOs" will engage in activities such as 
green fodder and silage production, the creation of 
Total Mixed Ration (TMR), and the marketing of crop 
residues, providing crucial market access to small and 
marginal farmers.  

As a premier R&D institution in South Asia, 
ICAR-Indian Grassland and Fodder Research Institute 
(ICAR-IGFRI), Jhansi, has been at the forefront of 
promoting sustainable agriculture through quality 
forage production for over 60 years. It is dedicated to 
conducting basic, strategic, applied, and adaptive 
research, as well as providing training on forage 
production and its utilization to improve animal 
productivity. Recently, ICAR-IGFRI has been 
entrusted by the Indian Council of Agricultural 
Research (ICAR) under the National Agriculture 
Innovation Fund (NAIF) to support Agri-business 
Incubators (ABIs). IGFRI's Agribusiness Incubation 
Centre is committed to fostering new startups and 
enterprises by offering essential support—technical, 
physical, business, and networking—to help 
entrepreneurs test and validate innovative 
technologies before successfully establishing their 
ventures. The ABIC at IGFRI was specifically set up to 
nurture entrepreneurship in the feed and fodder 
sector, supporting individuals and enterprises in 
realizing their ambitions in this growing field. 

A comprehensive National Fodder cum 
Grassland Policy would facilitate the development of 
common property resources such as pasturelands and 
wastelands for fodder production. Government-
supported initiatives to rehabilitate these lands, in 
partnership with other organizations, would increase 
fodder availability and reduce dependence on crop 
residues. 

Conclusion 

Entrepreneurship in fodder production offers 
immense opportunities for innovation, economic 
growth, and sustainability in the livestock sector. By 
focusing on key areas such as green fodder 
production, seed marketing, post-harvest 
technologies, and mechanized cultivation, 
entrepreneurs can address the significant deficits in 
feed and fodder availability. With the right policy 
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support and technological interventions, the fodder 
sector has the potential to revolutionize livestock 
farming in India, ensuring consistent access to quality 
feed, reducing production costs, and enhancing the 
livelihoods of millions of small-scale farmers. By 
adopting innovative practices, leveraging technology, 

and building resilient supply chains, entrepreneurs 
can create profitable ventures while contributing to 
food security, environmental conservation, and rural 
livelihoods. Embracing these pathways is key to 
transforming India's fodder ecosystem into a 
sustainable and self-reliant sector. 

 
* * * * * * * * *   
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