
Privacy Policy for United Builders USA - SMS and Email Updates


Effective Date: 01/01/2024


United Builders USA is committed to protecting your privacy. This Privacy Policy explains how 
we collect, use, disclose, and safeguard your information when you opt in to receive SMS and 
email updates and promotions from us. Please read this policy carefully to understand our 
practices regarding your personal data and how we will treat it.


1. Information We Collect


When you opt in to receive SMS and email updates and promotions from United Builders USA, 
we may collect the following types of personal information:


- Contact Information: Name, email address, phone number.

- Communication Preferences: Your preferences for receiving SMS and email updates and 
promotions.


2. Use of Your Information


The information we collect when you opt in will be used for the following purposes:


- To send you SMS and email updates and promotions related to United Builders USA 
products, services, and events.

- To communicate with you, including responding to your inquiries and providing customer 
support.

- To improve our products, services, and marketing efforts.


3. Sharing Your Information


We do not sell, trade, or otherwise transfer your personal information to third parties without 
your consent, except as described below:


- Service Providers: We may share your information with third-party service providers who 
perform services on our behalf, such as email service providers or SMS delivery services.

- Legal Requirements: We may disclose your information when required by law or in response 
to lawful requests by public authorities.


4. Your Choices


You can opt in to receive SMS and email updates and promotions from United Builders USA by 
providing your consent through our website, in person, or by other means where available. You 
may also update your communication preferences or unsubscribe at any time by following the 
instructions provided in our communications or by contacting us directly.


5. Data Security


We take reasonable measures to protect your personal information from unauthorized access, 
use, alteration, or destruction. However, no method of transmission over the internet or 
electronic storage is 100% secure, so we cannot guarantee absolute security.




6. Changes to This Privacy Policy


United Builders USA may update this Privacy Policy from time to time. We will notify you of any 
changes by posting the new policy on our website with an updated effective date. We 
encourage you to review this Privacy Policy periodically to stay informed about how we are 
protecting your information.


7. Contact Us


If you have any questions or concerns about this Privacy Policy or our practices regarding your 
personal information, please contact us at:


United Builders USA  

5800 S. Eastern ave # Suite 500  

Commerce, CA, 90040

Email: info@unitedbuildersusa.co

Phone: 323-389-1250


Conclusion


By opting in to receive SMS and email updates and promotions from United Builders USA, you 
consent to the collection, use, and sharing of your personal information as described in this 
Privacy Policy. If you do not agree with any part of this policy, please do not opt in or use our 
services for SMS and email updates and promotions.
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