
Greetings and Salutations!  

My name is Ryan Thomas Hock: Owner of the Word EVIL (Purchased from the United States Patent 
and Trademark Office) and Founder of Two relevant companies intended to be S-Corporations (mostly 
for practical reasons but also because together they are the EVIL SS     (…. . . )  

Environmentally Vigilant Intelligent Logistics (EVIL)_Mostly a Materials, Energy and Support 
Industry that meets the needs not as of yet existing/available for primarily making my other company 
possible/able to without controversy/ethically achieve it's goals and purposes.  

I have previously disclosed and attempted to disclose (prevented from finishing and sending a letter to then newly-elected 

president trump that admittedly attempted to gain favor by soliciting him to use his position for financial gain which I thought was the norm as at the time was the public 

consensus) plans related to these activities in part to government entities and private individuals.  The issue 
was I knew that a quarantine zone was needed to prepare for the predicted flood of refugees then 
predicted as per Zika and the poisons used to combat Zika (not immigrants unless they consented to my deal) the short 
version is that I intended to take advantage of the imminent transition from red-pine based paper to 
hemp based paper to utilize the now uncompetitive red pine plantations of for example: Wisconsin to 
manufacture synthetic crude oil and the soil amendment: biochar.  I made several unique prototypes but
the technology is proven and known: pyrolysis.  I proposed that instead of building one wall the 
President as ambassador partner with Mexico and build two walls far enough away that the other could 
not be seen so as to not feel like a prison (I was informed of a practically impossible provision of the Mexican Constitution prohibiting foreigners 

such as myself from influencing their government {really like never possible: they make decisions based upon what we do and say} the best attempt to honor their laws and get 

my plan to them was to go through persons they accept influencing them (talk to directly) and the most applicable to this was chief ambassador. I would then 
profiteer off this by selling the biochar to southern states/region of both USA and Mexico enclosed that 
is mostly arid land unsuitable for agriculture.  The mixing of biochar with sand makes that coveted 
“black earth dirt” and one property of biochar is the slow release of fertilizer if added that doesn't 
require quantities/methods resulting in run-off etc.  I thought I could make this in the President's 
financial interests by suggesting that he contribute to the massive construction efforts required to build 
long-term habitable/(somewhere you would want to live for fuck's sake) residences and cities/infrastructure etc.   I included a
provision to make peace with the “Cartels” and include them as partners with the understanding that 
they are as if not more powerful in that region than either the USA or Mexico and possibly event the 
combination {refers to those financially supported by illicit drugs manufacturing, distribution and 
sale(requires Constitutional adherence as We The People clearly understand the Supreme Laws of the 
USA that without any shadow of a doubt in the minds of the majority the 4th amendment right to be 
secure in our persons (as clarified to beyond any shadow of a doubt by the Constitutional precedent of the 18th and 21st amendments) is violated by 
the “war on drugs/unconstitutional prohibitions of medicinal necessities (after COVID-19 this is no 
longer refutable as they the smugglers and sons and daughters of liberty de facto rallied to save the 
majority who would accept their help using proven effective even in emergencies medications such as 
bronciodialators {ex. Marijuana, cocaine, methamphetamine} and performance enhancers (mostly the same but also MDMA and LSD and Mescaline etc drugs that 

are partial antidotes for the poisoning from Antipsychotics) not allowed by the Theocracy dictating policies in violation of our laws and duty to each other_we are all coerced and 

immune under the “good Samaritan defense,” and the WI constitution's provision for immunity for those of us who testify against government corruption of any crimes absolutely 

necessary to provide said testimony as well as those we have coerced to assist us through duty to our common defense and through testifying the truth to {and I will add not in 

violation of the Constitution as plainly and strictly interpreted} as well as supported by at least one of the COVID-19 era presidential decrees and the defense production 

authorization act interpretation I cited when I distributed ephedra sinica seeds to basically random people informing them that not even the DEA could come after them if used as a

tea or a topical but I did inform them that it is the plant from which amphetamines could be most safely manufactured_I was coerced into posting the synthetic routes for 

amphetamines publicly via the order to increase supply of specifically methamphetamine given me in the strongest most coercive manner by the DHHS, as well as learning that 

the population largely thought the preffered method to use Lithium as a catalyst.  This will lead to kidney failure and other major health problems.  The proper catalyst to use is 



Nickel.  I felt overwhelming coercion to get that information out and did what I could while under numerous impairments.   I cited that I was ordered by the  DHHS through 

injections of Haldol forced upon me and the witnessing of the even worse offs that they create {for real they are the “herders and livestock sellers/butchers” that dominate the 

organ markets and they get them when people die in proximity to one of their strongholds, it is impossible to convict me of even unconstitutional infractions in doing what I did as

I strictly adhered to the limitations I could not avoid due to scrutiny as per the use of the argument that the DHHS is not only ordering us to drop our preferred goals and 

manufacture medicines needed desperately only because of their Theocratic worship of Baal {for real I have no choice but to use valid arguments, the worship of Baal is defined 

as the practices of self-mutilation} but also doing that as a means to create a “soul harvest” for the slave trades by coercing us to risk our liberty to save our fellow persons.  I feel I

have not done what I should have ethically out of terror of imprisonment and therefore inability to achieve goals even minimally, and have allowed far too many I could have 

provided antidotes for enough to escape their imprisonments called “community supervision” aka the police come and drag you to the hospital by force if you fail to appear for 

injections of things like haldol that shrink the brain reportedly as much or more than 10%_they make them into animals almost) 

Including as partners the prevailing powers of the region is non-negotiable as this plan is 
impossible without their consent and partnership.  I cited their skills in tunnel building as useful in the 
irrigation of the rio grande and that by partnering them with returning Veterans/ the army core of 
Engineers they could without giving up 2nd amendment rights (balancing act as is inherent to the 
founder's designing of government that can persist in stability) quickly transform a previously 
unproductive landscape torn by war that congress never declared; into a region that generates wealth 
guaranteed if producing the crops of their choosing and/or the medicines I can't source enough of for 
the goals of my other company.  There is only one known farm for frankincense in the United States 
that is relatively new.  I haven't directly contacted the owner/farmer but intended to offer the 
opportunity to be part of the massive plantations of frankincense I require to keep the people from 
getting cancer and I have other uses for (ex in the public domain is concoctions based upon holy 
anointing oil used to bath in).  I also find it to be effective against anxiety and moderately pain 
relieving.  The current sources are being over-harvested meaning they will be depleted soon.  The 
Muslim world is where most frankincense is grown and they are unlikely to share a resource they value
highly with us when it becomes rare.  I had originally intended to invite to settle in the region: the 
Afganistan natives and Iraq natives who showed loyalty and support for the United States as an 
addittional complicating factor making domination by any one group that could ignore the 
Constitution(s) these peoples adopt (options for government included American-Mexican duel 
citizenship with both constitutions {meaning unfavorable rulings can be appealed to the other 
government} and potentially a third they decide for themselves.  This would win hearts and minds 
more than any other thing I could imagine us doing as this means a supporter of America in those 
countries could send their families and loved ones here for protection if necessary.  We really might not
have lost the high ground of Eurasia: a military advantage not likely to be in our possession again.  I 
also condemn the use of antipsychotics in the military as Treason.  They only impair and make less 
capable those sworn to defend us and soo grossely betrayed, “go-pills” are often thanked for.  Drugs 
most applicable as date rape drugs that lobotomize/make their victims lazy and complicit are not 
something that is used on it's own soldiers by a nation intending to win a war.

  Somalia is a source that is currently producing what I've recently been able to obtain in the years since
Ch.51 impairments. I want to propose that a new addition to the plan relative to the new situation.  Part 
of the United States military strategy in Afganistan was to provide protection to Opium farmers who 
the Taliban had punished for producing opium by death through public beheadings.  The Taliban 
doesn't allow the use or manufacture of pretty much any drug we label as illicit as per their not founded
in the Koran religious beliefs (I think I remember a similar warning against drunkenness as in the 
bible/Torah regarding Noah's over indulgences and wandering naked in the wilderness; which 
concerned his children).  There might be a specific prohibition of alcohol consumption but it might be 
drunkenness or overindulgence as in the parallel faiths.  I must note that I suspect an aspect of 
censorship and/or editing in the English translation I first obtained prior to Ch.51 in the era when they 
had just begun building what we now know to be concentration camps: that initial copy was missing an



entire section.  I later learned that it was a section describing Jihad but didn't get the reasonable 
opportunity to read it due to emergency habitability concerns (post Ch.51 included numerous not 
chosen but chosen for me by the people who committed me- housing situations that had unreasonable 
numbers of hazards not normal to encounter {like chronic refused to accept as existing or repair until proven with a hydrometer [gas and water 

displace each other more reliable than an electronic meter that zeros to the ambient which was flooded with non-oderous gases recognizable by dehydration and a different dry 

smell] which still took an order from community advocates and the recognition of my methods by WE energies who understood the science and limitations of their device once 

explained and shown} in another basically trafficked to residence the ceiling was dissolved by HCl acid stolen from me by the upstairs neighbors who had dissolved some form of 

animal/meat in their bathtub_for real I thought everyone had seen breaking bad and knew that would occur)  I lacked resources I could have used to determine human or other but 

verified that it was some form of animal because of the surviving flora of the stomach and gut in the slurry observed under microscope and documented/reported without 

meaningful government response and resulting in accusation of insanity to me by the landlord who tried to blame me which would mean I could get liquid to flow up against 

gravity through the ceiling of three rooms.  For real I collected a plastic tub's worth and some five gallon buckets of this pinkish thick slurry that was highly acidic and contained 

cestodes (trapeworms), some form of biflagellate and what appeared to be the remains of numerous squamous epithelial  cells along with mostly the remains of indistinguishable 

cells/tissues.  I don't quite remember clearly in part due to suffering serotonin syndrome from the inappropriate prescription of Trazadone for sleep (not safe apparently to be co-

prescribed with dextroamphetamine which I suspect she knew and also knew I could only object once and then must stay silent when overruled_I had been denied diazapam 

which was effective for sleep and improved the daytime effectiveness of the dextroamphetamine sulfate.

Back to the parts you want to read: We make peace with the Somali pirates via hiring them to 
sell us Frankincense Trees and resin at prices higher than paid by the Muslim world (only temporary 
expense that makes the future sourcing/production inexpensive and local).  And as a condition of these 
favorable trade deals we partner with them to transport the peoples we left behind and owe our 
allegiance too as technically they were part of the dominion of the United States and therefore entitled 
to full Constitutional rights of persons at a minimum.  Also we promised them something we failed to 
deliver: liberty.  

Now the part that the powers that be will try to prevent this argument from getting out only because of 
their faith in Baal (sorry it's definable as self-mutilation and I really consider abstinence from beneficial medications to be a form of self-mutilation but is permissible

if not forced upon others, and my backup protection from the DHHS is religious immunity which I'm extending to as many peoples as I can while using established doctrines etc)

We end the opioid (fentanyl) epidemic by a two pronged approach.  Bring the Opium farmers 
we left for dead to the region I'm envisioning and allow them to grow opium to sell as opium not 
necessarily as heroin.  Something the abstainers are not aware of is that heroin users simply cannot get 
opium because it is rarely available as it is charged by weight (in my case including the fucking bag) as
the same as heroin so much less effective amount of substance results in greater criminal penalties than 
heroin which is more potent by weight meaning an overdose amount of heroin is charged as less of an 
offense than a larger weight of opium that is almost if not impossible to overdose from because it is not
possible to inject or snort, only smoked or consumed.  The reality is that with opium you will pass out 
before your able to consume enough to die in all likelihood because the effects are also instant and 
continued use requires effort of packing the bowl etc.  Opium availability without unconstitutional 
penalties obsoletes fentanyl which only really became prevalent when we betrayed our allies the opium
farmers in Afghanistan. Seriously heroin users would choose opium in many cases if it was available.  
Many resort to opiods for relief from symptoms of those aforementioned electromagnetic weapons that 
they know they can never ever survive the retaliations for the accusation of having occurred so they 
simply numb themselves to be able to function under conditions that cause excitotoxicity etc.

The other solution that must occur in addition is the distribution of melting point analyzers with 
charts of drug melting points and the calculation for mixtures.  Really these people have cocaine and 
methamphetamine etc they are capable of math that is not that complicated in reality.  The common 
people are not fools as your likely made to consider them.  They are simply cautious of the retaliations 
for contradicting those of you who claim to be superior in intelligence because of (in the case of 



psychiatry as I've witnessed) purchased degrees whose only intellectual requirements are memorization
of guidelines they are given and told to believe in religiously.

 Our allies left for dead and denied even recognition as friends who we had given hope of liberty only 
to abandon them quickly to a group that doesn't allow the reasons they had to grow Opium: such as to 
send their Daughters to the Schools; do you really think a corn farmer could afford to lose even one 
worker?! Let alone support themselves in a war-zone.  Look it is common knowledge that we approved
of and allowed the production of Opium, Marijuana and other high value crops as is shown in an iconic
magazine front page from the era showing the poppy fields strategically located surrounding a US 
Military Base.  The written story said something complicit with the propaganda story that we opposed 
their best chance to be financially independent but the reality was obvious to the majority who are 
aware of changes in availability of drugs (OK no the opium I was illegally arrested for likely came from local sources as the secret transportation of 

opium is more difficult to do undetected by the zealots who believe the idea that illicit drugs are never medication or simply accept the rewards they reap through theft of the 

illegally persecuted people's properties than the truth: they imported Heroin, they did so with our blessing and even occassionally assistance which those caught for doing were 

sacrificed to maintain the illusion that the trade was something that could have flourished without our assistance: it was the “hearts and minds campaign” we were aware of and 

understood as how to rebuild an economy that wasn't that strong to begin with to the level of allowing deviation from traditions routed in “it worked for my ancestors and my 

situation is the same” they needed proof of a future that allows both survival and activities forbidden by the traditions they cling to involuntarily) (we really failed to give them the

2nd amendment and made them rely upon us for protection from peoples who had firearms we gave them to fight the Russians, it was impossible for them to comply with our 

demands and be able to resist an enemy not impaired by such restrictions against self-defense_seriously hearts and minds are great at the polling place but I only survived to write 

this by being armed and in ways they couldn't excuse incarcerating me for but that are unlikely to be forgiven if ever used other than as a deterrent {so difficult to do effectively I 

had to call the police on a recorded line and beg them not to do as threatened by a landlord to do such as illegally break into my residence and remove me by force with his 

“Sargent friend” and not do anything that I would be forced to defend myself against and explain to them in detail how I am armed with weapons that body armor or even a wall 

won't stop such as converting any pressurized gas tank like a fire-extingusher into a torpedo; I pray it never comes to this but they are applicable as a last stand some of which 

negates my body price (something that was diverted to unknown person(s) after I failed to muster the will to defend myself or manage to otherwise succeed in stopping armed 

with firearms assailants intent on murdering me for my parts even if not knowing that's the primary purpose of disabiling and kidnapping persons innocent of crimes that are 

lawful to enforce _I tried to call 911 and my lawyer on two different phones to report the illegal arrest in progress but help didn't come or was unable to come in time.  I had two 

purposes for that really never forgivable to use as a weapon combination of evidence of the use of electromagnetic weapons against the inhabitants of 477 W. Main St, Waukesha 

WI as proven by the collection of mercury amalgam that leaked in quantities that would have/did make me very sick but I captured the majority of in a piece of frankincense gum 

I placed over the filing then stored in a microcentrifuge vial (the silver-Hg filling was of a year that had been discontinued for leaking and only used for a few years but didn't do 

so in noticeable quantities unless exposed to strong electromagnetic fields.  The vial of Hg metal was an artifact given to me by friend I lost contact with due to Ch.51 

complications and possibly the threat I pose in association with.  Origionally I used the mercury switch as an educational tool for tutoring.;  I included it in the medicine bottle as a

reference standard to prove the identity of the leaked Hg which was significant in quantity in the gum   metal whose name was given to psychiatry soo long ago to define them as 

forever marked as not medical providers because they used that metal as medicine for “mental illnesses”   They are termed “Quakes” it is synonymous with “fraud” in modern 

speech but was derived from the Germanic quacksalber which is the word for Hg.  It is possible that they had a secret purpose for doing that: to create “canaries” who are 

sensitized to phenomenon they didn't clearly understand and likely feared such as the impact of solar storms and radiation bursts that could make unpredicted effects on primative 

electronics that didn't use insulation/shielding etc idk whatever their true purpose was it was and is unethical.  If I had resources available to me equivalent to prior to ch.51 such 

as the ability to borrow a spectrum analyzer, I could have gotten proof they are more likely to believe than the chemcial proof that requires scientific understanding and the 

required label of “sane” along with a title they can't discredit before the evidence is used only against you in a not scrutinized by the public, as in the secret court run by 

DSM-5 adherent worshipers of Baal.  It had to reach honorable persons who do adhere to the Constitutions and are Loyal to The True Republic and/or are simply 

ethical human beings   The biggest issue was I was not clearly thinking because I suffered the effects of those weapons that If I remember correctly co-coincided with the

election (I made a public accusation of voter fraud even saying the truth that I was targeted by electromagnetic weapons and considered the meaning to be they can 

track you remotely and therefore possibly record your vote via time-stamp or some other method (recall this coincided with the absentee ballots being returned to 

elderly voters with intimidating messages like “are you sure this is how you wan to vote” as reported on the televised broadcast news) and thought that I not only had to 

vote but that I had to vote for one of the two party candidates (I often vote by the person not the party and if I'm upset by both I usually vote for a third party), I was 

unable to competently vote under those impairments that.  I could only make myself even consider submitting this evidence to the appropriate constitutionally 

recognized authorities (the Courthouse) if I could do so without impairments from weapons never recognized as real when used as the common response observed was 

simply a depressed facial appearance and the sluggishness that is either submitted to or struggled against but doesn't allow full functioning.  A neighbor named Russel 

Case (I omitted most names but he is now past reason from the haldol, he was in a horrible state the whole time I knew him, but at least initially he was capable of 

understandably testifying to having been targeted by electromagnetic weapons (I make no claim to the accuracy of the sources he accused such as his family, satellites 



etc as I know such weapons to be somewhat limited in range if not impacting large areas, also I am aware from having prototyped some variations in crude forms that it

is also individuals that can use them and are also more probable if  able to target an individual specifically without the notice of proximal persons (electrical static, heat, 

numbness from heart palpitations etc and to do so would likely require either a tag on the victim and/or a dedicated setup such as could be built into the walls; it is also 

possible that he was made into a “Canary” through loss of insulation in the brain from the damages of the antipsychotics.  He claimed a foil hat made the voices come in

with digital clarity etc.  It is possible to generate and transmit wavelengths and amplitudes that would be resonant with neurons and it is possible that such could be 

done in configurations that are interpreted as understandable English.  The issue is they tried soo hard to get me to lie and accept what I'm certain is an 

imaginary/cover story diagnosis that is excused by arguments like : the public isn't ready to know about this and other rational that only defines tyrants who need 

superiority over their subjects through powers they can claim to be “god-king” or “magical” etc defining falsities relied upon by Theocracies.

Back to the hill my enemies hoped I would die on as soo many have been sacrificed to make the simple science forbidden to any aware of their “powers” etc that are not divine but

aberrations of science.  Unfortunately this assault lasted for a many days during the time leading up-to the election.  I managed to find relief almost only via methods always cited 

as proof of insanity such as running copper wires around my clothing along with metal sheets over my heart and various other availablle to use while partially retarded from  

interference with natural brainwaves like jamming signals preventing strings of thought aka planning,  I had the evidence and knew how to explain it, however I also knew that it 

is almost impossible that I was the first to report such after being made vulnerable to the Bill of Attainder (that was eventually used to divert the truthfully most horrific thing I 

made into hands unknown even after making a report of this diversion no response was received that was understood.  The fact is I knew at this time that I was subjected to 

weapons that are denied to exist almost only to the deemed insane (like I was taught how to make similar).and I have been aware of two meanings of my blood type since first told

that I was a “universal donor” (O- in some records O null in others O in at least one so whatever my body price is higher than most) at the age of roughly 8, 9 or 10 ish.  Also a 

side note my father has AB+ which is not considered possible to result in an O of any  Rh factor and especially not (-) from any cross.  This was not a subject I was allowed to 

inquire about only getting angry outbursts as response from my mother and the look of deep thought/concern from my father who I'm pretty sure realized the situation but refused 

allowing me to privately analyze his DNA to set the matter to rest.  When I decided not to go to the Master's Program I couldn't afford (mostly on a susceptibility to coercion made

possible by laws I was only aware of after considering moving there (imprisonment for debts, a reputation for having the most support for abortion derived stem cells etc 

{remember I have O- blood,same as organs the fetuses I might produce dependent upon cross would be the most expensive.  Straight up  I'm gonna have sex for pleasure with 

women that want to do so/I want etc: that's a human right.  I considered doing pornography to make up the difference as is reportedly common of graduate students and at the time

I was a marathon runner and relatively attractive.  I realized how likely such a situation was to result in being tricked probably by a girl financially coerced into sex being under 

the impression she was on birth control or wanted a child etc.  I now have a reality that shouldn't have been possible: a very short time-frame of injections of abilify has made me 

medically defined as obese and I struggle to run even short distances of a few miles.  I had to smoke tobacco as it up-regulates the enzymes that protect against antipsychotics 

(remember they imply that those poisons are our second amendment by saying things like: “haven't you ever heard of making yourself smarter by making others dumber?”  A 

nurse in Columbia St., Mary's in Mequon WI made that statement.  Ok all that aside, realize that I knew I could be murdered immediately in response to wearing electromagnetic 

shielding and waving around a bottle of Hg.  So I opted to stuff the container with a widely available product of the Military-Industrial complex whose exact composition is kept 

secret but reacts with water to produce heat and gasses=pressure along with some chemicals likely to react with that combination to form a slew of the most toxic substances for 

which there is no effective cure/antidote or treatment possibly including things like methyl-mercury.  The reason why: I am not willing to be sold as parts and involuntary 

commitment is really how they do it.   Very few things render all parts of the body unusable by harvesters.  The issue was I couldn't make something that would only harm myself 

and those who I can legally kill in self-defense (it wouldn't matter really to me if I was dead but would matter in terms of the results I would never know.  They never admitted to 

the victims of electromagnetic weapons that they exist and that their suffering is real. I couldn't make myself risk that level of improbability of success and high probability of 

failure requiring me to do something unforgivable such as add water to that combination.  I could not enter that courthouse in that municipality under conditions that others 

showed symptoms of but refused to acknowledge, and make a claim based upon evidence requiring that they do something that psychiatrists and the false Judges of secret court 

never ever allow: to make a complete argument and/or scientific explanation.  Note: this is not equivalent to a scientific paper or even representative of the standards I usually 

adhere to; but I really  am sacrificing survival efforts by even trying to do this in a manner that is complete enough to be understandable considering the appearance of extreme 

censorship in information available to authoritty figures/ government appointees etc of facts granted the general public and/or outright lying about truths so self-evident that not 

coming clean and shaping up to Constitutional law could result in real Civil War in reality near futures.  For real we don't actually have a highier security clearence than these so-

called expert psychiatrists and so called honorable Judges and police officers etc do we?  Truth I don't know if I ever got a security cleareance from the USA government.  I did at 

least once do a FOIA for a NASA publication that I was required to provide a reason for requesting.  I was horrified because they used enlisted persons they defined as 

“volunteers” and determined the limits of acceleration on the human body in various positions relative to the direction of force, and spun them to “expiration” if I remember the 

paper correctly (this was when I was very young and my reason was only to determine if it was feasible to make as a life goal building a spaceship to travel to the nearest star 

system, the ability to build ships fast enough existed already but humans wouldn't survive the acceleration required to get to relativistic speeds (I didn't want it to take long) as the 

paper's results indicated.  In the time since Ch.51 I've randomly run across less papers of potentially restricted information (didn't say classified for most and only did for really old

papers describing usually pretty horrific things (like 50 yrs ago) and innocuous things that are possibly explaining various conspiracy theories that were mostly irrelevant to my 

goals and suspected fakes because of the lack of adaption or use in apparent reality (ex the Nazi flying saucer not really a secret also we didn't steal and use that, we stole and used

jet engines so yeah) other more recent papers were more believable such as a suggestion of at least one function of a site proximal to Area 51 which I was predictable to consider 



of vital importance.  It was the most viable alternative use for the known toxin Fluoride as per fluorsiasilic acid and determined by me to be one of the research goals of the R&D 

department were I worked (in their defense a massive portion of the budget went to finding anywhere other than the tap water to dump the waste products too toxic to dump in the 

environment (for real it's called bio-sequestration and is an excuse given for Fluoride in water to people expected to “make themselves smarter by making others dumber.”  Also 

the excuse of water fluoridation makes people not drink the tap water which is an easy target for terrorists (except in jails, prisons, psych wards and related institutions of no 

liberty or self-determination we are forced to drink tap water as a sign of “compliance” called “sanity” and if given an argument they can't refute (I have had hydrofluoric acid 

spilled on me and exceeded my lifetime exposure even under their interpretations; I was offered “hypertonic solution” as an alternative to drink (fucking salt water!).  So I ate ice 

which has less fluoride and stil became lethargic even though I threw up their pills.  I find it unlikely that the project I was informed of to be the primary purpose of that site as the 

government would have been proud to announce such a solution to the energy crises that shape the conflicts globally..  I even gave them a solution to the very small risk of 

meltdown that was not incorporated in any design I've seen.  Now the issue that appeared in recent times: why is molybdenum appearing in vitamin supplements?!  It is cited as 

binding to various receptors and protiens but so do many toxic substances, simply binding to a biological substrate and changing it's activity doesn't necessatily mean beneficial 

and I was not educated of that being a necessary micro-nutrient.  I am aware of that being a bi-product of the otherwise if done intelligently promising energy source whose waste 

can be used as a slow consistent source of electricity via well-known properties of physics used in devices common.  I discussed this with experts in that field while still young 

and only continued to explore as a side hobby; I'm well aware that I am not allowed to own or contract with that industry by law in any direct way.  Is that only classified because 

it produces so few weaponizeable bi-products?  The molybdenum is used as a radioisotope in nuclear imaging techniques in medicine.  )

  (I have no choice but to include the events experienced and witnessed b/c these impairments of the 
obligations of contracts (we need to be able to focus on things other than emergencies forced upon us 
and the responsibility of for example landlords to maintain in exchange for our loss of income that if 
spent on mortgages is accrued as something we own and can exchange for something equivalent in 
money to what we invested: we were prevented by unconstitutional deprivations of rights from be 
eligible for and/or lost eligibility for such liberty as land ownership by those impairments.  Not having 
ownership of your residence was considered by the founders to be soo impairing that it would be 
impossible for tenants to vote in any manner other than as directed by their “Feudal Lord” (the 
situations forced upon the deprived of rights under color of law are fitting the definition of a feudal 
system wherein which the lord has almost no obligations to the serfs other than to agree to hurt them 
less if they pay rent that doesn't include any form of maintenance or welfare of the tenant(s) obligations
and the tenants might even be drafted into services via their position of being too weak from giving to 
be able to say no and therefore resist the resulting retaliations: a Feudal State relies upon the taking the 
production of their tenants in such a manner as to guarantee that they stay tenants unable to leave in 
any reasonable manner.

 Electrically Variable Integrated Life (EVIL) is primarily intended to serve my main goal: Mass-
producible quick-connect artificial and combination replaceable human parts and adjunct organs.  The 
purposes should be obvious: To obsolete the Murder Trades.  I define these both as abortions such as 
for the financial purposes of harvesting embryonic stem cells as well as the organ donations done in 
largest part in hospitals and as has become obvious via intentional malpractice (DSM-5 psychiatry_assumed I won't fund 

enemies of the State by purchasing said “psychiatrist's Bible” I would be guilty of Treason against “We The People, the Constitution and the Republic it defines).”  and the 
detainment/human trafficking that results in the prevention of the victims from getting to the DMV to 
change organ donor status to non-donor.

We are also told by USA allowed media that some level of the organ trades is done not under color of 
law (as in your local hospital/psych ward holding pen) but is done by the Cartels; however I find this to
be unlikely to be true of the most powerful/prominent/ the ones that have popular support as they have 
only been able to persist and gain influence via the loyalty of their members and neighbors who might 
need them financially and/or medically (as per the DHHS forced drug dependencies caused by 
antipsychotics whose permanent effects cause ever increasing with each dose of poison biochemical 



requirments for functioning at even survival levels the use of medications that either must be obtained 
through the permission of those who say you need poisons that increase the need for the drugs they 
make you beg for and eventually deprive you of (such as how haldol makes a biochemical need for 
dopamergenic drugs like the prescription amphetamines and synthetic cocaine: methylphenadate if you 
can manage to be in their favor, or for the majority of victims the demonized and heavily punished 
alternatives such as cocaine and methamphetamine; made available by people who don't seem to harm 
us but are harmed by our government and whose public support has never been higher (they really 
understood and responded to the plea for assistance during COVID-19 and saved significantly more 
lives and abilities than any hospital using fucking malaria drugs (intracellular parasite animal soo far 
from a virus that the likelihood of effectiveness is so minute that even the average without medical 
education populous doesn't consider truth)

The following is not technically appropriate but encompasses Constitutional arguments you might be 
required to use if you are to be allowed to fund my research and goals without turning me/us into 
something that is Truly EVIL.   

You are unlikely to feel secure enough to express your truthful opinions on many controversial 
subjects as the prevailing authorities are either transient and changing with every election or you are 
subservient to and living in terror of the State-Sponsored Theocracy (Department of Health and Human
Services {DHHS}_also known as the entity responsible for the Tuskegee Treasons (“experiments”) as 
well as the attempt to incite war both civil and with all of Central and South America via the 
imprisonment and lobotomization (reported chemically via Antipsychotics) of their Kin fleeing Zika 
and probably more so the toxicity of the counter measures to Zika (includes more recent concerns but I 
predicted this refugee flood many years ago as a response to Zika and confirmed to be a prediction of 
the USA Government and/or the DHHS Theocracy via the reportings made by Google Earth of the 
construction of the Concentration camps at the border several administrations ago (either Bush or 
Obama era_realistically I am now severely impaired as compared to 5 or so yrs ago before the bill of 
Attainder that forces me to beg for resources rather than build upon those I had, earned and voluntarily 
obtained through mutually beneficial business arrangements that I had planned to use to raise 
multitudes out of poverty (primarily for a greedy reason: they need to be able to buy and benefit from 
my products such that they generate benefits I didn't even consider that further my infinite goals that 
only lead to more goals).  For example I realized that in order to achieve my goals quick enough to 
make progress sufficient to beat the timer of death and disabilities 

I really had only considered naturally occurring disabilities as a risk, and only learned of involuntary 
commitment under Ch.51/related months before being committed myself, duriong which time I wrote 
documents opposing this utter disgrace as I knew it to challenge everything I could achieve as they 
“Worship Death and encourage unproductivity as the only definition of being Mentally fit/heathly/ not 
someone to kill/negate.”
 I was denied the protections of the laws of the United States of America as defined by the 
Constitutions via being subjected to the DHHS/associated Theocracy and it's worship of Baal (self 
mutilation) and Moloch (human sacrifice typically children).  I know you are likely not permitted to 
agree or disagree with that statement but you are able to understand that those practices are abhorred by
the largest 3 religions in the United States and regardless of prescribing to any religion at all: Every 
single person in these United States and it's Dominion have 1st Amendment immunity from being 
forced to take part in the practices of other religions and every Valid Branch of Government is 
Obligated to oppose and remove as it exists: State-Sponsored Religion that is spread almost exclusively
if not 100% via Violence and Coercion that most often leverages the forces of government meant to 
protect us from such an entity ever rising to power as it's very existence is prohibited 1st of all 
amendments made and is fundamental to the feasibility of the rest of the 1st amendment (religions like 



those of the DSM-5 etc opinion based so called “studies” pretending to be science rely on faith alone 
and use mechanisms such as inquisitions like the modern “involuntary commitment for treatment(s)” to
silence opposition that makes arguments based on reason and/or other faiths never considered, heard or 
repeated out of terror of the modern-day crosses of the Unconstitutional Theocracy that WILL argue 
that I am unable to receive funding for research that they define as “delusional.”  Indeed under their 
Theocracy such goals as ending the murder trades are delusional; as it is not done from necessity but 
for the ability to control and decide who lives and dies. 

Primarily they and others will likely attempt to blacklist me from this funding source and/or 
require that I disclose the  because I am their mortal enemy and potentially your most loyal ally if you 
can be what you are bound by Oath to yourselves and us via your voluntary commitment to the 
Constitutional Republic and all it encompasses such as mutual defense.

I might only release such as “powers reserved to the people” or not at all (as is my duty/right as 
an “inventor and/or useful artist”) (I know that such tactics have previously been attempted by the victims of the DSM-5/etc state-married religion(s) to 

attempt to both bribe and coerce compliance with the Constitutions and therefore liberate the multitudes who will never have a chance if not for the militias and loyal patriotic 

persons who risk life, limb and liberty to uphold the values of a Constitution that is almost never granted them/us)  I refer to a reported cure/treatment for HIV/AIDs  I must note I 

have a research and development mostly on paper option to treat that virus but experienced severe morbidity when taking steps to progress that treatment possability because
I have made materials and inventions that compete with military-grade weapons mostly on accident 
trying to invent similar medically beneficial devices.  One in particular I have disclosed only in terms 
of proving the component properties equivalent to electronic components/combinations of components 
and never recorded or disclosed the methods of manufacture as well as key materials even under 
torture.  Truthfully I may no longer be capable of 100% reproduction of the things your if aware of me 
at all: most ordered to obtain.  I feel obligated to inform you that the looted from me versions were 
mostly for non-direct biological contact and if used as the version you are most likely if aware of 
ordered to obtain and are very likely to cause only severe damages if used in the manner of the 
biologically more safe versions that I made only very limited quantities of.  I assume you obtained the 
images showing the biological interface from over 5yrs ago.  I also assume you have record of the other
materials that I accidentally and very temporarily violated FCC regulations against biologically active 
frequencies with: noticed both in myself and the surrounding insects when I powered said device.  I 
know similar exists but I'm only aware of versions requiring massive infrastructure.  If all that was 
nonsense to you then your either not having security clearances given us without even really asking or 
your really thinking you can erase decades of publications and admissions of the existence and use of 
technologies that are openly disclosed in primitive forms to the public media but ALWAYS called proof
of “insanity” when described in court by victims of it's unconstitutional use/abuse especially by those 
victims unable to do what I'm unwilling and possibly unable to do (yours are reproducible the designs 
are in the hands of the public as far as I'm aware: I suspect they want us to try to prove our sanity by 
reproducing them and therefore likely invent variations as slaves sentenced to death either way as the 
methods of irrefutably proving them would almost without exception constitute treason.  I know that 
your likely to try to leverage the properties of my version that might provide some level of protection 
against existing electromagnetic weapons and probably makes the external readings of biological 
signals encrypted that probable to exist devices can read and therefore make calculated alterations to.  
The fact is your attempting to (and have in terms of self when exposed to weapons you admit to both existing and using such as microwave guns_which are 

easily manufactured in crude form with materials available in almost every household_please don't make me sacrifice person(s) sent to illegally/unconstitutionally negate 

me/us/them as a threat to the enemies of the Constitutional Republic) coerce me into skipping all necessary requirements 
prerequisite to ethical human testing of a type of device without many valid medical purposes and 
possibly none that out-way the potential use to create tyranny everlasting.  

I recently became aware that one American and one Foreign company have been using on 



human subjects primitive traditional electronics based variations of this kind of abhorrent device in the 
most easily abused manner.  I suspect that the primary motivation to grant me the “title of nobility”of 
schizophrenia  (really we don't go to jail or prison and they try to convince us through implication that our new second amendment is the pills they know we can only 

stockpile if needing to prove our own competencies, that are only of value in the black markets as “date rape drugs” (such as quetiapine) and simultaneously they attempt to make 

us need to sell them by denying benefits like social security when needed most and made to need by their deprivations of rights.  Is to excuse the forced 
implantation of one of those utterly treasonous devices to “cure me of my delusions and make me 
appear happy in whatever servitude I'm permitted to perform; only persisting as an example to cause 
compliance through terror.  I consider the possibility that the expected response is for me to desperately
attempt to get mine out to the public quickly as a “alternative” that is potentially biologically broken 
down and temporary, possibly less abuseable and hypothetically adaptable as a shield if only to be 
immune from the worse-thans invented during my years of illegal incarcerations and tortures etc.

I will argue that many Constitutionally protected religions do not rely on Faith alone and do 
have in their histories evidence of being the preservation of science and medicine through periods of 
tyranny and/or might be truths as the people to record them were able to describe/communicate.  
Honestly I don't particularly care which way to seek, worship or honor the values of Higher 
authority(ies) that don't impair the obligations of contracts that define being human and made in God's 
image/ intended to be like God etc goals that are basically other wordings of the goals I have which are 
perfectly constitutionally permitted and encouraged and in my personal beliefs/religious obligations of 
contracts made, the only feasible way to possibly be capable of earning the salvation of my damned to 
hell soul; I committed a mortal sin, yes under coercion and after years of attempting to use the 
constitutionally defined mechanisms of due process which were systematically denied to me only to be 
able to use the threat of cruel and excessive but all too usual and utterly illegal/unconstitutional to have 
as a part of the United States Justice System punitive measures designed to utterly negate as a risk to 
tyranny the duties of Citizenship (voting, they deny felons the right to vote and define infractions of 
unconstitutional legislative and executive and sometimes judicial acts as felonies that by said 
impairments of our obligations as citizens {voting rights including the right to be secure in our person(s)_includes right to independent medical 

choices not limited by theocratic goals) allow the persistence of the very same unconstitutional realities abhorred by the 
majority as is known through polls and even when permitted the referendums and votes only open to 
those who are appearing to support the faiths of the slavery and murder based systems.

 that has prevented/impaired me from independent of government influence and/or in accordance with 
contracts that generate a reality of the Constitutionally defined Republic 


