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GREETINGS

SUPPORTERS, 
The Eldorado High School Football Program needs you! 

These are exciting times at Eldorado. The campus is starting to gain school spirit. The basketball 
court has a brand new floor, the cafeteria is getting a new expansion, our locker room is getting 
a fresh new look. The football program is now coming off back-to-back-to-back-to-back playoff 
appearances and is starting to make its mark in the 4A division of competition in Nevada. In fact, 
last season we were 1 game away from making an appearance in the 4A State Finals. With our 
community behind us, we will exceed the accomplishments of this past season both on the field 
and off and help us take advantage of the football stars aligning for Eldorado!

On behalf of the Eldorado High School football program, I am personally asking for your support. 
The goal, with your help, is to create a culture of achievement and success. Recognizing that 
you, our community, has already made a tremendous impact on our program, enhancing our 
weight room facilities, upgrading player gear, and providing invaluable experiences, such as 
attending your practices and camps. Your support has been instrumental in elevating Eldorado 
football to where we are today, and we are truly grateful.

As with many high school extracurricular activities, budget constraints significantly impact the 
football program. On behalf of the Eldorado High School football program, I am personally asking 
for your support. The Eldorado Support program allows us to solicit donations that will go a long 
way toward establishing a strong athletic program that includes the safest equipment for the play-
ers, improved athletic facilities, specialized training, and academic support. The goal, with your 
help, is to create a culture of achievement and success. Help from organizations like yours has 
already helped dramatically improve the weight room facilities, the nutrition the players receive, 
the experiences they have gotten like going to camp at Boise State and Western Colorado Uni-
versity, and hopefully much more as there is still plenty of work to do.

Thank you for your time and consideration. 

Sincerely,

Darryl Tootle, Head Football Coach
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BUSINESS DONORS

DIRECT LINK

SUPPORT OPPORTUNITIES
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GET INVOLVED
PANTRY 
ITEMS 
NEEDED:

PROTEIN POWDER

PROTEIN BARS

GRANOLA BARS

TRAIL MIX

DRIED FRUIT

SPORTS DRINKS

WWW.ELDORADOFOOTBALL.COM
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FOLLOW US 
ON SOCIAL 
MEDIA

X:
@ehsfirehawks

INSTAGRAM:
@ehsfirehawks

FACEBOOK:
@ehsfirehawks


