
2025 VETERANS MEMORIAL DAY GOLF TOURNAMENT SPONSORSHIP LEVELS 

 

(OVER) 

PLATINUM LEVEL SPONSORSHIP   $10,000 

The Sponsor’s name/logo will be used in all tournament literature. Platinum Sponsors will have two holes with tee 
sponsors signs and will have two foursomes of golfers included in their package. Platinum sponsors will also receive 
special recognition at the banquet and have up to six additional individuals attend the banquet. Platinum sponsors may 
display advertising items at the banquet on either the tables or within a booth. 

GOLD LEVEL SPONSORSHIP     $5,000 

The Sponsor’s name/logo will be used in all tournament literature. Gold Sponsors will have two holes with tee sponsors 
signs and will have two foursomes of golfers included in their package. Gold sponsors will also receive special 
recognition at the banquet and have up to six additional individuals attend the banquet.  

SILVER LEVEL SPONSOR     $4,000  

The Sponsor’s name/logo will be used in all tournament literature. Silver Sponsors will have one hole with a tee sponsors 
sign and will have one foursome of golfers included in their package. Silver sponsors will also receive special recognition 
at the banquet and have up to four additional individuals attend the banquet.  

BRONZE LEVEL SPONSOR     $3,000  

The Sponsor’s name/logo will be used in all tournament literature. Bronze Sponsors will have one hole with a tee 
sponsors sign and will have one foursome of golfers included in their package. Bronze sponsors will also receive special 
recognition at the banquet and have up to two additional individuals attend the banquet.  

GOLF TOWEL SPONSORSHIP     $2,500 

The sponsor’s name/logo will be stitched onto each golf towel. We estimate approximately 150 towels will be needed at 
a price of approximately $10 per towel. The sponsor will be used on promotional materials and will receive a mention at 
the dinner. If the Sponsor just wants to supply the towels and includes one foursome of golfers.  

GOLF BALL SPONSORSHIP     $2,500 

The sponsor’s name/logo will be placed on the sleeve of golf balls included in each player’s gift bag. We estimate 
approximately 36 sleeves will be needed at a price of approximately $7 per sleeve. The sponsor name and logo will be 
used on promotional materials and will receive a mention at the dinner, 10 sleeves of logo golf balls, and one foursome 
of golfers.  

DINNER SPONSOR      $2,000  

The sponsor’s name/logo will be prominently displayed at the tournament Dinner. The dinner sponsor will receive a 
foursome of golfers with the package. The Dinner sponsor will also be included in the programs and advertising. The 
Dinner sponsor may pass out literature on the dinner tables.  

LONG/MOST ACCURATE DRIVE SPONSORSHIP   $1,500  



The sponsor’s name/logo will be used on longest drive hole, and on the most accurate hole signs. The sponsor will be 
mentioned at the awards dinner and on all printed materials as soon as possible. The sponsorship will also include one 
foursome in the tournament.  

19th HOLE SPONSORSHIP     $1,500  

The 19th hole sponsor will be the sponsor of the bar tickets. Each player receives two drink tickets valued at $4.00 each. 
We anticipate 144 players and another 15 volunteers. The sponsorship includes name on all drink tickets, mention on 
day of the tournament program, and mentions at the dinner. The sponsorship will also include two entries into the 
tournament  

PUTTING CONTEST      $1,000  

The Putting contest sponsor will have a “tee sign” at the putting green. There will be contests for men and women, and 
each contestant will receive a special prize (generally a putter). The sponsor will also receive special recognition.  

LUNCH SPONSOR      $1,000  

The Lunch sponsor will have a “tee Sign” at the food area. The sponsor will be mentioned in all the printed literature and 
mentioned at the dinner and will receive special recognition.  

CLOSEST TO THE PIN (Men’s & Women’s)  $750  

There are two closest to the pin holes. The sponsor will be mentioned in the program as the closest to the pin and will 
be mentioned at the awards dinner. The sponsor will also have a “tee sign” with their name affixed.  

TEE SPONSORS SIGN     $150  

Tee sponsors will receive a hole and tee sign with their name affixed. The tee sponsors will also receive the sign upon 
completion of the tournament. Tee sponsors will be mentioned in the program and if time permits at the awards dinner.  

OTHER NON-CASH SPONSORSHIP OPPORTUNITIES  

We welcome other in-kind sponsorships. Those may include items to distribute to each player in Tee Bag, including but 
not limited to Promotion Items from the business, Discount cards, or raffle items from the business. If you are interested 
in a donation in the way of having a booth on the course, please contact us so we can discuss your needs. If you are 
interested in another in-kind sponsorship, please feel free to contact us and we will be most happy to discuss your ideas.  

In general, we believe we have a premier golf tournament, one in which players and sponsors want to return. There are 
several pieces of literature, including posters, tournament announcements, programs, etc., which we can make available 
to you upon your request. Should you wish to meet with me, or other members of the committee please feel free to 
contact Mark Kim or myself to set up a meeting or answer your questions.  

On behalf of the Veterans Memorial Day Golf Tournament, the Clovis American Legion, the Clovis VFW, and the Central 
Valley Blue Star Moms, we sincerely appreciate your consideration.  
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