
What to do instead:
Look beyond the monthly
premium. Consider copays,
coinsurance, and coverage.
Make sure your preferred
doctors and hospitals are in-
network.

What to do instead:
Consider a Medigap plan to
cover things like deductibles,
copays, and coinsurance.
The best time to enroll is
during your Medigap Open
Enrollment Period (the 6
months after you turn 65 and
enroll in Part B).
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What to do instead:
Know your Initial Enrollment
Period (IEP): It begins 3 months
before the month you turn 65
and ends 3 months after your
birthday month.
Even if you’re still working, talk
to a Medicare advisor to see if
delaying makes sense.

What to do instead:
Budget for monthly
premiums, especially for Part
B and drug coverage (Part D).
Understand that out-of-
pocket costs can add up
depending on your plan.

What to do instead:
Even if you're not currently
taking medication, consider
enrolling to avoid future
penalties.
Compare plans to find one
that fits your current and
future medication needs.


