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Dr. Kamel Hothi OBE is a pioneering leader with over 40 years in banking, from becoming the 
UK’s first Asian bank manager to shaping industry-wide strategy and transformation. Honoured 
with an OBE by Queen Elizabeth II for championing diversity, she is ranked among the Top 100 
Most Influential Black, Asian and Minority Ethnic Leaders. Dr. Hothi is Chief Strategy O=icer at 
GoldenPoint Global Fund, bridging investments across Riyadh, the US, UK, and India, and has 
advised 300+ organizations on leadership, culture, and governance. She also serves on global 
nonprofit and ESG boards, driving purposeful and inclusive change. 

Dr. Kamel Hothi OBE has been a trailblazer in the banking industry for over four decades, 
breaking multiple glass ceilings on her journey from becoming the UK’s first Asian bank 
manager to senior leadership as Director, Strategist, and Architect of industry-wide initiatives 
that reshaped financial services. Recognized among the UK’s Top 100 Most Influential Black, 
Asian and Minority Ethnic Leaders, she was awarded the Order of the British Empire (OBE) by 
Her Late Majesty Queen Elizabeth II in 2017 for championing diversity and inclusion across 
banking. 

Today, Dr. Hothi is the Chief Strategy O=icer at GoldenPoint Global Fund, bridging 
investments across Riyadh, the United States, the UK, and India. She has advised over 300 
organizations on leadership, cultural transformation, and governance, alongside managing her 
own family property business. 

Her commitment to giving back is equally distinguished: she serves as an Advisor to The Queen 
Elizabeth II Commonwealth Trust across 56 nations, sits on the ESG Committee of Lloyd’s of 
London influencing the global insurance sector, and is an Ambassador for Alzheimer’s Society 
and board member of ImpactMatch advising corporates on their social impact strategies. 

A globally recognized voice on leadership, strategy, and inclusion, Dr. Hothi brings a powerful 
perspective on how businesses can thrive by embracing transformation while upholding 
purpose and integrity. 


