


Mancala: A Detailed Guide to Playing and Winning

Introduction to Mancala

Mancala is a traditional board game with roots tracing back to 
ancient Africa and the Middle East. It is a game of strategy, 
calculation, and a bit of luck, making it exciting and engaging for 
players of all ages.

Game Mechanics

The game is played on a board with pits and stores, where players 
take turns sowing and capturing stones. Each turn involves picking
up stones from a pit and distributing them one by one into 
subsequent pits, strategizing to maximize captures and hinder the 
opponent.

Objective of the Game

The main goal is to collect as many stones as possible in your 
store. Players must carefully plan their moves to capture the 
maximum number of stones while preventing their opponent from 
doing the same.

Winning the Game

The player with the most stones in their store at the end of the 
game wins. The combination of strategic planning, tactical 
execution, and a bit of luck makes each game of Mancala a unique 
and engaging experience.



How to Play

To play, use the controller to move your cursor to the desired pit 
and press Fire to remove the stones. Alternatively, you can press a 
number from 1 to 6 to select the corresponding pit.

Basic Rules

Starting the Game: Decide who goes first (a common method is a
coin toss).

Sowing: On your turn, pick up all stones from one of your six pits. 
Move counterclockwise, dropping one stones into each subsequent 
pit and your store, but not into your opponent’s store.

Capturing: If the last stones you drop lands in an empty pit on 
your side, and the opposite pit (on your opponent’s side) has 
stones, you capture both the last stone and the stones in the 
opposite pit, placing them in your store.



Free Turn: If your last stones lands in your store, you get another 
turn.

Ending the Game: The game ends when all six pits on one side 
are empty. The remaining stones on the other side are captured by 
the player with stones still on their side.

Detailed Gameplay

Player A’s Turn:

• Player A chooses one of their pits, picks up all stones 
from it, and sows them counterclockwise.

• If the last stones lands in Player A’s store, they take 
another turn.

• If the last stones lands in an empty pit on Player A’s side, 
and there are stones in the opposite pit on Player B’s side, 
Player A captures those stones along with the last stones.

Player B’s Turn:

• Player B follows the same procedure, picking up stones 
from one of their pits and sowing them.

• Captures and free turns follow the same rules as for 
Player A.



Strategic Tips

Plan Ahead: Always think several moves ahead. Consider how 
your move will affect both your position and your opponent’s 
position.

Control the Board: Try to maintain control over the pits that give 
you the most flexibility and options for sowing stones.

Maximize Captures: Look for opportunities to land your last 
stones in an empty pit on your side to capture your opponent’s 
stones.

Extra Turns: Aim to end your sowing in your store to earn extra 
turns. This can allow you to dominate the flow of the game.

Count Your Moves: Be aware of the number of stones in each pit. 
This will help you predict where your last stones will land.

Block Opponent’s Captures: Try to play defensively by 
minimizing opportunities for your opponent to capture your stones.

Advanced Strategies

Chain Moves: Set up sequences where multiple moves give you 
extra turns, allowing you to control the game tempo.

Starving Tactic: Aim to empty your opponent’s side quickly, 
forcing them to play into your captures or ending the game with 
you having more stones.



Seed Distribution: Keep a balanced distribution of stones in your 
pits to maintain multiple options and reduce predictability.

Store Management: Focus on gradually filling your store while 
minimizing the stones available for your opponent’s store.

Ending the Game

When one player’s six pits are all empty, the game ends. The 
remaining stones on the opponent’s side are captured by the 
opponent. The player with the most stones in their store is declared
the winner.

Conclusion

Mancala is a game of deep strategy and tactical foresight. By 
mastering the rules and employing smart strategies, you can 
outmaneuver your opponent and capture the most seeds. Enjoy the 
challenge and excitement that each game of Mancala brings!

Happy playing!



History of the Game Mancala

Origins and Early History

Mancala is one of the oldest known games in human history, with 
archaeological evidence suggesting it dates back to ancient times. 
The earliest known evidence of Mancala boards comes from 
Aksumite Ethiopia, around the 6th and 7th centuries AD. However,
it is believed that the game could be much older, potentially 
originating in ancient Egypt or the Middle East.

Spread Across Africa

Mancala quickly spread throughout Africa, where it became deeply
embedded in many cultures. In Africa, Mancala games are often 
referred to by different names in different regions. For instance, it 
is known as "Oware" in Ghana, "Bao" in East Africa, and 
"Omweso" in Uganda. The game was traditionally played with 
seeds, stones, or shells and boards that were often carved into the 
ground or made from wood.

Introduction to the Middle East and Asia

From Africa, Mancala spread to the Middle East and then further to
Asia. Historical records show that the game was played in Persia 
(modern-day Iran) and the Arabian Peninsula. The game reached 
India, Southeast Asia, and even the Philippines, where it became 
known by various names such as "Pallanghuzi" in Tamil Nadu, 
"Kalar" in Sri Lanka, and "Sungka" in the Philippines.



European Encounter

Mancala games were encountered by European travelers and 
traders as they explored Africa, the Middle East, and Asia. The 
game's introduction to Europe can be traced back to the 17th 
century, although it did not become as popular there as in other 
regions. The simplicity and strategic depth of Mancala made it a 
fascinating subject of study for anthropologists and game 
enthusiasts.

Modern Era and Global Spread

In the 20th century, Mancala saw a resurgence in global interest, 
partly due to the increasing recognition of its cultural significance 
and historical depth. Mancala has been the subject of various 
academic studies, highlighting its role in social and cultural 
practices in different societies. The game also gained popularity in 
the Western world through cultural exchange and the efforts of 
enthusiasts and educators who recognized its educational value.

Mancala's adaptability and simplicity have allowed it to thrive in 
the digital age, with numerous digital versions of the game 
available on various platforms. This has helped introduce Mancala 
to a new generation of players around the world.



From the author:

The game Mancala was originally developed for the Intellivision 
and has now been ported to the ColecoVision. I don't recall exactly
how much time I spent on the original version, but all the work 
back then (in 2018) was done on my sofa with a laptop, as I was 
recovering from a broken ankle and was in a cast for two months. 
As the game evolved, I conceived additional ideas, such as 
incorporating a more advanced AI.

I would like to extend my gratitude to Oscar (Nanochess) for 
making the basic compiler, CVBASIC, available to us for both the 
ColecoVision and the Intellivision. The main game logic remains 
unchanged from the Intellivision version, but as the porting 
process progressed, increasingly polished features were introduced
in the ColecoVision version.

Thank you for purchasing this game. Enjoy!






