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ii Amazons ofAmerica:

Female Gender Variance

When Pedro de Magalhaes de Gandavo explored northeastern

Brazil in 1576, he visited the Tupinamba Indians and reported

on a remarkable group of female warriors.

There are some Indian women who determine to remain chaste:

these have no commerce with men in any manner, nor would they

consent to it even if refusal meant death. They give up all the duties

of women and imitate men, and follow men's pursuits as if they were

not women. They wear the hair cut in the same way as the men, and

go to war with bows and arrows and pursue game, always in com-

pany with men; each has a woman to serve her, to whom she says

she is married, and they treat each other and speak with each other as

man and wife. 1

Gandavo and other explorers like Orellana were evidently so

impressed with this group of women that they named the river

which flowed through that area the River of the Amazons, after

the ancient Greek legend of women warriors.

To what extent did this recognized status for women exist

among Native Americans? The sources are few, since European

male explorers dealt almost entirely with aboriginal men. Most
documents are unclear about anything to do with women, and

as a result it is difficult to make conclusions about those females

who took up a role similar to that of the Tupinamba Amazons.

But we can begin by making it clear that this institution was not

the same as berdache. As specified earlier, the term berdache

clearly originated as a word applying to males. Anthropologist

Evelyn Blackwood has done a thorough search of the ethno-

graphic literature and found mention of a recognized female

status in thirty-three North American groups. Because she sees
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it as distinct from berdachism, she does not use the term "female

berdache" but instead calls this role "cross-gender female." She

notes that it was most common in California, the Southwest,

the Northwest, and the Great Basin, but she also notes a few

instances among peoples of the Subarctic and the northern

Plains. 2

Because I have some disagreement with the concept of gender

crossing, and also because "cross-gender female" is linguisti-

cally awkward, I prefer the word amazon. This term is parallel

to berdache, but it is a status specific to women that is not sub-

servient to male definitions. American Indian worldviews al-

most always recognize major differences between amazons and

berdaches. With the single exception of the Navajo, in those

cultures that recognize alternative roles for both females and

males, have distinct terminologies in their languages that are

different for each sex. The Papago word translates as "Light

Woman," and such women even up to the 1940s were considered

simply socially tolerated variations from the norm. 3 Among the

Yumas of the Southwest, berdaches are called elxa', while ama-
zons are called kwe'rhame. They are defined as "women who
passed for men, dressed like men and married women." There

is no ceremony marking their assumption of the role, as there

is for the elxa'.
4

The parents of a kwe'rhame might try to push her into femi-

nine pursuits, but such a child manifested an unfeminine char-

acter from infancy. She was seen as having gone through a

change of spirit as a result of dreams. In growing up she was

observed to hunt and play with boys, but she had no interest in

heterosexual relations with them. According to Yuman infor-

mants in the 1920s, a kwe'rhame "wished only to become a man."

Typical of amazons in several cultures, she was said to have a

muscular build and to desire to dress like a man, and it was also

claimed that she did not menstruate. A Yuman kwe'rhame mar-

ried a woman and established a household with herself as hus-

band. She was known for bravery and for skillful fighting in

battle. 5
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RAISING A FEMALE HUNTER

While there are parallels between berdaches and amazons, fe-

male amazons are also very different from male berdaches.

Among the Kaska Indians of the Subarctic, having a son was

extremely important because the family depended heavily on

big-game hunting for food. If a couple had too many female

children and desired a son to hunt for them in their old age, they

would simply select a daughter to "be like a man." When the

youngest daughter was about five years old, and it was obvious

that the mother was not going to produce a son, the parents

performed a transformation ceremony. They tied the dried ova-

ries of a bear to a belt which she always wore. That was believed

to prevent menstruation, to protect her from pregnancy, and to

give her luck on the hunt. According to Kaska informants, she

was dressed like a male and trained to do male tasks, "often

developing great strength and usually becoming an outstanding

hunter." 6

The Ingalik Indians of Alaska, closely related to the Kaska as

part of the Dene culture, also recognized a similar status for

females. Such a female even participated in the male-only activ-

ities of the kashim, which involved sweat baths. The men ig-

nored her morphological sex in this nude bathing, and accepted

her as a man on the basis of her gender behavior. 7 Other notable

Subarctic amazons from the eighteenth century included the

leader of the eastern Kutchin band from Arctic Red River, and

a Yellowknife Chipewayan who worked for peace between the

various peoples of the central Subarctic. 8

Among the Kaskas, if a boy made sexual advances to such a

female, she reacted violently. Kaska people explained her reac-

tion thus: "She knows that ifhe gets her then her luck with game
will be broken." She would have relationships only with

women, achieving sexual pleasure through clitoral friction, "by

getting on top of each other."
9 This changed-gender demon-

strates the extreme malleability of people with respect to gender

roles. Such assignment operates independently of a person's

morphological sex and can determine both gender status and

erotic behavior.
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TRANSFORMATION INTO A MAN

In other areas, becoming an amazon was seen to be a choice of

the female herself. Among the Kutenai Indians of the Plateau,

for example, in what is now southern British Columbia, such a

female became famous as a prophet and shaman. She is remem-
bered in Kutenai oral tradition as being quite large and heavy

boned. About 1808 she left Kutenai to go with a group of white

fur traders, and married one of them. A year later, however, she

returned to her people and claimed that her husband had oper-

ated on her and transformed her into a man. Kutenai informants

from the 1930s told ethnographer Claude Schaeffer that when
she returned she said: "I'm a man now. We Indians did not be-

lieve the white people possessed such power from the supernat-

urals. I can tell you that they do, greater power than we have.

They changed my sex while I was with them. No Indian is able

to do that." She changed her name to Gone-To-The-Spirits, and

claimed great spiritual power. Whenever she met people she per-

formed a dance as a symbol of her transformation. 10

Following her return, she began to dress in men's clothes, and

to carry a gun. She also began to court young women. After

several rebuffs she met a divorced woman who agreed to marry
her. "The two were now to be seen constantly together. The
curious attempted to learn things from the consort, but the lat-

ter only laughed at their efforts." A rumor began that Gone-
To-The-Spirits, for the pleasure of her wife, had fashioned an

artificial phallus made of leather. But whatever their sexual tech-

nique, the wife later moved out because of Gone-To-The-
Spirits's losses in gambling. Thereafter, Gone-To-The-Spirits

changed wives frequently.

Meanwhile, she began to have an interest in warfare and was

accepted as a warrior on a raid. Upon coming to a stream, Ku-
tenai oral tradition recalled, the raiders would undress and wade
across together but she delayed so as to cross alone. On one of

these crossings, her brother doubled back to observe her. He
saw her nude and realized that her sex had not been changed at

all. Seeing him, she sat down in the water and pretended that

her foot was injured. Later, trying to protect her reputation, she
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told the others that she was injured in the stream and had to sit.

She declared that she hereafter wished to be called Qa'nqon

ka'mek klau'la (Sitting-In-The-Water-Grizzly).

Her brother did not tell what he saw, but refused to call her

by her new name. Later, she took still another wife, and as she

had done with previous wives eventually began accusing her of

infidelity. Qa'nqon was of a violent temper, and when she began

to beat this wife, the brother intervened. He yelled out angrily,

in the hearing of the entire camp: "You are hurting your woman
friend. You have hurt other friends in the same way. You know
that I saw you standing naked in the stream, where you tried to

conceal your sex. That's why I never call you by your new
name." 11

After this, according to Kutenai informants, all the people

knew that Qa'nqon had not really changed sex. It is conceivable

that the community already knew about her sex before this pro-

nouncement since Qa'nqon's ex-wives must have spread the

truth. The oral tradition does not explain why women contin-

ued to marry the temperamental Qa'nqon. Soon after this in-

cident, evidently, she and a wife (whether the same woman or

another is unknown) left to serve as guides for white traders.

The couple seemed to get along fine once they arrived at Fort

Astoria on the Columbia River in 1811.

One trader named Alexander Ross characterized them as

"two strange Indians, in the character of man and wife." "The

husband," he said, "was a very shrewd and intelligent Indian"

who gave them much information about the interior. Later, this

trader learned that "instead of being man and wife, as they at

first gave us to understand, they were in fact both women—and

bold adventurous amazons they were." Qa'nqon served as guide

for Ross's party on a trip up the Columbia to the Rocky Moun-
tains. Ross recounted that "the man woman" spread a prophesy

among the tribes they passed, saying that the Indians were soon

going to be supplied with all the trading goods they desired.

These stories, so agreeable to the Indian ear, were circulated far and

wide; and not only received as truths, but procured so much celeb-

rity for the two cheats, that they were the objects of attraction at
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every village and camp on the way; nor could we, for a long time,

account for the cordial reception they met with from the natives,

who loaded them for their good tidings with the most valuable ar-

ticles they possessed—horses, robes, leather, and higuas [?]; so that,

on our arrival at Oakinacken [Okanagon, near the present-day bor-

der of British Columbia and Washington State], they had no less

than twenty-six horses, many of them loaded with the fruits of their

false reports. 12

Another white traveler in the area nearly a decade later heard

the Indians still talking about Qa'nqon, whom they referred to

as "Manlike Woman." She had acquired a widespread reputation

as having supernatural powers and a gift of prophesy. Her most

important prediction was that there would soon be a complete

change in the land, with "fertility and plenty" for all tribes.

According to this traveler, writing in 1823, she had predicted

that the whites would be removed and a different race of traders

would arrive "who would supply their wants in every possible

manner. The poor deluded wretches, imagining that they would

hasten this happy change by destroying their present traders, of

whose submission there was no prospect, threatened to extir-

pate them." 13 What we can see from these stories is that

Qa'nqon sparked a cultural movement similar to "cargo-cults"

that twentieth-century anthropologists have observed among
Melanesians and other tribal peoples coming in close contact

with Western trade cargo goods. This movement also reflected

the dissatisfaction the Indians felt with the white traders.

After establishing her fame, Qa'nqon returned to settle with

the Kutenai and became noted as a shamanistic healer among
her people. A twentieth-century elderly headman named Chief

Paul remembered his father telling stories of her curing him of

illnesses when he was a child. In 1825 she accompanied a Ku-

tenai chief to the Hudson's Bay Company post among the Flat-

head Indians, taking the role of interpreter. The company trader

described her as "a woman who goes in men's clothes and is a

leading character among them. . . . [She] assumes a masculine

character and is of some note among them." 14

In 1837 she was traveling with some Flatheads when a Black-
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foot raiding party surrounded them. Through her resourceful-

ness the Flatheads made an escape while she deceived the attack-

ers. The Blackfeet were so angry that they tried to kill her, but

after several shots she was still not seriously wounded. They
then slashed her with their knives. But according to Kutenai

oral tradition, "Immediately afterwards the cuts thus made were

said to have healed themselves. . . . One of the warriors then

opened up her chest to get at her heart and cut off the lower

portion. This last wound she was unable to heal. It was thus

Qa'nqon died." Afterward, the story goes, no wild animals dis-

turbed her body. 15

This story, which was passed down among the Kutenai for

over a century, signifies the respect the Indians had for the sha-

manistic power of the "Manlike Woman." Even the animals rec-

ognized this power and respected it. It should be noted that the

Kutenai did not recognize a berdache status for males. A tribe

that had an alternative gender role for one sex did not necessarily

have another role for the other sex. Native Americans did not

see the two roles as synonymous so equating amazons with ber-

daches does not clarify the matter.

MANLIKE WOMAN

The Mohaves, like other cultures, have different words for ber-

daches and amazons. Hwame girls are known to throw away

their dolls and refuse to perform feminine tasks. It is said that

they dreamed about their role while still in the womb. Adults

recognize this pattern and, according to ethnographer George

Devereux, make "occasional half-hearted and not very hopeful

attempts to discourage them from becoming inverts. When
these efforts fail, they are subjected to a ritual, which is half 'test'

of their true proclivities and half 'transition rite' and which au-

thorizes them to assume the clothing and to engage in the oc-

cupations and sexual activities of their self-chosen sex." Adults

then help the hwame to learn the same skills that boys are

taught. 16

Mohaves believe that such females do not menstruate. In the
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worldview of many American Indians, menstruation is a crucial

part of defining a person as a woman. Some amazons may have

in fact been nonmenstruating, or, since they wished to be seen

as men, if they did menstruate they would hide any evidence of

menses. The other Indians simply ignored any menstrual indi-

cators out of deference to their desire to be treated like men. 17

Mohaves also accept the fact that a hwame would marry a

woman. There is even a way to incorporate children into these

female relationships. If a woman becomes impregnated by a

man, but later takes another lover, it is believed that the pater-

nity of the child changes. This idea helps to prevent family fric-

tion in a society where relationships often change. So, if a preg-

nant woman later takes a hwame as a spouse, the hwame is

considered the real father of the child. 18

George Devereux, who lived among the Mohaves in the

1930s, was told about a famous late nineteenth-century hwame
named Sahaykwisa. Her name was a masculine one, indicating

that she had gone through the initiation rite for hwames. Never-

theless, she dressed more like a woman than a man, proving

that cross-dressing is not a requirement for assuming amazon
status. While she was feminine in appearance and had large

breasts, Mohaves said that she (typical of others like her) did

not menstruate. As evidence of this, they pointed out that she

never got pregnant, despite the fact that she hired herself out as

a prostitute for white men.

Sahaykwisa used the money that she received from this het-

erosexual activity to bestow gifts on women to whom she was

attracted. With her industriousness as a farmer (a woman's oc-

cupation) and as a hunter (a man's occupation), she became rel-

atively prosperous. She was also noted for her shamanistic abil-

ity to cure venereal diseases. Shamans who treated venereal

diseases were regarded as lucky in love. This fame, plus her

reputation as a good provider, led women to be attracted to her.

Sahaykwisa's first wife was a very pretty young woman,
whom many men tried to lure away from her. Motivated by

jealousy, they began teasing her, "Why do you want a hwame
for a husband? A hwame has no penis; she only pokes you with

her finger." The wife brushed off the remark saying "That is

alright for me." But then later the wife eloped with a man. Such
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a breakup was not unusual, given the fact that heterosexual mar-

riages among Mohaves were equally subject to change. After a

time the wife returned to Sahaykwisa, having found the man
less satisfying. People referred to Sahaykwisa by the name Hith-

pan Kudhape, which means split vulvae, denoting how the

hwame would spread the genitals during sex. This part of the

oral tradition indicates that the Mohaves were well aware that

an amazon role involved sexual behavior with women.
While accepting these relationships, Mohaves nevertheless

teased Sahaykwisa's wife unmercifully. While teasing is quite

common in American Indian cultures generally, in this case it

was done so much that the woman left a second time. Sahayk-

wisa then began to flirt with other women at social dances, soon

easily attracting another wife, and then a third one later on.

Mohaves explained this by the fact that Sahaykwisa was, after

all, lucky in love. Her reputation as a good provider was also an

obvious factor. But after the third woman left her, and returned

to the man from whom Sahaykwisa stole her, the man attacked

the hwame and raped her. Rape was extremely uncommon
among the Mohaves, so this incident had a major impact on her

life.

Sahaykwisa became demoralized and an alcoholic, and iron-

ically began having wanton sex with men. She claimed to have

bewitched one man who rejected her advances, and when he

died in the late 1890s she boasted about having killed him. The
man's son was so enraged by this that he threw her into the

Colorado River, where she drowned. In telling this story Dev-
ereux's Mohave informants were convinced that Sahaykwisa

claimed witchcraft intentionally so that someone would kill her.

They explained that she wanted to die and join the spirits of

those she had earlier loved. 19

While this story does not have a happy ending, it does never-

theless point out that female-female relationships were recog-

nized. Sahaykwisa was killed because it was believed that she

had killed another person by witchcraft, not because of her gen-

der status or her sexual relations with women.
While the social role of the hwame was in some ways like that

of men, the story of Sahaykwisa does not support Blackwood's

view of gender crossing. The Mohaves did not in fact accept
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Sahaykwisa as a full-fledged man, and the wife was teased on
that regard. She was regarded as a hwame, having a distinct gen-

der status that was different than men, women, or alyha. Mo-
haves thus had four genders in their society.

To what extent an amazon was accepted as a man is unclear.

The variation that existed among Indians of the Far West typifies

this matter. The Cocopa warrhameh cut her hair and had her nose

pierced as men did, and did not get tattooed as women did. 20

Among the late nineteenth-century Klamath a woman named
Co'pak "lived like a man. . . . She tried to talk like a man and

invariably referred to herself as one." Co'pak had a wife, with

whom she lived for many years, and when the wife died Co'pak

"observed the usual mourning, wearing a bark belt as a man
does at this time." Nevertheless, this mourning may have been

the standard for a "husband" rather than for a "man," and we
do not know if Klamath custom made a distinction between the

two categories. Co'pak also retained woman's dress, which cer-

tainly implies a less than total crossover. Other Klamaths con-

tinued to see her as a manlike woman rather than as a man. 21

A survey of California Indian groups that recognized amazon
status revealed that in half of the groups amazons performed

both men's and women's work, while in the other half they did

only men's work. 22 No doubt this variation of roles is typical of

cultural diversity in aboriginal America generally.

Unlike Western culture, which tries to place all humans into

strict conformist definitions of masculinity and femininity,

some Native American cultures have a more flexible recognition

of gender variance. They are able to incorporate such fluidity

into their worldview by recognizing a special place for ber-

daches and another one for amazons. "Manlike Woman" is how
Indians described the Kutenai female, and that phrase recurs in

anthropological literature when direct translations are given. By
paying more attention to words used by Indians themselves, we
can make more precise definitions. Gender theory is now begin-

ning to make such distinctions. Terms like gender crossing im-

ply that there are only two genders, and one must "cross" from

one to the other. As with the male berdache, most recent theo-

rists argue, the amazon is either a distinct gender role, or is a

gender-mixing status, rather than a complete changeover to an

opposite sex role.
23
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WARRIOR WOMEN IN THE GREAT PLAINS

When we turn to the nomadic Plains cultures, the picture be-

comes even more complex. Here, an accepted amazon status

was generally lacking. Female divergence into male activity was

not recognized as a distinct gender comparable to the institu-

tionalized berdache role. Women could participate in male oc-

cupations on the hunt or in warfare, but this did not imply an

alternative gender role. Precisely because they had various ac-

tivities open to them on a casual and sporadic basis, there was

not as much need to recognize a specific role for females behav-

ing in a masculine way. For example, they could become "War-

rior Women." Such a woman might join a war party for a spe-

cific occasion, like a retribution raid for the death of a relative.

She might even accumulate war honors, called coup. But since

it did not affect her status as a woman, she should not be con-

fused with an amazon. Male warriors simply accepted female

fighters as acting within the parameters of womanhood, with-

out considering them a threat to their masculinity. 24

Warrior women were not the same as amazons partly because

their menstruation continued to define them as women. Among
Plains peoples, as among many other American Indians, blood

was seen as an important and powerful spiritual essence. An
individual who bled would not be able to control the power of

this bleeding, so if a person bled it might disrupt any important

activity that depended on spiritual help, like'a hunt or a raid.

Consequently, if a woman began her period, the raid would

have to be delayed while the spirits were placated. As a result of

this belief, the "manly hearted women" who sometimes partic-

ipated in warfare were almost always postmenopausal. 25

This belief was not just a restriction on women; a male who
bled from an accident or a wound had to go through the same

efforts to placate the spirits. The matter was more a question of

power than of restriction. Menstruation "was not something

unclean or to be ashamed of," according to the Lakota shaman
Lame Deer, but was sacred. A girl's first period was cause for

great celebration. Still, Lame Deer concluded, "menstruation

had a strange power that could bring harm under some circum-

stances." 26 Paula Gunn Allen explains: "Women are perceived to

be possessed of a singular power, most vital during menstrua-
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tion. . . . Indians do not perceive signs of womanness as con-

tamination; rather they view them as so powerful that other

'medicines' may be cancelled by the very presence of that

power." American Indians thought of power not so much in

terms of political or economic power, but as supernatural

power. Being a matter of spirituality, woman's power comes
partly by her close association with the magical properties of

blood. 27

Another possible factor inhibiting the development of ama-
zon status among Plains women had to do with the economic
need for their labor and procreation. Women were responsible

for the preparation of buffalo meat. Since a successful hunter

could kill more bison than one woman could dress and preserve

for food or trade, every available woman was needed to do this

work. This economic system limited women's choice of occu-

pation and put more pressure on them to marry than in other

North American cultures. Furthermore, with the loss of men
from warfare, there was the expectation that every woman
would marry and have children. 28

There was such a strong need for female labor that Plains men
began taking multiple wives. A typical pattern was for an over-

worked wife to encourage her husband to take a second wife.

The first wife now had higher status, as a senior wife who di-

rected younger women, and the family as a whole benefited

from the extra output of the additional wife. Quite often it

would be the younger sisters of the first wife who were later

brought in as co-wives. This pattern gave advantages to

women. It kept female siblings together, giving them support

and strength throughout their lives. In contrast to Western cul-

ture, which keeps women separated by promoting competition

among them for men, Plains polygyny meant that wives were

added to the family rather than replaced by divorce and serial

monogamy. 29

Despite these pressures on women to marry and procreate,

even in the Plains culture there were exceptions. An amazon role

was followed by a few females, with the most famous example

being Woman Chief of the Crows. She was originally a Gros

Ventre Indian who had been captured by Crow raiders when
she was ten years old. She was adopted by a Crow warrior, who
observed her inclination for masculine pursuits. He allowed her
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to follow her proclivities, and in time she became a fearless

horseback rider and skilled rifle shooter. Edward Denig, a white

frontiersman who lived with the Crows in the early nineteenth

century, knew Woman Chief for twelve years. He wrote that

when she was still a young woman she "was equal if not supe-

rior to any of the men in hunting both on horseback and

foot. . . . [She] would spend most of her time in killing deer

and bighorn, which she butchered and carried home on her back

when hunting on foot. At other times she joined in the surround

on horse, could kill four or five buffalo at a race, cut up the

animals without assistance, and bring the meat and hides

home." 30

After the death of the widowed man who adopted her, she

assumed control of his lodge, "performing the double duty of

father and mother to his children." She continued to dress like

other women, but Denig, writing in 1855, remembered her as

"taller and stronger than most women—her pursuits no doubt

tending to develop strength of nerve and muscle." She became

famous for standing off an attack from Blackfoot Indians, in

which she killed three warriors while remaining unharmed her-

self: "This daring act stamped her character as a brave. It was

sung by the rest of the camp, and in time was made known to

the whole nation." 31

A year later she organized her first raid and easily attracted a

group of warriors to follow her. She stole seventy horses from

a Blackfoot camp, and in the ensuing skirmish killed and scalped

two enemies. For these acts of bravery she was awarded coups,

and by her subsequent successful raids she built up a large herd

of horses. As a successful hunter, she shared her meat freely

with others. But it was as a warrior, Denig concluded, that her

fame was most notable. In every engagement with enemy
tribes, including raids on enemy camps, she distinguished her-

self by her bravery. Crows began to believe she had "a charmed

life which, with her daring feats, elevated her to a point of

honor and respect not often reached by male warriors." The
Crows were proud of her, composing special songs to com-
memorate her gallantry. When the tribal council was held and

all the chiefs assembled, she took her place among them, as the

third-highest-ranked person in the tribe. 32

Woman Chief's position shows the Crows' ability to judge
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individuals by their accomplishments rather than by their sex.

Their accepting attitude also included Woman Chief's taking a

wife. She went through the usual procedure of giving horses to

the parents of her intended spouse. A few years later, she took

three more wives. This plurality of women added also to her

prestige as a chief. Denig concluded, "Strange country this,

where [berdache] males assume the dress and perform the duties

of females, while women turn men and mate with their own
sex!" 33

Denig's amazement did not denote any condemnation on his

part, for individual traders on the frontier often accepted Indian

ways of doing things. Rather, he respected his friend as a "sin-

gular and resolute woman. . . . She had fame, standing, honor,

riches, and as much influence over the band as anyone except

two or three leading chiefs. . . . For 20 years she conducted

herself well in all things." In 1854 Woman Chief led a Crow
peacekeeping mission to her native Gros Ventre tribe. Resentful

because of her previous raids against them, some Gros Ventres

trapped her and killed her. Denig concluded sadly, "This closed

the earthly career of this singular woman." Her death so enraged

the Crows that they refused to make peace with the Gros

Ventres for many years. 34 Woman Chief's exceptionally high

status was rather unique on the Plains; stories that were passed

down made her a hero in the classic Plains mode. Even her

death, at enemy hands, was typical of the pattern for the hon-

ored male warrior.

WIVES OF AMAZONS

What about the wives of the amazon? Woman Chief, like the

other amazons, evidently had no difficulty finding women to

marry. Yet, these women did not identify as lesbian in the West-

ern sense of the word. American Indian women were not di-

vided into separate categories of persons as is the case with An-
glo-American homosexual and heterosexual women. The white

lesbian often sees herself as a member of a minority group, dis-

tinct from and alienated from general society. She is seen as

"abnormal," the opposite of "normal" women, and often suffers
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great anguish about these supposed differences. Paula Gunn Al-

len writes, "We are not in the position of our American Indian

fore-sister who could find safety and security in her bond with

another woman because it was perceived to be destined and nur-

tured by non-human entities, and was therefore acceptable and

respectable." 35

With the exception of the amazon, women involved in a re-

lationship with another female did not see themselves as a sepa-

rate minority or a special category of person, or indeed as dif-

ferent in any important way from other women. Yet, they were

involved in loving and sexual relationships with their female

mates. If their marriage to an amazon ended, then they could

easily marry heterosexually without carrying with them any

stigma as having been "homosexual." The important consider-

ation in the Indian view is that they were still fulfilling the stan-

dard role of "mother and wife" within their culture. The tradi-

tional gender role for women did not restrict their choice of

sexual partners. Gender identity (woman or amazon) was im-

portant, but sexual identity (heterosexual or homosexual) was

not. 36

WOMEN-IDENTIFIED WOMEN

Socially recognized marriages between an amazon and her wife

only tell part of the story. Relationships between two women-
identified women were probably more common. American In-

dians, while not looking down on sex as evil or dirty, generally

see it as something private. Consequently, it is not something

that is talked about to outsiders, and there is not much infor-

mation on sexual practices. It is most important for a woman
to have children, but in many tribes a woman's sexual exclu-

siveness to the child's father is not crucial. Thus, a woman might

be sexually active with others without worrying that she or her

children would be looked down on. In many Native American

societies, a woman has the right to control her own body, rather

than it being the exclusive property of her husband. As long as

she produces children at some point in her life, what she does

in terms of sexual behavior is her own private business. 37
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Individual inclinations, after all, are usually seen as due to a

direction from the spirits. This spiritual justification means that

another person's interference might be seen as a dangerous in-

trusion into the supernatural. "In this context," writes Paula

Gunn Allen, "it is quite possible that Lesbianism was practiced

rather commonly, as long as the individuals cooperated with the

larger social customs." Allen wrote a poem to native "Beloved

Women" which expresses this attitude of noninterference:

It is not known if those

who warred and hunted on the plains . . .

were Lesbians

It is never known
if any woman was a lesbian

so who can say. . . .

And perhaps the portents are better

left written only in the stars. . . .

Perhaps

all they signify is best left

unsaid. 38

It is precisely this attitude, that sexual relations were not any-

one else's business, that has made Indian women's casual ho-

mosexuality so invisible to outsiders. Except for some female

anthropologists, most white observers of native societies have

been males. These observers knew few women, other than ex-

ceptional females who acted as guides or go-betweens for

whites and Indians. Most writers expressed little interest in the

usual female lifestyle. Yet even if they did, their access to accu-

rate information would be limited to bits that they could learn

from Indian males. Given the segregation of the sexes in native

society, women would not open up to a male outsider about

their personal lives. Even Indian men would not be told much
about what went on among the women. 39

Given these circumstances, it is all the more necessary for

women researchers to pursue this topic. Openly lesbian ethnog-

raphers would have a distinct advantage. In contrast to institu-

tionalized male homosexuality, female sexual variance seems

more likely to express itself informally. Again, enough cross-

cultural fieldwork has not been done to come to definite conclu-
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sions. However, Blackwood suggests that female-female erotic

relationships may be most commonly expressed as informal

pairings within the kin group or between close friends. 40

GENDER AND SEXUAL VARIANCE AMONG
CONTEMPORARY INDIAN WOMEN

In what ways do these patterns continue today? An idea of the

type of data that might be gathered by contemporary field-

workers is contained in a report by Beverly Chinas, who has

been conducting research among the Isthmus Zapotecs of

southern Mexico since 1966. While she details an accepted ber-

dache status for males, among females the picture is somewhat
different. In two decades of fieldwork she has observed several

instances of women with children leaving their husbands to live

with female lovers. She sees these relationships as lesbian:

"People talk about this for a few weeks but get used to it. There

is no ostracism. In the case of the lesbians, they continued to

appear at fiestas, now as a couple rather than as wives in hetero-

sexual marriages." At religious festivals, she points out, such

female couples do not stand out, since every woman pairs up

with another woman to dance together as a couple. There is

virtually no male-female couple activity in religious contexts.

The sexes are always separated in ceremonies, with different

roles and duties. 41

The only negative reaction that Chinas reports concerned an

unmarried daughter of a close friend and informant who "left

her mother's home and went to another barrio to live with her

lesbian lover. The daughter was only 25 years old, not beyond

the expected age of heterosexual marriage. The mother was

very upset and relations between mother-daughter broke off for

a time but were patched up a year later although the daughter

continued to live with her lesbian partner." 42

The Zapotec mother's anger at her daughter was due to the

latter's evident decision not to have children. By refusing to take

a husband at least temporarily, the daughter violated the cultural

dictate that females should be mothers. It was thus not lesbian-

ism per se that caused the mother-daughter conflict. It would
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be interesting to know if the mother was reconciled by the

daughter's promise that she would get pregnant later. If so, it

would fit into the traditional pattern for American Indian

women. The importance of offspring in small-scale societies

cannot be ignored; female homosexual behavior has to accom-

modate to society's need to reproduce the population.

Chinas explains that in such marimacha couples, "one will be

the macho or masculine partner in the eyes of the community,

i.e., the 'dominant' one, but they still dress as women and do
women's work. Most of the lesbian couples I have known have

been married heterosexually and raised families. In 1982 there

were rumors of a suspected lesbian relationship developing be-

tween neighbor women, one of whom was married with hus-

band and small child present, the other having been abandoned

by her husband and left with children several years previ-

ously." 43

These data offer an example of the kind of valuable findings

that direct fieldwork experience can uncover. The fact that one

of the women was looked on as the macho one, even though

she did not cross-dress, points up the relative imimportance of

cross-dressing in a same-sex relationship. An uninformed out-

sider might have no idea that these roles and relationships exist,

and might assume that the practice had died out among the

modern Zapotecs.

Since the field research that could answer these questions has

not yet been done with enough Native American societies, I am
reluctant to agree with Evelyn Blackwood's statement that by
the end of the nineteenth century "the last cross-gender females

seem to have disappeared." 44 Such a statement does not take into

account the less formalized expressions of gender and sexual

variance. If I had trusted such statements about the supposed

disappearance of the male berdache tradition, I never would

have carried out the fieldwork to disprove such a claim.

As also occurs with the berdaches, contemporary Indians

perceive similarities with a Western gay identity. A Micmac ber-

dache, whose niece recently came out publicly as gay, reports

that the whole community accepts her: "The family members
felt that if she is that way, then that's her own business. A lot of

married Indian women approach her for sex. A male friend of
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mine knows that she has sex with his wife, and he jokes about

it. There is no animosity. There might be some talking about

her, a little joking, but it is no big deal as far as people on the

reserve are concerned. There is never any condemnation or

threats about it. When she brought a French woman to the com-
munity as her lover, everyone welcomed her. They accept her

as she is."
45

Despite the value of such reports, it is clear that a male cannot

get very complete information on women's sexuality. I hope

that the data presented here will inspire women ethnographers

to pursue this topic in the future.

Paula Gunn Allen, who is familiar with Native American

women from many reservations, states that there is cultural

continuity. She wrote me that "There are amazon women, rec-

ognized as such, today in a number of tribes—young, alive, and

kicking!" 46 They may now identify as gay or lesbian, but past

amazon identities, claims Beth Brant (Mohawk), "have every-

thing to do with who we are now. As gay Indians, we feel that

connection with our ancestors." Erna Pahe (Navajo), cochair of

Gay American Indians, adds that this connection gives advan-

tages: "In our culture [and] in our gay world, anybody can do

anything. We can sympathize, we can really feel how the other

sex feels. [We are] the one group of people that can really under-

stand both cultures. We are special." Paula Gunn Allen also em-
phasizes this specialness, which she sees as applying to non-

Indian gay people as well. "It all has to do with spirit, with

restoring an awareness of our spirituality as gay people." 47 As
with the berdache tradition for males, modern Indian women's

roles retain a connection with past traditions of gender and sex-

ual variance. There is strong evidence of cultural revitalization

and persistence among contemporary American Indians.
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A Cross-Cultural Viewpoint

While comparative study of female gender variance is not the

central topic of this book, 1

it is important to point out that

American Indian cultures are not unique in recognizing a special

status and respected role for individuals like berdaches and ama-
zons. Many societies, in various areas of the world, have a spe-

cial gender category which seems to be generally comparable to

the berdache role. This chapter is a survey of some of these

institutions, concluding with a statement about the implications

of this cross-cultural research for a theory of gender variance

and sexual variance among humans.

SIBERIA

Probably the closest institution to berdachism outside the

Americas is among the reindeer-herding peoples of Siberia. The
ancestors of Native Americans migrated from this area between

30,000 and 15,000 years ago. The presence of a tradition similar

to berdachism among the peoples of Siberia suggests that this

role has existed among at least some American Indians from

their earliest arrival in the New World.

A major source for Siberian ethnography is Waldemar Bo-
goras, a Russian anthropologist who lived among the Chukchi
in eastern Siberia from 1890 to 1901. He devoted a section of his

book to "Sexual Perversion and Transformed Shamans," noting

the close connection between homosexual behavior, gender var-

iance, and spiritual power. The Chukchi refer to such a person

as a "soft man (yirka-la ul) meaning a man transformed into a

252
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being of a softer sex." The transformation takes place gradually

when the boy is between ages eight and fifteen, the critical years

when shamanistic inspiration usually manifests itself. The
Chukchi feel that this transformation is due to powerful spirits.

Though people sometimes make jokes about the peculiar ways

of soft men, the Chukchi respect them highly for their healing

abilities and fear their spiritual or psychic powers. 2

The soft man keeps his masculine name, but otherwise

"leaves off all pursuits and manners of his sex, and takes up those

of a woman. ... He learns the use of these quickly, because the

spirits are helping him." Bogoras knew several soft men, but

considered Tilu Wgi to be the most remarkable. He described

this thirty-five-year-old Chukchi as physically "wholly mascu-

line and well developed besides." Nevertheless, with his hair

arranged in the manner of Chukchi women, his face "looked

very different from masculine faces. . . . All the ways of this

strange creature were decidedly feminine. ... I heard him gos-

sip with the female neighbors in a most feminine way, and even

saw him hug small children with evident envy for the joys of

motherhood." 3

While homosexual behavior was not limited to soft men, and

there was even a case of one soft man who had a female wife

before taking a male husband, in general Chukchi same-

sexuality focused on the soft men. Bogoras wrote that a soft

man "seeks to win the good graces of men, and succeeds easily

with the aid of the spirits. Thus he has all the young men he

could wish for striving to obtain his favor." One young soft man
even created something of a problem in the 1890s because all of

the eligible bachelors "beset him with their courtship to the

great detriment and offense of the lawful [female] beauties."

When a soft man chose a husband, Bogoras wrote,

The marriage is performed with the usual rites, and I must say that it

forms a quite solid union, which often lasts till the death of one of

the parties. The couple live much in the same way as do other

people. The man tends his herd and goes hunting and fishing, while

the "wife" takes care of the house, performing all domestic pursuits

and work. They cohabit in a perverse way, modo Socratis, in which

the transformed wife always plays the passive role. 4
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Soft men excelled in shamanism because of their close asso-

ciation with the spirit world, which made them "dreaded even

by the untransformed shamans." A soft man would never have

to worry about being treated badly because his supernatural

protector would retaliate for any slight. Though having a soft

man as a spouse marked high status for a man, the role of the

husband could be difficult. The soft man's personal spirit was

"said to play the part of a supernatural husband. . . . This hus-

band is supposed to be the real head of the family, and to com-
municate his orders by means of his transformed wife. The hu-

man husband, of course, has to execute these orders faithfully

under fear of prompt punishment. Thus in a household like

that, the voice of the wife is decidedly preponderant." In the

case of Tilu Wgi's husband, who was, Bogoras noted, "alto-

gether a normal well-balanced person," he followed his spouse's

wishes in most serious matters. Once, when he attempted to

chastize Tilu Wgi, the transformed one "gave him so powerful

a kick that it sent him foremost from their common sleeping

room. This proves that the femininity of Tilu Wgi was more
apparent than real."

5

Not only the Chukchi, but other peoples of eastern Siberia

recognized soft men. Koryak, Kamchadal, and Asiatic Eskimo

men commonly had a soft man as a concubine in addition to

their female wives. "The women were not displeased, but as-

sociated with their male rivals in quite friendly fashion." How-
ever, by 1900 the practice had declined greatly due to the med-
dling interference and complaints of Russian government

officials.
6

This practice was also evident throughout much of northeast

Asia. The main authority on the ancient folk religion of Korea

suggests that it was closely connected to that of Siberia. An-

drogynous males who served as shamans were known for their

curing abilities, and also their ability to predict the future. They
would often be concubines to men. 7

Related peoples of the Bering Sea area of Alaska also had male

concubines. Numerous Russian explorers noted, usually in con-

demnatory terms, the practice as being most common among
the Aleuts and the Kodiak Island Eskimos. For example, the
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explorer Davydov reported in amazement in 18 12 that androg-

ynous Kodiak males, called schopans or achnuceks, did female

work and had one or sometimes even two husbands: "These

individuals are not only not looked down upon, but instead they

are obeyed in a settlement and are not seldom wizards." 8 As

noted earlier, Kodiak parents raised a boy androgynously, and

then married him to a wealthy man before his fifteenth birthday.

Having such a person in a family provided social prestige for

both the parents and the husband. The boy-wife was treated

with great respect. 9

POLYNESIA

Polynesian societies also institutionalized male gender variance

in the mahu role. Mahus are defined on the basis of doing wom-
en's work, but they also act as the passive partner in sexual acts

with men. Masculine men might have sex with each other, and

a mahu might abdicate the status and marry a woman, but if he

remains in the mahu role he will not have sex with women.
Mahus were often attached to chief's households, and were con-

sidered prestigious persons. An English captain in Tahiti in 1789

reported one of his sailors being "very much smitten with a

dancing girl . . . but what was his surprise when the perfor-

mance was ended, and after he had been endeavoring to per-

suade her to go with him on board our ship, which she assented

to, to find this supposed dancer, when stripped of her theatrical

paraphernalia, [was] a smart dapper lad." James Wilson, a mis-

sionary in Tahiti during the 1790s, described mahus as dressing

in women's clothing, and seeking "the courtship of men the

same as women do, nay, are more jealous of the men who co-

habit with them, and always refuse to sleep with women. We
are obliged here to draw a veil over practices too horrible to

mention. . . . Women do not despise those fellows, but form

friendships with them." 10

Another Englishman at the same time, a sailor named Mor-
rison from the HMS Bounty, remarked that mahus "are in some
respects like the Eunuchs of India but are not castrated. They
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never cohabit with women but live as they do. They pick their

beards out and dress as women, dance and sing with them and

are as effeminate in their voice. They are generally excellent

hands at making and painting of cloth, making mats and every

other woman's employment. They are esteemed valuable

friends in that way." The infamous Captain William Bligh of the

Bounty also reported meeting "a man [who] had great marks of

effeminacy about him . . . and of a class of people common in

Otaheite called Mahoo, that the men had frequent connections

with him and that he lived, observed the same ceremonies, and

ate as the women did. . . . The women treat him as one of their

sex, and he observed every restriction that they do, and is

equally respected and esteemed." 11

Holding the mahu role is a prized position, since only one

person is allowed to claim the status in each village. Families

gently encourage certain boys to prepare for the roles, so that if

a mahu dies or resigns the most suitable one would be ready to

take over the position. Likewise, in the Marquesas Islands, ma-

hus are merely categorized as males who prefer a woman's life

and desire men. Men who have sexual relations with a mahu

consider it no different from having sex with a female, and see

no impact on their own identity other than to reinforce their

male identity. 12

Ethnographer Robert Levy interviewed some men in Tahiti

in the early 1960s, who detailed their sexual involvement with

a mahu without embarrassment. An informant told him that

mahus "really believe that [semen] is first class food for them.

Because of that mahu are strong and powerful. The seminal

fluid goes throughout his body. It's like the doctors say about

vitamins. I have seen many mahu and I've seen that they are

very strong." On the sexual experience this man said, "It's just

like doing it with a woman, but his way of doing it is better

than with a woman, as you just take it easy while he does it

to you."

Another informant stated, "When you go to the mahu it's

more satisfactory. The sexual pleasure is very great." Asked if

he had any embarrassment about doing this, he replied, "No,

you're not ashamed. You don't put any value on it. It's like feed-
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ing the mahu with the penis. . . . You don't take it seriously." 13

A man from the United States who lived for three months in

Tahiti in 1984 reported to me that mahus are still quite prevalent

in Tahiti. Tourists look down on them, but the native Tahitians

are indifferent. The Tahitian attitude is that "They're just other

people. They're really men, but they are good workers and do

good service for others, so who cares." 14 Tahitians consider ma-

hus to be that way "naturally," and there is no discussion of the

origins of mahu tendencies becausejthings that are natural are

not subject to moral evaluation. Sometimes it is said that a mahu

is born that way, and that a tendency to be mahu runs in certain

families. Tahitians say simply that God creates the mahu and that

is the way it is.
15

Nevertheless, other Tahitians say that adults encourage chil-

dren to take the mahu role. Levy observed this kind of sociali-

zation by a woman, who referred constantly to her friend's

three-year-old son as mahu when she was talking to him.

Though the boy did not seem effeminate, the boy's mother ac-

cepted this encouragement with amusement. Levy reports that

he had the feeling that the woman was trying to coach the boy

into being a mahu. 16 Similar customs exist in Hawaii, in Samoa,

where the role is called fafafini ("like a lady"), and also among
the Maori ofNew Zealand. 17 The widespread acceptance of this

kind of gender variance by cultures spread throughout the Pa-

cific may also indicate its ancientness.

As a means of exploring the cross-cultural similarities of gen-

der variance, in 1984 I made a brief fieldtrip to Hawaii to inter-

view traditional Hawaiian mahus. The ones I met impressed me
as being very similar to berdaches. They are androgynous in

character, do women's work as well as men's, may dress in uni-

sex clothing or a mixture of women's and men's clothing, are

sexually active with men, and have certain special roles in tra-

ditional Hawaiian religion.

The mahu is the one who usually cares for parents in their old

age, and retains the greatest closeness to both parents as the

other children move away to form their own families. Mahu is

integral to the way the family works as an institution. The social

utility of having a child as a mahu is clear. Mahu informants
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explain that they are not considered either women or men, but

are "kind of a third entity." One traditionalist says, "His rela-

tions with the parents would be stronger than the other mem-
bers of the family. Because of this, the mahu would be more
highly respected." 18

Though the status of the mahu has declined considerably

among westernized Hawaiians today, in the traditional religion

a mahu could gain additional status as a tahiku dancer. This an-

cient form of the hula, a religious ceremony done with chant-

ing, was dominated by mahus. According to an informant, "The
chanter usually is mahu because he has no outside distractions in

marriage. They remained separated from all women so that they

could concentrate on what was necessary for the hula. . . . Tra-

ditional hula dancers, and especially mahu dancers even today

are cherished by the traditional people. They are practically

worshiped. All would like to dance as the mahus dance."

To be sure, homosexual behavior is not always associated

with gender variance; there are masculine men who will have

sex with a mahu or with each other. But it is expected that the

mahu will be sexual with men. As with the berdache, however,

mahu status involves more than sex. When I asked the difference

between a mahu and a gay identity, a traditionalist mahu told me,

"Mahus hold on to the traditional Hawaiian spirituality and

value our feminine ways. . . . Mahu is part of the culture, it's

natural. I guess for the haoles [whites] who find out they're

gay— it's harder for them. You don't get that kind of isolation

with Hawaiians, because we've always existed here. . . . On the

mainland the Qudeo-Christian] religion doesn't allow a culture

of acceptance. Gays have liberated themselves only sexually, but

they have not yet learned their place in a spiritual sense." 19 As
with the berdaches I talked with, the mahu saw the difference

from a gay identity not in terms of the different character of the

individual, but of the spiritual role taken by the mahu.

INDIA

In large-scale societies, cultural diversity makes for a more com-
plicated picture, but we still see institutionalized forms of gen-

der variance. In India, for example, with its wide range of reli-
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gious sects and ideas of acceptable behavior, the role of sexual

expression ranges from celibacy to anal- and phallic-worshiping

promiscuity. The celebration of oral and anal heterosexual prac-

tices has created a climate for acceptance of similar practices

between individuals of the same sex. Even before the impact of

sex-negative European Christianity, however, social attitudes

were ambiguous because of differing opinions about non-

masculine males. South Asian mythology is full of examples of

gods who were hermaphroditic, and there was a widespread

belief in a third sex. Certain persons were considered as neither

male nor female, or were seen as having changed from one sex

to another. Androgynous males, usually incorrectly labeled by

English writers as eunuchs, were often associated with same-

sex desire. Ancient Indian sex manuals discussed at length the

different ways that these individuals used their mouths to pro-

duce orgasm for their male partners. 20

In modern India, the most notable example of gender vari-

ance is a cult of males who dress and live as an alternative gender

and are known as hijras. They perform as mediums for female

goddesses, which gives them a special role at weddings and after

births. In addition, many of them take the passive role as pros-

titutes for men. Anthropologists disagree about the extent to

which they are involved in sexual behavior with men, partly

because Indians are so close-mouthed about even accepted

forms of sexuality. But hijras are "an example par excellence of

the cultural construction of gender, being both 'neither man nor

woman' and 'man and woman.'" 21 One anthropologist reported

on his 1978 fieldwork in North Gujarat:

Almost none of the hijras I saw were effeminate in physical appear-

ance, although many adopted caricatured feminine traits. One . . .

showed a very strong chest and arms. He appeared to have recently

shaved and had a strikingly handsome—and very masculine— face.

He also wore a sari, the traditional dress of Indian women, and had a

long, carefully combed braid that hung to the middle of his back.

The androgyny—suggesting the characteristics of both sexes rather

than suggesting neither—was extraordinary. . . . The hijra are nei-

ther male nor female. They have an intermediate or additional sexual

identity, but they are not "unnatural" because of it. Male and female

are poles on a continuum rather than two types with a fixed bound-
ary between them. 22



260 I UNDERSTANDING GENDER AND SEXUAL VARIANCE

OTHER AREAS OF ASIA AND AFRICA

The fluidity of gender roles is well represented in an analysis of

gender variance in several areas. It is not the purpose of this

book to provide a survey of such institutionalized roles around

the world, but mention of a few instances will provide refer-

ences for future research. In Southeast Asia, the Vietnamese

do'ng bo'ng shaman fills an alternative gender role and dresses

like a man sometimes and like a halfman-halfwoman at other

times. This shamanistic role represents a holdover from pre-

Buddhist folk religions. 23 On the Indonesian island of Celebes,

similar shamans are part of the court of an important person,

serving rather as a male version of a geisha. 24 Urbanized areas

of Indonesia have institutionalized an entertainment role for

nonmasculine males in the ancient ludruk theater. They are re-

ferred to as alus, which denotes a quality of aristocracy and

idealism, and are known to be able to arouse men erotically.

Though they are referred to by anthropologists as transvestites,

such singers "often accentuate the fact that they combine male

and female elements." And their songs have been compared to

"a prayer, voiced by a priest . . . reminiscent of certain Javanese

rites."
25 When I was in the Philippines in 1983, 1 observed similar

entertainment roles by markedly androgynous males who were

also known as homosexual.

Horrified European travelers, missionaries, and anthropolo-

gists in other areas have observed the connection in many tra-

ditional cultures between gender variance and same-sex rela-

tions. Several sources note the occurrence of "transvestite

shamans" in various areas of Africa, for example among the

Zulus and in Zanzibar. 26 Males in an alternative gender role are

active as prostitutes for men in Oman, and in other areas. 27

EUROPEAN CASTRATI

While there likely existed earlier forms of androgyny in Euro-

pean folk traditions, practically the only practice that is com-
parable to institutionalized gender variance in Christian Europe

originated with church music. The high soprano voices of
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young boys were highly valued in early modern Europe, and

the Church would pay lower-class parents for boys with good

voices. The main problem with investing in the training of a

boy singer was that at puberty he would lose this valued talent

when his voice changed. To preserve the high voice of their best

students, choir directors began the practice of cutting off the

boys' testicles.

When opera emerged as a popular form of musical theater in

seventeenth-century Italy, it seemed natural for castrati to be-

come the singers of female roles. In European theater women
did not appear on the stage, and female parts were played by

young men. Castrati became the highest-paid opera singers, the

prima donnas of the high culture of their time. Cross-dressing

for the opera, and often in their daily life as well, the castrati

were renowned for their free sexuality as well as for their femi-

nine dress and demeanor. Though their masculinity was ques-

tionable, their high status was not. 28

It is perhaps not farfetched to suggest that the high prestige

of the castrati in European high culture led to the establishment

of a new tradition of gender mixing in the West. Though the

popularity of the castrati declined, it merged with a folk tradi-

tion of androgynous males known in England as Mollies, which

led in the nineteenth century to entertainment by female imper-

sonators known as drag queens. 29

HOMOSEXUALITY AND MASCULINITY

Melanesia

On the one hand, cross-cultural data in widely separated cul-

tures reveals that there is a strong relationship between a socially

defined androgynous character among males and a proclivity

for same-sex eroticism. On the other hand, the existence of

homosexual behavior between masculine men, in an equally

varied group of cultures, shows that homosexual behavior is not

limited to nonmasculine males. This is especially notable in cul-

tures that take the opposite approach of those in which gender

variance is institutionalized. Instead of associating male-male

sex with androgyny, as hetero-gender, these other cultures as-
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sociate it with hypermasculinity. It is often assumed that male-

male sexual relations are necessary for the absorption of mas-

culinity. It is intra-gender.

This notion is most emphasized in various parts of Melanesia.

In many areas of southern lowlands New Guinea and nearby

islands, there is a strong cultural belief that there are two body
fluids that bring about human life and growth: breast milk and

semen. Infants need woman's milk to grow, but in the Melane-

sian view boys cannot grow to become men without ingesting

semen from adult males. Melanesian societies that have this be-

lief institutionalize male homosexual behavior as obligatory for

all boys, as part of their socialization into manhood. Though
there is variation of specific beliefs and practices, the typical

pattern is that boys between the ages of about seven and thirteen

are taken from the maternal household and placed in a boys'

house set away from the village. For a period of several months

to several years, depending on the culture, boys avoid all contact

with females as they are prepared in elaborate initiations for

manhood. 30

Sperm, the essence of manhood, is not seen as something that

forms spontaneously. These Melanesians believe that it is a

scarce resource that must be planted in the boy by a mature

male. In some societies this is done by the boy performing oral

sex on the man, in others by receiving anal intercourse, and in

others by having the sperm rubbed on his body. The homosex-
ual behavior is thus a duty of men (women are also seen as

strengthened by absorbing sperm), and it is ritualized as part of

male initiation ceremonies. While casual homosexual acts may
take place, they must always be with the boy receiving the older

male's semen. To reverse roles would be considered damaging

to the boy's growth.

The most important homosexual relationship for a boy is

with his mentor, who is assigned by his father and is ideally his

mother's brother. This mentor is responsible for educating the

boy and seeing that he is raised into proper manhood. They
sleep together and work together until the boy is mature. In the

Melanesian view, years of ingesting semen has an effect, as evi-

denced by the fact that the boy grew to adulthood. Thus, in a
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cultural pattern almost directly opposite to Western stereotypes

about "corrupting innocent children," masculinity and proper

growth is absorbed through homosexual acts and male nurtur-

ance. Instead of fearing sex and keeping boys ignorant of it,

Melanesians see sex as a key to the growth of spirit in heart and

mind as well as physical growth.

This overlay of ritual and male duty makes Melanesian no-

tions of homoeroticism seem quite different from the berdache

tradition. Yet, both are ways for a society to construct sexual

behavior between males, allowing close erotic bonding between

individuals. Melanesian males are closely united in an egalitarian

warriorhood. Just as heterosexual intercourse cements mar-

riage, in Melanesia homosexual acts cement warriorhood. Both

heterosexual marriage and homosexual relationships are inte-

gral to social harmony, in that they widen the network of indi-

viduals to whom one is tied by close emotional bonds.

Because a boy is expected to engage in these sexual acts with

older males does not mean that he will become a lifelong exclu-

sive homosexual. Just as every boy is expected to be repeatedly

sexually penetrated by older males, followed by a stage when
he in turn supplies semen to younger boys, so at a later time he

is expected to get married to a woman. In some groups he is

even expected to give up sex with boys altogether after his first

or second child is born. He does not have a "gay" lifelong pair-

ing with a man of similar age. We cannot even properly call him
a lifelong bisexual, because he is homosexual at one stage of his

life, followed by a period when he is bisexual, and then (in some
societies) ends up as heterosexual in his later years.

All of this shows the extreme plasticity of human behavior,

with cultural norms shaping people in widely divergent ways.

It destroys the Western notion that homosexual behavior is

somehow "unnatural," "deviant," or "abnormal." Homosexual
behavior in many of these Melanesian societies, at least before

Christian missionaries and colonial governments suppressed it,

was the norm; it was normal in that context.

All males in these societies in New Guinea are expected to

participate in homosexual acts, but we cannot tell much about

gender variance because the intensive masculine initiation rites
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admit no gender nonconformity. Moreover, the universality of

bisexual behavior renders the concept of sexual variance inap-

plicable for those societies. Rather than divide society into het-

erosexuals and homosexuals, these people keep unity among
men by making every male follow the same mixture of eroti-

cism toward both men and women. 31

Azande Boy- Wives

Though other societies did not institutionalize man-boy sex to

the same degree as in New Guinea, there was (and still is, in

some cases) a strong man-boy sexual tradition in many cultures.

Among some Australian aboriginals it was not unusual for an

unmarried man to take a prepubescent boy as a "wife," with the

boy fulfilling this social and sexual role until after reaching pu-

berty. Likewise, among the Azande ofEast Africa a young adult

warrior was expected to take a boy as a "temporary wife" before

later marrying a woman. He even went through the formality

of paying a bride-price to the boy's family, while the boy did

domestic duties for the warrior. After reaching age twenty the

boy-wife would himself take a younger boy as a sexual and af-

fectional partner, and he would fulfill the warrior role himself.

Such a practice was the major means by which boys were so-

cialized to their later warrior role. It likely also insured a

smoother heterosexual marriage later on, after the male had

played both sides in the husband-wife routine. 32

Even for the married Azande men, boys were sometimes

brought into the family as pages, to be available sexually, espe-

cially during those times (such as preparing to consult oracles)

when heterosexual activity was forbidden. Though the culture

set the rule of boys as only auxiliary partners for married men,

a variation of individual preferences has been noted by an an-

thropologist who recognized that some men paid more atten-

tion to their boy partner than to their female wife. 33

MedievalJapan

Japan, especially during the Tokugawa period, before 1865, also

celebrated relationships between men and boys. Japanese my-
thology suggests that the great cultural hero Kobo Daishi,
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founder of the Shingon sect of Buddhism, first popularized ho-

mosexuality around the year 800. As with the all-male warrior-

hoods, groups of male Buddhist monks were known for hous-

ing boys in the Zen temples, and the passion aroused by these

boys is the subject of many love poems written during the

medieval times. Religious laws forbade monks to have sexual

relations with women, but did not proscribe other kinds of sex-

uality. As a consequence, the Portuguese Jesuit missionary Alas-

sandro Valiquano reported from Japan in the late 1500s that ho-

mosexual behavior was "regarded so lightly that both the boys

and the men who consort with them brag and talk about it

openly without trying to cover the matter up." The monks, he

wrote, not only considered their loves to be unsinful, but "even

something quite natural and virtuous." Though the missionaries

severely condemned homosexuality during the fifteenth and

sixteenth centuries, their tirades seemed to have little effect on

the Japanese. 34

In the military samurai class there also developed a tradition

of passionate and heroic devotion between male lovers. The
usual model was for the adult samurai warrior to court a boy,

and if the boy accepted, they would establish a patron-vassal tie.

The boy's parents would prepare their son for sexual relations

by having him relax with a special smooth wooden implement

gently inserted in his rectum. The boy would serve his samurai

lover as an aide in battle, and as personal secretary in times of

peace. The man, in turn, educated the boy to assume the high

samurai role upon maturity.

Similarly, in traditional China same-sex relations commonly
occurred on an age-gradient basis between master and servant

or between teacher and student. In Chinese history the most

notable incidents concerned the loving relationships some of the

emperors had with their male court favorites. Idealized love is

presented in the famed incident in which an emperor cut the

sleeve of his robe rather than disturb the sleep of his boy lover

who lay next to him. 35 There was no universal stage every male

would have to go through, as in New Guinea, but males with a

preference for male love were encouraged to take a boy as a

consort.
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Middle East

In general, many precolonial Arabic cultures also accepted male

homosexual behavior, mostly in the form of relations between

men and boys. Poetry and song celebrated the special erotic

attractions of boys. Anthropologists have probed the nature of

these formalized man-boy marriages, which existed among the

Berbers of the North African Siwah oasis area, for example, and

also more casual homosexual behavior in other Muslim areas. 36

One of the most notable forms of the institutionalization of

masculinity through male bonding was the Mamluk system of

government. Sultans would buy young boys as slaves, mostly

from nomadic tribes of eastern Turkey and the Caucasus, and

then raise them to be their loyal palace guards. In Egypt, and

also in various areas of Mesopotamia, these palace guards actu-

ally ran the government. In some cases they overthrew the sul-

tan and became the established power in name as well as in fact.

Having been raised in an all-male group, Mamluks did not

marry women. When a Mamluk reached adulthood his master

freed him, and he in turn would buy his own boy slave. This

boy became the servant, confidant, lover, and eventually heir to

the master who would free him upon his maturity. Mamluks
kept their power and influence over the generations by passing

down this heirship from man to boy. They are one of the world's

most notable examples of an all-male society, which continued

without heterosexual families, and they governed large areas of

the Middle East for centuries. 37

Partly due to knowledge of the Mamluks, European travelers

long associated man-boy sex with the Middle East and the

Turkish empire. They even noted the spread of "boy brides" to

Christian Albania under Muslim rule. It was from the Middle

East, after all, that the word bardaj originated. There, however,

it meant a boy who was a man's lover rather than the alternative

gender role the word berdache later came to signify among
American Indians. In 1850 the French writer Flaubert wrote to

a friend from the Turkish empire: "Since we are speaking of

bardaches, this is what I know of the matter. Here it is well

regarded. One owns up to sodomy and talks about it at lunch-

eon." 38
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Greece

The acceptance of masculinizing intergenerational male-male

eroticism in Middle Eastern culture was partly a heritage of the

ancient Greeks. Greece is the most famous example of the as-

sociation between masculinity and homoeroticism. Unfortu-

nately, when Greek homosexuality is discussed, it is usually pre-

sented as being a unique and strange aberration. Considering

the foregoing examples from other societies around the world,

however, what one realizes about the Greeks is how common
their sexual patterns were. As in the other cultures mentioned

above, it would not have been proper to continue a lover rela-

tionship after a youth matured. A pair might remain friends for

life, but each turned to new adolescents as erotic partners. In

this type of relationship, as is obvious in the many examples of

Greek homoerotic painting that celebrate the beauty of the male

body, it is the youth who chose to accept or reject the courting

of the man. Since this erotic relationship frequently provided

the basis for the boy's education, vocational training, and so-

cialization into adulthood it made for a system in which youth

had much more say in their own situation than pre-adults usu-

ally have. 39

This strong association between homoeroticism and education,

between sexuality and male training for adulthood, is a com-
mon factor in cultures that emphasize man-boy relationships.

Whether in association with New Guinea initiation rites,

Azande and Japanese warrior training, or Greek education, this

male nurturance was distinct from female child rearing. Perhaps

these cultures might recognize that some individuals would be

more or less homosexually inclined, but they would have re-

garded the monosexual exclusive homosexuals and exclusive

heterosexuals as odd. Same-sex relations were not only ac-

cepted, but celebrated. On the other hand, a man who did not

eventually marry a woman would be seen as neglecting his so-

cial duty. The male role, in both same-sex and other-sex rela-

tions, was cast in terms of the ideal of manhood. Homosexual
behavior did not threaten men's masculinity; it ensured it.

This brief survey shows that cultures can shape human vari-
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ation in extremely diverse ways. In examining American Indian

berdachism, and comparing it to other gender-variant institu-

tions around the world, we can see many similarities. Yet we
also see sharp contrasts to the masculinizing male bonding cul-

tures. Why do some societies institutionalize an alternative gen-

der as the socially acceptable form of homosexual expression,

while others institutionalize such a different man-boy hyper-

masculine pattern?

Perhaps there is still not enough factual data to suggest any-

thing more than a hypothesis, but a crucial factor seems to be a

culture's attitude toward women. While American Indian and

Melanesian societies, for example, are both gender-differ-

entiated and sex-segregated, American Indian men generally re-

spect women while Melanesian men generally distrust women.
If men fear women, and see femininity as pollution, then they

will likewise fear feminine character traits in males. They will

work to suppress androgyny, and to insure male unity in op-

position to women, by forcing all males to be masculine. Ho-
moeroticism is just one among many means for strengthening

these masculine bonds between the generations. In contrast, if

men value women then it is not considered bad if a male displays

some character traits more like those of a woman. Androgyny
is not suppressed, as it is in the hypermasculine societies, but

valued.

Yet despite their differences, alternative gender and hyper-

masculine societies end up with the same result: the unity of

men as a group. Unlike Western culture, which categorizes in-

dividuals into opposite dichotomies as heterosexuals and ho-

mosexuals, and in which males of each group often feel antag-

onistic toward the other, these other cultures avoid such

divisions.

Melanesians avoid separate homosexual and heterosexual

identities by pushing every male toward sexual involvement

with both males and females. While still perhaps allowing for

individual preference within those ideal boundaries, they dis-

courage monosexual extremes. In contrast, societies with an

alternative gender emphasize the difference of the berdache or

his equivalent to such an extent that he is no longer considered

a man. They focus on the high-status social role of the nonmas-
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culine male, rather than on sexual behavior, but they encourage

him to be sexual with men. A masculine person, whether he

has sex with a berdache or not, is still considered a man. There

is no separation of males into opposite groups of homosexuals

and heterosexuals; men's unity is preserved because same-sex

behavior is not a matter of great concern. Because the androg-

ynous male has a unique status outside masculinity, everyone's

position in the society is secured, without stigma and without

deviance.

WESTERN HISTORY AND GENDER VARIANCE

Being aware of the cross-cultural context may help us better

understand the changes in gender variance and sexual variance

in Western culture. In European and Euro-American history, we
can see three types of sexual variance, with two sharp changes

due to major repressive campaigns against sexuality in the thir-

teenth and the twentieth centuries. European culture had inher-

ited its first pattern from the ancient Greek type of man-boy
bonding. Despite the influence of Christianity, such ancient tra-

ditions of intergenerational male love survived into the medieval

era. But after about 1250, such traditions were ruthlessly sup-

pressed. "Sodomy," by which accusers of the time often meant

boy-love (since that was the most common form at the time),

was associated with the Islamic enemy and with heresy. 40

This suppression practically wiped out a cultural tradition,

leaving Europe without culturally acceptable forms of male-

male sexual behavior. While same-sex behavior no doubt con-

tinued to occur in private, or outside the bounds of established

society (as among the pirates), it was not to emerge in an insti-

tutionalized form until popularized by gender-bending enter-

tainment figures like the castrati and the drag queen. The cas-

trati emerged in new forms of popular culture, during a creative

period that was developing new styles of music and theater.

Vastly different from the man-boy pattern that had become so

tainted with heresy and so associated with the alien Muslims,

the castrati had emerged from two of the central institutions of

Europe: the church and the theater. What form of same-sex be-
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havior could be less threatening? Though more research is nec-

essary before definite conclusions can be reached, it is likely that

these roles helped to make an association of sexual variance and

gender variance in the mind of modern Europe and the Amer-
icas.

41

With such an association, eventually another era of suppres-

sion occurred in the twentieth century that was in many ways

quite like the Inquisition. In Europe, both the German Nazis

and the Russian Stalinists campaigned to eliminate everything

considered weak and effeminate among males. They destroyed

a flourishing homosexual rights movement and placed unnum-
bered thousands of homosexuals in concentration camps. 42

In

the United States, "sexual perversion" replaced anti-Semitism

and ethnic prejudice as a favored political scapegoat, especially

in the McCarthy witchhunts and the Eisenhower purges of the

1950s. Thousands lost their jobs, were jailed, or experienced

severe harassment from police and the Federal Bureau of Inves-

tigation.

The two derogatory images of homosexuality with which

American males have been bombarded in this century are "the

child molester" and "the sissy." It is not surprising that males

who are attracted to other males would react against these im-

ages. Prompted by this reaction, a third pattern of same-sex

relations emerged. Perhaps drawing some inspiration from the

male marriages on the frontier and the "buddy system" pairings

in the armed forces, this pattern became much more popular

during World War II. This new masculine erotic bonding was

different from the man-boy pattern and the gender-mixing pat-

tern which had earlier existed. The new image that emerged out

of World War II was the army buddy pair, masculine to the core,

and above age eighteen.

These adult homosexual relationships formed the basis for a

"gay" subculture, that largely rejected its cultural roots. Drag

queens, pedophiles, and youths below eighteen were shunted

aside both politically and socially as a masculine gay community
emerged in a number of American cities. With a focus on bars

where masculine adult men mixed among themselves, the older

forms of gender variance became distinctly second rate. In re-

action against the stereotypes, the witchhunts, and the purges,
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and also as a means of trying to make themselves respectable to

society at large, homophile organizations in the 1950s and 1960s

became politically active and began to call for an end to discrim-

ination on the basis of sexual orientation.

For a brief time in the late 1960s and the early 1970s, it seemed

that a gender-mixing aspect might reemerge in the new mili-

tancy of Gay Liberation. In 1969, the drag queens began a mas-

sive riot against police harassment, at the Stonewall bar in New
York's Greenwich Village. The radicalized era, in which social

standards (and especially gender standards) were being ques-

tioned by numerous groups of young women and men, pre-

sented an opportunity in which nonconformists could challenge

several conventions. But such radicalism was not to last. By the

late 1970s the mood was more conservative. Even as the gay

community grew stronger, it shifted its focus from Gay Liber-

ation (revolutionizing society) to Gay Rights (getting the same

rights as the majority). A new mood of masculinity took hold

among gay men, represented by the "clone" look: work clothes

and boots, short hair, and mustaches. There was little room for

nonconformists. 43

THEORETICAL PERSPECTIVES

The outline of modern gay history is beginning to be under-

stood, and we have come to realize that a gay subculture is of

fairly recent origin in Western history. Historians may be able

to trace a recognizable gay community, at least in London, to

the seventeenth century, but in North America such a sense of

community did not emerge until the nineteenth century. 44 This

community is a product of urbanization and a reaction against

stigmatization. Gay identity is just one form of social construc-

tion, one direction in which same-sex relations may be shaped.

With such wide variation of both homosexual and heterosexual

desire among many people, the Western view, that every person

is either a homosexual or a heterosexual, does not hold up under

cross-cultural analysis. Neither category makes much sense in

societies like Melanesia, where we cannot properly speak in

terms of gay and straight. Such societies demonstrate that there
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is quite a bit of difference between male-male sexual behavior

and a homosexual identity. The many variations in sexuality

worldwide are exploding our notion that humans are neatly cat-

egorized as homosexuals or heterosexuals. Institutions like the

berdache are leading us also to question the categories of men
and women.

Taking inspiration from the writings of Michel Foucault, a

group of historians and sociologists has emphasized that it is

inadequate to see sexuality as a biological constant. They rightly

point out that sexual identity is not set by nature as an essential

part of each individual, but that sexual desires, like other aspects

of human behavior, are largely influenced by the culture in

which a person happens to be born. 45 Yet, having said all that,

it is not improper to suggest that the current interpretation,

known as social constructionism, has gone too far.

Social constructionists postulate that culture is in total con-

trol, that individuals are basically blank slates upon which cul-

ture writes. While this degenerates to the old debate of nurture

versus nature, which biologists have largely abandoned, it ig-

nores the many biological, hormonal, environmental, cultural,

sociological, and psychological influences that combine in very

complex ways to shape human behavior. By looking only at the

discussion of the social establishment, social constructionists

examine history from the top down rather than from the bot-

tom up. If we are going to see a larger reality, we must also

recognize that individual character has a role in shaping culture,

in a person's accepting or rejecting certain options that the cul-

ture offers. If behavior is socially constructed, of what is it con-

structed? What is the substructure on which a culture inscribes

its variations?

Human behavior observed around the world does not exhibit

limitless variety; there are patterns and similarities that repeat

themselves beyond anything that can be explained by diffusion

from one society to another. Social scientists have been strug-

gling to understand these similarities for decades, and there are

no simple answers.

Because of the complexity of cross-cultural comparisons, the

certitude of social constructionists in proclaiming that no other

people before "the modern homosexual" had a similar identity
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seems foolhardy. 46 Such a view ignores folk traditions about

certain types of persons, called "fairies," "queers," and a myriad

other terms, in Europe and elsewhere. And in emphasizing the

discontinuities of a modern homosexual identity, social con-

structionists discount the implications from cross-cultural re-

search. Their view is quite ethnocentric, and in its focus on the

modern West blithely dismisses anything we might learn about

sexual variance and gender variance in other cultures. Sociolo-

gist Kenneth Plummer stated the constructionist view in its

most extreme form: "Why should one even begin to contem-

plate the notion that the berdache has anything at all to do with

homosexuality in our terms?" And Jeffrey Weeks suggests that

there is no "separate homosexual role" among American Indi-

ans because in those societies "There's no place for the homo-
sexual; it's actually a place for someone who just happens to be

a biological man who lives the life of a woman and becomes a

woman. . . . There are only men and women, quite straight-

forward." 47

As I established earlier, seeing the berdache as a woman is

inaccurate. Indian societies constructed an alternative gender,

and put their emphasis on the berdache's character and social

role rather than only on sexual behavior. This is certainly a so-

cial construction, and by that construction the men who had

sex with the berdache do not have a distinct identity from men
who didn't. Yet, the berdache does have an identity, which

seems much more a reflection of the individual's innate charac-

ter. And judging from the evolution of that identity from ber-

dache to gay, and contemporary Indian people's comparison of

the two roles, such folk definitions show a berdache identity to

be much more similar to a queen identity among nonmasculine

gay men than it is to an identity as a woman.
Social constructionists argue that a gay identity is unique in

history, that there was no such separate category of person be-

fore modern Europe. They suggest that a person who engaged

in the "sin of sodomy" had no identity as being different. Yet,

evidence suggests that a distinct identity did exist, and had

words that described it. Did a man who had a strong preference

for sex with another male not have an identity as a "sodomite"?

While the reference to Sodom, with its sense of doom, would
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hardly seem able to inspire anyone to a positive identity, the

meaning of that word to the participants in same-sex acts is still

unclear. Perhaps "sodomite" is not as different from "homosex-
ual" as we have been led to believe. Both terms were imposed
from external, professional elites, as stigmatizing terms.

By focusing on a derogatory word imposed by an antagonis-

tic establishment, we may be getting a distorted image of the

actual life identity of a person from the past. When we look

instead at terms used within the stigmatized group itself, we
find much more emphasis on character: a person in the subcul-

ture today is more likely to call themselves gay or even queen

than homosexual, and for the good reason that one's identity is

a product of more than sex alone. There are words in other

cultures which denote a different identity, with the Indian words
for berdache being examples.

When seventeenth-century Europeans used the word ber-

dache, or applied it to American Indians, they had a clear mean-
ing in mind. Such a meaning denoted both androgyny and sex-

ual involvement with other males. Since gender mixing was a

major component of same-sex behavior at the time, we can

hardly find fault with observers for associating the two. The
berdache certainly thought of themselves as different, and their

society agreed. This difference was at least partly associated

with sexual involvement with men. If we are going to consider

only the Western "modern homosexual" as a completely unique

identity and therefore the only proper object of focus, as social

constructionists have done, then such a definition will blind us

to a diversity of same-sex behaviors and identities.

How we see other cultures in the past has much to do with

our attitudes toward the future. If we study only the "modern
homosexual," what about those growing numbers of people

who dislike fitting their sexuality into either/or boxes of gay or

straight? Homosexual identity will surely change in the future.

The modern Western gay role has not been, or will be, the only

role which sees individuals as distinctly different on the basis of

same-sex attraction and androgynous character.

Today, in a world where peoples are interacting more inten-

sively, knowledge of this diversity—and recognition that the

"modern homosexual" and the "modern heterosexual" are not
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the pinnacle of evolution— is necessary both politically and so-

cially. The next frontier of research on both sexual and gender

variance is to understand the many varieties of identities and

roles. How they are different and alike is the question that will

enrich our understanding much more than the simple answers

that they are all the same or all different. They are both. The

interaction of continuity and change is at the base of the human
story, and any theory that ignores one of those elements is

faulty. The interaction of these aspects, and of the social with

the personal, is what is important. Their opposition is a false

dichotomy.

We can look to institutions like the berdache for new ways of

thinking about sexual variance, love between persons of the

same sex, and flexibility in gender roles. We can see from the

berdache that friendship is just as important a value as family,

and that such emotions and tendencies erotically expressed are

not unnatural. We can question whether a separated gay sub-

culture, a minority lifestyle built around sexual preferences, is

more preferable to integration of gender variance and same-sex

eroticism into the general family structure and the mainstream

society. We can use the American Indian concept of spirituality

to break out of the deviancy model, to reunite families, and to

offer special benefits to society as a whole. At the least, our

awareness of alternative attitudes and roles can allow us to ap-

preciate the diversity of the human population, and the similar-

ities that we share across the boundaries of culture.
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plate 2. Ancient Vicus ceramic sculpture, showing one male having anal

intercourse while the other holds his penis in his hand.

Private collection; photograph originally published in Federico Kauffmann Doig, Somporta-
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i' i a 113. Timucua berdaches transporting injured persons tor medical

treatment and deceased persons tor burial.
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Collection.

plate 4. Timucua berdaches working with women in carrying food.
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plate 5 . Spanish explorer Balboa orders Indians accused of sodomy to be

eaten alive by dogs.

Theodor de Bry engraving (1 594), based on an account by Girolamo Benzoin 111 the 1540s;

New York Public Library,' Rare Book Room, De Brv Collection.





plate 6. "Dance to the Berdache," a sketch drawn by George Catlin

the 1X30S while among the Sac and Fox Indians.

Printed in George Catlin, North American Indians; original sketch in National Museum of

American An, Smithsonian Institution. Washington, DC.

plate 7. Barebreasted Plains Indian woman hunting a buffalo.

Painted by Alfred Jacob Miller, 1837; Walters Art Gallery, Baltimore, Maryland.

plate 8. Shoshone woman roping a horse.

Painted by Alfred Jacob Miller, 1837; Walters Art Gallery. Baltimore. Maryland.



ihate 9. We-wha, Zuni
berdache, ca. [885.

National Anthropological Archives,

Smithsonian Institution, Washington,

D.C.

plate 10. A group of Zuni

Indians, females on the left,

males on the right, and the

berdache We-wha in the

middle, signifying the posi-

tion of the berdache between

women and men.
Southwest Museum. Los Angeles.

California.



plate ii. Zuni berdache

Wc-wha, who was known as a

skillful weaver, ca. 1885.

National Anthropological Archives,

Smithsonian Institution. Washington.
DC.

plate 12 (right). A Crow
berdache, probably Osh-Tisch

(Finds-Them-and-Kills-Them), ca

1900.

Museum of the American Indian. Heye

Foundation, New York City.

plate 12 (left). Tolowa berdache

shaman, also headman of his

village in northern California,

wearing insignia of his wealth, ca.

1910.

National Anthropological Archives.

Smithsonian Institution. Washington. DC.



plate 14. An Alaska Yupik berdache,

singing and drumming traditional songs,

at a social event sponsored by Gay Ameri-
can Indians, San Francisco, May 16, 1985.
Courtesy Gay American Indians.

plate i 5 . A member of
Gay American Indians looks

to the future.

Courtesy Gay American Indians.

plate i 6. Randy Burns,

co-founder of Gay American
Indians.

Photograph by Stephen Stewart.
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NOTE: The name for berdache in a particular native language, when
known, appears in italics in parentheses following the tribe's name. An In-

dian person's tribe is inserted in parentheses following her or his name.

Acoma Pueblo, 167, 185-86

Actors, berdaches as, 32-33

Adoption: of children by berdaches,

55-57. 112, 120, 194-95, 208; of

outsiders, 170, 244
Advocate (newspaper), 205, 213, 214
Africa, 260, 264, 3 1 in. 40

AIDS epidemic, 297m 20

Akwesasne Notes (newspaper), 191

Alcoholism, 57, 190, 207, 213-15,

241

Aleut (shopan or achnucek), 45-46,

254-55
Allen, Paula Gunn (Laguna Pueblo),

11, 187, 228, 243, 247, 248, 251

Allotment, 176

Amazon, 11, 78, 233-52; in child-

hood, 235; different from ber-

dache, 11, 233, 296n.35; defined,

234; distribution of, 30911.2; as

hunter, 235, 245; as warrior, 233,

234; 236, 245. See also Woman-
Woman marriage; Women

Amazon Basin, 233, 278n.io

American Indian Movement (AIM),

207, 218, 224
American Indians: contemporary,

207-29; interviewing of, 7; sur-

vival of traditions, 36-37, 196-

200, 222, 224-29; treaties with,

175-76. See also under Urban
areas

Androgyne, 51-53, 67-86, 75, 82,

84, 85, 191, 198, 212, 217, 219-

24, 226, 268-69; in Asia/Pacific,

252-60; among mestizos, 147-51;

among whites, 1 16-17, 125-26,

202-4, 285n.3i. See also Ber-

dache gender role; Gender; Inter-

mediate sex; Queen; Transsexual-

ism

Angelino, Henry, 79, 82, 123

Anthropological Research Group on

Homosexuality, 13, 205

Anthropologists, critique of, 5, 10,

n-13, 39, 74-75, 76, 94-95,

104-5, I2 3, 184-87, 191. See also

Fieldwork; specific anthropolo-

gists

Apache, 4, 39
Arapaho (haxu'xan or a-whok), 22,

190

Araucanian, 141

Art, homoerotic, 135-36

Arts and crafts. See Crafts

Assiniboine, 29, 38, 58

Australian aboriginals, 264

Azande, 264
Aztec, 148

Balboa, Vasco Nunez de, 137

Baldy, Jerry (Hupa), 42, 5on.23,

5^.32, 54
Beach, Frank, 204
"Beloved Women" (Allen), 248

Berdache character: changing to a
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gay identity, 208-24; changing to

a man, 25, 78; considered inborn,

25, 27, 49-52, 257, 273, 258n.29;

reflection of individual's innate

spirit, 21-30, 49, 76, 77, 85-86,

285n.29; as spiritual person, 32-

44, 63-64, 82, 127, 189, 191, 206,

217, 218, 220.

Berdache characteristics. See Actors;

Bravery of berdaches; Ceremo-
nies; Childhood; Children;

Cleanliness; Clothing; Cooking;
Crafts; Cross-cultural compari-

sons; Dances; Deviancy; Dispute

settlement; Dreaming; Family;

Flamboyance; Funeral rites; Gay;

Gender; Generosity; Gentleness;

Go-Between; Hairstyle; Hered-

ity; Hermaphrodite; Heterosexual

behavior; Homosexual; Humilia-

tion; Hunting; Husband; Incest

taboo; Initiation ceremony; Intel-

ligence; Joking; Kinship; Labor;

Luck; Marriage; Matchmakers;
Mediators; Medical curing;

Moon; Name; Peacemakers;

Prestige; Prophesy; Prosperity;

Prostitution; Puberty; Queen;
Religion; Ridicule; Schools; Se-

crecy; Shamans; Singing; Sister-

hood; Speech; Suicide; Sun
dance; Violence; Warfare; White
men; Women

Berdache, distribution of, 3-4
Berdache, female. See Amazon;

Women
Berdache gender role: as androgy-

nous, 22, 41, 51-53, 67-86, 75,

82, 84, 85, 191, 198, 212, 217-24:

226, 268-69; different from
women, 59, 67-70; similar to

women, 45-46, 49-51, 53, 221;

different from female gender var-

iance (See Amazon)
Berdache, Indian attitudes toward:

ambivalence, 41, 58, 108, 187-

92, 198; dangerous to interfere

with, 22-23, 3 8 - 41. 44. 73- 193.

225, 248, 254; negative attitudes,

4. 94- 95» 148, 187-92; pitied, 30;

protective of, 52, 63, 103-4, 167,

179-80, 183-87, 193. See also

Berdache character, as spiritual

person

Berdache, Le (Quebecois magazine),

206, 216

Berdache physical body: male body
of, 77, 166-67, 253; strength of,

62, 67-68, 98. See also Hermaph-
rodite

Berdache, white attitudes toward.

See Anthropologists, Canadian
government, Christianity,

French, Gay liberation move-
ment, Homophobia, Homosex-
ual partnerships, Psychiatry, Rid-

icule, Russians, Schools, Spanish,

United States government, White
men

Berdache (word): defined, 1-3, 9-

10, 11, 79-86, 127, 142; 274; de-

fined in native languages, 7, 18,

19, 28, 29, 40, 55, 74, 76, 78, 79,

81, 82, 83, no, 122, 142: 212,

217, 223, 224, 234; history of, 9-
10

Bible, 189, 3 15m 3 5

Bisexual flexibility, 91, 101-2, 105-

6, 108-9, 1 17-19, H9. 263, 267-

68, 272

Black Elk (Lakota), 38

Blackfoot, 166, 172, 239, 245
Blackwood, Evelyn, n, 233-34;

241, 249, 250, 292n.82

Bogoras, Waldemar, 252-54
Boy love. See Intergenerational rela-

tionships; Children

Bravery of berdaches, 38, 68-69.

See also Warfare

Broch, Harald, 102-6, 107

Buddhist monks, 264-65

Bureau of Indian Affairs. See United

States government
Burns, Randy (Paiute), 21-11, 227

California Indians, 26-27, 36, 46,

60, 77, 87, 1 10, 1 14. [38, 139,

167; female, 242, 30911.2

Callender, Charles, 82, 124,

29111.82, 296m 3 5
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Calling Eagle, Terry (Lakota), 6,

36-37, 56, 74-75, 85, 126-27,

193, 218

Cameron, Barbara (Lakota), 210-11

Canadian government suppression

ofberdaches, 180-81

Caribbean, 152-57
Carpenter, Edward, 202, 203

Castrati, 261, 269

Catlin, George, 107-8, 165-66

Ceremonies, berdaches as leaders of,

31-43, 258. See also Dances, Ini-

tiation ceremony
Cherokee, 4, 39, 53

Cheyenne (he man eh), 6, 32, 35, 69,

71, 73, 76, 84, 97, 190, 191, 194,

223

Childhood, berdaches during their,

42, 45-54, 59, 61, 63, 72, 99
Children: berdaches as adoptive par-

ents of, 55-57, 112, 120, 194-95,

208; berdaches as helpful to, 37-

38, 54-56, 62, 79, 161; freedom

of, 46, 89-90; sexual freedom of,

89-90. See also Family; Intergene-

ration al relationships

China, 265, 300n.11, 31 in. 40

Chinas, Beverly, 11, 59, 81, 120,

124, 142: 249-50
Chippewa (a-go-kwa), 31, 68-69,

no, 165, 167-68, 289m 13; fe-

male, 235

Choctaw, 225

Christianity: derogatory attitudes

toward homosexual behavior ot

berdaches, 39, 131-40, 181-83,

188-90, 192, 206, 225, 226, 258,

259, 269, 297n.20; Indian con-

verts to, 13, 187-90, 209-10,

213; missionaries to American In-

dians, 177, 181-83, 187, 195-96,

199; missionaries to Asia/Pacific,

255-56, 263, 265. See also French;

Russians; Spanish

Chukchi (yirka-la ul), 252-54
Chumash (joya), 139

Cleanliness, berdaches noted for, 50,

58, 62, 194, 221

Cleveland, Grover, 194

Clothing: ofberdaches, 24, 50, 58,

71-76, 81, 83, 102, 125, 146,

179-80, 183, 193-95, 2o8 , 2I 9>

221, 226, 227; of females, 240,

242, 245, 250. See also Transves-

tism

Clown society of the Pueblos, 113,

177-78

Cocopa female (warrhameh), 242

Comanche, 39, 48

Contrary, 7, 28

Cooking, berdaches noted for, 24,

36, 49, 50, 58, 103, 221

Cora, 141

Courts of Indian Offenses, 192—93.

See also United States govern-

ment
Cowboys, 157-59, 172-73

Crafts, berdaches noted for, 19, 51,

57-61, 208, 220, 222

Crazy Horse (Lakota), 38, 112

Cree (ayekkwew), 83

Creek Indians, 70, 172, 289m 22

Cross-cultural comparisons to ber-

daches, 1 16-17, 125-26, 252-61,

268-75

Crow (bade), 6, 50, 53, 58, 67, 68,

73, 77, 81, 96, 101, 113, 165,

178-80, 183, 185, 194, 197, 224;

female, 244-46

Dances, 188, 214; for berdaches, 24,

69-73, 84, 107-8, 145, 166, 177-

78, 199, 221, 223; for females,

236; in Polynesia, 258; Scalp

Dance, 69, 71, 84; Sun Dance,

36-37, 218. See also Saturnalia

orgy

Death. See Funeral rites

Devereux, George, 48, 89-90, 97-

98, 114-15, 123, 124, 184-85,

204, 239, 240
Deviancy, berdaches vis-a-vis, 20,

61-62, 269, 275
Disease, 138, 297n.20

Dispute settlement, role ofber-

daches in, 70-71. See also Go-
Between; Mediators

Dog Soldier, Pete (Lakota), 58, 70,

74
Double vision. See Prophesy
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Double Woman (Lakota moon
spirit), 19, 28-29, 39. 59- See also

Moon
Drama, berdaches noted for, 32-33

Dreaming, 25-30, 31, 48, 51, 220,

226, 234, 239. See also Prophesy;

Vision quest

Dress. See Clothing; Transvestism

Education. See Schools

Egalitarianism, 40, 288n.3

English, 152-54, 201, 202

Eskimo, 254-55. See also Aleut; Ko-
diak Island Eskimos

Europe: homophobia in, 131-34,

260; homosexuality in, 9-10,

261, 269-75. See also English;

French; Russians; Spanish

Family: berdache role in 44-64, 199,

208-9, 226, 257-58, 275; ber-

dache as spouse in, 112-20, 127;

berdachism running in certain

families, 45, 257; closeness of,

54-55, 57, 225; economic contri-

butions of berdache to, 54-64,

228; parents encouraging child to

become berdache, 44-47, 256,

257. See also Children; Luck;

Marriage

Female berdache. See Amazon;
Women

Fieldwork: gay and lesbian research-

ers and, 140-41, 187, 201, 248;

need for, 5-6, 7, 11, 83, 124, 140,

198, 250-51, 278n.4, 289n.22.

See also Anthropologists

Flamboyance, berdaches noted for,

75, 212

Flathead, 81, 238-39

Florida Indians, 36, 67-68, 73, no,
138, 171-72

Forgey, Donald, 48-49
Foucault, Michel, 272

Four Bears (Hidatsa), 38

French, 9; explorers and missionar-

ies, 10, 17, 44, 50, 65, 69, 73, 88,

182

Freudian psychoanalytic interpreta-

tion, 48-49, 53, 115

Friendship between men, 91-92
Frontier, homosexuality on the, 92,

152-75, 181, 302n.44. See also

White men
Funeral rites: berdaches officiate at,

36, 60, 68, 186; burial of ber-

daches, 63, 83, 84

Gabrielino, 46
Ganimede, 9
Gay American Indians (GAI), 14,

210-12, 227, 251

Gay guides, 12

Gay identity: compared to ber-

daches, 62, 126, 204-8, 212-15,

219-24; contrasted to berdaches,

54, 125, 143-44, 202, 209, 215-

19

Gay liberation movement, 201-7,

271

Gay people: advantages of, in doing

fieldwork, 14 10-41, 187,

3i4n.22; compared to modern
Indians, 207-8

Gay subculture, 151, 216, 270-71,

275, 302n.44

Gender: fluidity of, 45-47, 112, 243,

260; as social category rather than

fixed biological entity, 22

Gender concepts: alternative gender,

76-86, 273, 292m 82; gender

crossing, 76, 79-80, 234, 241-42,

292m 82; gender mixing, 76, 81-

86, 125, 292n.82. See also Andro-
gyne; Berdache gender role;

Queen; Transsexualism

Gender variance: acceptance of, as

powerful, 3; assigned by parents,

45-47; related to women's status,

66, 150-51, 188-89, 268; as unity

of women and men, 84. See also

Woman; Psychiatry

Generosity, berdaches noted for, 58,

79, 218

Gentleness, berdaches noted for, 48,

51, 82, 126. See also Dispute

settlement; Mediators

Germany, 201, 205, 270
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Go-Between (negotiator), 70-71,

84, 227-28

Government. See Canadian govern-

ment; United States government
Grant, Peter, 31, 167-68

Grant, Richard, 52, 90, 187^37
Greece, 9, 267
Greenberg, David, 40, 95
Grinnell, George B., 69, 177

Gros Ventres, 81, 244, 246

Guajiro, 58

Hairstyle, 74, 75, 100, 221

Haliwa-Saponi, 97
Hammond, William, 166-67, 185—

86

Hare Indians, 102-5

Hawaiians, 173-74, 222-23, 257. See

also Polynesia

Hay, Harry, 6, 199^74, 202-5, 209,

283n.38

Healing. See Medical curing; Sha-

mans
Hebrews, 315^35
Heredity; berdachism and, 45, 257
Hermaphrodite, 10, 21-22, 63, 77,

166-67, 202, 259, 290n.45

Heterosexual behavior of berdaches,

120-23, 208. See also Bisexual

flexibility; Homosexual behavior;

Sexuality

Hidatsa (miati), 29-30, 32, 38, 41,

79, 114, 119, 164, 178

Hijra. See India

Hill, Williard W., 61, 63-64, 75, 81,

102, 124, 183-84
Hirschfeld, Magnus, 201-2

Historians, critique of, 8

Hoboes, 155-56

Holder, Dr. A. B., 81, 178-79
Homesteaders, 161. See also Frontier

Homoerotic art, 135-36
Homophobia: among contemporary

Indians, 14, 40, 187-92, 228,

304n.29; among Europeans, 131-

34, 204, 270, 3i5n-35; among
Latin American mestizos, 147-51;

among scholars, 8, 12, 124, 184,

186, 304n.3i; among white

North Americans, 162-63, x 66,

178-84, 189, 3i5n.35; avoided by
Indians, 106-7, 225; reasons for,

133. 315H.35; as a reason for ho-

mosexuals to go to the frontier,

166-69. See also Christianity; En-
glish; French; Russians; Spanish

Homosexual behavior: boys raised

for 45-47; as casual and humor-
ous, 40, 89-93, XI 3; in Europe,

9-10, 132; on the frontier, 152-

75; in men's traveling work
group, 69, 102-6; spirituality

and, 31, 37, 88, 90. See also Ber-

dache; Christianity; Marriage;

Sodomy
Homosexual partnerships: between a

berdache and a man, 93-120,

121-26, 144-45, 256; between a

berdache and a white man, 169-

72; between a berdache and a

boy, 100; between two berdaches,

93~94, 97; between boys, 90-91,

99, 143-44; between two men,

91-93, 154, 156; reversal of sex

roles between a man and a ber-

dache, 96-97, 144-45; between
women (See Amazon; Woman-
Woman marriage, Women, sex-

uality of); between a man and a

boy (See Intergenerational rela-

tionships)

Homosexual techniques: anal inter-

course, 93, 97-99, 115, 159, 253,

262; documentation of, 162; mas-
turbation, 89, 159; oral-genital,

93, 96, 115, 159, 191, 256, 259,

262

Hopi, 52, 58, 90, 101, 177-78, 186-

87, 188, 221

Hudson's Bay Company, 68-69, 83

Huichol, 141

Human Relations Area Files, 12

Humiliation; berdache power to in-

flict, 108

Humor, sex as. See Joking
Hunting: berdaches' avoidance of,

57, 60; berdaches' participation

in, 69

Hupa, 42, 50, 51, 53, 97, 219, 222-

^3
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Husband of the bcrdache, 1 12-20,

125, 126, 127, 139, 145, 170, 185,

213-14, 253, 254. See also Bcr-

dache; Marriage; Masculine

bonding

Illinois, 10, 17, 50, 65, 73, 88

Incest taboo, 93-94. See also Kinship

India, 259-60
Indians. See American Indians; spe-

cific tribes

Indonesia, 260

Ingalik, 92-93. 235
Initiation ceremony: for amazons,

239, 240; for berdaches, 23-25,

26

Inquisition, 132-33, 270

Intelligence, berdaches noted for,

19-20, 22, 32, 55, 59, 62

Intergenerational relationships be-

tween men and boys, 99-100,

143-44, H7, 155-56, 173-74,

208, 213-14, 261-69; boy wife,

45-46, 90-91, 264, 266, 300n.11;

casual sexuality, 89-90, 91, 99-
100

Intermediate sex, 202, 203. See also

Androgyne; Gender concepts;

Hermaphrodite; Queen; Trans-

sexualism

Interviewing, problems of, 7, 8-9,

13, 32, 183-87

Inuit. See Eskimo
Iroquois, 4, 39, 48

Jacobs, Sue-Ellen, 5, 6, 82, 124: 205

Japan, 264-65, 3i5n.35

Joking: with berdaches, 103, 106-7,

145; with the husband of a ber-

dache, 1 13-14, 1 18-19; role of, in

Indian society, 39-41; about sex,

89, 93, 98, 113; with the wife of

an amazon, 241

Kachina, 18

Kamchadal, 254
Kamia, 18

Kama, 165

Karsch-Haack, Ferdinand, 201

Kasineli (Zuni), 73

Kaska, 92-93, 235

Katz, Jonathan, 5, 8, 163, 205

Kenny, Maurice (Mohawk), 191-92,

205, 228, 286n.5i

Kepner, Jim, 6, 203

Kinipai (Navajo), 61, 81, 183-84

Kinship, fictive, among berdaches,

81, 93-94, 223, 225, 29m. 75. See

also Family

Kiowa, 219, 308n.37

Klamath, 9, 25, 36, 41, 75, 118, 178,

184, 193; female, 242, 309m

2

Kochems, Lee, 82, 124: 29m. 82,

296m 3 5

Kodiak Island Eskimos (shopati or

achnucek), 45-46, 193-94, 254-55
Korea, 254, 3i2n.7

Koryak, 254
Kroeber, Alfred, 5, 22, 79, 97, 124,
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Kutchin female, 235

Kutenai {stammiya), 74; female, 236-
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Kwakiutl, 55, 76, 98, 101, 121, 123,

180-81

Labor: berdaches doing women's,

19, 28, 50, 57-60, 220, 287n.73;

division of, by gender, 111-12,

190, 244; men's migrant labor

groups, 105-6

Lache, 46, 87

Lafitau, Joseph Francois, 10, 17

Laguna Pueblo (mujerado), 166-67,
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Lakota (winkte): character of winkte,

49, 51, 53-58, 62, 69, 70, 71, 75,

76-77, 81, 84-85, 198, 216, 217,

218-19, 223-24; decline of

winkte, 182-83, 190-91; husband
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32, 34-38, 41-42, 44, 74; sexual

behavior of, 93, 96, 99, 101, 102,

no, 112, 113, 121-22; survival of

winkte, 186, 194-95, 210, 212-15;

Wakan Tanka, 20, 32, 86; women.

243
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1

Lame Deer (Lakota), 25, 28, 42, 75,

84, 198, 243; 28311.37

Landcs, Ruth, 12, 39, 55, 62, 94,

220

Lane, Erskine, 149-50

La Salic, 88, 165

Latin America, 7, 31, 47, 58, 87,

134-51, 197, 233, 27811.10. See

also Mexico; Spanish

Lcgg, W. Dorr, 6, 204

Lele'ks (Klamath), 25

Le Moyne de Morgues, Jacques, 36,

68,73
Lesbian identity, 246-51, 30on.24.

See also Woman-Woman mar-

riage; Women
Lewis and Clark expedition, 164

Literature, theme of male marriage

in, 169

Los Angeles, 202-5, 212, 214, 220,

223

Loud Hawk, Ronnie (Lakota), 76,

84-85, 210, 224
Luck, berdaches noted for, 38, 61,

64, 69, 114; female, 241

Luiseno, 46
Lumbee, 225, 30211.45

Lurie, Nancy O., 186

Mahu, 173, 223, 255-58. See also

Polynesia

Maidu (osa'pu), no
Male fringe societies, 152-75, 216-

17

Mamluk, 266. See also Middle East

Mandan (mihdacke) , 23, 29, 164

Maori, 257
Mapuche, 141

Maricopa, 57
Marquette, Jacques, 17, 65

Marriage: between a berdache and a

woman, 120-23, J 46; married

men having sex with berdaches,

100-102, 108; not sexually re-

strictive, 91, 144; polygamy, 100,

112, 1 18-19, 244; same rules ap-

plicable to berdaches, 95
Marriage between two males, 90-

91, 110-20, 127, 156-62, 185,

194-95, 215-16, 253, 264, 266,

270; in literature, 169; same rules

applicable to, as to heterosexual

marriage, 95. See also Homosex-
ual partnerships; Intergenera-

tional relationships; Woman-
Woman marriage

Masculine bonding, 91-92, 152-75,

261-69, 270
Masculinity, 47-48, 52, 66, 79, 154,

189-90, 197, 261-69, 271

Masturbation, 89, 159

Matchmakers, berdaches as, 71

Mattachine Society, 203-4
Maximilian, Prince Alexander, 23,

165

Maya, 6-7, 90-91, 135, 138, 142-48

Mead, Margaret, 12, 50, 72, 222

Means, Russell, 224
Mediators, berdaches as, 21, 41, 84,

190, 199, 227, 228. See also Dis-

pute settlement; Gentleness; Go-
Between

Medical curing, 33-36; berdaches

noted for, 35-36, 68, 69, 178,

253. See also Shamans
Medicine Crow, Joe (Crow), 179

Medicine person. See Shamans
Melanesia, 261-64, 278n.ro

Menstruation, 84, 234, 235, 239-40,

243-44
Mestizo, 141, 147-51

Mexico, 135-38, 141-51. See also

Aztec; Cora; Latin America;

Maya; Spanish; Zapotec

MicMac (geenumu gesallagee), 195-6,

227; female, 250-51

Middle East, 9, 131, 133-34, 260,

265-66

Minneapolis, 213-14

Missionaries. See Christianity

Mission Indians (coia, cuit,joya, or

uluqui , 114, 139. See also Califor-

nia Indians

Mohave (alyha), 23, 35, 48, 58, 89-

90, 96, 97-98, 106, 1 1 4-1 5, 118,

119, 184-85, 204, 229; female

(hwame), 239-42
Mohawk, 191-92, 228, 251

Moon as symbol for berdache, 19,

28-29, 30, 59, 189

Moors in Spain, 133-34
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Nadouessi, 65

Name: new, provided at initiation of

berdaches, 24; obscene nicknames

provided by berdaches, 107; sa-

cred, provided by berdaches, 37-

38, 107, 121, 218

Native Americans. See American In-

dians; specific tribes

Nature, Indian respect for, 30
Navajo (nadle): character of nadle,

35, 49, 53, 54, 63-64, 66, 70-71,

72, 81, 95, 126, 180; creation

story, 19-20, 211; female, 78,

234; 251; hermaphrodites, 77-78;

nadle decline, 183-84, 191, 210;

nadle survival, 195, 199, 225;

prosperity, 60-61, 63-64; sexual-

ity of, 91, 102, 121, 122

New Guinea, 261-64

Nez Perce, 81

Nisqually, 196

Ojibwa. See Chippewa
Omaha (mexoga), 6, 29, 30, 40, 45,

54, 70, 71-74, 78, no, 123, 197,

198, 222, 223

Oman, 260

One Feather, Michael (Lakota), 42,

45"-5, 75, 212-15, 225-26

One Institute of Homophile Studies,

6, 203-4; magazine of, 106

Orgy. See Saturnalia orgy
Osage, 68, 168-69, 182

Osh-Tish, or Finds Them and Kills

Them (Crow), 68, 73, 77, 81,

179-80, 183, 224
Overland Monthly. See Powers, Ste-

phen; Stoddard, Charles Warren
Oviedo, Fernandez de, 87, 135-36

Pahe, Erna (Navajo), 251

Panama, 135, 137

Pan-Indianism, 208. See also Ameri-
can Indian Movement; American
Indians; under Urban areas

Papago, 18, 24, 25, 50, 58, 88-89,

107, 108, 122, 166, 181, 198, 208;

female, 234
Parsons, Elsie Clews, 12, 50, 52, 73,

73, 185, 198

Pawnee, 29
Peacemakers, berdaches as, 48, 51,

82, 126. See also Gentleness; Go-
Between; Mediators

Pedophilia. See Intergenerational re-

lationships

Persecution of homosexuals, 31,

131-41, 154, 162-63. See also

Homophobia
Peru, 31, 135, 136, 139
Philippines, 260, 3i3n. 12

Pima (wi-kovat), 4, 18, 39
Pirates, 153-57
Polygyny. See Marriage

Polynesia, 173-74, 222-23, 255-58
Porno (dass), 26-27, 55, 170,

302n.47

Population: procreative values, 133,

3i5n.35; decline of (See Disease)

Potawatomi, 37, 55, 62, 67, 220-21

Powers, Stephen, 26-27, 77, 167

Prestige, berdaches' striving for, 60-

62

Prisoners, homosexual behavior

among, 156

Prophesy; berdaches noted for, 41-

43, 204, 220, 226; among fe-

males, 236-38
Prosperity; berdache bringing, to

family, 45-46, 60-61, 63-64,

107, 114, 221, 287m 73; among
females, 240

Prostitution, 213, 240, 259
Psychiatry, gender variance as

viewed by, 48-49, 53, 61-62,

115, 184-85. 221-22

Puberty, berdache status assumed at,

23, 25, 253
Pueblo Indians, 46-47, 49-50, 66,

82, 101, 113, 185-86, 197, 203-5,

209. See also Acoma Pueblos;

Hopi; Laguna Pueblo; Tewa
Pueblo; Zuni

Quebec. See Berdache, Le
Queen, 52, 125-26, 150-51, 213,

217, 223, 261, 269, 270, 273. See

also Androgyne
Quinault (keknatsa'nxwix), no
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Read, Kenneth, 12-13

Religion, American Indian, 17-44;

creation stories, 18-20, 22, 188-

89; dreams, 25-30; spiritual es-

sence of everything, 21-22, 56,

63, 64, 85-86, 248; spirituality of

berdache, 21-30, 32-44, 49, 76,

77, 82, 85-86, 126, 206; survival

of, 196-200; weakening of, 141—

42, 187-92. See also under Ber-

dache character; Shamans; Vision

quest

Ridicule: of berdaches by Indians,

39-41; of berdaches by whites,

178-83, 189; use of, among Indi-

ans generally, 30

Russians, 45, 193, 252-55, 270,

3i5n.35

Sahaykwisa (Mohave), 240-42
Sailors, 153-57, 159, 255-56,

300n.11

Samoa (fafafitii), 257
Sandpiper, Joseph (Micmac), 227

San Francisco, 210-11, 219, 222, 227

Santee (winkta), 39-40, 94-95
Saturnalia orgy, 107, 167, 186

Sauk and Fox (i-coo-coo-a), 107-8,

166

Schools: berdaches as teachers in,

55, 199; repression of berdaches

in, 51, 180, 182, 199; sexual ac-

tivity in, 99; teaching about ber-

daches, 213

Secrecy: due to magical qualities of

berdaches, 32; to protect ber-

daches, 13-14, 183-87, 195; to

protect Indian culture, 190, 211

Seminole, 70, 227, 289n.22

Sexuality, Indian attitudes toward,

88-91, 177-79, 187-93, 211,

246-47. See also Bisexual flexibil-

ity; Heterosexual behavior; Ho-
mosexual

Shamans, 23, 27-28, 33-36, 56, 187,

196, 217, 226; berdaches as, 35-

36, 41, 141, 178, 192-93, 252-55,

260; women as, 35, 62, 141, 238-

39, 240. See also Religion

Shedd, Charles, 79, 82, 123

Shining Evening (Fapago), 58

Shoshoni (ma ai 'pots), 81, 100

Siberia, 252-55
Singing, berdaches noted for, 53,

260

Sioux. See Lakota

Sisterhood, berdaches' Active, 81,

94, 223, 29m. 75
Sitting Bull (Lakota), 38, 225

Social constructionism, 271-75,

302n.44

Social position, each Indian individ-

ual valued for holding, 57
Sodomy, 9-10, 132-35, 137, 154,

162-63, 269. See also Homosex-
ual

Spanish, 9, 132-40; killing ber-

daches, 137, 171; punishing ber-

daches, 31, 139, 171; reporting

berdaches, 46, 67, 87, no. See

also Latin America
Speech, berdaches' use of feminine

forms of, 30, 52-53, 84

Spier, Leslie, 184

Spirituality. See under Berdache

character; under Homosexual be-

havior; Religion; Shamans; Vi-

sion quest

Stevenson, Matilda Coxe, 12, 32,

57-58, 62-63, 77, 83, 114, 185,

194,

Stewart, Omer, 92, 100, 204-5,

304n.29

Stoddard, Charles Warren, 173-74

Suicide, 57, 181, 182, 207, 211

Sun dance, 36-37, 218

Tahiti, 255-58. See also Polynesia

Tanner, John, 168

Teachers. See Schools

Tewa Pueblo (kwih-doh or quetho),

46-47, 49-50, 82, 203, 205.

Thayer, James, 123

Timucua, 36, 68, 73, no, 138

Tixier, Victor, 68, 168-69

ToIowa, 60

Transsexualism, 76, 79-80, 1 16-17,

125

Transvestism, 71-76, 116, 193-94,

219, 260, 261. See also Clothing



344 I INDEX

Treaties, 175-76
Tupinamba females, 233

Turkey, 266

Ulrichs, Karl, 202

Underhill, Ruth, 12, 24, 88-89, 107,

124, 198

United States government: attack on
Indian sexuality, 77, 177-78,

192-93, 211; policies toward In-

dians, 175-77, 179; resistance to,

by Indians, 195; suppression of

berdaches, 178-80, 182

Urban areas: gay people in, 270-71,

30m. 44; Indians in, 197, 202-12,

213-15

Vietnam, 260

Violence toward berdaches, absence

of, 22-23, 38, 41, 147, 222

Vision quest, 27-30, 37, 85, 188,

218. See also Dreaming; Prophesy

Wakati Tanka. See Lakota

Warfare; berdaches' avoidance of,

57, 60; berdaches' bravery in, 68-

69; berdaches' role in, 35

Washo, 202

Wasting people. See Social position

Wealth. See Prosperity

Westermarck, Edward, 201, 203,

204

We'wha (Zuni), 32, 58, 62-63, 73,

83, 194, 290m 37
White Cindy (Klamath), 9, 41, 75,

178

White Cloud, Vincent (Lakota), 84

Whitehead, Harriet, 79, 124, 125,

287m 73, 288n.5, 292n.82

White men on the frontier: ber-

daches attracted to, 169-72; in-

teractions with amazons, 236-38,

245-46; interactions with ber-

daches, 92, 152, 164-72, 194-95;

ridiculing of berdaches, 178-83,

189

"Winkte" (Kenny) 228-29.

Winkte. See Lakota

Winnebago (siange), 29, 42, 58, no,
186, 1 89-,

Woman Chief (Crow), 244-46
Woman-Woman marriage, 233, 234;

236-37, 240, 242, 246-51

Women, gender variance among.
See Amazon; Gender

Women, high status of, 19, 52, 65-

67, 188-89, 268; decline due to

Western influence, 150, 189; in

religion, 21, 236; status of ber-

daches related to, 66, 150-51,

188-89, 268. See also Menstrua-

tion; Shamans
Women in relations with berdaches,

42, 48-49, 52, 54, 58-59, 82,

120-23, 146, 167, 256, 268; dif-

ferences between women and

berdaches, 59, 67-70
Women, sexuality of, 114; homo-

sexuality, 92, 235, 236, 241, 246-

51, 300n.24

Women's work. See under Labor

Woman warriors, 233, 234; 236,

243-46
World War II: impact on Indians,

190, 197, 207; impact on gay

people, 270

Wovoka (Paiute), 202

Yaqui, 26, 51-52, 220

Yellow Head (Chippewa), 68-

69m 13, 168, 289m 1

3

Yellowtail, Thomas (Crow), 183

Yokuts (tongochim or tunosim), 27,

36, 60, 186

Yucatan. See Maya
Yuki (i-wa-musp), 26-27, 55, 77
Yuma (elxd or marica), 24, 25-26,

57, 92, no, 126, 138, 166, 184;

female (kwe'rhame), 234
Yurok (wergern), 36, 57
Yuwipi (Lakota curing ceremony),

34-35, 218

Zapotec (ira' muxe), 49, 59, 70, 75,

81-82, 91, 119-20, 142; female

(marimacha), 249-50
Zoque, 140-41

Zuni (lhamana), 32, 50, 57-58, 67,

70, 72, 77, 83, 100, 114, 185,

194, 198; creation story, 18, 22
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