
can nue rom page

Lot Price Lot Price Lot Price Lot Price Lot Price Lot Price

400 .25
~

.50 If.78 .60 517 no bid 556 1.@5 595 no bid
401 .10 .60 '+79 .85 518 .70 557 1. 0 596 " "402 .25 441 .20 480 .90 519 . 25 558 .60 597 " "
~~

.10 442 .10 481 '+.25 520 no bid 559 . 45 598 " ".10
~

.40 482 If..25 521 .75 560 . 85 599 . 35
405 .10 .55 ~~

.90 522 1.70 561 .40 600 .50
406 .45 445 .60 1.10 52~ .25 562 3.75 601 no bid
407 .75 446 .85 485 If..25 52 .40 56~ .60 602 . 40
408 .45 447 . 50 486 .70 525 no bid 56 .55 60~ no bid
409 .15 448 .60 487 .75 526 1.25 565 ·35 60 II II

410 .10 449 .10 488 .70 527 .~O 566 2-30 605 " u

411 1.10 450 .45 489 1030 528 • 5 567 5.50 606 . 80
412 .55 451 .40 490 1030 529 .25 568 10. 00 607 1.25
'+1~ . 90 452 .45 '+91 1.30 530 1.10 569 1.60 608 no bid
41 no bid 45~ .45 - '+92 1.30 531 .70 570 2. 25 609 n "
415 .80 45 -35 49~ 5.35 532 2.95 571 2.25 610 u "416 2.50 455 2030 If.9 2.75 53~ 1.10 572 '+. 00 611 . 55
41t no bid 456 .60 '+95 4.50 53 .85 57~ .55 612 no bid
41 .20 '+57 .20 496 12.50 535 .50 57 no bid 61~ " "
419 .75 458 .45 497 1.00 536 2.60 575 no bid 61 1.70
'+20 .10 459 .10 498 .90 537 .65 576 . '+5 615 1.15
421 .45 460 .55 499 .90 538 . 45 577 no bid 616 .50
422 2.50 461 .55 500 . 90

~
1.10 578 . 40 61t 1.35

42~ .55 462 .60 501 .90 2.25 579 no bid 61 .55
42 .80 463 .70 502 .90 541 1.00 580 .50 619 .55
425 .20 46'+ .40 50~ 2.25 542 no bid 581 no bid 620 .95
426 .40 465 2.20 50 32.50 ~ . 50 582 " " 621 .~427 .10 466 1.75 505 no bid .70 58~ u " 622 3·
428 .60 467 .55 506 .40 545 .75 58 " " 62~ . 30
'+29 2.50 468 .60 50t 1.00 546 no bid 585 " " 62 .40
430 1.60 469 1.10 50 .'+5

~
.50 586 .35 625 .95

431 2.25 470 .40 509 .35 .55 587 no bid 626 .65
432 .40 471 .60 510 .55 549 3.20 588 " n 627 ·35
43~ no bid 472 .55 511 2.20 550 3.40 589 .30 628 .40
'+3 .40 If.7~ .75 512 2.25 551 1.25 590 .60 629 .35
'+35 no bid If.7 .~o 51~ .55 552 .65 591 .40 630 .35
436 .30 '+75 • 0 51 1.70

~~
.50 592 no bid 631 035

437 .55 476 2.50 515 1.70 1.15 59~ " " 632 1.60
438 no bid 477 .90 516 no bid 555 1.00 59 " " end of sale
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PERFIN COVER
OF THE MONTH

Shownat left is the
"FIRST DAY OF PER­
FIN" cover of the
American Philatelic
Society,marking the
start of the Soci­
ety's useof its new
"APS" Perfin. The
Perfin pattern is
shown below•
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