
5 & 6/80/Page 1 
 

SECURITY ENDORSEMENT & PERFIN SOCIETY OF G.B.  
(Affiliated to the B.P.F.) 

 
May/June 1980 No.187        Subscription £2 per annum. 
PRESIDENT :   J. Nelson       69, Aperfield Road, Biggin Hill, 

Westerham, Kent 
SECRETARY/)   J. Rucklidge   13, Moncrieffe Road, 
TREASURER )                  Sheffield, S7 1HQ. 
CAT. EDITOR   B. Tomkins    25, Beccles Road, Thurlton, Norwich. 
LIBRARIAN/ )  B. Birch     16, Redwood, Shevington, 
PACKET SUP.)                Wigan, WN6 8DG 
BULLETIN)   R. Bowman     "Gwel Marten", Beechfield, Frilsham, 
EDITOR )                Newbury, Berks, RG16 9XF. 

 
NEW MEMBERS 

Since our last issue went to press we have had a further seven 
members join the Society and we are pleased to welcome the 
following. 

Mr T.A. Edwards  23, Foxfield Close, Northwood, Middx. 
Mr W. Garnett    Barn Cottage, Main Street, Wilson, Nr. Melbourne  

Derby, DE7 lAD, 
Mr T.G. Maynard  15, Grovefields Avenue, Frimley, Surrey. 
Mr R.A, Putnam   125, Charlton Road, Harrow, Middx, HA3 9HR. 
Mr B. Schneider  19, Easenby Avenue, Kirke11a, Hull, 

North Humberside. 
Mr R. Trower   48, Clivedale Road, Woodley, Berks 
Mr L.L. Wassell  Barnside, The Lane, Chilton, Didcot, 

Oxon, OX11 OSE. 
 

ADDRESS CORRECTION 
In our January/February we gave Mr F.W.H. Hewitt's  

address as 13 Abercynon Road.  The house number_should be 193. Our 
apologies for this error. 
 
SUBSCRIPTIONS 

Inflation is hitting the Society just as hard as everyone else 
and with the recent increase in postal charges, our expenditure 
is rapidly overtaking our income.  An increase will be inevitable  
in September but we are hoping to hold the new rates to £2.50  
per year, with an additional supplement of £2.00 (i.e. a total of  
£4.50) for those members wishing to have their Bulletins sent by 
airmail. Incidently, as far as possible air mail postings are  
franked with the recent commemorative issues of which we have 5 
or 6 a year. 
 
MEMBERSHIP LIST 

A new membership List is under preparation by Michael Rucklidge 
and it has been suggested that we include members' telephone  
numbers. We already have a few numbers on file but we wi11 not,  
of course, publish these without permission in case there is some  
reason for them being kept confidential. If anyone, would like  
their numbers added to the list would they please let Michael have 
details?
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S.E.P.S. SPRING AUCTION 
The Spring Auction went off successfully with 130 of the 140 

lots on offer being sold. The highest price realised was £16.10  
for a lot of 392 Edward Vll perfins, although the top bidder would  
have gone much higher for them. Some quite staggering bids on  
other lots, especially non G.B. items, shows the continuing trend 
of demand far exceeding the supply of material. 

Nevertheless, about 75% of the bidders received at least one 
lot, so on average most people should be happy - especially the  
vendors. If you wish to join their "happy band" there is still  
time to submit lots for the July Auction (lots by end of June at 
latest). There is already a fine array of material in hand but  
more is welcome 

Peter Day  P. O. Box 29, Bognor Regis,  
West Sussex, PO21 5UH. 

Prices Realised 
Lot  £    Lot   £   Lot   £   Lot   £   Lot   £ 
1   10.00  29  2.17  57  2.60   85  0.50  113  0.55 
2   10.00  30  1.10  58  0.45   86  0.45  114  0.55 
3    2.10  31  1.00  59  0.90   87 no bid  115  0.55 

  1.15  32  1.00  60  0.75   88 no bid  116  0.75 
5    1.35  33  3.00  61  1.50   89  0.45  117  0.65 
6    0.60  34   11.60  62  1.00   90 no bid  118  0.40 
7   0.10  35  1.60  63  1.00   91  0.25  119  0.60 
8  no bid  36  2,10  64  2.00   92 no bid  120  1.80 
9    0.40  37  2.10  65  0.55   93  0.55  121  3.10 
10   0.35  38  2.00  66  0.25   94 no bid  122  1.60 
11   0.30  39  2.50  67  0.70   95 no bid  123  2.35 
12  0.40  40  no bid  68  1.40   96  8.10  124 _ l.35 
13   0.25  41   3.60  69   0.55   97 no bld  125  1.35 
14   0.25  42   0.80  70   1.50   98  2.10  126  1.70 
15  0.25  43  1.20  71  0.75   99  0.75  127  0.60 
16  0.35  44  1.90  72  0.85  100  0.90  128  1.60 
17  0.45  45  1.60  73  2.35  101  1.60  129  1.25 
18  0.80  46   16.10  74  2.10  102  0.85  130  0.35 
19  0.70  47  0.55  75  2.10  103  0.85  131  0.75 
20  1.20  48  0.30  76  1.45  101  1.30  132  3.00 
21  1.60  49  0,30  77  3.10  105  2.90  133  2.85 
22  5.00  50  0.75  78  1.10  106  2.10  131  0.75 
23  3.10  51  0.55  71  1.00  107  0.40  135  4.35 
24  1.00  52  5.10  80  2.10  106  0.40  136  2.10 
25  0.85  53  2.10  81  8.25  109  1.10  137  6.35 
26  2.10  54  1.10  82 no bid   110  0.60  138  2.10 
27  1.10  55  1.25  83  5.10  111  1.85  139  4.10 
28  1.10  56  6.00  84  0.55  112  0.55  140  2.50 
 

Sale Total £247.25 
 
PERFIN TALKS 

The Coventry Philatelic Society has asked if wo have a member 
willing to give atalk on perfins at one of their society evenings.  
If there is some willing member within easy reach of Coventry  
would they please lot Michael Rucklidge know? Expenses are usually 
covered by societies visited and no doubt Coventry P.S. will be no  
exception. 

If there are other members willing to give similar talks in 
their own area perhaps they would let Michael have their names also  
for future reference.

4 
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WHO KNOWS THE ANSWER? 
We have received the following plea from Jack Brandt in Canada, 

" A few months back I obtained two Great Britain perfin covers,  
one with an AB perfin and the other with an AS perfin. 

Details are: 
1.  To: A. van der Valk Esq., Santiago, Chile, 

From. The Anglo South American Bank Limited.  
(embossed on flap) 

Cancel: London 14 February 1933. 
Stamps: K.G.V. 1924-26 2 x 1/-, 1 x 3d - all 

unperfinned and 1 x 6d (S.G. 426a) 
with perfin as shown but inverted. 

Sent:  By airmail, Santiago receipt cancel of 3 March 1933. 
 
2.  To: as above. 

From: as above, with London address, all on brown tape used to  
seal the envelope. 

Cancel: London 14 February 1933. 
Stamps: K.G.V. 1924-26 1_x ld with no perfin  

and 1 x 6d (S.G. 426a) with AS perfin  
as shown but inverted. 

Sent:  By registered surface mail, Santiago  
receipt cancel of 13 March 1933. 

 
Now comes the question - why on letters to the same person,  

from the same company, on the same stamp, and the only perfinned  
stamp on each cover, were there two different perfin types?  
Neither type is listed either in the McKee_Tomkins, list or the  
old Van Lint listing. 

I have been thinking for some time now, and have not come up  
with an answer. However, recently I acquired a Spanish cover with  
the perfin A.S./A.B., and the user identified as The Anglo-South 
American Bank Limited, with a Barcelona address. In the G.B.  
issues the AS and AB both sort of fit the user, but not as well 
as the Spanish type. So, I am wondering is it at all possible that 
machine perforating the G.B. issues punched different letters on 
different stamps? Such a practice is definitely known for perfins  
of the U.S.A., but I have not heard it for G.B. Who knows the  
answer, and will share it with us?" 
 
THE LIBRARY 

A plea from Brian Birch, 
"My list of items for sale in the last Bulletin proved very  

popular but I managed to satisfy most of the requests. 
Now I would like to request help in obtaining a couple of  

items I need for the Library. If any member has either of the  
following to donate to the Library or for sale, plcase get in  
touch with me. 

 
S.E.P.S. Identities Catalogue 1965 pages A - H 
Catalogue of French perfins by Col. Lebland - lst listing  
 

Brian Birch. 
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SALES PACKET 
The operation of the Sales Packet has gradually deteriorated  

over the past few years and I feel that a few notes on the causes  
of the deterioration, and the steps being taken to put it right  
are needed. 

Firstly, the previous 3 years have been very bad for me from 
a philatelic point of view; I got married; moved house; changed my  
job; and moved house yet again. This caused extreme disruption in  
my philatelic activities which are only now getting straightened  
out. It has also caused me to have two current addresses :- 24,  
Calder Drive, Maghull, Liverpool, L31 9DS (this is my parents'  
address which I continue to use for bulky items since they have a 
convenient porch for the postman to leave packets in) and 16,  
Redwood, Shevington, Wigan, WNG 8DG. (this is my home address).  
Either address will do, but for bulky items which might not fit  
through a standard letter box, use 24, Calder Drive. 

The second problem was the loss of a packet last year,  
addressed to Mr S. Butler of Wrexham. He is no longer at his old  
address and my enquiries have failed to locate either him or the  
packet. To minimise such losses in the future, all Packets must  
be sent by recorded delivery, must bear no indication of contents,  
and have my address on the back. Hopefully then, if a Packet is 
presented to an out of date address, it will be refused and  
returned to me. Obviously, there is no need to return packets to  
me by recorded delivery, just obtain a certificate of posting. 

The final problem is one of slow circulation. Please make  
every effort to pass packets on within 2 days of receipt (Sundays 
excepted). Packet R, sent out in the first week of January has 
averaged 1 week per person on the circulation list.  In future,  
packets will be identified by the month they went into circulation 
(rather than by letter) so that evryone can see whether they have  
been delayed. 

To provide a worthwhile service I intend to send out one  
packet each month. There is enough material on hand to see me up 
to the June packet. If you wish to see more packets each year,  
start making up some booklets now. 
 
Packet Q  This packet has been lost. The member to whom it was 

sent has moved and has now been dropped from the 
Society. All members owning booklets in this packet have been paid  
in full. The Society lost approximately £30. 
 
Packet S  Packet S was put into circulation in February and 

contains books to the value of £73,41. 
 
Packet T This went out in April and contained 18 booklets to  
  the value of £146.80. 
 
April Packet  This was not sent out until the first week in May  

and had 12 booklets with. a total value of £106,36. 
 

Brian Birch 
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PERFINS ABSTRACTS      January, 1980 
 
0503  continued 

During the Second World War, Thomas Cook & Son Ltd.,  
were authorised to provide a forwarding service for letters  
to enemy territory. Initially, the service was run through  
various P.O. Boxes in Amsterdam but after the fall of the  
Netherlands, the facility was rearranged using Box 506 in  
Lisbon. The procedure used to transmit letters to and from  
enemy territory explains why some covers, apparently  
unconnected with Thomas Cook & Son bear their perfin. 
 
0504  Agricultural & General Engineers Limited  

Burrows, M.J. 
S.E.P.S. Bull., July/Aug. 1979, (182), 4-6 
Agricultural and General Lngineers Ltd., was  

established in 1919 with the intention of providing a single  
marketing body for fourteen companies engaged in the  
agricultural engineering field. Of the companies involved  
in this conglomerate, four are known to have used perfins:  
Aveling & Porter Ltd. (A & P); E.H. Bentall & Co. Ltd. 
(EH/B/& Co); Bradford & Perkins Ltd. (B&F/P) and Richard  
Garret & Sons Ltd. (R.G.)  The perfin J&IFH has been 
tentatively identified with James Frederick Howard Ltd. 
 
0505  Dienstmarken II Fur die Bundesverwaltung (Official  

stamps II for the federal administration)  
Katalog Schweiz/Liechtenstein und Campione 1969.  
Zumstein & Cie., Bern, 1968, pp. 142-145  
Translation: S.E.P.S. T 25, pp.6 
From 1935 to 1938 Swiss official stamps were perfinned 

with a cross. Subsequently, an overprinted cross was used 
to distinguish official stamps.  All of the stamps which 
were perforated with a cross are listed and priced. 
 
0506  Perforations from the Moscow postal department on  

stamps from pre-revolutionary Russia  
Mazur, P. 
Fi1at. SSSR, 1973, (5) , vii-viii 
Translation: S.E.P.S. TRANS. 27, pp.6 
To prevent the re-use of high value postage stamps 

on certain transit documents, the Russian department of 
posts and telegraphs instituted in 1908 secondary cancellation  
by perforation within the Moscow postal district. Details  
of the 48 Moscow postal districts which are known to have  
used a perforated cancel are given. 
 
0507  Perfins odds'n ends 

Roy, R. 
Perf. Bull., Apr. 1979, 32, (4), 2 
Perfins can have intrinsic interest as well as  

interest concerned with the user. Examples given include  
a perfin on a very high face value stamp, the largest and  
smallest perfin area/stamp area ratios; a pair of stamps  
one with and one -,Without a perfin and a mirror image pair  
of perfins on the one stamp. 
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0508  Canadian users who remain unidentified  
Dicketts, M. 
Perf. Bull., Apr. 1979, 32, (4), 3-4 
Although Canada has relatively few perfins and these  

have been catalogued since 1955, there are still a few  
whose user is unknown. In an effort to identify the  
remaining perfins, seventeen are illustrated together with  
all the information known about them. 
 
0509  A note on British affixer perfin  

Burrows M.J. 
Perf. Bull., Apr. 1979, 32, (4), 4 
A number of coil testing labels perfinned DH/E are  

illustrated. The stamps appear to have been used to  
demonstrate an automatic stamp affixing machine of the  
Poko type, which simultaneously perfinned, moistened and  
applied stamps directly to envelopes. 
 
0510  Discover a "new world": revenue perfins. Part 2  

Richerson, W.D. 
Perf. Bull., Apr. 1979, 32, (4), 5-6 
Certificates of sale of stock, which are the original  

source of very many revenue perfins are the equivalent of  
perfin covers with return addresses as they always bear the  
user's name. Additionally, being printed in large quantities  
in advance of use, they are usually overprinted when the 
company’s name changes and thus trace that company’s  
developments.  A great many of the perforations on  
revenue stamps include numbers which indicate the date.  
These are invariably perforated cancellations which can 
often be found together with a normal perfin on the same 
stamp, Punched letters and initials are also frequently  
encountered on revenues. 
 
0511 It might explain  . . . .  

Burrows, M.J. 
Perf. Bull., Apr. 1979, 32, (4), 7 
Occasionally, British stamps are found which bear two  

different perfins. A possible reason for this is that  
one firm has remitted them to another firm as payment for  
return postage and the second firm has a policy of 
perforating all such incoming stamps.   Evidence that this  
practice occurred is included in an advertisement for  
Francis A. Hancock, which is shown. 
 
0512  Firms perforations on Russian stamps  

Mazur, P. 
Filat. SSSR, 1975, (4), 29 
Translation: S.E.P.S. TRANS. 28, pp.3 
Although very seldom encountered, private firms 

perfins were permitted on Russian postage stamps from 1907. 
small number of Finnish firms used perfins prior to 1917.  
(when Finland was a Russian Grand Duchy) and so their  
perfins could be found on early Finnish and Tsarist  
Russian stamps. 
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0513 Liverpool cotton stamps 
Tennant, C.F. 
Cind. Philat., July 1979, 19, (3), 48-51 & 53 
The Liverpool Cotton Brokers Association was founded  

in 1843 and commenced to use stamps in 1875. In 1885, it  
merged with its rival the Liverpool Cotton Exchange and 
formed the Liverpool Cotton Association Ltd. Many of the 
stamps are known perfinned CH which is presumed to mean 
"Clearing House".  The Cotton Brokers Bank was formed by  
the Liverpool Cotton Brokers Association in 1878 and it  
too produced stamps which can be found perfinned. 
 
0514  Brian Birch corner. 4 Bulgarian perfins  

Birch, B. J. 
S.E.P.S. Bull., Jan./Feb. 1973, (143), 3 
An illustrated list of the eleven known Bulgarian  

perfins. 
 

0515 The activities of the police 
Hobday, P. 
Stamp Mag. Mar. 1974, 40, (3), 22-25 & 37 
The beginnings and development of a specialised  

collection dealing with the activities of the police is  
describod.  Amongst the items included are two police  
perfins, the German POL and CP, used by the Jersey Chief  
of Police, 

 
0516 Argentine Republic – 1899 "Liberty" and shield issue * 

Overseas 1 Stamp Catalogue - A-C; 2nd Edn., Stanley 
Gibbons Publications Ltd., London, 1976, A87 
The 20p of the Liberty and shield issue is known with 

its centre inverted (SG 241b). Against the stamp is a 
note that it only exists perforated with the word 
"INUTILIZADO", having been used on bundles of newspapers 
before the erro was discovered (Price £325)(Complete) 
 
0517 Foreign catalog report 

Walker, F.A. 
Perf. Bull., May 1979, 32, (5), 1-2, 4 & 7 
A detailed report is given on the availabiiity of  

catalogues of the perfins of specific countries which are  
held in the Perfins Club library. 
 
0518 Great Britain precancelled perfins  

Burrows, M.J. 
Perfs. Bull., May 1979, 32, (5), 3 & 6 
G.B. has never used precancels of the style used by 

other countries but rather used spccia1 postmarks applied  
prior to posting.  A checklist of perfins cancelled by  
such postmarks is given. 
 
0519 Perfin cover of the month 

Maxa, V. 
Perf. Bull., May 1979, 32, (5), 4 
A cover bearing an Austrian stamp perfinned N./CR.  

of the National Cash Register Company is shown. _Although 
there is no return address or users name, the envelope is  
illustrated in colour with a picture of a cash register  
and its satisfied owner. 
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0520  Advert for Baddeley Brothers' perforator*  

Baddeley Brothers (London) Ltd.  
Am. Bhilat., Sept. 1977, 91, (9), 735 
The advert shows a drawing of a perforating machine  

and the perfin BB. 
 
0521  Netherlands - 1943–44 issue * 

Scott's Standard postage stamp catalogue - 1971  
127th Edn., Scott Publishing Co., New York, 1970,  
Vol. 2, 928 
In 1944, 200,000 copies of No. 247 (2c Swans) 

of the Germanic symbols issue, were privately punched 
with a cross and printed on the back with a number and the  
words "Prijs 15 Cent toeslag) ten bate Ned. Roode Kruis."  
These were sold at an exhibition, the surtax going to the  
Red Cross. The Dutch post office tolerated these stamps.  
(Complete) 
 
0522  G.B.: Tea Clearing House Stamps  

Burrows, M.J.  
Cind. Philat., July 1979, 19, (3), 53-54 
The Tea Clearing House stamps of Great Britain are  

known with the perfin T.C./&Co. although the user is not  
known. 
 
0523  Beginners please: what is a SPIF? 

Rapkin, F. 
Stamp Mag., Aug. 1979, 45, (8), 79 
A very brief and basic introduction to perfins. 
 

0524  Perfin of the Comptoir National d'Escompte de Paris  
Prins, J. 
Perf. Bull., July/Aug. 1976, 29, (7), 3-6 
The Comptoir National d'Escompte de Paris, one of 

the largest banks in France, was founded in 1889. As 
well as several hundred branches in France, it had branches  
throughout Europe and the French colonies in Africa. 
Sixty two perfins from the various branches of the Comptoir  
National can be found on French stamps and some 17 perfins  
of the overseas branches can be found on the stamps of the 
appropriate countries. Most of the patterns are illustrated  
together with two CN perfins which are not from Comptoir  
National. 
 
0525  Common British official perfins 

Brandt, J. 
Perf. Bull., July/Aug. 1976, 29, (7), 7 
The most common British "official" perfins are 

DS/IR of the Department of Scientific and Industrial  
Research and HM/SO of Her(His) Majesty's Stationery Office.  
Prior to the introduction of the HM/SO perfin the  
S(crown)O perfin was used. 
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0526  Story behind the perfin: L-130, Daniel Low & Co.,  
Salem, Mass. 
Walker, F.A., Crow, R.B., Murrin, R. & Haack, E.  
Perf. Bull., July/Aug. 1976, 29, (7), 7 & Sept. 1976, 
29, (8), 7 
The U.S. Low perfin is known used between 1917 and 1941.  

It was used by Daniel Low & Co, of Salem, Mass, a mail  
order company established in 1868. Originally, a single die  
perforated was used to perforate the owner's last name  
through the stamps but this has now been discontinued in  
favour of a meter machine. 
 
0527  Responses to articles - Faroe Islands perfins* 

Bergman L. 
Perf. Bull., July/Aug. 1976, 29, (7), 8 
The following additional information is offered to  

the article by J.H. Baker in the March 1976 Perfins  
Bulletin: According to the late Ostergaard Hansen,  
the perfin "V.L." existed on provisionals. Hansen may  
have listed this in "Posthistorisk Tidskrift" with other 
Danish perfins. Lot 818 in the Danam Stamp Company  
auction of May 1 and June 1, 1976 is "V.L. " perfins on 
provisionals tied to a piece from 1940.  The oldest copy  
of this perfin in the author's collection dates from  
1935 (Complete) 
 
0528  Responses to articles - numerical perfins * 

Brandt, J. 
Perf. Bull., July/Aug. 1976, 29, (7), 8 & 10 
Many countries stamps can be found with numbers or  

number and letter combinations perforated through them,  
four examples of which are illustrated.  It is known that  
some of these at least are from address labels attached 
to films sent for processing.  A list of 18 countries  
from which such perforations are known is included. 
 
0529  The State of New Jersey perfin 

Jackson, P.T. 
Perf. Bull., July/Aug. 1976, 29, (7), 9 
Official departments of the State of New Jersey use  

the perfin S/NJ. Two perforating machines are used - both  
manufactured by the Cummins Perforator Co. of Chicago.  
Various minor varieties have occurred over the years due  
to breakages and repairs, five of which are illustrated.  
As an example of the usefulness of perfins, an account is  
given of an employee apprehended after having used some of  
the State stamps for private postage. 
 
0530  Perfin cover of the month 

Crow, R.B. 
Perf. Bull., July/Aug. 1976, 29, (7), 10 
The Mishawaka Woollen Manufacturing Co, use the  

perfin BB (in a circle) which stands for thuir "Ball-Band"  
rubber and woollen footwear. An advertising cover is  
shown bearing a 1912 2c stamp perfinned by the Mishawaka  
Woollen Manufacturing Co, which doesn't appear to have been  
used until 1949 - an unaccounted for lapse of 37 years. 
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FOR SALE 
Over 26,000 all world perfins, predominance of G.B. Blocks,  

pairs, covers, face values to £5. Q.V. to date. Collections, 
accumulations and studies. 

Total weight in excess of 25 lbs.  
Notes, albums, catalogues, listings.  
Hours of sorting!!! 
First cheque for £325 secures. 

Brian Cartwright 
39, Widgeon Close, Hardway, Gosport,  

Hampshire, P012 4JG. 
 
MEMBERS' WANTS 

Member Mike Bavin 2, Sollershot West, Letchworth, Herts, 
3NN 77, would like to hear the details of any Lincolnshire perfins  
on cover. Not necessarily to purchase but to aid his studies.  
Can anyone help? 

Tony Edwards 23, Foxfield Close, Northwood, Middx., is  
interested in the crown cancellation mentioned by Mr Hewlett in 
a recent bulletin. He has three examples himself, not associated  
with perfins, but would welcome any further news of examples seen  
or owned. 
 
EXHIBITION SUCCESS 

Member P.F. North tells us that he won first prize with a  
display of Perfins in the Members' Competition of the Chelmsford  
and District Philatelic Society. This was back in February but we  
have not had space to mention it before, however it does not make  
our congratulations any the less sincere. 
 
SOCIETY PUBLICATIONS 

Ron Bowman is able to supply the following at the members'  
prices quoted which are post free. 

IDENTITIES CATALOGUE - complete A to Z .... .... .  £2.00 
RAILWAY PERFINS CATALOGUE - 73 pages in card cover. 

100+ illustrations. 40 .... £1.50 
different railway offices in the U.K. 

PERFIN ABSTRACTS - back pages to Abstract 500 ... .  £2.00 
ABSTRACTS INDEX - author and subject indexes of 

the first 500 Abstracts .... .... ..£1.40 
 

Items will be sent 2nd class mail inland and by printed paper  
rate overseas. 
 
CONTENTS 
The contents of this issue are: 

Pages 1 to 4  - General Interest 
Pages 5 to 9  - Perfin Abstracts pages 97 to 101 inclusive.  
Page 10    - General Interest 
Pages 11 & 12 - New Identities Received 
Pages 13 & 14 - Identities Catalogue pages J7 and J8. 
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NEW IDENTITIES RECEIVED. 
 

From Mr P.G.Day. 
167A.2  S/&Co    10/12,5,6   5½ IIIa  Richard Smith & Co 

Worcester. 
314    SG/C    10,10/8    5     Smith Greenwood & Co 

London EC. 
From Mrs M. Rosemary Smith. 
615.2   H.R/&Co   12,13/14,8,6 4½ III  Hayn Roman & Co, 

London. 
52    LB&L    7,14,14,7   4 I    Lake & Co, Lincolns  

Inn, London WC. 
274.2   A&H     10,13,11   5½ III  Arnati & Harrison,  

London EC. 
11    BAC     13,10,8    5½    Brookfield Aitchison 

& Co. Manchester. 
68    DCC/N    11,8,8/13   4½    Digby Colliery Co,  

Near Nottingham. 
174    H.C.W    11,8,15    5½    Hull Chemical Works Ltd 

Hull. 
571A   HP/BC    10,8/11,7   4½    High Peak Boro' Council  

Buxton, Derbyshire. 
494.1   TWA     6,12,8    4½     Thames Water Authority. 
419    FTP     8,7,10    5     F. Tennant Pain,  

London EC. 
39    LB/C    6,11/9    4½    London Borough of 

Greenwich. 
117    U.L     10,7     5½    University of London, 

London WC1. 
257   LG/MC    6,9/11,7   4½   Ø "Hither Green Hospital"  

London SE 13. 
322    CH/GH    7,10/9,10   4½   Ø "Guys Hospital" London 
206.1   GH     9,10     4½   Ø "New Cross Hospital" 

London SE 11, 
721    HTP/&Co   10,6,8/14,7,4 4 I    H.T. Pearson & Co Ltd  

London Bridge SE. 
211.2   THC/&Co   9,12,9/12,8,6 5/4½ IIIa T.H.Catcheside & Co,  

Newcastle on Tyne. 
343.3   L&L     7,11,7     5 Ia    London & Lancashire  

Insurance Co Ltd, 
Glasgow. 

53.3   HB/&Co    12,13/12,8,6  4½ IIIa  Houlder Brothers & Co,  
Manchester.
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From Mr A.E. Smith.  
26.4  EB      10,14     5     2.Borough of Ealing. 
30   L/B      7/13     5½    Law & Bonar Ltd, 

Dundee. 
798.2  CURRIE     14,10,13,13,5,10,8 3½  D. Currie & Co., 

London E C. 
85   F&Co./(N&S)/Ld.       4/3½/4 III Frazer & Co (North 

7,16,4/4,8,4,7,4/6,5    Shields)Ltd,  
Newcastle. 

497.1  HM/&Co     12,15/14,8,4  4½ III  Hoare Marr & Co, 
London EC4. 

256A  PI/O     8,4/8     4½    Pratts Insurance Office  
Uxbridge, Middx. 

From Dr R.W. Powell. 
772.4  B/W&Co     15/16,14,8,6  4½ III  Bessler Waechter & Co 

London EC 
416   D/R&Co     11/13,14,8,6  4½/5 III D. Radford & Co  

London EC 
2.1   F       14      10    John S. Fitter & Son,  

London. 
163.2  FG/&Co     8,10/13,8,6  5½/5 III F. Gregory, Horley. 
515.7  GTR      11,6,10    5     The Grand Trunk Rly Co 

London EC 
326.1  GLYN      10,7,8,13   4     Glynn Mills Currie & Co, 

London EC 
61   U.D      10,11     5     Underground Electric 

Rlys Comp. of London, 
London SW. 

66.3  J.B/&Co.   7,14/13,9,6  5 III   Jaffe Brothers & Co,  
Dundee. 

388   P&R/F&Co          4½ IIIa  P & R Fleming & Co 
9,12,11/8,12,8,6        Glasgow 

153.1  P/D      8/9      4½    Parke Davis & Co, 
Hounslow, Middx. 

536   HN/&Co    l2,13/14,8,4 5 I    Hedley Norris & Co, 
London WC 2 

75   LBW      7,l4,15    5     Lewisham Board of Works, 
Catford SE 

222A  RH/A8     10,10/8,10  4½    London Ambulance Service 
H.Q. London SE 1. 

From Mr R. Tarrant. 
500.1  TWCo     6,10,7,4   4½    Timothy Whites Ltd. 
408.3  DR/C     11,12/8    5½    Dunlop Rubber Co Ltd, 

Birmingham 3. 
150.1  WH/C     12,11/7    4½   5.Wolverhampton Borough 

Council. 
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 J. ADDITIONS. 
 

13   J.A/&Co/Ld   10,10/15,10,8/7,9 5½ IIIb Ø John Abbot & Co Ltd,  
Gateshead. 

16.4  JA/E     7,10/10    5      J.A.Ewing & Co.LondonECl 
62.1  JB/Co     7,12/8,6   4½     James Booth & Co,  

Birmingham. 
66.3  J.B/&Co.    7,14/13,9,6  5 III    Jaffe Brothers & Co,  

Dundee. 
99A   JB/&/SLtd   8,15/12/11,7,5,6 5½ IIIa  J. Bibby & Sons Ltd,  

Liverpool. 
142.1  J/C&Co     7/8,14,8,6  4½/5 III  Carters. London. (Seed  

merchants) 
148   J.C.H/&Co   7,8,12/12,8,6 4½ IIIa   J.C.Houghton & Co Ltd,  

Liverpool. 
170.1  J.C/&S     7,10/13,10  5½ III   James Cartland & Son,  

Birmingham. 
170.2  J.C/&S     10,10/15,12  5½ IIIb   Sir Joseph Causton &Sons  

Ltd., London EC. 
197   J.D      7,11     5½     W.W.Jones Dooley & Co  

Ltd Liverpool 2. 
206.4  JD/&Co     7,11/14,8,4  5 III   Ø John Dickinson & Co Ltd,  

London. 
208   J.D/&Co.    7,11/13,8,6  5½ III  Ø John Dickinson & Co Ltd, 

Hemel Hempstead. 
257.3  JE/&/S     7,10/14/10  4 I     Joseph Ellis & Sons,  

Leicester. 
277.2  JF/&Co     7,8/14,8,4  4½ III   J.Fowler & Co (Leeds)Ltd  

London. 
279   J.F/&Co..   7,8/14,11,6  5 III    John Fowler,Steam P1ough  

Works, Leeds. 
285B  JF/P     7,8/10    4½     John F. Powe. London EC 
361   JH/&/Co.Ld.  7,11/13/8,6,7,9 6/5½ III  Japp Hatch & Co Ltd, 

London EC. 
388.3  JHS/&S     7,12,10/14,10 4½ I    J.H. Sankey & Son Ltd,  

London E16 
464   J.K/&Co    7,10/14,8,4  4 I     John Knox & Co (London)  

Ltd. London NW 1. 
485   J.L./B     7,7/13     5½     Joseph Lucas. Birmingham 
556   JMT/&Co    7,15,7/12,8,6 4½ IIIa   J.M.Thomson & Co,  

London EC1 
616   JPH/Ld     7,11,12/7,7  4½     J.P.Harrington Ltd,  

Glasgow. 
623.1  JP/&S     7,9/12,10   4½ III   Joseph Parker & Sons Ltd 
                          Willenhall.
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686.6  J&S     7,13,11     5½_III  Johnston & Son.  
London EC3 

693A  J.S.C/Ld   7,10,8/7,6    4½    Schweppes Ltd. London 
698.3  J.S/&Co   7,11/12,8,6   5/4½ IIIa James Schoolbred & Co 

Ltd. London. 
698.4  J.S/&Co   7,11/13,8,6   5/4½ IIIa James Simpson & Co Ltd,  

London. 
704.2  JSD     6,9,9      4½    J.S.Darwen & Co.  

London EC1 
721   J.S.S    7,11,11     5½    John Sutcliffe & Son 
787   JTS     7,7,17     4½    Joseph Taylor & Sons.  

Huddersfield 
79.3  JT/S    9,10,9     5½    Joseph Terry & Sons Ltd, 

York. 
790.1  J/TS    6/6,9      4½    Joseph Travers & Sons 

Ltd, London EC 
796   JT/&S/Ld.  7,7/14,10/7,6  4½ III    do. do. do.  
827.4  JW     7,16      5½    John Wheeler. London EC 
830.2  J&W     7,12,17     5½ III  Jones & Willis Ltd,  

Birmingham 
842.3  JW/&Co   7,14/16,8,4   5 II   J. Wippell & Co Ltd,  

Exeter. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


