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The ornate corner card on this photographically
cropped cover leaves no doubt that the Cole Manu­
facturing Company, 3218-3238 South Western
Avenue, Chicago, Illinois made heating and cooking
supplies. In addition, the use of perfin pattern
C248.5 on the 2 cent red Washington-head postage
stamp canceled May 27, 1912provides us with some
usage data. The Catalog of United States Perfins

entry was updated by an Additions and Corrections
page to show Chicago, Illinois usage; however, no
user is listed.
A full-size photocopy of this cover has been for­
warded to John M. Randall, the US Catalog Editor,
SO that the additional information will be provided
in the next edition of the catalog,

Nl71 - The Northwestern Consolidated Milling Company

Joe Laura (#1238)

To that end, I have forwarded a photocopy of this
cover to the John Randall, the US Catalog editor ,

Figure 1 - Top Strip from Northwest Consolidated Milling Company Advertising Card
user's name as "NW Consolidated Milling Co." I
suggest that the full corporate name should be
included in the new catalog.

The illustrated 1908 advertising post card from
The Northwestern Consolidated MillingCompanyof
Minneapolis, Minnesota (back shown on page 55)
provides us with the full company name. The
Catalog ofUnited States Perfins has abbreviated the
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Figure 2. Back of Advertising Card
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. purchasing manager we arc ind';bt ed to for a lar ge
supply of covers. What makes thi s wrapper ev~n
more interesting is the perfin pattern D esign 14 on

The newspaper wrapper illustrat ed below with the
corne r card of TIle f11i1isrine of East Auro ra, New
York was addressed to the Norton Company whose
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