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A rather unusual piece is currently being sold by Bill Barrell Ltd and 
is shown below.  It is a piece of headed notepaper from Oxford Local 
Examinations with 6d, 9d, 10d, 1/- green Jubilees each with perfin 
OL/E O1030.02.  Asking price £175.00. 

 

Lastly Colonial Stamps Company of Los Angeles had for sale an 
“unrecorded 1d Crown & "B. T." perfin Plate 206 Variety - perfin                 
reversed rare.....$1000.00”.  If you didn’t fancy spending $1000 for a 
forgery you could have bought a similar perfin forgery but from plate 
162 for just £4.95 on ebay. 
 
A interesting item on e-bay was the sale of a copy of the 
Tomkins/McKee Catalog Album which was published by Harvey 
Tilles in the US back in 1977.  The copy contained a thousand or so 
perfins and sold for £92 – was the buyer after the catalogue or the 
stamps – a good realisation either way. 
 
An unusual cover shown overleaf was sold on e-bay in July.  The cover 
shows a QV 1d Fiscal postally used by the General Life and Fire 
Assurance Company.  This is certainly an unusual combination of a 
postal fiscal with perfin on an identifying cover. The item realised £33. 

 
O1030.02 
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I stumbled across the colour advertisement shown overleaf for the 
printers and stationers Allan & Ferguson on an excellent website 
www.theglasgowstory.com .  The advertisement is from the back of 
the Post Office Glasgow directory of 1891-1892.  The phone number 
at the top was apparently one of the first ever to appear in an 
advertisement in a Glasgow directory.  The advert states that the 
company supplies “initial perforating machines, numbering dating 
and all kinds of endorsing machines”.  As far I can tell the company 
didn’t use perfins themselves – indeed there are no recorded “A&F” 
perfins.  I have been unable to find out much about this company or 
even indeed how long they operated in Glasgow.  The company was a 
renowned lithographer and engraver and I have found them recorded 
in an 1869 directory.  They were associated with the production of a 
number of classic illustrated books.  Can any member provide 
additional information on this company, in particular their period of 
operation?  Could this be the company that produced the famous 
“OinCo” perfins? 

GLASGOW INITIAL PERFORATOR 
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