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NEW MEMBERS 

We are pleased to welcome two more members, both from overseas,  
into the Society, 

Dr. J.M. Buckner 2560, N.W. 13th Street, Gainesville,  
Florida 32601, U.S.A. 

Pan (Mr) L. Janecek, Jiraskovo Nabrezi 363, 468 22 Zelezny  
Brod, Czechoslovakia. 

 
ADDRESS CHANGES 

Derek Glynn now lives at 7, The Gardens, Xlonkseaton, Whitley  
Bay, Tyne & Wear, NE2 5 SBG. 

Guy Ubaghs has been moved to Iran and can be reached c/o Zam  
Zam Bottling Company, PO Box 1159, 
Teheran, Iran. 

ANNUAL SUBSCRIPTION 
Subscription time is almost upon us once more, all renewals  

are due on 1st September, and please remember that as agreed at  
our meeting last November the new annual rate will be £2. It was  
set at this figure in the hope that it can remain unchanged for a  
few years. 

We would be pleased to receive your subs as early as possible.  
If you have a credit balance (see your membership card) you have  
only need to send the extra to make it up to £2. All subs to 
Michael Rucklidge please. 
 
WHO KNOWS THE ANSWER? 

Alan Mackie, 32, Woodland Close, Albrighton, Wolverhampton,  
wonders whether any of our 'Perfin Sleuths' can help identify the  
following, 
(1) L&S  7,13,11  5½mm.   K.G.V. 1½d jubilee postmarked Manchester  

7th May 1935. The flap of the cover is 
damaged and only part of the user's  
name remains:- & SALAVAN LIMITED 

DEANSGATE 
(2) H.R/&Co 12,13/14,8,4 5mm. K.G.V. 1½d postmarked Registered  

London 3 Nov 1913. The cover has an  
office date stamp with only part of the  
name legible:- HAYN, ROM 

3 Nov 1913 
London. 
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AUCTION NEWS 
Prices Realised at the S.E.P.S. Postal Auction for Spring 1977 
Lot   p   Lot   p   Lot    p  Lot   p   Lot   p 
1    30  33  No bid  65  No bid  97   45  129  £1.70 
2    55  34   15  66   £2.10  98   30  130  £1.60 
3    30  35   55  67   £1.10  99   15  131    15 
4  No bid  36   35  68    25  100   95  132  £1.60 
5    85  37   £1.10  69   £1.10  101   25  133    90 
6    30  38   35  70    85  102   20  134  £1.00 
7    35  39   35  71    85  103   25  135    85 
8    50  40   35  72   £1.10  104   45  136    85 
9   £2.10  41  No bid  73    35  105   25  137    45 
10   60  42  No bid  74    60   106   40   138    80  
11   15  43   45  75   £1.80  107   30  139    25 
12   £1.10  44   90  76   £1.20  108   55  140     25 
13   50  45   70  77   75  109   30  141    55 
14   20  46   20  78   75  110   40   142    15 
15   95  47   60  79   35  111   25  143    30 
16   35  48   55  80   65  112   15  144    60 
17   50  49   20  81   £1.50   113   30   145    30 
18   30  50  £10.10  82   85  114   25  146    30 
19   25  51   £1.10  83   70  115   40  147    65 
20   35  52   65  84   30  116   35  148    25 
21   55  53   30  85   £1.10  117   30  149    40 
22   65  54   45  86   90  118   25  150    20 
23   35  55   75  87   £1.20  119   85  151  £1.15 
24   15  56   £1.60  88   60  120  £1.30  152    45 
25   65  57   40  89   75  121  £1.30  153  £1.45 
26   £1.60  58   £1.60  90   75  122   50  154    60 
27   40  59   £1.80  91   50   123   15  155    60 
28   £1.10  60   £1.60  92   50  124   40  156    15 
29   45  61   £1.70  93   45  125  £1.10  157    30 
30   30  62   50  94   45  126  £1.20  158    60 
31   25  63   30  95   35  127  £1.20  159  No bid 
32   25  64   40  96   30  128  £1.70 
 

Gross Receipts  . . . . . . . £108.80  
S.E.P.S. Commission at 10%. .   10.88 
Net Paid to Vendors ........   97.92 

 
Outstanding Payments 

Payment for two lots is still outstanding and a further  
invoice will be attached to the bulletin of the members concerned. 

Would those members please advise the Hon. Auctioneer whether  
the lots were received or not, and if received, how payment was sent? 
 
Next Auction 

It is proposed that our next Auction should take place in the  
Autumn with a closing date for receipt of lots September 9th 1977. 

Publication of the Auction List should appear in our September/  
October number. Closing date for receipt of bids will be 18th  
November so that all settlements can be made before Christmas. 

Please send your lots to Ted Francombe at 72, Scott Close,  
Emmer Green, Reading, Berks RG4 8NY as early as possible to help  
spread the load in compiling the catalogue. Ensure that your 
requirements on reserves are made clear and enclose a stamped  
addressed envelope if you want acknowledgement of receipt. 
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ANNUAL MEETING 

A room has been booked at the National Liberal Club for the  
afternoon of Saturday 19th November. 

We hope that all members in easy reach of London will come  
along so make a note of the date in your diary. Further details  
will be given in our next issue. 
 
SOME PRICES SEEN 
The Auctions Tell You - Philatelic Magazine, Nov. 1976 
Stanley Gibbons: 
 Australia -  1935 Silver Jubilee 3d and 2/- mint blocks of 14  

perfinned G/NSW               £85 
Western Australia - 1902-11 perf 12½ 10d deep mauve and £l  

orange-brown, perfed "OS" used       £22 
Robson Lowe International: 
Australia -  1915 Kangaroo 2d second wmk., bottom two rows of  

sheet, mint, perfed "OS"          £325 
- 1929 Western Australia Centenary 1½d mint imprint  

block perf "OS"               £260 
The Auctions Tell You - Philatelic Magazine, Dec. 1976 
Bournemouth Stamp Auctions: 
Australia -  1916-18 rough paper 5d bright chestnut, perf "OS"  

used.                    £30 
Robson Lowe: 
Great Britain - 1877 p.s. envelope ld pink advertising ring,  

OFFICE OF THE PHILATELIC QUARTERLY/BRIGHTON,  
unused.                   £57.50 

The Auctions Tell You - Philatelic Magazine, Feb. 1977 
Robson Lowe: 
Sudan -   1900 official 5m rose-carmine, mint block perfed "SG"  

tete-beche                 £28 
The Auctions Tell You - Philatelic Magazine, March 1977. 
Cavendish Philatelic Auctions: 
Australia -  1932 1/- Lyre Bird + 1935 1/- Anzac, both perfed  

G/NSW, mint                 £12 
H.R. Harmer: 
Great Britain - 1864 p.s. envelope with green Baylis  

advertising ring.             £135 
 
THIS ISSUES CONTENTS 
 

Three pages of general interest - 3 sheets. 
'Elusive Everetts' article - 1 sheet.  
Shipping Companies page S/Co/G1 - sheet.  
Thomas Cook page T.C./B3 - 1 sheet. 
Identities Catalogue pages S9 & S10 - 2 sheets.  
Full Names & Officials Worksheets - 2 sheets. 
Abstracts - Subject Index pages 1 to 5 inc. - 5 sheets. 

 
Due to pressure of other work and summer holidays this issue  

is about two weeks behind schedule and will be going out around  
mid-August. 
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ELUSIVE EVERETTS 

By Mike J. Burrows. 
 

At the 12th Philatelic Congress of Great Britain held at  
Cambridge in 1926, Dr. Grodon Ward presented his paper 'Thief –  
Proof Stamps & Legitimate Philately'. Part of this discourse  
concerned the Everett stamp thief detector. Later this information 
was incorporated in the series by Bertram McGowan that appeared in  
the British Philatelist during 1926-27. 
 

Charles Jennings gave a very full description of the device in  
his article 'Security Endorsement Machines & Processes' published  
by the Society in News-Sheet No.6, May-June 1958 (out of print).  
Further facts, amendments and amplification can be found on pages  
29 and 30 of his magnum opus published in parts beginning in 1968. 

Mention of the underprint was made by member Dr. Reg. W. Powell  
in 'A K.E.Vll. Miscellany' which can be found in the G.B. Journal, 
Volume 13, page 14.  

For members who do not have access to the above references, 
here is a brief description of the apparatus patented by Arthur  
Everett of William Henry Everett & Son Limited, wholesale news- 
vendors of 11, St. Bride Street, London, E.C. 

An ink roller-pad was kept in contact with a rubber roller 
containing-rows of the required insignia. Each row had six  
of these dies. In this case the initials WH/E&S/Ltd. By  
using the hand-machine in a similar manner to the rubber  
roller multi-colour stampers of today, it was possible to  
overprint, on top of the gum, several postage stamps in a  
single operation. 

It had taken many years before Everetts persuaded the Post  
Office to accept this form of private protection. Permission being 
finally granted in 1903. In an attemt to publicize the invention  
it was offered for sale in the contemporary press at £1 each, but  
it is doubtful if any were ever sold. 

Bearing in mind that the ink used was probably that normally  
associated with the conventional rubber stamps then in use, and  
that the impressions were made over the gum, it is doubtful if 
any legitimately used examples could still exist, considering that  
they would have to be removed from the original material to which  
they had been affixed. Furthermore, any mint examples might still  
be considered the property of the security conscious originators. 

Nevertheless, the following are recorded as having been seen,  
over the years, with this security device, overprinted either in  
purple or violet. Whether mint or used was not stated. 

K.E.VII.  ½d dark green, 1d, 1½d, 2d ordinary paper, 2½d, 6d  
K.G.V.  ld die III. 
By 1915 the war had made such inroads into the staff that most  

had been replaced by less reliable casuals, resulting in the  
management deciding to conform to the more normal method of  
security by having its stocks of stamps perfinned with a large  
single E. 

Although Dr. Gordon Ward gave this information in 1926, the 
new illustrated catalogue does not carry this identification. For  
a company that has attracted the attention of several philatelic 
writers, it does seem that the products of W.H. Everett & Son  
Limited security methods are destined for oblivion. 
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GOOLE STEAM SHIPPING COMPANY LIMITED 
 

G.S.S.   10,10,10 
Co Ld    8,8,7,9     4½mm. 
 
Cat. No. 483. 

 
When the regular service from Goole to the Continent ceased  

with the bankruptcy of Messrs Watson, Cuneliffe & Company in 1864,  
it left a large void in the trading prosperity of the area. To  
overcome this, several local land owners formed the Goole Steam  
Shipping Company Limited. 

This company maintained steady progress taking over, in 1895,  
the Humber Steam Shipping Company Limited and the Yorkshire Coal  
& Steamship Company Limited. 

As Sir George Armytage, the Chairman of the Lancashire &  
Yorkshire Railway, was also a director of the Goole Steam Shipping 
Company Limited, it was inevitable that the 'Lanky' obtained  
government sanction to take over the G.S.S., in 1904. This was  
achieved by the purchase of the entire fleet on 2nd January 1905. 

Following the practise that seems normal for the time the  
G.S.S, name continued to be used for publicity purposes. 

The black days of the depression saw most of the fleet still  
in existance taken over by a four company consortium in May 1935.  
Owning between them twnety five cross-channel steamers the  
Consortium, which included the Hull & Netherlands Steamship  
Company Limited and Wilson's & North Eastern Railway Shipping  
Company Limited, decided upon a single management, 'Associated  
Humber Steamship Lines Control Committee', to run Associated  
Humber Lines. 

Registered in 1957 as a limited liability company, the  
Associated Humber Lines came under the control of the British  
Transport Commission who had 91% of the shares. The rest being  
lodged with Ellerman's Wilson Line. In 1963 the Transport Holding 
Company took over. The next change was in 1969 to the National  
Freight Corporation. 

Only a few members reported holding examples of this die.  
 
Issues Reported 

Queen Victoria 
1d red  Plates:  117, 119, 121, 122, 123, 125, 127, 129, 

139, 140, 141, 142, 145, 146, 149, 150,  
152, 154, 157, 161, 163, 166, 170, 181,  
193, 194. 

2½d   Plate:   23 
3d   Plates:   11, 16, 18. 
Jubilee Issue:  ½d verm., ½d blue-green (identity piece),  

2½d. 
King Edward V11  ½d blue-green, 1d, 2½d. 

 
Postmarks recorded are Goole and Liverpool. Latest date : 24/9/1902  
 

S/Co/Gl 
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THOMAS COOK USED IN FRANCE  Continued from our last issue TC/B2 
 
 

I made an error in saying that TC/&S is not listed in  
Lebland. Mr Bergman points out that it is listed on page 39  
(although the identity is not given). 
 

Lebland gives Yvert numbers - 140, 263, 288, 842, 970. 
 

Mr Bergman has  Peace type 30c, 50c, lf.  
Jean Jaures 1f50. 

 
Miss Wright tells me that she has the perfin on, 

1923 Pasteur 1f50 blue. 
Merson Type 60c 

lf dated 1922. 
 

Mr Brandt says that he has the perfin on both postal and  
revenue issue. "The revenue one is on a 'Wagons-Lits'  
ticket which shows the Cook name, and also the cancel of  
the reverse shows THOS. COOK & SONS. S.A., with a Paris  
address. 
 
 

OTHERS 
 

Mr Bergman and Mr Brandt say that TC/&S perfins are also  
known on stamps of the following countries: 
 

BURMA   7,8/14,10  (J. Brandt & L. Bergman)  
CHINA   7,7/12,10 

7,8/12,10    "      " 
JAPAN   7,7/12,10  (L. Bergman) 
 

This is number H32 in the Adachi catalogue,  
but as the text is in Japanese, Mr Bergman  
does not know if it has been identified. 
 

TRANSVAAL 7,7/12,10  (L. Bergman) 
VICTORIA  6,9/13,11  (J. Brandt) 
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646.1  S/&/S   11/12/11    4½   Ø Stapley & Smith Ltd,  
London EC 2. 

649   S.S/C   11,11/8     5½    South Shields Corpn: 
650   S/SC   9/9,7      4½    Standard Soap Co Ltd, 

Ashby-de-la-Zouche 
655.2  SS/&Co  11,11/13,8,6  5½ III  Schill Bros Ltd, 

Manchester. 
656.1  S.S/&Co  10,10/14,6,6  4½ III  Schuster & Son Ltd. 
660.1  S'SEA/CPn 10,l0,10,10/8,10,11 4½   Swansea Corporation. 
660.2  S'SEA/CPn 9,9,9,8/7,8,8  4½      do. do. 
663   SSG    11,11,10    5½    South Suburban Gas Co 
673   S&S/Ltd.. 11,13,11/7,6,8  5½ III  Spink & Son Ltd, 

London W. 
682.1  S&S/T   9,12,9/6    4½ Ia   G. Small & Sons Ltd,  

Taunton. 
682.2  S&S/T   9,14,9/6    4½ I     do. do do. 
684   S.S.U   10,10,10    6     Sunday School Union 
686.2  SS/W   9,9/12     4½    The South Staffs Water 

works Co. Birmingham. 
706.3  ST    9,6       4½    Standard Telephone &  

Cables Ltd. London. 
706.4  ST    13,8      6     Stewart Thompson & Co 

Ltd. Manchester. 
712   StA/C   9,5,8/7     4½    St Albans Cornoration. 
715.2  ST/&B   9,6/12,11    4½ Ia   Spencer Turner & 

Boldero Ltd. London. 
715.3  ST/&B   13,7/14,15,   4½/4 III   do. do. do. 
717   St/BH   9,5/11,10    4½    St Bartholomews 

Hospital. 
718   StB/PL  10,6,14/10,7  5    Ø St Brides Press Ltd, 

London WC 1. 
721.2  ST/C   10,7/8     5½    Scottish Tube Co Ltd, 

Glasgow. 
731   ST/&Co/Ld 10,7/13,9,6/6,7 4½ III   Samuel Turner & Co Ltd 

Rochdale. 
732   STD    9,6,9      4½    "The Standard" (news 
                        paper) London EC. 
738.1  StG/H   9,5,9/10    4½    St Georges Hospital 

London S.W. 
738.2  StG/H   10,5,10/12    5    Ø   do. do. do.  
739.2  STH    9,6,10     4½    St Thomas's Hospital, 

London  
741.1  StH/C   9,5,10/7    4½    St Helen's Corporation 

Lancashire. 
 

IC5/S9 
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751   StP/BC  9,5,8/11,7   4½     St Pancras Borough  
Council. London NW1 

760   ST/WA   9,6/12,8    4½     Severn Trent Water  
Authority. 

779.1  SU/DC   9,8/9,7     4½    1. Shipley Urban District 
Council. 

2. Skegness do.  do. 
3. Solihull do. do. 

780   S.U./G.  11,10/10    5½    Ø Sheffield United Gas  
Light Company. 

781   S.U/GAS/Co. 11,10/10,10,11/8,6 5½  Ø  do, do. do. 
782    SU/GC   11,10/10,8   5½     Swindon United Gas Co. 
782A  S.U/G.C  11,10/10,8   6     Ø  do. do. do. 
784   S.U./Ld.  12,10/7,7    5½    Ø Salt Union Ltd. Winsford 
788.1  SUTTON/  8,9,6,7,8,10/ 

READING. 9,7,8,8,4,10,9 4½     Sutton & Sons Ltd,  
                    Reading. 

783.2  SUTTON/  10,10,7,7,10,13 
READING  11,10,10,10,5,l3,10 4½    do, do. do. 

789.1  SUTTON/  10,8,6,6,8,10/ 
&/SONS  14/10,8,10,9  5&3½/3½/5&3½ I  do. do. do. 

789.2  SUTTON/  11,10,7,7,10,13/ 
&/SONS  14/11,10,13,10 7&5/5/7&5 I   do. do. do. 

801.1  SW    9,2       4½     The Sutton District  
Water Co. Surrey. 

803.2  S/W    10/14      5      J.E.Simpson & J.R. 
Watkins Ltd. London 

804.1  S/&/W   9/12/12     4½ Ia    Smith & Wellstood Ltd, 
London W1 & EC4. 

809   SW/EB   9,12/9,11    4½     South Western Electricity  
Board. 

812   SW/GB   9,12/9,11    4½     South Western Gas Board. 
817.1  S&W/Ld  9,14,11/6,7   4½     J.H.Simpson & J.R.  

Watkins Ltd. London SE 
820.I  SWR/&Co  11,13,11/12,8,6 4 IIIa   Sir S.W.Royce & Co Ltd,  

Manchester. 
827   S.W.W   12,15,15     4      Sheffield Corporation  

Water Department. 
651   S/27   9/10,7     4½     Middlewood Hospital, 

Sheffield. 
 
 
 
IC5/S10 
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OFFICIAL PERFINS WORKSHEET 
 

For a short period during 1895 perfins were used by this 
Department prior to overprinting. 
 
Die 1   HM/OW 
 

Q.V.  ½d vermilion 
1d lilac 
 

Die 2   Crown/OW 
 

Q.V.  ½d vermilion  
1d lilac 

 
This Department was later entitled the Ministry of Works and  

its duties are now presumably taken over by the Department of  
the Environment. 
 
 
 
 
PUBLIC TRUSTEE OFFICE 
 

This perfin was reported by ex member Mr W. Pieterse who had a  
cover used by the Public Trustee, London and franked with four  
1d K.G.V. stamps. The cover was postmarked 14th April 1914 and  
had the inscription "ON HIS MAJESTY'S SERVICE" printed on it. 

 
The Public Trustee Office was opened in 1908 so it is possible  

that perfins exist fromm that date. 
The only details known of the die are,  
 

PT/O      10,9/l0 
 

Does anyone have any further information?  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Name  . . . . . . . . . . 
 

Please add details of any stamps you own with the perfins of  
the above Departments and return to Ron Bowman. 
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FULL NAME WORKSHEET - LETTER Y 

 
UNKNOWN 
 
7   YALE    7,10,7,10      6½mm (sideways) 
 
Stamps Known                 Postmarks  
 
 
 
THE YOST TYPEWRITER Co., Ltd., London E.C. 
 
86.1  YOST    7,8,10,6      4½mm (sideways) 
 
 
 
 
Stamps Known                 Postmarks 
86.2 YOST     8,10,10,7      4mm (sideways) 
 
 
Stamps Known                 Postmarks. 
K.E.VII.   ½d blue-green           London  
 
 
 
86.3 YOST     8,10,10,7      4½mm (sideways)  
Stamps Known                 Postmarks 
K.E.VII   1d                Belfast 4/1/1912  

London 5/11/1905 
K.G.V.   ½d (Mackennel, wmk script)     London 17/7/1913  

1d (1911-12) 
2d 
 
 
 
 

86.4 YOST     8,10,10,7      5½mm (sideways) 
 
Stamps Known                 Postmarks 
86.? YOST     7,8,10,6      4mm 
 
 
Stamps Known                 Postmarks 
Q.V. ½d vermilion              Edinburgh  
 
I have :- 
Van Lint/Tilles *            Name . . . . . . . . .   
 
Please add any further details known and return to Mike Burrows 
Englewood, Bildeston Road,,Little Finborough, Stowmarket, Suffolk  
IP14 2LA. 

* Delete as appropriate 
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PERFINS ABSTRACTS       April 1977 
   
  SUBJECT INDEX 

 
In an attempt to make PERFINS ABSTRACTS as useful 

as possible, this index has been constructed from a large  
number of keywords and, wherever possible, actual perfins  
derived from the text of the articles themselves, are included. 
 

All entries in the index refer to perfins unless  
otherwise indicated. 
 

Arrangement is primarily by countries. For each  
country there will be two alphabetical sections, the first is  
a list of perfins and the second a list of subjects. (It  
should be noted that in the perfin list the ampersand has been  
counted as the twenty seventh letter such that A & A comes  
after AZ.) Those items in the subject list which could be  
sought irrespective of country e.g. Railways, forgeries, etc.,  
are cross-referenced as major terms followed by the respective  
country e.g. "Great Britain - Forgeries" would also be found  
under "Forgeries - Great Britain". However, items have only  
been indexed under particular subjects where that subject was  
mentioned in the text e.g. "Great Britain - GWR" would not  
appear under "Great Britain - Railways" if it was not pointed  
out in the text that GWR stood for Great Western Railway:- 
An identity of a perf in user has never been assumed for the  
purpose of this index, even where it appeared obvious. The  
subject index is by no means complete with respect to  
collecting topics since it was difficult to determine what  
would be of interest. Generally, only topics which had an  
article written about them have been included. Suggestions  
of topics which could be included in future index will be  
appreciated by the author. 

Each country or subject is usually followed by a  
further term (or terms) in order to make the index as specific  
as possible. Cross-references take the following form:  
for the basic term "FRANCE - XYZ"; 
 
Cross-reference (1) "See - ZYX" means see "FRANCE - ZYX" 

(2) "see GERMANY - " means see "GERMANY - XYZ". 
 

Where an article attempts to include all of a certain  
countries perfins or is in fact a catalogue, it will be found  
under "COUNTRY - Catalogue". 
 

The various types of security endorsement, except  
perfins, are listed both by country and also under their own  
titles e.g. Overprints, Manuscript, Underprints, Embossing,  
Advertising Rings. Only items about perfins in general or  
where the country involved would be irrelevant e.g. collecting, 
exhibiting, etc., are included under Perfins.  
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Advertising Rings 
Great Britain                0010, 0030, 0140 
U.S.A.                   0092  

Akassa 
See Great Britain - Used in Akassa 

American Perforator Co.               0024  
Artist's Proof 

France                   0109 
Australia - see also the individual States. 

G/NSW                    0011 
N.Z./l.C.                  0110 
NZL                     0110 
OS                     0011, 0046 
OS/NSW                   0011 
T                      0011 
VG                     0011 
WA                     0011 

Austria - post offices in Levant 
See Levant - Austrian post offices  

Austria - Post offices in Turkey 
See Levant - Austrian post offices 

 
Bangkok - British Post Offices 

B & Co                   0128 
Banks 

U. S. A.                  0099, 0144  
B.F. Cummins Co. 

See also U.S.A. - BFC 
B.F. Cummins Co. 

Perforated Corner Card           0013  
Bosnia and Herzegovina 

Catalogue                  0108  
Branch Code Holes 

Canada                   0050 
U.S.A.                   0066  

Bulgaria 
Catalogue                  0012  

Bushire 
F                      0094 

Canada 
OHMS                    0093, 0097  

Canada - OHMS 
Catalogue                  0008, 0009, 0033  

0034, 0090, 0114  
0118 

Forged                   0097 
Canada 

Branch Code Holes              0050 
Catalogue                  0050, 0127 
Forgeries                  0097 
Government Departments           0050 
Overprints                 0050 
Postal Regulations Regarding Perfins    0086 
Postal Stationery              0050, 0097 
Precancels                 0048 
Revenues                  0050 
U.S. Perfins on Canadian stamps       0050 

Canal Zone 
P                      0051 
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Cancellations 
see Perforated Cancellations  

Carpet dies 
Great Britain                0141 

China 
See also Shanghai 
Catalogue                  0134  
Eastern Turkestan - see Sinkiang Province 
Sinkiang province              0023, 0034 

Christmas seals 
U.S.A.                   0038 

Cochin  
Catalogue                  0025  

Corner card 
See Return Address 

Crash Covers 
U.S.A.                    0002  

Credit Note Cancelled by Perfin           0015  
Croatia 

H.P.S.                   0083 
Cummins Co. 

See B.F. Cummins Co. 
Czechoslovakia 

1842                    0119 
Education 

Great Britain                0141 
Egypt 

Catalogue                  0139 
Lloyd Triestino               0081 

Eire 
See also Great Britain - Used in Eire 
GWR                     0129 
RE/WR                    0129 
Great Western Railway            0085, 0129 
Railways                  0085, 0129, 0141 

ELPEX 
’73                     0004 

Embossed security endorsements 
Great Britain                0030, 0041, 0141  

Envelopes 
See Postal Stationery 

Exhibitions 
See ELPEX 

 
Fancy perfins                    0022  
Faroe Islands 

V.L.                    0122  
Fiscals 

See Revenues 
Forgeries 

Canada                    0097  
Great Britain                0141  
Guatamala                  0146 

France 
ATP                     0109 
G.MINI                   0121 
M                      0022 
W.N.J.                    0022  
Artist's proof perfinned ATP         0109  
General                   0022 
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France (continued) 
German Parfins on French stamps       0022  
German stamps with French Perfins      0022  
Rouletted Perfin              0121 

Full Names 
Great Britain                0130, 0141  

Funchal 
BB/C                    0001 
 

Germany 
Dr. B.                   0105  
M                      0022  
Tokio 1964                  0137  
W.N.J.                    0022  
French Perfins on German Stamps       0022 
French Stamps with German perfins      0022 

Great Britain 
AN/J/SL                   0141  
A.T/D.                    0141  
BB                      0138  
BB/NA                    0141  
BIRK/BECK                  0070  
BNZ                     0110 
B & L/H                   0141 
CA                     0141 
CANCELLED/N.B of I.LD            0141 
CB                     0138 
C.B.I.                   0138, 0141 
C.L.                    0138 
C.M.S.                   0096 
CO                     0141 
C of A                   0141 
C/oF/A                   0141 
DB                     0141 
D.S.                     0089 
DSIR                     0141  
F & C                    0141 
GWR                     0085, 0129, 0141 
G & Co                    0141 
HB & T                   0141 
HM/F                    0141 
HM/F/QF                   0141 
HM/OW                    0141  
HM/SO                    0065, 0141 
H.S.K/& Co.                 0089 
I.B.H.L.                   0138  
INVENTION                  0141  
J/R & Co                   0141  
K                      0089  
K & K                    0141  
MC (Script)                 0141  
MH/J.R                    0141  
M.K/& B                   0141 
No. 2/N.F.F.                0141 
NZ                     0110, 0141 
N.Z.L.                   0110 
N & P                    0141 
PJ/N.T                   0141 
PT/O                    0141 
RB/13                    0094 
RB/15                    0094 
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Great Britain (continued) 
S.C                     0130 
S/CROWN/O                  0065, 0141 
S.S/& Co.                  0141 
SUTTON                   0130 
T/B&Co                   0130 
TC/&S                    0112 
UL/IS                    0087 
UN/Co                    0096 
WT                     0088 
05/18                    0094 
6(CRO/75) 7                 0141 
18 (93) 2                  0141 
"Crown"/A.O.C. (within circle)       0141 
"Crown"/B.T                 0141 
"Crown"/OW                 0141 
"Crown"/RCJ (within circle)         0141 
"Crown"/SCJ (within circle)         0141 
"Crown"/S0 (within circle)         0141 
"Single hole"                0141 
"Flattened cross"              0141 
Advertising Rings              0010, 0030, 0141 
Carpet dies                 0141 
Catalogue                  0071 
Councils                  0068  
Designs                   0130, 0141  
Dumb perfins - see  Designs  

Numerals 
Education Committees            0141 
Electricity Boards             0141 
Embossed Security Endorsements       0030, 0041 
Embossing - Sanders and son         0141  
Foreign Branch cancellations - see Private  

Companies Foreign Branch cancellations 
Forgeries - "Crown"/B.T           0141  
Full Name dies               0130, 0141  
Gas Boards                 0141  
History of Security endorsements      0030, 0035, 0044 

0130, 0141 
Hospitals                  0141 
Line engraved issues            0130, 0141  
Local Governmen Councils          0068, 0141 
Medicine - see also Hospitals  
Medicine                  0141 
Numerals                  0130, 0141 
Officials                  0130  
Overprints - see also Underprints 
Overprints - General            0030, 0041, 0130 

0141 
Overprints - Holloway 244          0042 
Overprints - N.B.N.Z./LD.          0110 
Overprints - O.U.S.             0028, 0029, 0141 

0147, 0150  
Overprints - Police Courts         0141 
Overprints - Revenues            0141 
Penny Reds                 0130 
Perforated Cancellations          0027, 0141 
Perforating Machine Manufacturers      0130 
Police                   0141  
Post offices in Bangkok - see Bangkok - 

British Post Offices 
Postal Stationery              0027, 0141 
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