
  

 

Contact Us 

If you need to update your contact information, or   
if your committee or group would like to include an 

event or activity in the monthly newsletters, please 

contact the church office at mhbc@madisonhills.com 

or 

 (210) 656-3946 
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Office Hours: 

Mon-Thurs: 9 am—4 pm 

Fri 9 am—12 pm 

Sat & Sun — Closed 

 

Hey there! I’ve got some thoughts on how to be a great 
friend. 

 
Friendships are super important for everyone, even if you 
think you don’t need one. But guess what? You’ll proba-
bly find yourself needing a friend someday. So, why not 

start making friends today? 
 

Remember, friends aren’t found; they’re made. And it’s 
not always easy. A lot of people are looking for friends, 
but the truth is, friends are made. That’s the tricky part. 

To make a friend, you have to be a friend. And that 
means putting yourself out there and being available to 

others. 
 

One person said it perfectly: “I’ve made more friends 
with my toolbox.” That means you have to get involved 

with people in any way you can. If you see someone who 
might need a helping hand, try to be there for them. The 

greatest gift you can give someone is your help. And 
when you help others, you’ll start the process of making 

friends. 
 

But there’s always a risk that by helping people, they 
won’t be a friend to you. That’s the risk to making 

friends. But hey, that’s part of the adventure! 
 

Another way to make friends is to be an encouraging per-
son. Celebrate others and their accomplishments. Lift 

them up when they succeed. 
 

So, when should you start making friends? Start today! 
One way to start is to encourage them to come to church 
with you. This summer, make a new friend by encourag-

ing them to come to MHBC with you. 
 

Let’s make some friends this summer!  

mailto:mhbc@madisonhills.com
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Kelly Wiese 1 Isabel Vaquera 11 Branden Lee 20 Laura Swiess 26 

Landon Jensen 1 Chris  Edmiston 12 Patricia Brown 23 Harry Gordon 28 

Gaylene Tenney 10 Rickie Baker 16 Jonathan Brown 25 Margarette Pena 28 

Coy Lee 10 Helga Chandler 17 Linda Newton 26 Daniel Spencer 28 

      Richie Flores 31 Happy Birthday to  you from MHBC!  

 

Youth Schlitterbahn  Trip 

Thursday, July 17 

9:30 AM - 4:00 PM 

 

Ice Cream Social 

Sunday, July 20 

5:00 PM 

 

Vacation Bible School 

Monday, June 21 - Friday, June 25 

9:00 AM - 12:00 PM 

 

VBS Family Night 

Wednesday, June 23 

6:00 PM 

 

Bring-A-Friend Sunday 

Sunday, July 27 

10:45 AM 
 

 

Kids’ Camp 
Friday, August 1 - Saturday, August 2 

2:00 PM - 2:00 PM 

 

Drive-Thru Prayer Event 

Saturday, August 2 

10:00 AM 

 

Promotion Sunday 

Sunday, August 10 

9:30 PM 

 

Deacon Ordination 

Sunday, August 10 

5:00 PM 
 

 

For more information about up-

coming events check out the 

“Events” tab on our website,  

madisonhills.com 
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Another fun, successful year in the books at MHBC  

Mother’s Day Out. We celebrated our Pre K with their end 
of year field trip to McKenna Children’s Museum. We 
were so blessed to have many of the parents and  

grandparents accompany us. 

Then Thursday, May 15 we held our Pre K graduation 

ceremony. We graduated 15 Pre K children, sending off  

prepared to Kindergarten. Our Three-year-old classes  

performed to the delight of the audience. 

I need one teacher for my Toddler class and possibly  

another teacher for a third three-year-old class. Of 
course, I always need subs to be available on short notice. 
If you know of any interested people, please have them 
contact me. The smiles, hugs and love received from the 
children are priceless. I am scheduling tours for interested 
new parents. We accept children 4 months through Pre K. 
Right now my Nursery and Three year old classes have a 
waitlist. If you know of families looking for a Bible based 
MDO, please have them contact me at (210)656-1194 or 
mdo@madisonhills.com. 

Music Camp 2025 – got fruit? 

 

What an amazing week of music-making with our kids! We had 21 students over the 

course of the week and the MOST incredible team of 27 volunteers that made the week 

run super smoothly. It seemed like every time I thought of something that needed to be 

done, someone was already there, handling it. It was truly 

amazing to be a part of such 

an incredible team of servants who love kids, love music, 

and love their Lord. I am 

overcome with thankfulness! If you worked Music Camp, I 

hope you know what a 

blessing you are and how much I appreciate you!!! 
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SUNDAYS 

  9:30 AM  Sunday School for all ages 

9:30 AM Partner’s for Christ - 

Sunday School  

on Campus or Online Zoom  

 (Join Zoom Link available on our website,  

Event Section) 

10:45 AM  Worship Service 

 

TUESDAYS 

6:30 PM  Men's Bible Study 

 

 

 

 

 

 

WEDNESDAYS 

10:00 AM  Adult Bible Study - Facebook Live 

11:00 AM  Ladies of Grace Sunday School 

1:00 PM Ladies’ Exercise Class 

6:15 PM Youth Bible Study 

6:30 PM  Adult Bible Study 

6:30 PM  Kid’s Bible Study 

6:30 PM  Worship Choir Rehearsal 
 

 

 

June Financial &  Attendance Information 
 

  June Giving – General Fund - $43,944.25 

  Total Giving – General Fund – Year to Date  - $264,330.14 

  New Building Fund Total - $363,317.26 

 

  Average Sunday School Attendance  - 119 

  Average Worship Service Attendance  - 171 

  Average Online Worship Service Attendance - 169 

  Average Online Wed Morning Attendance  - 120 

  Average Wed Evening Activities Attendance  - 46 

HAPPENING EVERY  
WEEK 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

Wednesday, July 2 

6:00 PM - Food Pantry at MHBC 
 

Friday, July 4 

Church Office Closed - 

Happy Independence Day! 

 

Sunday, July 6 

10:45 AM - Lord’s Supper 

 

 

 

 

 

Thursday, July 10 

6:30 PM - Deacon Meeting  

 

Friday, July 11 

7:30 PM - North East Wind  

Symphony Concert 
 

Wednesday, July 16 

6:00 PM - Food Pantry at MHBC 

 

Sunday, July 20 

5:00 PM - Ice Cream Social & 

Church Conference 

 

Monday, July 21 

9:00 AM - First Day of VBS  

 

 

 

 

 

 

Tuesday, July 22 

9:00 AM - VBS Day 2 

 

Wednesday, July 23 

9:00 AM - VBS Day 3 

6:00 PM - VBS Family Night 
 

Thursday, July 24 

9:00 AM - VBS Day 4 

 

Friday, July 25 

9:00 AM - First Day of VBS 

 

Sunday, July 27 

10:45 AM - Bring a Friend Sunday 
 

 

MARK YOUR 
CALENDAR 


