
1. Learning Objectives and Goals (20 points)

● Outstanding (16-20 points): Clear, specific learning objectives aligned with the
student’s academic and career interests. Objectives are challenging yet achievable.

● Good (11-15 points): Learning objectives are defined and relevant but may lack
specificity or alignment with career interests.

● Satisfactory (6-10 points): Objectives are general or somewhat vague, with limited
alignment to the student’s interests.

● Needs Improvement (0-5 points): Learning objectives are unclear, overly broad, or not
aligned with the student’s interests.

2. Quality of Assignments and Projects (20 points)

● Outstanding (16-20 points): Assignments are engaging, challenging, and directly
related to the student’s learning goals. Projects encourage critical thinking and creativity.

● Good (11-15 points): Assignments are relevant and moderately challenging but may
lack creativity or depth.

● Satisfactory (6-10 points): Assignments are somewhat relevant and may not fully
engage the student or challenge their skills.

● Needs Improvement (0-5 points): Assignments are not relevant or engaging and do
not challenge the student.

3. Mentorship and Support (20 points)

● Outstanding (16-20 points): Regular, constructive feedback from a dedicated mentor.
Mentors are accessible and provide guidance, support, and encouragement.

● Good (11-15 points): Feedback is provided, though it may not be as frequent or
in-depth. Mentors are generally accessible and supportive.

● Satisfactory (6-10 points): Feedback is occasional or general. Mentor support is limited
or inconsistent.

● Needs Improvement (0-5 points): Minimal or no feedback from mentors. Limited
support or guidance.

4. Skill Development (20 points)

● Outstanding (16-20 points): The internship significantly enhances key skills relevant to
the student’s career interests, including technical, communication, and problem-solving
skills.

● Good (11-15 points): The internship provides some skill development but may not fully
address all relevant areas.

● Satisfactory (6-10 points): Skill development is minimal or not well-aligned with the
student’s career goals.

● Needs Improvement (0-5 points): Little to no noticeable skill development.



5. Professionalism and Work Ethic (10 points)

● Outstanding (8-10 points): The student demonstrates exceptional professionalism,
reliability, and a strong work ethic. Meets or exceeds expectations consistently.

● Good (5-7 points): The student shows good professionalism and reliability, with minor
areas for improvement.

● Satisfactory (3-4 points): The student displays basic professionalism but may need
improvement in reliability or work ethic.

● Needs Improvement (0-2 points): The student lacks professionalism or reliability, and
work ethic is poor.

6. Engagement and Initiative (10 points)

● Outstanding (8-10 points): The student shows high levels of engagement, takes
initiative, and contributes positively to the team or project.

● Good (5-7 points): The student is engaged and takes some initiative, though there is
room for more proactive contributions.

● Satisfactory (3-4 points): The student is somewhat engaged but rarely takes initiative
or goes beyond assigned tasks.

● Needs Improvement (0-2 points): The student shows little engagement or initiative.

Total Score: _____ / 100 points

Comments:

● Strengths:
● Areas for Improvement:
● Overall Experience:


