
EQUINE LIABILITY WAIVER 
 
Name of Rider _________________________________  Date ________________________ 
 
Address  _________________________  City ________________ State _____ Zip ________ 
 
Phone __________________  Email ____________________________ 
 
Emergency Contact ________________________  Phone _________________________  
 
 
 ​WARNING!! 
 
LIABILITY RELEASE: -- PLEASE READ CAREFULLY BEFORE SIGNING -- WARNING: 
UNDER GEORGIA LAW, AN EQUINE ACTIVITY SPONSOR OR EQUINE PROFESSIONAL IS 
NOT LIABLE FOR AN INJURY TO OR THE DEATH OF A PARTICIPANT IN EQUINE 
ACTIVITIES RESULTING FROM THE INHERENT RISKS OF EQUINE ACTIVITIES, 
PURSUANT TO CHAPTER 12 OF TITLE 4 OF THE OFFICIAL CODE OF GEORGIA 
ANNOTATED.  
I have been advised that riding, showing and being around horses constitutes certain risks, in 
that horses, like any other animal, are unpredictable and often prone to mischief. Moreover, 
jumping horses over obstacles leads to additional possible danger due to tripping or falling. 
Therefore, being made aware of all of the above, I (we) readily accept all responsibility for 
myself, my child and my horse while I under the instruction of Candece Wagenfohr Niss, 
whether at my stable, clinic, show or other location.  
 
I understand that Candece Wagenfohr Niss will make all reasonable and prudent efforts to 
insure the safest possible horsemanship. I and/or my family totally release Candece Wagenfohr 
Niss from any liability for damages or injuries that may occur to me, my child, my horse or my 
vehicle, whichever is applicable. I understand that I will need to inform friends and family that 
may come to watch me or my child ride to the inherent risks of equine activity, and release 
Candece Wagenfohr Niss from liability in the possibility they may place themselves in harm’s 
way.  
 
The United States Equestrian Team, the United States Equestrian Federation, and the United 
States Pony Club require protective headgear to be worn at all times while mounted. This is for 
the protection of the rider in case of fall. This is a mandatory rule while participating in 
instruction from Candece Wagenfohr Niss. If you do not wear protective headgear, you are 
acting against lesson policy!!! 
 
Signature of Rider: ___________________ 
Parent or Guardian if rider is under 18: 
__________________________________ 

 



 
 

 


