LOS
VAQUEROS
RESERVOIR
EXPANSION I
PROJECT

LOS VAQUEROS RESERVOIR JOINT POWERS AUTHORITY
FINANCE COMMITTEE

AGENDA
Regular Meeting (June Rescheduled)
July 11, 2023 — 7:30 a.m.

Directors participating telephonically:

Anthea Hansen - 17840 Ward Avenue, Patterson, California 95363

Paul Sethy - 46961 Zapotec Drive, Fremont, California 94539

Rebecca Eisenberg - 2345 Waverly Street, Palo Alto, California 94301

Michael Tognolini - EBMUD Administration Building, 375 Eleventh Street, Oakland, California
94607

This meeting will be conducted remotely and any member of the public who desires to participate
in the open session items of this meeting may do so by accessing the Zoom link below without
otherwise complying with the Brown Act’s teleconference requirements.

Please click the link below to join the webinar:
https://lagerlof.zoom.us/j/81912208202?pwd=dG9hdGFyOWp6L1BERktwKOMyUHVRZz09
Passcode: 484186
Or One tap mobile:

US: +16694449171,,81912208202#,,,,*484186#
or Telephone: 1-669-444-9171
Meeting ID: 819-1220-8202
Passcode: 484186

Any member of the public wishing to make any comments to the Committee may do so by
accessing the above-referenced link where they may select the option to join via webcam or
teleconference. Members of the public may also submit written comments to the Clerk by
4:00 p.m. on the business day prior to the meeting for the Clerk to read into the record (subject to
three-minute limitation). The meeting Chair will acknowledge such individual(s) at the appropriate
time in the meeting prior to making their comment. Members of the public will be disconnected
from the meeting prior to any Closed Session, if applicable.

NOTE: To comply with the Americans with Disabilities Act, if you need special assistance to
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https://lagerlof.zoom.us/j/81912208202?pwd=dG9hdGFyOWp6L1BERktwK0MyUHVRZz09

participate in this Committee meeting, please contact the Authority’s Clerk
at  rperea@lagerlof.com by 4:00 p.m. on July 10, 2023 to inform the Authority of your needs
and to determine if accommodation is feasible. Each item on the Agenda shall be deemed to
include any appropriate motion, resolution, or ordinance, to take action on any item.
Materials related to items on this Agenda are available for public review at:
www.losvaquerosjpa.com/board-meetings.

CALL TO ORDER

ROLL CALL OF COMMITTEE MEMBERS

Anthea Hansen — Chair, San Luis & Delta-Mendota Water Authority
Paul Sethy — Vice Chair, Alameda County Water District

Michael Tognolini — East Bay Municipal Utility District

Rebecca Eisenberg — Santa Clara Valley Water District

PUBLIC COMMENT ON NON-AGENDA ITEMS

Any member of the public wishing to address the Finance Committee regarding items not on the
Agenda should do so at this time. The Committee welcomes your comments and requests that
speakers present their remarks within established time limits and on issues that directly affect
the Authority or are within the jurisdiction of the Authority.

DISCUSSION ITEMS (may include action to recommend forwarding items to Board of
Directors for adoption or approval)

1.1 May 25, 2023 Finance Committee Meeting Summary

1.2 Review of Draft Audit Policy

1.3 Review and Discussion regarding Clean Energy Capital Invoices

1.4  Draft Treasurer’s Report — Month Ended May 31, 2023

FUTURE AGENDA ITEMS

ADJOURNMENT


mailto:rperea@lagerlof.com
http://www.losvaquerosjpa.com/board-meetings

ITEM1.1: MAY 25,2023 FINANCE COMMITTEE MEETING SUMMARY

RESPONSIBLE/LEAD STAFF MEMBER:

James Ciampa, General Counsel

DISCUSSION:

Attached for the Committee’s information is the summary prepared for the May 25, 2023
Finance Committee meeting.

ALTERNATIVES:

Any suggested revisions to the attached summary will be considered.

FISCAL ANALYSIS:

Not applicable

ENVIRONMENTAL REQUIREMENTS:

Not applicable

EXHIBITS/ATTACHMENTS:

Summary from May 25, 2023 Finance Committee meeting.
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SUMMARY OF REGULAR MEETING OF

FINANCE COMMITTEE
May 25,2023 — 1:00 p.m.

Meeting called to order at 1:02 p.m.
Participating Telephonically:
Chair Anthea Hansen
Vice Chair Paul Sethy
Committee Member Rebecca Eisenberg (arrived at 1:04 p.m.)
Committee Member Michael Tognolini

Staff and approximately 17 others attended the meeting.

1.1  April 27, 2023 Finance Committee Meeting Summary. The draft summary of
the April 27, 2023 Finance Committee meeting was presented for the Committee’s review and
discussion. The draft summary was deemed approved by the Committee, as presented.

1.2 Discussion of 2024 Fiscal Year Budget, Draft Budget Book and Cost Sharing
Agreement Amendment No. 5. Taryn Ravazzini, Executive Director, noted that as previously
presented to the Finance Committee and to the Board of Directors, JPA staff along with CCWD’s
staff, have been working to develop the Authority’s Fiscal Year 2024 Budget. Executive Director
Ravazzini then introduced Charles Gardner from the Hallmark Group, the Authority’s new
Program Manager.

Maureen Martin reviewed the revised Budget Book for FY 24, with an emphasis on recent
changes made to the Budget Book and related budget figures. The draft budget includes sources
and uses of funds totaling $19,073,000, with $8,673,000 to be contributed by the Authority’s
members through Amendment No. 5 to the Multi-Party Cost Share Agreement. Ms. Martin pointed
out that no capital reserves will be funded in FY 24 because no construction activities are
anticipated during that fiscal year. However, the contingency was increased from 10% to 17% of
service costs to provide additional cushion for unexpected occurrences. Ms. Martin also advised
that the Board of Directors had requested at the May 19 Board meeting that the budget figures be
presented in millions, rather than in thousands. Ms. Martin then reviewed the additional detail
provided for the CCWD Services items, which had been requested by the Board at the May 19
Board meeting.

Vice Chair Sethy asked whether the various project component designs were being done
at CCWD or by subcontractors. Ms. Martin advised that outside consultants were handling the
design work for various project components and the Design Review Team, consisting of
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representatives from the Members, reviews design materials on a regular basis. Committee
member Tognolini asked for clarification of the item under “Environmental Planning — Program
(not facility specific).” Ms. Martin advised that term refers to items such as system integration and
modeling and power across the whole program that are not specific to any single facility.
Committee member Tognolini also requested a more detailed breakdown under the CCWD labor
category so those costs can be allocated among the separate line items, similar to what was done
under the CCWD services category. Ms. Martin advised that CCWD can provide that information.

Chair Hansen thanked staff for reformatting the numbers in millions of dollars. However,
she prefers whole numbers without decimal points. The Committee supported that proposed format
change.

Executive Director Ravazzini advised that changes to Multi-Party Cost Sharing Agreement
Amendment No. 5 were presented to the member agencies’ staff and will be brought back to the
Board in June for approval. She anticipates Amendment No. 5 will be fully approved and executed
by all members by July or August.

1.3 Consideration of Extension of Standard Services Agreement with Clean
Energy Capital for Financial Consulting Services for 2024 Fiscal Year (not to exceed
$535,000.00 through June 30, 2024). Executive Director Ravazzini advised that Clean Energy
Capital has been providing financial consulting services to the Project through Contra Costa Water
District for many years. At the November 9, 2022 Authority Board of Directors’ meeting, the
Authority engaged Clean Energy Capital to provide financial advisory services for the remainder
of the 2023 Fiscal Year. This item would extend the Authority’s agreement with Clean Energy
Capital for the 2024 Fiscal Year and would provide a revised scope of work related to those
services.

Executive Director Ravazzini acknowledged the tremendous work Clean Energy Capital
has done in addressing financial issues on the Project, as well as in preparing the term sheet for
the Service Agreement, developing various Service Agreement work groups and leading the
negotiating teams for the Service Agreement. Clean Energy Capital also played a significant role
in obtaining the indicative credit rating for the Authority in connection with the anticipated WIFIA
Loan and in the ongoing process to procure accounting and financial services and banking services.
Moving into Fiscal Year 2024, Clean Energy Capital is expected to play a large role in the WIFIA
Loan and bridge financing processes, while continuing to provide advisory services in the
development of the Service Agreement.

Given Clean Energy Capital’s experience in working on the Project and understanding the
Authority’s and respective Members’ needs, it is uniquely qualified to provide the financial
advisory services for Fiscal Year 2024. This item is being brought before the Finance Committee
for discussion concerning the continuation of these professional services through Clean Energy
Capital and the proposed scope of work, including the concept of transaction (“success”) fees to
minimize budget impacts.

Executive Director Ravazzini stated she met yesterday with Clean Energy Capital and the
Hallmark Group to discuss financing and program management issues. From that meeting, some
items relating to development of the Service Agreement and JPA financial administration will be
shifted to the Program Manager, so that will result in revision to Clean Energy Capital’s scope of
work that is included with the meeting materials, as well as in a reduction of costs. Those changes



will be reflected in revised documents to be presented to the Authority’s Board at its Junel4
meeting, assuming the Committee approves moving this item to the Board.

Vice Chair Sethy stated the sole source award to Clean Energy Capital is acceptable to him
but expressed his concern about possible duplication of services between Clean Energy Capital
and Khadam Consulting, Inc. Executive Director Ravazzini advised the entities provide
complementary services, with Khadam Consulting focusing on technical and operational issues
and Clean Energy Capital providing financially-related services. Chair Hansen understood Vice
Chair Sethy’s concern but confirmed the complementary nature of the two consulting firms’
services.

Committee member Tognolini appreciates the work done by Clean Energy and feels the
sole source approach is appropriate and approves of the not-to-exceed amount. Committee member
Tognolini posed a question regarding the possible “success” fee and Chair Hansen stated from her
prior experience, it is important to address contractually any Authority obligations in the event the
transaction fails. Committee member Eisenberg concurred with the other Committee members’
comments and was comfortable moving this item to the Board for consideration at its June 14
meeting.

1.4  Review of Draft Fiscal Year 2022 Audit Report. Executive Director Ravazzini
introduced David Alvey, audit partner with Maze & Associates, who reviewed with the Committee
the draft Fiscal Year 2022 Audit Report and Memorandum of Internal Control and Required
Communications. He advised the Authority has received a “clean” audit opinion, which concludes
that the financial statements are prepared, in all material respects, in accordance with the applicable
financial reporting framework and is the highest rating provided. Also, no deficiencies or material
weaknesses were identified. The final audit report will be presented to the Authority’s Board of
Directors for approval at the June 14, 2023 meeting.

1.5 Update on Accounting Services Request for Proposals. Executive Director
Ravazzini informed the Board that as part of the transition of the Authority’s financial management
from Contra Costa Water District to the Authority, it is necessary for the Authority to engage an
accounting firm to provide accounting and financial management services. In early April, the
Authority distributed a request for proposals to potentially qualified accounting firms and received
two proposals, one from Eide Bailly and one from Clifton Larson Allen.

A review panel consisting of finance staff from the Members is in the process of conducting
interviews of the two firms and a recommendation will be presented to the Board at the June 14
Board meeting. Vice Chair Sethy advised that he reviewed the websites of both firms and is
impressed with each firm.

1.6  Update on Banking Services. Executive Director Ravazzini advised staff is in the
process of procuring banking services for the Authority as part of the financial transition from
Contra Costa Water District. Clean Energy Capital has assisted in this process and received
recommendations from several Members for possible financial institutions. On May 18, Clean
Energy Capital interviewed two banks, JP Morgan Chase and Central Valley Community Bank.
David Moore of Clean Energy Capital provided a PowerPoint presentation and advised that JP
Morgan Chase emerged as staff’s recommendation for the necessary banking services based in
part on its financial strength and experience with public agency clients. JP Morgan Chase’s annual
fees are estimated to be approximately $3,500 for FY24 and as the JPA grows, that fee will
increase.



Committee member Eisenberg noted the importance of having a strong personal
relationship with the bank’s Relationship Manager. Vice Chair Sethy advised that he has reviewed
the websites of the two banks and is concerned with Central Valley Community Bank’s financial
strength, liquidity and ability to comply with collateralization requirements. Vice Chair Sethy also
noted that if the Authority issues bonds, the JP Morgan Chase relationship will be beneficial.

1.7  Draft Treasurer’s Report — Month Ended April 30, 2023. Executive Director
Ravazzini presented the draft Treasurer’s Report for the month ended April 30, 2023 for review
and discussion. General Counsel James Ciampa noted a correction in the report presented to the
Board today, which differs from the report in the meeting packet. Mr. Ciampa stated the cash on
hand figure was revised from $13,138,626 to $12,875,908 to reflect further expenses that have
been paid.

FUTURE AGENDA ITEMS:
e Follow up on Financial Transition plan.

Next Meeting: June 22, 2023, 1:00 p.m.

The meeting adjourned at 2:20 p.m.

James D. Giampa

James D. Ciampa
General Counsel




ITEM 1.2: REVIEW OF DRAFT AUDIT POLICY

RESPONSIBLE/LEAD STAFF MEMBER:

Taryn Ravazzini, Executive Director

DISCUSSION:

In connection with the Board of Directors’ action to engage the Authority’s auditor for the
2022 Fiscal Year audit, the Board discussed establishing an Audit Policy for future years. General
Counsel Ciampa has prepared the attached draft Audit Policy for the Committee’s review and
comment.

The draft Audit Policy provides an overview of audit tasks, as well as setting forth the
timing, criteria and process in selecting the Authority’s auditor. The draft policy also explains the
Finance Committee’s role and responsibilities in the audit process. Auditors are limited to serving
for five years under this policy, in conformance with Government Code Section 12410.6(b).

ALTERNATIVES:

For discussion purposes

FISCAL ANALYSIS:

Not applicable

ENVIRONMENTAL REQUIREMENTS:

Not applicable

EXHIBITS/ATTACHMENTS:

Draft Audit Policy



EXHIBIT 1

LOS VAQUEROS RESERVOIR JOINT POWERS AUTHORITY
AUDIT POLICY

A. Purpose and Scope. Under Government Code Section 6505 and the provisions of
its Joint Exercise of Powers Agreement, the Los Vaqueros Reservoir Joint Powers Authority (the
“Authority”) must prepare an audit each year, which must be filed with the California State
Controller within twelve (12) months of the end of the fiscal year being audited. In addition, as
the recipient of funding provided by the federal government, the Authority is subject to single
audit requirements.

The purpose of this policy is to ensure the Authority complies with all state and federal
audit requirements, including the State Controller’s minimum audit requirements set forth at
Title 2, Section 1131.2 of the California Code of Regulations (a copy of which is attached hereto
as Exhibit A) and does so in a timely and efficient manner. In addition, the audit will verify the
existence of adequate internal controls and attest whether financial statements are accurate,
complete and fairly represent the position and performance of the Authority. This policy also
establishes the Finance Committee’s role in appointing external auditors and provides the
requirements and guidelines to be used in screening, engaging and monitoring the external
auditor.

B. Definitions.

1. Audit: an independent and objective appraisal to examine or review the fair
presentation of financial statements, economy and efficiency of operations,
the compliance with laws and regulations, and/or the detection of fraudulent
activities.

2. External Audit: an independent and objective appraisal performed by a non-
Authority audit entity of the Authority’s financial and administrative
performance.

3. Request for Proposal: an invitation for service providers to submit a proposal
to perform audit activities for a specific fiscal period. The request for proposal
(RFP) process brings structure to the procurement decision and is meant to
allow the risks and benefits to be identified clearly upfront.

C. Policy.

1. Auditor Engagement Process: The Authority shall use a formal RFP process
to seek qualified accounting firms to provide independent external audit
services. The RFP shall include:

a. An introduction regarding the Authority, the range of services sought
and a request to submit an engagement proposal;

b. A statement of the minimum qualifications required from any
proposing firm and a requirement for the proposing firm to list by
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name and experience the audit team members to be assigned to the
engagement;

Proposing firms are to provide a list of at least three (3) contacts with
any current and/or former public agency clients for which they have
performed financial audits; and

A request for information on the method and basis of compensation
for services. Basic audit services, preparation of the annual financial
transactions report to be filed with the State Controller’s Office and
the preparation of any necessary tax filings will be quoted as a not-
to-exceed fixed fee. Fees for any related consulting services are to be
quoted at an hourly rate. Submitted proposals must include an
estimated number of hours to complete the audit and annual financial
transactions report work.

2. Selection Criteria:

3.

Timing:

The fundamental criteria in selecting the audit firm are the firm’s
capability to perform the required work, prior experience with
entities similar to the Authority and on work similar to the Los
Vaqueros Reservoir Expansion Project, professional reputation and
cost of services.

The audit firm should demonstrate through the RFP process that the
engagement proposal is complete, responsible and responsive to the
audit specifications.

The Authority operates on a July 1 to June 30 fiscal year, meaning
that its audit must be completed by June 30 of the year following the
year under audit.

When the Authority must proceed with the RFP process to engage an
auditing firm (see Section 6, below, for potential continued
engagement), the RFP should be completed and sent to qualified
firms by no later than July 31; responses from the prospective
auditing firms should be due by no later than August 31; staff and
Finance Committee review of proposals to be conducted at the
September Finance Committee meeting with the Finance Committee
recommendation to be made at that meeting; and award of auditing
contract and appointment of auditor at the October Board of
Directors’ meeting.

4. Engagement: The acceptance of the independent audit services proposal shall
be by motion passed by the Board of Directors and confirmed in writing to the
firm selected. The selected firm will work with Authority staff in conducting
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the audit and will present its initial report to the Finance Committee and final
report to the Board of Directors.

5. Post-Audit Performance Review: Following the completion and acceptance by

the Authority of the audit report for each fiscal year, the Finance Committee
will evaluate the performance of the audit firm, including:

a.

Did the firm meet all requirements for the audit and related annual
financial transactions report?

Did the firm maintain and meet the audit schedule?
Were reports and recommendations timely, clear and complete?

Were the firm’s personnel assigned to the audit those identified in
the firm’s proposal?

Did the firm’s personnel perform their duties in a professional
manner?

Was the firm responsive to the Authority’s auditing and related
needs?

6. Continued Engagement:

a.

Based upon a favorable post-audit performance review by the
Finance Committee, the Board of Directors may consider continued
engagement of the auditing firm for multiple years. The RFP shall
address this potential for multiple-year services conditioned upon a
satisfactory post-audit performance review.

Pursuant to Government Code section 12410.6(b), the Authority will
limit any engagement term by one auditing firm to not more than
five (5) years. A sixth-year extension may be considered by the
Finance Committee, to be recommended to the Board of Directors,
based upon exemplary performance by the engaged auditing firm.

An audit firm engaged by the Authority in a prior term is eligible to
respond to an RFP for a subsequent term after a five-year waiting
period.

D. Responsibilities. The Finance Committee will also serve as the Authority’s audit

committee. The Finance Committee will: (1) review and approve the RFP that Authority staff
prepares; (2) screen and recommend for appointment to the Board of Directors the final
candidate(s) to serve as the Authority’s auditor to prepare the audit report and related filings; (3)
review the draft audit report and recommend the draft audit report for approval by the Board of
Directors; (4) ensure Authority staff implements any actions recommended by the auditor; (5)
conduct the post-audit performance review of the auditor; and (6) perform other related duties as
directed by the Board of Directors.
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EXHIBIT A

§ 1131.2. Minimum Audit Requirements.

(a) The audit shall be made in accordance with generally accepted auditing standards.
Various auditing procedures are suggested and described on pages 41 through 69 of the
American Institute of Certified Public Accountants publication Audits of State and Local
Governmental Units. No hard and fast rules can be set down as to the specific procedures that
should be taken. Professional judgment must be exercised. Following are general statements that
the county auditor or independent accounting firm should consider in preparing an audit program
in connection with the audit of a California special district.

(1) A proper study and evaluation of the existing internal control and the financial
organizational structure should be made. The extent to which an auditor should go in testing the
evidential matter supporting his opinion on the financial statements depends on the effectiveness
of the district's system of internal control. Sufficient competent evidential matter is to be
obtained through inspection, observation, inquiries, and confirmations to afford a reasonable
basis for an opinion regarding the financial statements under examination. If the internal control
is so deficient that an auditor must disclaim his opinion in this regard, the reason for this
disclaimer must be set forth in the audit report.

(2) The auditor should review the laws applicable to the financial transactions of
the district. For instance, all special districts are subject to a uniform accounting system
prescribed by the State Controller. Should there be indications that the district may have failed to
comply with legal requirements, the transactions may be referred to proper legal counsel for
interpretation of the applicable law. Noncompliance should be commented upon in the report
and, if necessary, the auditor's opinion should be qualified, disclaimed or adverse.

(3) The district's report of financial transactions to the State Controller should be
reviewed to see that it agrees with the official records of the district for the period. The State
Controller should be informed of any material difference.

(4) A review should be made of the previous audit report workpapers and
program if available.

(5) The auditor should ascertain what funds are maintained and by what authority
or under what circumstances each fund maintained was created.

(6) The auditor should ascertain the basis of accounting, that is, cash, accrual or
modified accrual. Accrual is the basis for enterprise funds and modified accrual is the basis for
non-enterprise funds. The cash basis is no longer approved for special districts.

(7) The auditor should take a trial balance of the accounts of each fund and should
list both opening and closing balances. The opening balances should be compared with the
amounts shown in the audit report for the previous period, if any, and any difference should be
investigated and reconciled.

(8) A summary of the financial data included in the minutes or other official
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records of the proceedings of the legislative body should be prepared. Expenditure authorizations
and the appropriations made to cover the authorizations should be confirmed.

(9) The auditor should verify the balance of cash on hand.

(10) The auditor should reconcile bank accounts including cash on deposit with
county treasurer as of the balance sheet date and such other times as is necessary. He should
obtain confirmation from depositories for (1) all bank accounts, time certificates or savings and
loan accounts, and (2) collateral securing such accounts, if applicable. Collateral should be
examined or confirmed with the depository holding the collateral as trustee. The auditor should
determine the adequacy and propriety of the collateral pledged.

(11) The auditor should test the tax levy, tax collection and delinquencies whether
processed by the district or the county.

(12) The collection and recording of all ascertainable revenues should be tested
during the period under audit. The test should be sufficient to determine that receipts have been
recorded in the proper funds and period.

(13) The auditor should determine:

(A) That the expenditures were properly authorized and incurred and are
proper charges to the fund and appropriation against which they have been charged.

(B) That the expenditures are supported by the proper documents and that
the documents are so marked as to prevent their reuse. In this connection, it should be
ascertained whether noncash expenditures, that is, interdepartmental transactions are supported
by adequate documentation and were properly recorded.

(14) A review should be made of nonrevenue receipts and nonexpense
disbursements to determine if they were legal and properly recorded.

(15) All other assets such as investments, accounts receivable, inventories, paid
expenses, fixed assets and similar items should be verified in accordance with generally accepted
auditing standards.

(16) All liabilities such as accounts payable, notes payable, contracts payable,
judgments and similar items should be verified in accordance with generally accepted auditing
standards. Proper authorities should be contacted to ascertain existence of any possible

contingent liabilities.

(17) The auditor should verify the fund balance and reserve accounts of all funds.
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ITEM 1.3: REVIEW AND DISCUSSION REGARDING CLEAN ENERGY CAPITAL
INVOICES

RESPONSIBLE/LEAD STAFF MEMBER:

Taryn Ravazzini, Executive Director

RECOMMENDATION:

That the Finance Committee make a formal recommendation to the Board of Directors to
authorize payment from Fiscal Year 2023 contingency amounts to Clean Energy Capital
Securities, LLC (“Clean Energy Capital”) for services rendered in the following manner. Approve:
1) to revise the start date of the Authority’s contract with Clean Energy Capital to August 25, 2022,
2) to direct staff to negotiate a reduction in cost with Clean Energy Capital for the overages, and
3) to increase the Authority’s contract amount to cover the negotiated amount [Option 2 under the
alternatives listed below].

DISCUSSION:

Clean Energy Capital has been providing financial consulting services to the Project
through Contra Costa Water District (CCWD) for many years. At the November 9, 2022 Authority
Board of Directors’ meeting, the Authority engaged Clean Energy Capital to provide financial
advisory services to the Authority for the remainder of the 2023 Fiscal Year. The agreement with
Clean Energy Capital was fully executed on December 5, 2022, and took effect that day.

As discussed at the June 14 Board of Directors’ meeting, two issues have arisen with
respect to Clean Energy Capital’s work on behalf of the Authority. The Board requested the issues
be reviewed by the Finance Committee and a recommendation be brought back to the Board at its
July 12 meeting.

1) The first issue relates to services Clean Energy Capital (“CEC”) has provided to the
Authority that are beyond CEC’s agreed upon scope work in its contract with the
Authority. Those services were directed by the Executive Director since early 2023 to
assist with leadership support and membership coordination concerning the Service
Agreement development and key financial transition services, including work with the
auditor for the Fiscal Year 2022 audit, banking services procurement, and
development and coordination of the accounting and financial management services
request for proposals and evaluation process. On April 5, 2023, CEC requested an
amendment for out-of-scope services to add $211,561 to the NTE of the JPA
agreement. A written amendment was not provided to CEC. On June 9, 2023, CEC
invoiced the JPA for May services in the amount of $66,687.23 which exceeded the
NTE by $54,624.75. CEC has reported the total exceedance is $124,536 for services
performed through the end of June.

2) The other issue relates to an unpaid invoice from CEC to CCWD in the amount of
$136,776.60 for services rendered to the Authority from August 25, 2022 to December
4, 2022. At that time, CCWD transferred the direction of CEC’s work over to the
Authority while retaining management of the contract. The invoiced amount for work
within scope exceeded the not-to-exceed amount of CEC’s contract with CCWD of
$1.7 million. A written authorization was not provided to CEC to exceed the NTE.
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For Finance Committee consideration is the question of payment of the outstanding CEC
invoices for services rendered and, if approved, then by which contract mechanism. Staff will
provide the Board with further details regarding this issue based upon the Finance Committee’s
recommendation.

ALTERNATIVES:

Staff propose several options for remedy for the Committee’s consideration, as follows:

1) A) JPA does not pay the overage that was incurred while CEC was under contract to
CCWD; B) JPA negotiates a reduction to the CEC overage that was incurred under the JPA
contract; and C) a contract amendment is entered into for the negotiated amount.

2) A)JPA agrees to amend the JPA’s contract with CEC to an August 25% start date to provide
coverage to CCWD; B) negotiates a reduction for both CEC overages; and C) a contract
amendment is entered into to cover the overages.

3) JPA does not pay CEC either overage.

FISCAL ANALYSIS:

Regardless of whether CCWD or the Authority were to pay the subject amount (in whole
or as reduced), funds for payment would come from the same source — contingency monies left
from the Authority’s Fiscal Year 2023 Budget. If such payment is made, the Authority would
remain under budget for FY23.

ENVIRONMENTAL REQUIREMENTS:

Not applicable

EXHIBITS/ATTACHMENTS:

Clean Energy Capital contracts with CCWD and the Authority and related Clean Energy Capital
invoices
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INVOICE

BILL TO INVOICE # 1786
Contra Costa Water District DATE 12/31/2022
Accounts Payable DUE DATE 01/30/2023
1331 Concord Ave TERMS Net 30

Concord, CA 94520

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Los Vaqueros Reservoir Expansion Project - August 25-31, 2022 5,662.50
Los Vaqueros Reservoir Expansion Project - September 2022 35,522.50
Los Vaqueros Reservoir Expansion Project - October 2022 47,002.50
Los Vaqueros Reservoir Expansion Project - November 2022 47,003.75
Los Vaqueros Reservoir Expansion Project - December 1-4, 2022 1,486.25

All timesheets attached

BALANCE DUE $136,677.50

accounting@cleanenergycap.com
Please make payments to:
Clean Energy Capital Securities LLC
PO Box 841855
Pearland, TX 77584
(281) 685-0445

24



Client: Contra Costa Water District August 25 -

Project: Los Vaqueros Reservoir Expansion Project

Team Members: David Moore (Project Lead), Will Lockwood (Vice President), Saravleen Singh (Vice President),
Amanda Hanson (Associate)

31, 2022

Project Will
Lead VP
Date Description Hours Hours
8/25/2022 Finalize/ send key agreement summary to client 2.75
8/25/2022  Attend JPA Finance Committee meeting 1.25
8/25/2022  Call with Zone 7 re: WIFIA proforma 1.00
8/25/2022 JPA Finance Committee meeting 1.25
8/25/2022  Call with client re: review Zone 7 cost allocation modeling (w/ prep) 1.25
8/26/2022 Internal meeting re: Key Project Agreements file 1.75
8/26/2022 Develop Zone 7 extension with additional cost allocation calculations, respond to questions 3.00
8/29/2022 Develop timeline for Finance Workshop and Key Project Agreements file 1.25
8/31/2022 Update WIFIA proforma to reflect updated project costs 3.00
Total 5.00 11.50
Rate 385 325
Billing $ 1,925.00 $ 3,737.50
[T 2 T =300 e - | $ 5,662.50
— _ _ _
_— Page 1 of 1
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Client:
Project:

Team Members: David Moore (Project Lead), Will Lockwood (Vice President), Saravieen Singh (Vice President),

Contra Costa Water District
Los Vaqueros Reservoir Expansion Project

Amanda Hanson (Associate)

September 2022

Project Will
Lead VP
Date Description Hours Hours
9/1/2022 Internal meeting re: WIFIA LOI status 2.25
9/1/2022 Internal meeting re: WIFIA LOI status 1.50
9/1/2022 Update WIFIA proforma model for budget changes 4.50
9/1/2022 Review final WIFIA LOI submission materials 3.25
9/2/2022 Internal meeting re: LVE workshop materials 1.00
9/2/2022 Internal meeting re: LVE workshop materials 1.00
9/2/2022 Continue development of Summary of Key Agreements 2.50
9/2/2022 Continue development of Summary of Key Agreements 3.50
9/6/2022 Internal meeting re: Summary of Key Agreements 2.25
9/7/2022 Continue development of Summary of Key Agreements 2.25
9/7/2022 Call with client re: key agreements summary 1.00
9/7/2022 Develop/ send redline of key agreements summary 3.50
9/7/2022 Emails with JPA General Council 0.50
9/7/2022 Emails with EBMUD 0.50
9/7/2022 Call with client re: review Key Agreement document (w/ prep) 2.25
9/8/2022 Receive comments from General Council/ implement edits 1.25
9/8/2022 Review power point prez/ emails with client 0.75
9/8/2022 Receive/ implement comments from EBMUD 1.50
9/8/2022 Internal meeting/ account management 0.75
9/8/2022 Internal meeting - project management 0.75
9/8/2022 Continue development of Summary of Key Agreements 2.00
9/8/2022 Internal meeting - project management 0.75
9/9/2022 Review response to client email 0.50
9/9/2022 Review final Summary of Key Agreements for dist. to partners 3.25
9/12/2022 Revise/ distribute key agreements summary 2.25
9/12/2022  Emails with client team 0.50
9/19/2022  Organize comments received from partners on Summary of Key Agmts 3.25
9/19/2022  Emails with partners to answer questions and clarify next steps 2.25
9/20/2022  Internal meeting - project management 0.75
9/20/2022  Develop summary of comments from partners 3.75
9/20/2022  Internal meeting - project management 0.75
9/21/2022  Emails with client 0.75
9/21/2022  Finalize summary of comments from partners 1.75
9/22/2022  Review comments from partners/ organize presentation 3.00
9/22/2022 Develop board slides re: WIFIA 2.25
9/24/2022  Emails with WIFIA team 0.75
9/24/2022  Develop finance committee prez 2.25
9/24/2022 Develop finance committee prez 1.50
9/24/2022 Develop slide deck, agenda and meeting materials for finance workshop 5.50
9/25/2022  Finalize/ send finance committee prez 1.50
9/26/2022  Scheduling emails with client 0.75
9/26/2022  Finance committee meeting 1.50
9/26/2022  Finance committee meeting 1.50
9/26/2022  Client meeting re: workshop 1.00
9/26/2022 Distribute agenda to finance workgroup 0.50
9/26/2022  Revisions to workshop materials 3.00
9/26/2022  Call with client re: discuss workshop materials (w/ prep) 1.75
9/26/2022  Update participant lists for finance workshops 1.00
9/27/2022  Finalize workshop materials 2.00
9/27/2022  Finalize workshop materials 1.25
9/27/2022  Finance workshop 1.50
9/27/2022  Emails with client 0.75
9/27/2022 LVE Finance Group workshop (w/ prep) 2.75
9/29/2022  Emails with EBMUD 0.75
9/29/2022  Set up scheduling poll for October workshop 1.75
9/30/2022  Emails with client 0.50
9/30/2022 Review CCWD termsheet 3.25
Total 42.25 59.25
Rate 385 325
Billing $ 16,266.25 $ 19,256.25
INVOICE TOLAL. .. euiuueuriieeeii it et eet st ea e senseereaseeraasseeaaseeraa s s s asansaseasansnnsnsenransansnssnsanensensnnsnssnsensnnnsensanennensnnes $ 35,522.50
@ CleanEneravCanital Page 1 of 1
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Client:
Project:

Team Members: David Moore (Project Lead), Will Lockwood (Vice President), Saravleen Singh (Vice President),

Contra Costa Water District
Los Vaqueros Reservoir Expansion Project

Amanda Hanson (Associate)

October 2022

Project will
Lead VP
Date Description Hours Hours
10/3/2022  Internal meeting re: Summary of Key Agreements 2.25
10/4/2022  Review key agreements redline/ implement changes 2.25
10/4/2022  Revise board slides/ send to client 2.00
10/4/2022  Organize materials for rating agency outreach 3.00
10/5/2022  Rating agency outreach/ prep 0.75
10/5/2022  Send board slides to general council 0.50
10/5/2022  Emails with client team 0.50
10/5/2022  Develop redline of Summary of Key Agreements 4.00
10/10/2022 Internal meeting re: workshop planning, agreement development 3.50
10/12/2022 Board meeting 2.50
10/12/2022 Revisions to rating agency materials 1.25
10/12/2022 Emails with client team re: SFPUC 0.50
10/12/2022 Scheduling emails 0.50
10/12/2022 LVR JPA Board Meeting 3.50
10/13/2022 Emails with client team 0.50
10/14/2022 Develop slide deck for financing briefing for JPA members 4.50
10/17/2022 Scheduling emails 0.50
10/17/2022 Organize SFPUC/LVE Participation briefing 1.75
10/17/2022 Internal meeting re: prep for SFPUC/LVE briefing and finance workshop 3.00
10/18/2022 Develop SFPUC prez 3.50
10/18/2022 Develop slide deck for financing briefing for JPA members 4.50
10/19/2022 Emails with client team 0.50
10/19/2022 Develop SFPUC briefing prez/ emails 3.00
10/19/2022 Review draft SPFUC slide deck/ provide comments 1.75
10/19/2022 Finalize slide deck for financing briefing for JPA members 2.25
10/19/2022 Internal review of finance briefing slides 2.25
10/20/2022 Emails with client team 0.50
10/24/2022 Call with client team 0.50
10/24/2022 Scheduling emails 0.50
10/24/2022 Review/ send financial briefing prez 2.50
10/24/2022 Call with client re: planning Fin. Comm presentation (w/ prep) 2.25
10/24/2022 Draft slides for Finance Committee meeting 5.25
10/25/2022 Call with client team 1.00
10/25/2022 Emails with client team 0.50
10/25/2022 Emails with SFPUC 0.50
10/25/2022 Emails re: EIL funding 0.50
10/25/2022 Scheduling emails 0.50
10/25/2022 Send agenda and materials to SFPUC 1.75
10/25/2022 Finalize/ send LVE finance committee prez 3.25
10/25/2022 Call with client re: review finance slides for Fin. Comm presentation (w/ prep) 2.25
10/25/2022 Update/finalize Finance Committee slides with client edits 3.50
10/25/2022 Rating agency outreach, organize intro meetings 3.50
10/26/2022 Presentation to SFPUC 1.75
10/26/2022 Internal meeting re: Finance Committee presentation 3.00
10/26/2022 Call with client re: SFPUC participation in LVE financing (w/ prep) 3.00
10/27/2022 Finance committee 0.75
10/27/2022 Emails with client team 0.50
10/27/2022 Call with client re: discuss LVE Finance workgroup materials (w/ prep) 2.25
10/27/2022 Call with Moody's re: LVE credit rating introduction (w/ prep) 2.25
10/27/2022 Review comments on CCWD Term Sheet, begin drafting workshop materials 4.50
10/27/2022 Internal meeting re: credit rating strategy 3.00
10/27/2022 LVE Finance Committee Meeting (w/ prep) 3.50
10/28/2022 Call with client 1.00
10/28/2022 Call with rating agency 0.75
10/28/2022 Finalize draft workshop materials 6.00
ﬁ-’ ~ 0 — S~ a ]
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10/28/2022 Call with client re: Review LVE Finance Workshop materials (w/ prep) 2.25
10/31/2022 Call with rating agency 0.75

10/31/2022 Call with rating agency 0.75

10/31/2022 Review finance workshop prez/ provide comments 2.00

10/31/2022 Finance workshop 2.00

10/31/2022 Scheduling emails with client 0.50

10/31/2022 Rating agency outreach 0.75

10/31/2022 Call with S&P re: LVE credit rating introduction (w/ prep) 2.25
10/31/2022 Call with Fitch re: LVE credit rating introduction (w/ prep) 2.25
10/31/2022 LVE Finance Workshop (w/ prep) 3.50
10/31/2022 Finalize workshop slides based on client feedback 3.50
Total 44.00 92.50
Rate 385 325
Billing $ 16,940.00 $ 30,062.50
Yo Yo =Y o | $ 47,002.50
ﬁ-’ ~ 0 — ~~ "a 1
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Client:
Project:

Team Members: David Moore (Project Lead), Will Lockwood (Vice President), Saravleen Singh (Vice President),

Contra Costa Water District
Los Vaqueros Reservoir Expansion Project

Amanda Hanson (Associate)

November 2022

Project will
Lead VP
Date Description Hours Hours
11/1/2022  Prep for finance committee 1.50
11/1/2022  Review WIFIA loan application 1.75
11/1/2022  Rating agency interviews/ follow up 0.75
11/1/2022  Develop rating agency presentation 1.50
11/1/2022  Finalize/ send plan of finance presentation 2.00
11/1/2022  Develop and circulate Rating Agency RFP 3.75
11/1/2022  Develop slide deck for Board presentation on Plan of Finance 5.50
11/1/2022  Internal meeting to review Board slides/presentation 2.25
11/1/2022  Internal meeting to review Board slides/presentation 1.50
11/2/2022  Review rating proposal 0.75
11/2/2022 Finalize Board slides, send to client 2.75
11/3/2022  Emails with client 0.50
11/3/2022  Proforma model walkthrough 1.25
11/3/2022  Develop "LVE Proforma Roadmap" for proforma review call 2.25
11/3/2022  Call with client re: review of LVE Proforma model (w/ prep) 2.75
11/4/2022  Proforma model roadmap 0.75
11/4/2022  Follow up with credit rating agencies re: RFP responses and questions 2.75
11/4/2022  Internal meeting re: credit rating proposals and upcoming meetings 1.00
11/4/2022  Internal meeting re: credit rating proposals and upcoming meetings 1.75
11/8/2022  Emails with client re: fiduciary duty 1.75
11/8/2022  Prep for Board meeting presentation 2.75
11/8/2022  Internal meeting re: Board meeting prez, credit rating process 1.75
11/8/2022 Internal meeting re: Board meeting prez, credit rating process 0.75
11/9/2022  JPA board meeting 2.25
11/9/2022  Emails with client 1.25
11/9/2022 Los Vaqueros JPA Board Meeting (w/ prep) 3.25
11/9/2022 Review client questions, prep for proforma review call 2.25
11/9/2022 Internal meeting re: debrief from Plan of FInance presentation 1.00
11/9/2022 Internal meeting re: debrief from Plan of FInance presentation 1.00
11/10/2022 Call with Zone 7 team re: WIFIA proforma walkthrough/questions 2.75
11/10/2022 Organize/summarize credit rating proposals 2.25
11/11/2022 Internal meeting re: schedule for upcoming workshops/presentations 2.25
11/11/2022 Internal meeting re: schedule for upcoming workshops/presentations 1.25
11/11/2022 Update proforma model to reflect discussion with Zone 7 team 3.25
11/11/2022 Review Board presentation language for Zone 7 1.75
11/12/2022 Review rating agency proposals/ internal meeting 1.75
11/12/2022 Review finance committee agenda 0.50
11/12/2022 Revisions to rating agency prez 1.25
11/14/2022 Rating agency evaluation 1.25
11/15/2022 Call with client/EPA re: WIFIA application walkthrough (w/ prep) 1.50
11/16/2022 LVR JPA Finance Committee meeting 2.25
11/17/2022 Internal meeting - rating prez 0.75
11/17/2022 Internal meeting re: credit rating proposals and recommendations 2.75
11/17/2022 Develop rating agency engagement summary/recommendation prez 4.50
11/18/2022 Develop rating agency engagement summary/recommendation prez 3.25
11/18/2022 Call with client re: finance workgroup schedule 1.75
11/19/2022 Respond to client questions regarding rating proposals pricing 2.25
11/21/2022 Internal meeting re LVR workshop schedule and topics 1.75
11/22/2022 Scheduling emails with client 0.50
11/22/2022 Update credit rating recommendation prez to reflect client comments 2.75
11/23/2022 Call with client 0.75
11/23/2022 Review key terms summary 1.50
11/23/2022 Emails with client 0.50
11/23/2022 Prep for GM meeting 1.75
11/24/2022 GM meeting 1.75
ﬁ-’ ~ 0 — S~ a ]
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11/27/2022 Draft GM prez 3.50

11/27/2022 Review technical memos 2.25

11/27/2022 Review technical memos 2.50
11/27/2022 Internal Meeting re: workshop background / terms 1.25

11/27/2022 Internal Meeting re: workshop background / terms 1.25
11/28/2022 Scheduling emails 0.50

11/28/2022 Finalize/ send GM prez 2.50

11/28/2022 Revisions to GM prez 2.00

11/28/2022 Meeting with client team 1.75

11/28/2022 Call with client re: prep call for GM Meeting discussion (w/ prep) 275
11/28/2022 Review GM Meeting slide deck re: Service Agmt approach 3.25
11/29/2022 Revisions to board memo 0.75

11/29/2022 Revisions to rating agency prez 0.75

11/29/2022 Finalize/ send GM meeting prez 2.00

11/30/2022 Prep for GM meeting 1.25

11/30/2022 GM meeting 1.25

11/30/2022 Finalize GM Meeting slide deck 1.75
Total 53.50 81.25
Rate 385 325
Billing $ 20,597.50 $ 26,406.25
[0 T =300 o - | $ 47,003.75
ﬁ-’ ~ 0 — S~ a ]
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Client: Contra Costa Water District December 1 - 4, 2022

Project: Los Vaqueros Reservoir Expansion Project

Team Members: David Moore (Project Lead), Will Lockwood (Vice President), Saravleen Singh (Vice President),
Amanda Hanson (Associate)

Project will

Lead VP

Date Description Hours Hours

12/1/2022  Draft slide deck for Board meeting re: credit rating engagement 2.50
12/2/2022  Circulate GM meeting summary 1.75

Total 1.75 2.50

Rate 385 325

Billing $ 673.75 812.50

1Yo o = e T PP 1,486.25

Z>
Page 1 of 1
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LOS VAQUEROS RESERVOIR JOINT POWERS AUTHORITY
Standard Services Agreement

THIS AGREEMENT for services is between Los Vaqueros Reservoir Joint Powers Authority (“JPA”) and Clean
Energy Capital Securities, LLC, a California limited liability company (the "Consultant”). Consultant’s address is
207 Santa Rosa Avenue, Sausalito, California 94965, telephone 415-710-1350. Consultant’s taxpayer’s
identification number is: 27-1758258.

1. The Agreement. JPA and Consultant agree that Consultant shall provide financial consulting
services for the JPA and shall perform those services on the terms and conditions set forth herein. The specific
scope of services, and any special performance conditions are defined in Attachment A - Scope of Work.

The following document is attached hereto and is a part of this Agreement:
Attachment A - Scope of Work / Project Schedule / Project Fees

This Agreement, including said attachment, constitutes the entire agreement between the parties and
supersedes any prior proposals, representations, or understandings. This Agreement may be modified only by
a written amendment signed by each party.

2. Time of Performance. Consultant is authorized to commence performance of this Agreement
upon its execution by the JPA. Consultant shall complete all services covered by this Agreement no later than
June 30, 2023, unless this date is extended by the JPA in writing. At the JPA’s discretion, the JPA may extend
the term of the Agreement.

3. Payment. Consultant shall at convenient intervals not more frequent than monthly submit
itemized statements of services performed at the rates and charges in Attachment A. If invoices are submitted
on a monthly basis, they must be submitted by the tenth (10%) day of the month for services rendered in the
prior month. The JPA shall pay for work satisfactorily performed within thirty (30} days after receipt of a
statement. Without the prior written approval of the JPA, the total amount payable by JPA for Consultant’s
services pursuant to this Agreement shall not exceed $390,995.00 for services rendered through June 30, 2023.

4, Consultant an Independent Contractor. Consultant shall perform the consulting services under
the Agreement as an independent contractor and not as an employee of the JPA. Consultant shall be wholly
responsible for the methods of performance and shall provide and use its own tools and equipment in
performing those consulting services. The JPA shall have no right to supervise or control Consultant's
performance but shall have the right to observe it to ensure compliance with the requirements of this
Agreement. Consultant maintains its own business office, complies with all applicable business license laws,
customarily engages in an independently established business the purposes of which is to perform services of
the same nature as that involved in the work performed hereunder, can contract with other businesses to
provide the same or similar services, maintains a clientele without restrictions from the JPA and advertises and
holds itself out to the public as available to provide the same or similar services as those required hereunder.
Consultant shall work closely with the JPA in performing the services.
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5. Insurance.

A Without in any way limiting Consultant’s liability pursuant to the “indemnification”
section of this Agreement, Consultant must maintain in force, during the full term of the Agreement, insurance
in the following amounts and coverage:

(1) Workers’ Compensation, in not less than statutory amounts, with Employers’
Liability Limits not less than $1,000,000 each accident, injury, or illness; and

(2) Commercial General Liability Insurance with limits not less than $1,000,000 each
occurrence, $2,000,000 aggregate, for Bodily Injury and Property Damage, including
Contractual Liability, Personal Injury, Products and Completed Operations; and

(3) Commercial Automobile Liability Insurance with limits not less than $1,000,000 each
occurrence for Bodily Injury and Property Damage, including Owned, Non-Owned and Hired
auto coverage, as applicable; and

(4) Professional liability insurance, applicable to Consultant's profession, with limits
not less than $1,000,000 each claim with respect to negligent acts, errors or omissions in
connection with professional services to be provided under this Agreement.

B. Commercial General Liability and Commercial Automobile Liability Insurance policies
must be endorsed to:

(1) Name as Additional Insureds, the JPA, its members and their respective directors,
officers, agents, employees, and volunteers.

(2) Provide that such policies are primary insurance to any other insurance available to
the Additional Insureds, with respect to any claims arising out of this Agreement, and that
insurance applies separately to each insured against whom claim is made or suit is brought.

C. Regarding Workers’ Compensation, Consultant hereby agrees to waive its rights to
subrogation which any insurer of Consultant may acquire from Consultant by virtue of the payment of any loss.
Consultant agrees to obtain any endorsement that may be necessary to effect this waiver of subrogation. The
Workers’ Compensation policy shall be endorsed with a waiver of subrogation in favor of the JPA for all work
performed by the Consultant, its employees, agents and subcontractors.

D. All policies shall provide thirty days’ advance written notice to the JPA of reduction or
nonrenewal of coverage or cancellation of coverage for any reason.

E. Should any of the required insurance be provided under a claims-made form,
Consultant shall maintain such coverage continuously throughout the term of this Agreement and, without
lapse, for a period of four years beyond the expiration of this Agreement, to the effect that, should occurrences
during the contract term give rise to claims made after expiration of the Agreement, such claims shall be
covered by such claims-made policies.

F. Before commencing any work under this Agreement, Consultant shall furnish to the JPA
certificates of insurance and additional insured policy endorsements with insurers with ratings comparable to
A-, VIll or higher, that are authorized to do business in the State of California, and that are satisfactory to the

2
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JPA, in form evidencing all coverage set forth above. Failure to maintain insurance shall constitute a material
breach of this Agreement.

G. Approval of the insurance by the JPA shall not relieve or decrease the liability of
Consultant hereunder.

H. If a subcontractor will be used to complete any portion of this agreement, the
Consultant shall ensure that the subcontractor obtains all necessary insurance, which shall name the JPA, and
its respective directors, officers, agents and employees and the Consultant as Additional Insureds.

6. [intentionally omitted]
7. Abandonment by Consultant. In the event the Consultant ceases performing services under this

Agreement or otherwise abandons the project prior to completing all of the services described in this
Agreement, Consultant shall, without delay, deliver to the JPA all materials and records prepared or obtained
in the performance of this Agreement, and shall be paid for the reasonable value of the services performed up
to the time of cessation or abandonment, less a deduction for any damages or additional expenses which the
JPAincurs as a result of such cessation or abandonment, such as expenses associated with obtaining substitute
services.

8. Records and Documents. Upon request, and at no additional charge, Consultant shall deliver to
the JPA all records, data, and reports prepared or obtained in the performance of the Agreement, which shall
become and remain the property of the JPA. This includes, but is not limited to, all materials and records of a
finished nature that are prepared or obtained in the performance of this Agreement, and all materials of a
preliminary nature, such as computations and other data prepared or obtained in the performance of this
Agreement.

9. Right to Audit. Consultant shall permit the JPA and its authorized representatives to examine,
re-examine, make excerpts, transcribe and copy Consultant's books, documents, papers, materials, payrolls,
records, accounts, computer disks, tapes and any and all data relevant to the Agreement at any reasonable time
upon at least seventy-two (72) hours’ prior written notice within three years after final payment under the
Agreement. Consultant shall also permit the JPA and its authorized representatives to audit and verify
statements, invoices, or bills submitted by Consultant pursuant to the Agreement. Consultant shall provide
such assistance as may be reasonably required in the course of such examination and audit.

10. Compliance with Laws and Regulations. In performing this Agreement, Consultant shall comply
with all applicable laws, statutes, ordinances, rules and regulations whether federal, state or local in origin.
Consultant shall not allow its employees and/or agents to discriminate, harass, or allow harassment,
retaliation, or abusive conduct by or against any person or persons. Immediate and appropriate corrective
action by the JPA, up to and including termination of this Agreement, will be implemented as warranted for any
and all such reported misconduct.

11 Standard of Care; Breach, Error, and Omission. In the event that Consultant fails to perform any
of the services described in this Agreement or otherwise breaches this Agreement, JPA shall have the right to
pursue all remedies provided by law or equity, including termination of this Agreement in accordance with
Section 17, below. Consultant shall exercise the same degree of care, skill, and diligence in the performance of
the Agreement as would be exercised by a reasonable professional performing similar work under similar
circumstances, and shall, at no cost to JPA, re-perform services which fail to satisfy this standard of care. In
addition, any costs incurred by the JPA (including but not limited to additional administrative costs, to the

3
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extent that such costs are recoverable under California law) and used to correct deficiencies caused by the
Consultant's errors and omissions shall be borne solely by the Consultant. The JPA is relying upon the
Consultant’s qualifications concerning the services furnished under this agreement, and therefore the fact that
the JPA has accepted or approved the Consultant’s work shall in no way relieve the Consultant of these
responsibilities.

12. [intentionally omitted]

13. indemnification. If an action is filed or claim is filed in which it is claimed or alleged that any
damages, injuries, or deaths arose out of, pertained to, or related to negligent acts, errors or omissions,
recklessness, or willful misconduct of Consultant (or any person or organization for whom Consultant is legally
liable), in the performance of the services for the JPA, Consultant agrees, at its own expense, to defend JPA and
its Directors, officers, employees, and agents; provided, however, that no settlement of a claim shall be made
without the consent of the JPA.

To the extent permitted by law, Consultant shall indemnify the JPA, its members and their respective directors,
officers, employees, and agents from any and against all claims, demands, costs, including reasonable
attorney’s fees, and liability for any damages, injuries, or deaths arising directly or indirectly from, or connected
with, the services provided under this Agreement and due to, or claimed or alleged to be due to, negligence,
recklessness, or willful misconduct of Consultant (or any person or organization for whom Consultant is legally
liable). Consultant will reimburse the JPA for any expenditures, including reasonable attorney's fees, Jthe PA
may make by reason of such matters and, if requested by the JPA, will defend any such suits at the sole cost
and expense of Consultant.

To the extent permitted by law, Consultant shall also indemnify the JPA, its members and their respective
Directors, officers, employees, and agents, against any and all claims, demands, costs and expenses at law or
in equity including reasonable attorney’s fees, and liability, suffered or incurred on account of, or that may at
any time arise out of, or are in any way connected with, any breach by Consultant, or its employees, agents,
subconsultants, or subcontractors, of the obligations, covenants, or any other provisions of this Agreement.

This Section shall survive any expiration or termination of this Agreement.

14. Confidentiality. Consultant shall treat any information it may come to have relating to the
Agreement with confidence, revealing information to third parties only with prior written approval of JPA.

15. Assignment. The Agreement shall not be assignable or transferable in whole or in part by
Consultant, whether voluntarily, by operation of law, or otherwise; provided, however, that Consultant with the
prior written consent of the JPA may subcontract that portion of the services for which Consultant does not
have the facilities to perform so long as Consultant receives written approval from the JPA of the qualifications
of the subcontractor or sub-consultant qualifications prior to execution of this Agreement. Any other purported
assignment, transfer, or subcontracting shall be void. Nothing in the Agreement shall be construed to give any
right or benefit to anyone other than JPA and Consultant.

16. Governing Law. This Agreement shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the
laws of the State of California.

17. Termination. JPA may terminate this Agreement at any time by thirty (30) days prior written
notice to Consultant. Either party may terminate this Agreement upon written notice if the other party has
breached the Agreement and such breach is not remedied within at least fifteen (15) days after written notice

4
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of that breach is provided to the breaching party, or if such breach is not capable of being remedied within that
fifteen (15) day period, the breaching party fails to commence and diligently pursue that remedy within that
fifteen (15) day period. Upon termination, the JPA shall pay Consultant for all amounts due for services
rendered up to the date of termination.

IN WITNESS THEREOF, the parties hereto have made and executed this Agreement as of the day and year written
below.

Los Vaqueros Reservoir Joint Powers Authority

Tarah Bavazzivl Dec 5, 2022

By: Taryn Rvazzini (Dec 5, 2022 12:46 H5T) Date:
Name: Taryn Ravazzini
Title: Executive Director

CONSULTANT: Clean Energy Capital Securities, LLC

oavid M Moore Dec 20, 2022

By: David M. Moore (Dec 20, 2022 14:56 PST) Date

Name: David M. Moore
Title: Managing Director, CEO

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

James Ciampd

James Ciampa (Dec 5, 2022 14:07 PST)

JPA Legal Counsel
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Consulting Services Agreement
Between Los Vaqueros Reservoir Joint Powers Authority (“JPA”) and
Clean Energy Capital Securities, LLC (“Consultant”)

Scope of Work / Project Schedule / Project Fees

A. Scope of Work
Clean Energy Capital shall complete the following tasks, which may be performed concurrently:

1. Credit rating
e Run procurement process to select rating agency(s) for indicative and final
rating(s)
e Prepare and submit materials and presentations
¢ Organize meetings and follow-up
e Coordinate input from Member agencies
o Prepare and submit final ratings package

2. WIFIA loan
e Support preparation and submittal of loan application
e Support loan documentation and negotiation
e Coordinate input from Member agencies
¢ Facilitate financial closing
e Provide financial modeling to the EPA

3. Proforma financial model
¢ Maintain and update proforma financial model
e Model cost allocation alternatives
e Model implementation of WIFIA funding, WSIP and WINN Act funding, and
Member cash contributions
¢ Coordinate input from Member agencies
e Provide scenario analysis

4. Service Agreements
s Support negotiation of commercial terms for service agreement
¢ Develop contract schedules
o Integrate contract terms with proforma financial model

5. JPA Credit Facility
e Perform cost benefit analysis
s Present results and recommendations
e Procure facility, negotiate terms and implement as appropriate
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6. Workshops
o Develop materials for financial workshops
e Administer and lead financial workshops
7. Member Agency support

e Provide customized financial modeling and analysis to Members
e Review, revise, present results

8. Provide such other services as are reasonably requested by the JPA and its Members
B. Project Schedule

The following fee table shows our estimated scope of service for FY2023. FY2024 services will be awarded
under separate contract.

C. Project Fees
Clean Energy Capital shall endeavour to complete the tasks described in this scope of work, payable

based on actual hours/expenses incurred. Our estimated total compensation and proposed not-to-
exceed amount is set forth in the following Fee Table.
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Fee Table - FY2023 (Through June 30, 2023)

Task Vice
No. Task Description Project Lead President Associate  Combined
1 Credit Rating
Total Estimated Hours 40 60 20
Billing $17,400.00 $21,900.00 $5,500.00 $44,800.00
2 WIFIA Loan
Total Estimated Hours 60 40 20
Billing $26,100.00 $14,600.00 $5,500.00 $46,200.00
3 Proforma Financial Model
Total Estimated Hours 40 120 0
Billing $17,400.00 $43,800.00 $S0.00 $61,200.00
4 Service Agreements
Total Estimated Hours 80 20 0
Billing $34,800.00 $7,300.00 $0.00 $42,100.00
5 JPA Credit Facility
Total Estimated Hours 10 20 20
Billing $4,350.00 $7,300.00 $5,500.00 $17,150.00
6 Finance Workshops
Total Estimated Hours 60 80 0
Billing $26,100.00 $29,200.00 $0.00 $55,300.00
7 Member Agency Support
Total Estimated Hours 40 60 0
Billing $17,400.00 $21,900.00 $0.00 $39,300.00
8 Meetings / calls
Total Estimated Hours 40 20 0
Billing $17,400.00 $7,300.00 $0.00 $24,700.00
9 Other services
Total Estimated Hours 0 0 0
Billing $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
10 Scheduling and Project Management
Total Estimated Hours 40 20 0
Billing $17,400.00 $7,300.00 $0.00 $24,700.00
Total $355,450.00
Contingency Added for Not-to-Exceed Amount
Percentage 10%
Amount $35,545.00
Not-to-Exceed Amount for Amendment $390,995.00

The above Fee Table provides an estimate of the level of effort required to complete each task and
Clean Energy Capital may shift hours among tasks and personnel as circumstances change during the
engagement. If hours incurred are less than anticipated, then the savings shall be passed on to client

Any additional work beyond the services described herein are optional services that will only be
performed at client’s request. Optional services will be billed on a time and materials basis.

We propose the hourly rate schedule set forth below, which provides for a 3% annual escalation of our
rates from the amounts set in our 2018 Standard Services Agreement with CCWD.
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Hourly Rate Schedule

Consultant Rate
Project Lead (David Moore) $435/Hour
Director/Vice President (Will Lockwood, | $365/Hour
Saravleen Singh)

Associate (Amanda Hanson, Jordan Decker) $275/Hour
Analyst (TBD) $235/Hour
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CONTRA COSTA WATER DISTRICT
Standard Services Agreement

THIS AGREEMENT for services is between Contra Costa Water District (“District™) and Clean Energy
Capital Securities LLC (the "Consultant"). Consultant’s address is 600 California Street, 11% Floor, San
Francisco, CA 94108, telephone (415) 710-1350, and fax number N/A. Consultant is a [X] corporation,
[ 1 partnership, [ ] sole proprietor, having taxpayer’s identification number FEIN 27-1758258.

l. The Agreement. District and Consultant agree that Consultant shall provide financial
advisory consulting services and shall perform these services for District on the terms and conditions
herein set forth in connection with District’s project number 401100 for the Los Vaqueros Reservoir
Expansion Project. The specific scope of services, and any special performance conditions are defined in
Attachment A - Scope of Work.

The following documents are attached hereto and are a part of this Agreement:

Attachment A - Scope of Work
Attachment B - Consultant’s Rates and Charges

This Agreement, including said attachments, constitutes the entire agreement between the parties and
supersedes any prior proposals, representations, or understandings. This Agreement may be modified
only by a written amendment signed by each party.

2. .Time of Performance. Unless otherwise stated in Attachment A, Consultant is authorized
to commence performance of this Agreement upon its execution by District. Consultant shall complete
all services covered by this Agreement no later than August 30, 2018, unless this date is extended by
District in writing. At the District’s discretion, the District may extend the term of the Agreement. Should
the District elect to extend this Agreement through December 30, 2018, there shall be no change to the
terms and conditions of this Agreement (other than to the time of performance).

3. Payment. Consultant shall at convenient intervals not more frequent than monthly submit
itemized statements of services performed at the rates and charges in Attachment B. District shall pay for
work satisfactorily performed within thirty (30) days after receipt of a statement. Without the prior written
approval of the District, the total amount payable by District for Consultant’s services pursuant to this
Agreement shall not exceed $150,000 for the period from March 1, 2018 to August 30, 2018, and $0 for
the period from September 1, 2018 to December 30, 2018 upon extension of the Agreement.

4. Consultant an Independent Contractor. Consultant shall perform the consulting services
under the Agreement as an independent contractor and not as an employee of District. Consultant shall
be wholly responsible for the methods of performance. District shall have no right to supervise or control
Consultant's performance, but shall have the right to observe it. Consultant shall work closely with District
in performing the services.

Consulting Services Agreement between
Contra Costa Water District and Clean Energy Capital Securities
Page 1
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5. Insurance. '
A. Without in any way limiting Contractor’s liability pursuant to the
“Indemnification” section of this Agreement, Contractor must maintain in force, during the full term of
the Agreement, insurance in the following amounts and coverage:

(1) Workers® Compensation, in not less than statutory amounts, with Employers’
Liability Limits not less than $1,000,000 each accident, injury, or illness; and

(2) Commercial General Liability Insurance with limits not less than $1,000,000
each occurrence for Bodily Injury and Property Damage, including Contractual Liability,
Personal Injury, Products and Completed Operations; and

(3) Commercial Automobile Liability Insurance with limits not less than
$1,000,000 each occurrence for Bodily Injury and Property Damage, including Owned,
Non-Owned and Hired auto coverage, as applicable; and

(4) Professional liability insurance, applicable to Contractor’s profession, with
limits not less than $1,000,000 each claim with respect to negligent acts, errors or
omissions in connection with professional services to be provided under this Agreement.

B. Commercial General Liability and Commercial Automobile Liability Insurance policies
must be endorsed to:

(1) Name as Additional Insureds, Contra Costa Water District and its respective
Directors, Officers, Agents, and Employees.

(2) Provide that such policies are primary insurance to any other insurance available
to the Additional Insureds, with respect to any claims arising out of this Agreement, and
that insurance applies separately to each insured against whom claim is made or suit is
brought.

C. Regarding Workers’ Compensation, Contractor hereby agrees to waive its rights to
subrogation which any insurer of Contractor may acquire from Contractor by virtue of the payment of any
loss. Contractor agrees to obtain any endorsement that may be necessary to effect this waiver of
subrogation. The Workers” Compensation policy shall be endorsed with a waiver of subrogation in favor
of Contra Costa Water District for all work performed by the Contractor, its employees, agents and
subcontractors.

D. All policies shall provide thirty days’ advance written notice to Contra Costa Water
District of reduction or nonrenewal of coverage or cancellation of coverage for any reason.

E. Should any of the required insurance be provided under a claims-made form,
Contractor shall maintain such coverage continuously throughout the term of this Agreement and, without
lapse, for a period of four years beyond the expiration of this Agreement, to the effect that, should
occurrences during the contract term give rise to claims made after expiration of the Agreement, such
claims shall be covered by such claims-made policies.

Consulting Services Agreement between
Contra Costa Water District and Clean Energy Capital Securities
Page 2
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F. Before commencing any work under this Agreement, Contractor shall furnish to
Contra Costa Water District certificates of insurance and additional insured policy endorsements with
insurers with ratings comparable to A-, VIII or higher, that are authorized to do business in the State of
California, and that are satisfactory to Contra Costa Water District, in form evidencing all coverage set
forth above. Failure to maintain insurance shall constitute a material breach of this Agreement.

G. Approval of the insurance by District shall not relieve or decrease the liability of
Contractor hereunder.

H. If a subcontractor will be used to complete any portion of this agreement, the
Contractor shall ensure that the subcontractor obtains all necessary insurance, which shall name Contra
Costa Water District, and its respective directors, officers, agents and employees and the Contractor as
Additional Insureds.

6. Payment of Prevailing Wages. If any personnel of Consultant or a subcontractor of
Consultant performs work under the Agreement for which a general prevailing wage has been determined
by the Director of the Department of Industrial Relations, Consultant or subcontractor shall pay the
prevailing wage for such work and shall comply with all applicable provisions of the California Labor
Code Section relating to public works (Section 1720 et. seq.). Copies of such wage rates are on file at the
District’s principal office. For questions regarding this section, Consultant should visit
www.dir.ca.gov/oprl/pwd/index.htm or call the Department of Industrial Relations at
1-415-703-4774.

The general prevailing wage rates for such work which establish minimum wages for this Agreement shall
be posted by Consultant in a prominent place at the site where such work is performed. Consultant shall
comply with all of the provisions of Section 1775 of the Labor Code relative to penalties paid to the
District regarding wage under- payments to workers employed under this Agreement, and Consultant shall
comply with all of the provisions of Section 1776 of the Labor Code regarding payroll records
requirements.

7. Abandonment by Consultant. In the event the consultant ceases performing services under
this Agreement or otherwise abandons the project prior to completing all of the services described in this
Agreement, Consultant shall, without delay, deliver to District all materials and records prepared or
obtained in the performance of this Agreement, and shall be paid for the reasonable value of the services
performed up to the time of cessation or abandonment, less a deduction for any damages or additional
expenses which District incurs as a result of such cessation or abandonment, such as expenses associated
with obtaining substitute services.

8. Records and Documents. Upon request, and at no additional charge, Consultant shall
deliver to District all records, data, and reports prepared or obtained in the performance of the Agreement,
which shall become and remain the property of District. This includes, but is not limited to, all materials
and records of a finished nature, such as final plans, specifications, and maps prepared or obtained in the
performance of this Agreement, and all materials of a preliminary nature, such as survey notes, sketches,
preliminary plans, computations and other data prepared or obtained in the performance of this Agreement.

Consulting Services Agreement between
Contra Costa Water District and Clean Energy Capital Securities
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9. Right to Audit. Consultant shall permit District and its authorized representatives to
examine, re-examine, make excerpts, transcribe and copy Consultant's books, documents, papers,
materials, payrolls, records, accounts, computer disks, tapes and any and all data relevant to the Agreement
at any reasonable time within three years after final payment under the Agreement. Consultant shall also
permit District and its authorized representatives to audit and verify statements, invoices, or bills
submitted by Consultant pursuant to the Agreement. Consultant shall provide such assistance as may be
reasonably required in the course of such examination and audit.

10. Safety and Compliance with Laws and Regulations. In performing this Agreement,
Consultant shall comply with all applicable laws, statutes, ordinances, rules and regulations whether
federal, state or local in origin, and shall also comply with the CCWD Contractor/Consultant Safe
Practices Handbook at all times when present on District property or at the site(s) of public works being
installed, altered, repaired or removed for the District. - The signature page of the CCWD
Contractor/Consultant Safe Practices handbook shall be signed by the Consultant and submitted to the
District. The Consultant shall provide copies of the Handbook to all Sub-Consultants/Sub-Contractors.
The Handbook is available at http://www.ccwater.com/files/safepracticeshandbook.pdf.

11.  Breach, Error, and Omission. In the event that Consultant fails to perform any of the
services described in this Agreement or otherwise breaches this Agreement, District shall have the right
to pursue all remedies provided by law or equity. Consultant shall exercise the same degree of care, skill,
and diligence in the performance of the Agreement as would be exercised by a reasonable professional
performing similar work under similar circumstances, and shall, at no cost to District, re-perform services
which fail to satisfy this standard of care. In addition, any costs incurred by the District (including but not
limited to additional design and administrative costs, to the extent that such costs are recoverable under
California law) and used to correct deficiencies caused by the Consultant's errors and omissions shall be
~ borne solely by the Consultant. The District is relying upon the Consultant’s qualifications concerning the
services furnished under this agreement, and therefore the fact that the District has accepted or approved
the Consultant’s work shall in no way relieve the Consultant of these responsibilities.

12.  Endorsement on Plans. All work of an engineering nature shall bear the stamp and
signature of an engineer registered in the State of California.

13.  Indemnification. If an action is filed in which it is claimed or alleged that any damages,
injuries, or deaths arose out of, pertained to, or related to negligent acts, errors or omissions, recklessness,
or willful misconduct of Consultant (or any person or organization for whom Consultant is legally liable),
in the performance of the services for District, Consultant agrees, at its own expense, to defend District
and its Directors, officers, employees, and agents; provided, however, that no settlement of a claim shall
be made without the consent of District. :

To the extent permitted by law, Consultant shall indemnify District and its Directors, officers, employees,
and agents from any and against all claims, demands, costs, including reasonable attorney’s fees, and
liability for any damages, injuries, or deaths arising directly or indirectly from, or connected with, the
services provided under this Agreement and due to, or claimed or alleged to be due to, negligence,
recklessness, or willful misconduct of Consultant (or any person or organization for whom Consultant is
legally liable). Consultant will reimburse District for any expenditures, including reasonable attorney's
fees, District may make by reason of such matters and, if requested by District, will defend any such suits
at the sole cost and expense of Consultant.

Consulting Services Agreement between
Contra Costa Water District and Clean Energy Capital Securities
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To the extent permitted by law, Consultant shall also indemnify the District and its Directors, officers,
employees, and agents, against any and all claims, demands, costs and expenses at law or in equity
including reasonable attorney’s fees, and liability, suffered or incurred on account of, or that may at any
time arise out of, or are in any way connected with, any breach by Consultant, or its employees, agents,
subconsultants, or subcontractors, of the obligations, covenants, or any other provisions of this Agreement.

This Section shall survive any expiration or termination of this Agreement.

14. Confidentiality. Consultant shall treat any information it may come to have relating to the
Agreement with confidence, revealing information to third parties only with prior written approval of
District.

15.  Assignment. The Agreement shall not be assignable or transferable in whole or in part by
Consultant, whether voluntarily, by operation of law, or otherwise; provided, however, that Consultant
with the prior written consent of District may subcontract that portion of the services for which Consultant
does not have the facilities to perform so long as Consultant receives written approval from the District of
the qualifications of the subcontractor or sub-consultant qualifications prior to execution of this
Agreement. Any other purported assignment, transfer, or subcontracting shall be void. Nothing in the
Agreement shall be construed to give any right or benefit to anyone other than District and Consultant.

16.  Governing Law. This Agreement shall be governed by and construed in accordance with
the laws of the State of California.

17.  Termination. District may terminate this Agreement at any time by thirty (30) days prior
written notice to Consultant. Upon termination, District shall pay Consultant for all amounts due for
services rendered up to the date of termination.

IN WITNESS THEREOF, the parties hereto have made and executed this Agreement as of the day and
year written below.

CONTRA COSTA WATER DISTRICT

By: \)m\ Date: (i/ 9/// N
Name: J rry rown t
Title: G neralfManager

CONSULTANT: CLEAN ENERGY CAPITAL SECURITIES

Name: David M. Moore
Title: Managing Director

Consulting Services Agreement between
Contra Costa Water District and Clean Energy Capital Securities
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APPROVED AS TO FORM:

N/A

District Legal Counsel

Revised 7/2014

Consulting Services Agreement between
Contra Costa Water District and Clean Energy Capital Securities
Page 6
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ATTACHMENT A

Consulting Services Agreement
Between Contra Costa Water District (“District™) and
Clean Energy Capital Securities (“Consultant™)

SCOPE OF WORK

The primary objective of the scope of work is to assemble the significant work product that has been
developed to date (such as project scope description, engineering and design work, initial costing,
permitting assessment, grant applications) into an integrated proforma financial model and a first cut at a
plan of finance. We see this effort as both a data assembly and modeling exercise and an initial exploration
of key organization and contractual issues, such as the potential role of a joint powers agency (“JPA”) as
owner of the Project.

A key aspect of the scope of work will be presentations to, and meetings with, the Local Agency Partners
to identify the preferences and needs of each agency with respect to the Project’s organizational and
contractual structure and associate plan of finance. These meetings are expected to facilitate collaboration
and identify areas were further discussions and/or negotiations will be required. A second key aspect of
the scope of work will be development of a process and timeline and milestones for potential future
“finance-track” activities.

Scope of work includes:

¢ Receive and review information and descriptive of the Project;

¢ Develop a proforma financial model;

¢ Develop a timeline and responsibilities for subsequent finance-track activities;

¢ Develop PowerPoint presentations to Local Agency Partners, and to other Project stakeholders are
reasonably directed;

e Participate in meetings with CCWD, Local Agency Partners, and other stakeholders as reasonably
direct;

¢ Coordinate CWC work with other consultants and advisors; and

¢ Perform such other tasks as reasonably directed by CCWD and the Local Agency Partners.

CCWD approves Consultant’s release of information to third parties as necessary and appropriate to
Consultant’s engagement and scope of service hereunder.
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Consulting Services Agreement

ATTACHMENT B

Between Contra Costa Water District (“District”) and
Clean Energy Capital Securities (“Consultant™)

CONSULTANT’S RATES AND CHARGES

Project Lead (David Moore)

Director/Vice President

$385 per hour

$325 per hour

Associate $245 per hour
Analyst $210 per hour
Task Project Lead | Director Analyst Combined
Data Collection/Review
Project data 15 30 20 65
Participant data 15 15 15 45
WSIP related 15 20 15 50
Total estimated hours 45 65 50 160
Billing $17,325 $21,125 $10,500 $48.,950
Proforma Modeling
Model definition/setup 25 25 25 75
Initial base case model 10 35 50 95
Total estimated hours 35 60 75 170
Billing $13,475 $19,500 $15,750 $48,725
Meetings, Presentations, Misc
Meetings / presentations
(including prep) 40 20 20 80
Emails/project coordination 25 25 25 75
Total estimated hours 65 45 45 155
Billing $25,025 $14,625 $9,450 $49,100
Travel allowance  $3,025
Total not to Exceed $150,0600

* If overtime is anticipated, it is assumed to be at the same hourly rate unless otherwise noted in this

Attachment.
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Contract # M
BOD Date _4- & -dclO
Executed m&
AMENDMENT NO. 2
TO
CONSULTING SERVICES AGREEMENT

BETWEEN CONTRA COSTA WATER DISTRICT
AND CLEAN ENERGY CAPITAL SECURITIES LLC

The Consulting Services Agreement as executed June 4, 2018 and amended December 7, 2018,
between the Contra Costa Water District ("District") and Clean Energy Capital Securities LLC
("Consultant") shall be amended as follows:

1. Section 1 - The Agreement - Scope of Work - the Scope of Work shall be amended to
include the additional services set forth in Attachment A-2 attached hereto and
incorporated herein.

2. Section 2 - Time of Performance - time of performance is extended through December 31,
2021.
3. Section 3 - Payment - Agreement shall be amended in the amount of $400,000 for a new

total not to exceed $1,350,000. The fees and costs set forth on the attached Table B-2,
Summary of Project Costs, represent the maximum amount that the District will pay for
the services described in the Scope of Work for each respective task, Subject only to the
District’s right to move funds from one task to another by so directing in writing.

Except as specified above, all provisions of the Agreement as amended on December 7,
2018 between District and Consultant shall remain in full force and effect.

7~
7

Approved by.{ . 7 JAAARTAI Date: ?/Z{/ZQ
Stepten J. Wel(h, General Manager
Contra Costa Water District

Accepted by: O@@ Date: September 21, 2020

David Moore, Managing Director
Clean Energy Capital Securities

Approved as to Form:

N/A
By:

District Legal Counsel

Rev: 05/2015
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Attachment A-2
Amendment to Scope of Work
Los Vaqueros Reservoir Expansion Project

Consultant: Clean Energy Capital Securities

Task 1 — Project Management

CEC will manage the scope, schedule, and budget and track project progress through regular
reports and meetings as required. CEC will support CCWD and the Local Agency Partners in the
formation of a Joint Powers Authority including support of governance agreement development
and in the drafting of the service agreements.

Task 3 — Engineering Feasibility

Update the Proforma Financial Model in response to comments by the District and the LAPs and
incorporation of updated operations and cost information as available. Support development of
the final Project term sheet. Develop a Plan of Finance describing the proposed financing
structure and key assumptions to support ongoing partnership discussions.
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Table B-2
Summary of Project Costs
Los Vaqueros Reservoir Expansion Project

Consultant: Clean Energy Capital Securities

Amendment No. 1 Task Budgets:

Task No. | Description Total Cost
1 Project Management $100,000
3 Engineering Feasibility $300,000
Total $400,000

Previously Authorized Budget Amount $950,000

Total Amendment No. 2 Additional Authorized Budget Amount $400,000
Revised Total Contract Amount Not to Exceed $1,350,000
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ITEM 1.4: DRAFT TREASURER’S REPORT - MONTH ENDED MAY 31, 2023

RESPONSIBLE/LEAD STAFF MEMBER:

Taryn Ravazzini, Executive Director

DISCUSSION:

The draft Treasurer’s Report for May 2023 will be presented for the Committee’s review
and discussion.

ALTERNATIVES:

For discussion purposes

FISCAL ANALYSIS:

None

ENVIRONMENTAL REQUIREMENTS:

Not applicable

EXHIBITS/ATTACHMENTS:

Draft Treasurer’s Report for May 2023
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VAQUEROSR
RESERVOIRm
EXPANSIONER

PROJECT

JUNE 29, 2023

UPCOMING ACTIVITIES
July 11 at 7:30 a.m. — Finance
Committee Meeting via Zoom
(Rescheduled from June)

July (TBD) — Finance workgroup and

subgroup meetings (Draft Term
sheet and Service Agreement
Development )

July 27 at 1:00 p.m. — Finance
Committee Meeting via Zoom

Finance Committee Members:
Chair: Anthea Hansen, SLDMWA
Vice-Chair: Paul Sethy, ACWD
Rebecca Eisenberg, SCVWD
Michael Tognolini, EBMUD

ACRONYM KEY
ACWD - Alameda County Water
District

CCWD - Contra Costa Water District
CWC - California Water Commission

EBMUD — East Bay Municipal Utility

District
LAP — Local Agency Partners

MPA — Multi-party Cost Share
Agreement

SCVWD - Santa Clara Valley Water

District (Valley Water)

SLDMWA — San Luis & Delta-
Mendota Water Authority

DRAFT TREASURER’S MONTHLY REPORT

MULTI-PARTY AGREEMENT STATUS

Amendment No. 5 to the Multi-party Cost Share Agreement (MPA)
was executed by the JPA and CCWD and will be routed electronically
to each JPA Member following their approval. The first invoice of
$619,500 per agency will be sent to JPA Member agencies in
September.

The following chart provides an overview of the MPA expenditures
through May 31, 2023 in addition to in-kind services, funds received,
outstanding receivable, and cash on hand. All LAPs remain in good
standing and the Project cash on hand remains positive.

Multi-Party Agreement Summary To Date
S70

S60

$50 —

$40

$30

S20

. []

$0 —
MPA Cost  Expenditures Funds Qutstanding Cash on Hand
Received Receivable

mTotal mCWC mLAP mCCWD In-Kind m Reclamation

Millions

MPA Summary to Date:
MPA Cost: $63,437,864 (total through Amendment No. 4)
Expenditures:
CCWD: 535,766,166 (includes consultants and legal services)
In-kind: $7,157,326 (LAPs and Reclamation)
Total: $42,923,492

Funds Received:

CWC: $17,171,120

Reclamation: $2,420,227

LAP: $22,853,077 (cash contributions)
In-kind: $7,157,326 (LAPs and Reclamation)
Total: $49,601,749

Outstanding Receivable:

CWC: $2,610,577 (invoices and retention)
Reclamation: SO
LAP: SO
Cash on Hand: $12,700,780
19
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FEDERAL FUNDING STATUS

A total of $82 million was allocated to the Project in the Bipartisan
Infrastructure Law FY22 Spend Plan and Reclamation recommended
$18 million of Water Infrastructure Improvements for the Nation
(WIIN) Act to be allocated in FY23. Previous awards of Federal
funding during FY21 an FY22 include $10 million in pre-construction
funding and $54 million in construction funding. CCWD executed an
assistance agreement with Reclamation for a total of $7.2 million in
federal funding for permitting, design, and other pre-construction
activities and Reclamation has paid the first two invoices. Staff are
working with Reclamation to develop an amendment to allocate
approximately $800,000 in additional pre-construction funding.

Future Federal funding requests include the remainder of the
requested federal share of 21 percent of the total project cost
(approximately $49 million).

STATE FUNDING STATUS

The Project qualified for funding under the Water Storage
Investment Program and received an adjusted Maximum Conditional
Eligibility Determination of $477,558,343 from the California Water
Commission (CWC) on March 16, 2022. This amount reflects an
additional inflation adjustment of 1.5 percent and an increase in over
$7 million from the previous award.

The Early Funding Agreement with the CWC provides for a cost share
of 50 percent of eligible costs during pre-construction. An
amendment was executed in November 2022 that extends the
agreement through December 31, 2023 and included $927,917 in
additional early funding that is now available as a result of the
inflation adjustments to the total award amount. The summary
below reflects the Total Budget and other budget status information
of the amended Early Funding Agreement.

Early Funding Agreement Summary to Date:

Total Budget: $47,755,834
Total Program Funding: $23,877,917 (50% cost share)
Total Billed To Date: $39,977,079 (84% spent to date)

Total Amount Remaining: $7,778,755

Total Retention To Date: $261,058
Outstanding Invoices: $2,349,519
20
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