
 

Terms of Service 
 

Terms of Service 

Welcome to Coachella Valley Anesthesia. Please read these Terms of Service ("Terms") 
carefully before using our website and services. By accessing or using our website, you 
agree to be bound by these Terms. 

 

Acceptance of Terms 

By using our services, you agree to comply with and be bound by these Terms. If you do 
not agree to these Terms, you should not use our website or services. 

 

Modifications to Terms 

We reserve the right to modify these Terms at any time. Any changes will be effective 
immediately upon posting on our website. Your continued use of the website and 
services after such modifications indicates your acceptance of the new Terms. Please 
review these Terms regularly for updates. 

 

Services Provided 

Coachella Valley Anesthesia provides medical anesthesia services. The content on our 
website is for informational purposes only and is not intended as medical advice. For 
medical advice, diagnosis, or treatment, consult a qualified healthcare provider. 

 

User Responsibilities 

You agree to use our website and services only for lawful purposes. You are responsible 
for ensuring that your use of the website does not violate any applicable laws, 
regulations, or third-party rights. 

 

Privacy Policy 

Our Privacy Policy, which can be found [here](privacy policy), explains how we collect, 
use, and protect your personal information. By using our services, you agree to the 
collection and use of your information as outlined in our Privacy Policy. 

 

https://cvanes.com/privacy-policies


 

Intellectual Property 

All content on our website, including text, graphics, logos, and images, is the property of 
Coachella Valley Anesthesia or its content suppliers and is protected by intellectual 
property laws. You may not use, reproduce, or distribute any content without our prior 
written permission. 

 

Disclaimers 

Our website and services are provided "as is" without warranties of any kind, either 
express or implied. We do not warrant that our services will be uninterrupted or error-
free. 

 

Limitation of LIbability 

To the fullest extent permitted by law, Coachella Valley Anesthesia shall not be liable for 
any indirect, incidental, special, or consequential damages arising out of or in 
connection with your use of our website or services. 

 

Governing Law 

These Terms are governed by and construed in accordance with the laws of the state of 
California, without regard to its conflict of law principles. Any disputes arising from these 
Terms or your use of our services shall be resolved in the state or federal courts located 
in California. 

 

For any concerns regarding our Terms of Service, please contact us immediately at 
info@cvanes.com. 
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