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Studio 

Calendar 

Spring Break                

NO CLASS                 

Friday, March 30th - 

Friday, April 6th  

Memorial Day             

NO CLASS              

Monday, May 28th  

Last Full Week of Class                          

June 4th - 9th  

Dress Rehearsal     

Thursday, June 14th 

 Recital!                          

Friday, June 15th &       

Saturday, June 16th 

*ATTENDANCE* 

Now that we have begun working on Recital Dances, weekly 
attendance is VERY important!  Anyone that is absent more 
than 5 times may lose their spot in the recital. 

 

*OUTSIDE SHOES IN THE STUDIO* 

It is important that everyone follow the “NO OUTSIDE 
SHOES IN THE STUDIO” rule!  Especially when there is 
snow on the ground!  Wet/dirty shoes make the floors gross and 
ruin other students Ballet, Jazz and Tap Shoes. 

*Hip Hop students should be bringing dry shoes to wear to class 
*Parents and Students need to REMOVE wet shoes before  
entering any dance room 
*On Side B when walking through the dance room to get 
through to the back PLEASE REMOVE YOUR SHOES 
AND WALK ALONG THE BACK WALL! 
 

*CLASS ROOM OBSERVATION* 

Because we are now working on Recital routines, we need the 
students full attention during class.  We will be closing the   
studio doors, parents are asked to not sit in the dance room.  
From time to time we will invite parents in watch the last few 
minutes of class, but we would also like to have their dances be 
a surprise come recital. 

 

*AT HOME PRACTICE* 

We strongly encourage practice at home!  If anyone wants to 
video their child’s dance please let the teacher know and she 
will let you know when to come in and do so, usually at the end 
of class. 

Having the music helps with home practice, we have practice 
CD’s available to purchase.  CD’s are $2.00 and will include all 
of your child’s music, edited as it will be for recital.  Please 
order CD’s through your child’s teacher..   

 

*CSAD TEAM FUNDRAISER* 

Our competitive team is selling Yummy Candy from Minonk 
Chocolate Company!  They are selling; Snappers, Peanut   
Clusters, Coconut Clusters, Mints, Gourmet Nuts, Toffee,    
Peanut Butter Crunch, Caramels, Caramel Corn, and Chocolate 
Easter Bunnies!  We are taking orders until February 15th, if 
you would like to place an order please see Miss Amy! 


