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Studio News 

Studio 

Calendar 

*Halloween*                   

NO CLASS              

Wednesday, Oct 31st  

*Thanksgiving Break*                       

NO CLASS          

Wednesday, Nov 21st 

- Sunday, Nov 25th  

*Christmas Break*    

Friday, December 21st - 

Friday, January 4th 

*Spring Break*                          

Monday, April 15th -       

Sunday, April 21st 

Memorial Day             

NO CLASS              

Monday, May 27th  

Last Full Week of Class                          

June 10th - 15th  

Dress Rehearsal     

Thursday, June 20th 

 Recital!                          

Friday, June 21st &       

Saturday, June 22nd 

 

THERE ARE NO CLASSES                                        
WEDNESDAY, NOV. 21st-SUNDAY, NOV 25th              

 

It’s been a fantastic first couple of months here at Center Stage!  
Everyone has been working hard and learning new things.  All 
of the CSAD Teachers are excited to be back at the studio and 
we can’t wait to see what this year will bring!   

This year Center Stage will be celebrating 15 YEARS!  I can’t 
tell you yet what the recital theme will be but….I THINK         
EVERYONE IS GOING TO LOVE IT! 

 

*ANNUAL FUNDRAISER* 

This week we will be sending home fundraising information.  
As always any profit that you earn is YOURS!  It will be added 
to your account and can be used to purchase costumes or pay 
for tuition!  Be sure to read the parent letter and check out the 
product! 

FUNDRAISING ORDERS ARE DUE BACK BY            
TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 13TH 

 
 

 

*A COUPLE REMINDERS* 

*Dress Code~I know the teachers have been sending home 
dress code reminders.  Please make sure you are aware of the 
dress code and are sending your child to class in the appropriate 
attire.  **PLEASE SEE DRESS CODE ON BACK** 

*Monthly Tuition~Tuition is due during the first week of each 
month, any account not paid by the 10th of each month will be 
assessed a $5 late fee.  Tuition payments are the same amount 
each month regardless of studio closings.  We accept Cash, 
Check, Credit Cards, and can also set your account up for Auto 
Pay!   

 

*SAFETY!* 

Parents, please speak with your children about the dangers of 
leaving the studio unaccompanied.  We ask that they please 
wait inside the building if an adult has not arrived by the end of 
class to pick them up. 

 


