
Club
Charter



The club will:
Ensure that all coaches and regular
volunteers undertake an Enhanced
DBS check every 3 years

Ensure all coaches undertake annual CPD
in coaching techniques, safeguarding and
concussion protocols

Provide access to a named Child Welfare
Officer at all times

Provide qualified first aiders at all sessions

Provide regular opportunities for members
to train and play games between February
and October

Communicate fixtures and training sessions
with as much notice as possible

Ensure that training equipment is kept in
serviceable use and is safe to use

Ensure that volunteers place the enjoyment
and safety of members as their prime
motivation for helping out.



Players will:
Ensure they uphold the good name of the
club at all times both on and off the field

Listen to and respect coaches at all times

Act safely in training and games, ensuring
that their actions allow themselves and
others to always have fun

Arrive prepared and on time to training
sessions and games

Never argue with match officials, or engage
in arguments with officials from other teams

Recognise that they are a member of a team
and are no more important than any other
team member

Thank coaches and other volunteers for
their time and effort at the end of sessions

Assist in clearing away equipment at the
end of sessions



Parents will:
Ensure they uphold the good name of the
club, showing respect always

Respond to match and training invitations
in a timely manner

Place the emphasis of their child’s
participation on having fun and getting better
at rugby league, rather than defining
success solely on the final score

Ensure their children arrive prepared and on
time to training sessions and games

Never argue with match officials, or engage
in arguments with officials/visitors from other
teams

Never make public comparisons between
their own children and the performance of
other players or volunteers

Thank coaches and other volunteers for
their time and effort at the end of sessions

Ensure any concerns are discussed with the
Child Welfare Officer confidentially


