
1. The club shall be known as Causeway and Glens Riding Club. 
  
2. The committee will consist of not less than 7 members, plus the Chairperson. 
  
3. The judge’s decision is final. Rudeness towards judges will not be tolerated. 
Objections must be lodged within 30 minutes of the event; accompanied with 
£20.  The objection will be dealt with by the committee at their earliest 
convenience.  Should the objection be overruled the £20 will go to club funds. 
  
4. The committee has the right to refuse membership. 
   
5. The club will not tolerate bad language, cruelty to animals, mischievous conduct 
etc.  Any party concerned will be told to leave. 
 
6. All competitors ride at their own risk.  The committee and club accept no 
responsibility for damage or injury to horses, vehicles and personal property. 
  
7. British Riding Clubs and BHS STRONGLY recommends that all Horse 
riders/owners have at least 3rd party insurance. Being mindful of this, the Committee 
require you to indicate on your membership form that you have 3rd party insurance or 
that you are going to purchase it once a member. 
  
8. Horses/Ponies MUST NOT be left unaccompanied tethered to a trailer/box. 
  
9. Members ages will be as of 1st January.  
   
10. Horse/Pony age will be as of the 1st January in the current year. Please ask if 
you are unsure. (NO Horse/Pony under the age of 4 years to be ridden on the 
showground) Young horses/ponies are welcome, however they must not be over 
challenged ie too high jumps. The Committee at the event/show have the authority to 
intervene and members/guest will be asked to leave if they do not comply with 
committee request. 
  
11. All mounted riders must wear fastened hard hats conforming to PAS 015:1998; 
EN1384:1996 and VG1 01.040 (2014-12) and carry the British Kite Mark together 
with correct footwear whilst on the field. 
   
12. Dogs must be kept on leads at all times. 
  
13. The committee reserves the right to cancel, amend or withdraw an event at any 
time. 
  
14. Members when requested must produce a valid membership card (or 
screenshot) to enter each class, otherwise the member will be charged at the non-
members rate. 
   
15. Any competitor withdrawing (after the start list has been published) or missing 
from a class WILL NOT be refunded their entrance fee other than in extreme 
circumstance i.e. illness of horse/pony or rider. A voucher may be offered.  
 



16. Showjumping competitions will be run under SJI rules (www.sji.ie), dressage 
under Dressage Ireland rules (www.dressageireland.ie) and showing/working hunter 
under Irish Pony Society rules (www.ips.ie) 
 
17. Photographers will be present to take photos and these may be published on 
social media or in the local papers. If you do not want your photo to be taken/used in 
this manner, this is your personal responsibility so please approach the 
photographer on arrival and make yourself known to them that you do not wish to be 
photographed. 
 
 

http://www.sji.ie/
http://www.dressageireland.ie/
http://www.ips.ie/

