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Airborne Intelligence, Surveillance, & 
Reconnaissance (A-ISR) is at the 
forefront of strategic and tactical-level 
intelligence gathering. The capability 
to collect real-time intelligence and to 
push that data off board in near-real 
time for decision makers requires a 
well-oiled mechanism consisting of 
relevant technology and well-trained 
operators. V1 Solutions’ key leadership 
has wide-ranging experience supplying 
Full-Motion Video (FMV) and Moving 
Target Indicator (MTI) radar support in 
addition to Signals Intelligence 
(SIGINT) to both Conventional and 
Special Operations Forces units in 
multiple theaters around the globe. 
With many of our instructors having 
Joint Terminal Attack Controller (JTAC) 
or ISR Tactical Controller (ITC) 
qualifications, our ISR SME’s can 
provide your personnel with the most 
up-to-date Tactics, Techniques, & 
Procedures (TTP) from the field. Learn 
how to properly integrate FMV into 
your collection plan and identify the 
appropriate methodologies for 
Processing, Exploitation, and 
Dissemination (PED). 

ISR Capabilities: 

Airborne / Remote Sensor Operators 

FMV / MTI training 

JTAC training 

ITC training 

ISR PED operators & training 

Multi-INT collection & training 

ISR systems integration  

Aircraft configuration consulting 

ISR utilization consulting 

UAS / CUAS operations  

Exercise support 

Basic ISR course (pre-deployment)
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