



One Financial Plaza
100 SE 3rd Avenue, 23rd Floor
Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33394
(954) 522-2200
(954) 522-9123 Facsimile

May 09, 2019

VILLAGE OF LAZY LAKE
2250 LAZY LANE
LAZY LAKE, FL 33305

Bill Number 206143
Billed through 04/30/2019

VILLAGE OF LAZY LAKE / LEGAL SERVICES

018862 018001 DJL

Balance forward as of bill dated	04/22/2019	\$1,646.46
Payments and Trust amounts applied		\$1,646.46
Net balance forward		<u>\$0.00</u>

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

04/01/19	DJL	Status conference with OIG Counsel Attorney Breece regarding Lazy Lake.	0.20 hrs
04/02/19	DJL	Receipt and review e-correspondence from OIG General Counsel.	0.10 hrs
04/04/19	DJL	Review statutory procedures for annexation and contraction.	0.50 hrs
04/05/19	DJL	Teleconference with Administrative Assistant and Mayor regarding need to cancel meeting for Workshop since no authorizing Resolution had been adopted.	0.10 hrs
04/09/19	DJL	Address issues with cancellation of Workshop.	0.10 hrs
04/09/19	DJL	Continue investigation of evidence concerning issues to address OIG.	3.00 hrs
04/09/19	DJL	Conduct legal research on County election special laws and other matters incident to investigation of evidence for OIG response.	2.00 hrs
04/10/19	DJL	Review evidence of ordinance enactments and legislative material at Lazy Lake Office; phone conference with Mr. Way of Supervisor of Elections; prepare e-mail to Mr. Way; prepare e-mail to Ms. Tayar; confirm with Mayor Anthony.	2.50 hrs
04/11/19	DJL	Initial preparation of memorandum to file regarding investigation status regarding issues to report back to OIG.	2.50 hrs
04/11/19	DJL	Phone conference with Mayor Anthony.	0.10 hrs
04/11/19	DJL	Receipt and review Ms. Tayar's response to resident public records request.	0.10 hrs
04/12/19	DJL	Complete research whether municipal Charter had been amended since 1953; review minutes of appointments; teleconference with Mr. Doody; prepare e-mail to Mr. Doody.	3.50 hrs
04/12/19	DJL	Prepare e-mail regarding charter requirement for notice on website as approved by voter referendum in November 2018 election.	0.25 hrs
04/12/19	DJL	Teleconference with John Boisseau.	0.20 hrs
04/15/19	DJL	Receipt and review e-mail from Mayor Anthony.	0.10 hrs
04/16/19	DJL	Teleconference call with Mayor Anthony regarding Village matters.	0.25 hrs
04/16/19	DJL	Finalize draft Resolution for Regular Meetings.	0.50 hrs
04/16/19	DJL	Prepare draft Resolution for Special Meeting.	0.20 hrs

04/16/19	DJL	Attend Village Council Meeting.	2.25 hrs
04/17/19	DJL	Finalize Resolutions (drafts adopted last night) for special meeting and for Notice procedures.	0.25 hrs
04/17/19	DJL	Add provisions in file memorandum setting forth chronology of minutes for 2018 regarding persons serving as public officials.	1.20 hrs
04/17/19	DJL	Interim status conference with OIG General Counsel regarding outstanding issues raised by that Office; prepare notes for file.	0.80 hrs
04/23/19	DJL	Prepare status e-mail to OIG General Counsel regarding efforts to post on County web-site for Workshop meeting.	0.20 hrs
04/23/19	DJL	Receipt and review response from OIG General Counsel regarding staggered terms; request records mentioned; receipt and review e-mail regarding public records request.	0.20 hrs
04/23/19	DJL	Attend 4-23-19 Workshop meeting at Hagen Community Center.	0.75 hrs
04/24/19	DJL	Teleconference with Mr. Doody regarding Lazy Lake history.	0.20 hrs
04/25/19	DJL	Complete fact investigation of Lazy Lake election history.	2.00 hrs
04/30/19	KMM	Perform legal research re: de facto public officials.	2.50 hrs
Total fees for this matter			\$6,119.00

DISBURSEMENTS

04/30/19	WESTLAW RESEARCH	\$66.00
Total disbursements for this matter		\$66.00

BILLING SUMMARY

LUNNY, DONALD	24.05 hrs	230.00 /hr	\$5,531.50
MORGAN, KYLE M.	2.50 hrs	235.00 /hr	\$587.50
TOTAL FEES		26.55 hrs	\$6,119.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS			\$66.00
TOTAL ADMIN COSTS			\$183.57
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL			\$6,368.57
NET BALANCE FORWARD			\$0.00
TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE			\$6,368.57
TRUST BALANCE			\$0.00

A 3% administration charge on all fees has been included to cover internal costs such as scanning, photocopying, postage, conference calls, long-distance telephone charges and similar other charges

MAKE PAYMENT



LAWPAY

To pay your bill online go to: www.BrinkleyMorgan.com