
Hands On Happenings
M onday, September 3rd:
Labor Day
Office Closed

Sep tember 10th:
Happy Birthday, Meg!

September 18th:
Happy Birthday, Chiropractic!
(Birthday specials to the right of this page.)

 

Have you given us a review
yet?

Check out our Yelp Page

Watch our video on 
Health Benefits of

Probiotics

Join our FREE
Email Mailing List

For Email Newsletters you can trust

The next Dynamic Thermal Imaging Session 
that will be held at Hands On is

Friday October 4, 2019
Click the link below for more information.

Dynamic Thermal Imaging

Happy Birthday
Chiropractic!!

Hands On Chiropractic
Celebrates Chiropractic's 

124th Birthday
September 3rd-27th

Only 8 spaces open for a
$75 Spinal Exam

(Includes initial complete
chiropractic consultation,

exam, and high quality
digital x-rays: if needed). 

A $300 value

Call to reserve your space
today!

 
P roduct of the M onth:  

PROSYNBIOTIC

ProSy nbiotic is a sy nergistic
blend of  f our research-

supported probiotic strains and
two prebiotic f ibers to support
gut f lora and ov erall intestinal

health

Contains research-supported
strains of lactic acid bacteria
(Lactobacillus and
Bifidobacterium), and
Saccharomyces cerevisiae var.
boulardii
Contains inulin, a
nondigestible soluble fiber
from chicory root, and
galactooligosaccharide
(GOS), a nondigestible
carbohydrate, both of which are
used by probiotic bacteria as
food
Useful in maintaining a healthy
gut microbial environment
Helps support the body's
natural absorption of calcium
and magnesium
Improves nutrient digestion
and absorption
Supports normal bowel
regularity and consistency
Supports the body's natural
immune system function*

10% off for the 
month of September

https://www.yelp.com/biz/hands-on-chiropractic-corning?uid=ExRwOKVDrI44kz4b6_ouTQ&utm_campaign=www_business_share_popup&utm_medium=copy_link&utm_source=(direct)
https://www.google.com/search?tbm=lcl&ei=neBgWvyuGomYsQWDrZSQDw&q=hands+on+chiropractic+corning+ny&oq=hands&gs_l=psy-ab.3.1.0i67k1l2j0i131k1j0i67k1j0i131k1j0l5.8870.9427.0.12040.5.5.0.0.0.0.157.286.0j2.2.0....0...1c.1.64.psy-ab..3.2.283...0i10k1.0.6NVGh0lGnmk#rlfi=hd:;si:7540999331003973166;mv:!1m3!1d1943.1025444279774!2d-77.0603346827686!3d42.1506365776919!3m2!1i635!2i1009!4f13.1
http://www.facebook.com/handsonchiropractic
https://www.yelp.com/biz/hands-on-chiropractic-corning
https://youtu.be/phBp6BXvygA
http://visitor.r20.constantcontact.com/d.jsp?llr=rgmka8eab&p=oi&m=1104712904913
http://visitor.r20.constantcontact.com/d.jsp?llr=rgmka8eab&p=oi&m=1104712904913
http://www.constantcontact.com/jmml/email-newsletter.jsp
http://www.nydti.com

