
Weekend of October 31, 2021

Thirty-first Sunday in Ordinary Time


This new Mass schedule will stay in effect until the 
Covid-19 crisis is over. Thanks for your patience.                                   


Barona:

Mass: Tuesday through Friday. Rosary at 7:45 AM, Mass 
at 8:00 AM. @ Shrine

Sunday: Sunday 8:00 AM.@ Shrine

Confessions: By appointment only

Adoration: 1st Fri. of the month (8:00 AM). 

Viejas:

Sunday: Sunday, 10:30 AM. @ Church

Confessions:  By appointment only.

Sycuan:   
Sunday:  Sunday Mass 12:00 noon @ the Church

Confessions: By appointment only     


                           

Sue Kierig, Martha Boone, A. J. Samot, Angelo Samot, 
Donna Berardi, Daniel Vicaldo, Kash Osuna-Sutton, 
Anthony Pico, Dolly Albano, Mike Montes, Bobbie Turner,  
Mae Guerrero, Susanna Gotell, Agnes Ruiz, Deacon Bill 
Clarke, Rosario Ravasco, Minerva Mayor, Michele Nikas 
Beaman, Richard Nikas, Purita Amparo, Wendy Reyes, 
Alicia Castro, Barbara Reeves, Nancy Rourke, Bobby Curo, 
Abraham Pascual, Richard Padua, Irmina Gines, Gimo 
Manuel, Joyce Martinez, Elvira Hapin,  Dustin Lutze, 
Deloris Loucks, Cameron Welch,  Christine Therese 
Macaraeg, Beverly Means 

Please check prayer list and add names as desired. 





RELIGIOUS EDUCATION CLASSES (K-High 

School)


Barona – Thursdays, 3:00 PM


Reminder:  Please give the bus driver a pass to get 
off at the church.





Sunday Mass is livestreamed @ 8:00 AM, Barona.

Just go on Facebook under Herman Manue




Please join us for Brother Ed’s zoom series on the 

Catholic Mass.


When:  Wednesday, 11/3

Time:  5:30 PM


If you would like to join us, please contact Brother Ed 
at  bktparish@aol.com and leave your email address 

and the zoom link will be sent to you.





1 – All Saint’s Day Mass, 8:00 AM Barona


2 – All Soul’s Day schedule:

Viejas – 11:00 AM


Los Conejos – 12 PM

Sycuan – 4 PM


Barona – 6:30 PM


Sunday, November 7 – Daylight Savings Time ends.  
Be sure to turn your clocks back one hour!


Thursday, November 11 – Veteran’s Day


Thursday, November 25 – Thanksgiving Mass, 8:00 
AM Mass


ALL SOUL’S DAY envelopes are in the pews in the 
churches.


 Love of God, Love of Neighbor and Love of Self  

A reflection on the 31st Sunday in Ordinary Time  


        UPCOMING EVENTS

mailto:bktparish@aol.com


 There is a Bible scholar who said: “The message of the 
Scripture from the first page to the very last is love.” 
Indeed, love is the main message of Christianity, others are 
just commentaries. Apart from it, no religious practices, 
teachings, and rituals which are pleasing and acceptable to 
the Lord. Hence, the perfection of the Christian life 
consists principally and essentially in charity. It is the 
foundation, center, and the summit of Christian life.  


“You shall love the Lord your God with all your heart, 
with all your soul, with all your mind and with all your 
strength…you shall love your neighbor as you love 
yourself,” (Mk 12:30-31). This is the words of Jesus when 
one of the scribes asked Him which is the first of all 
commandments since in Israel in Jesus’ time, the scholars 
of the Law could extract 613 commandments from 
Scriptures: 365 prohibitions – the number of days in a year 
and 248 positive precepts, the number of the bones in the 
human body (or so they thought), symbol of a person’s 
structure.  


Jesus refers to two Biblical passages and joins them to 
form two faces of one supreme commandment of love. 
These are like the two beams that make up a cross. One 
points upward and one points sideward. For Jesus, these 
two dimensions together constitute what it means to be an 
authentic Christian. The first is the famous Shema (Deut 
6:4-5) as it is read in our first reading which invites Israel 
to a joyful union with and total love of God. This is the 
vertical dimension of the commandment of love.  


But the problem is, there are people who overstress the 
love of God. They want to shut other people out of their 
lives; they want to live for God alone and spend their day 
praying. They say that people only disturb them and keep 
them away from God. If you ask them to help you to do 
something, they say: “I’ll pray for you.” This kind of 
thinking is wrong. It is selfishness.  


The second, from the Book of Leviticus, invites a person 
to love his neighbor as himself (19:18). This is the 
horizontal dimension of the commandment. But, just like 
the commandment of loving God, there are also people 
who do just the opposite. They are totally involved in 
helping people: the sick, the rascals, the poor, the drug 
addict, the people with problems, etc.. They work all day 
and half the night. They are so busy that they have no time 
to pray. They say: “My work is my prayer.”  But that is 
only a half-truth. We cannot do God’s work without God! 
Jesus in today’s gospel said to us clearly: “Love God and 
love your neighbor.” One saint put this new commandment 
in this way: “”We should fold our hands in prayer in 
church and then we should open our hands to others 
outside of the church.” We cannot love without loving 
people. We cannot love people without loving God.  


How can we apply this new commandment of love into our 
lives: There is a chapter in the book entitled Loving Each 
Other – The Challenge of Human Relationships authored 

by Leo Buscaglia that lists suggestions from the 
participants in the survey on how to make relationships 
work since love is a kind of relationship too. Fr. Joseph 
Galdon, SJ called these suggestions the Ten 
Commandments of Love. Here are the lists to help us in 
our love relationships.  


1. Take your time. A love relationship is not built overnight 
and so be patient and take your time.  .

 2.  Don’t smother each other. Give them space too and      
allow them to move and don’t let them feel that they are 
required to spend every waking hour with you.  3.  Don’t 
brood. Stop self-pity, self-blaming and the mea-culpa 
syndrome. It is because we are not as bad as we think.   

4. Exercise feelings. Feelings have meaning only as they 
are expressed in action.  5.  Forming a relationship takes a 
lot of looking. But looking can be fun. Grow up together 
constantly. 6. . Don’t be afraid. Stop all worry. Most of 
what you are worried about you’ll have difficulty 
remembering a week later,7. Learn to listen. You don’t 
learn anything from hearing yourself talk. See all criticism 
as positive. Anyway, you are always free to reject it if it is 
unfair or does not apply.  8.  Don’t lose touch with the 
craziness in you. Keep the child in you alive and playing. 
Keep laughing. It exercises your heart and protects you 
from cardiac problems.  9.  Don’t be afraid or 
disagreements and arguments. The only people who do not 
argue are people who don’t care or are dead. After an 
argument is over, forget it. Learn to bend. 10.  Don’t hold 
to anger, from love.  11.   Stop playing games. 
Relationships are not sporting events. Stop wrestling for 
control.     
 
To end, one very popular song sang in church has this 
refrain: “Did you fill the world with love, did you fill the 
world with love, did you fill the world with love your 
whole life through?”   
 
If your answer is yes, blessed are you and be sure you have 
been blessing to others.  

       Rev. Fr. Joseph Benitez  

        Philippines  



