
Thursday, May 26, 2022

Rio Vaqueros Meeting Minutes 

Call to Order


President Carl McCleskey called the meeting to order and the Pledge of Allegiance was 
recited at 17:31.


• Members present were: Gary Allen, Carol Whitney, Craig Pierson, Jim Paxon, Doug 
Kamicar, Cece Kamicar, Carl McCleskey, Charles Bonner, George Richards, Kari 
Richards.


Previous Minutes


Secretary Carol Whitney read the minutes from the April 28, 2022 meeting. 


Note that all meeting minutes are available on the website: riovaqueros.org 


Jim Paxon made a motion to accept the minutes as read. Charles Bonner seconded. 
Motion carried.


Treasurer’s Report


Treasurer Gary Allen gave the monthly treasurer’s report.


May 26, 2022 

• Checking Balance: $1833.48


• Income: $195.00 (Long Range shoot $35, 6 memberships $120, Fun Shoot $40)


• Expenses: $93.24 (checks $23.95, Deposit books $69.29)


• Savings Balance: $919.81


• TOTAL: $2753.29 

Carol Whitney made a motion to accept the Treasurer’s Report as read. Seconded by 
Craig Pierson. Motion carried.


1



Thursday, May 26, 2022

Old Business


Items From Meeting with City of TorC Management 

• A meeting was held with the city on 04/15/2022. Notes from this meeting appear 
after the April minutes on the website.


• Range Gate Closing: 


• The city attorney has indicated that he will draft a liability waiver for Rio Vaqueros 
Inc. members with regard to closing the range gates at night. 


• The city has indicated that dispatch will send police officers immediately if a need 
arises.


• We will need to form a work party to fix the fence before a nightly gate closing can 
actually prevent after hours range entry. 


• The city is not in a big hurry and realistically we would start doing this in the fall if 
we can come up with enough volunteers and settle on an acceptable schedule.


• Jim Paxon requested that the secretary, Carol W, write up a thank you letter to the 
city to be signed by Carl Mc. for the city’s recent efforts at range cleanup. (Pending 
from April meeting)


• Friends of the Range: The city has indicated that they are in favor of setting up a 
friends of the range organization to accept donations for range maintenance and 
improvements. 


• This would require its own Non-profit entity and management body.


• This effort is in its infancy and further talks and coordination with the city will be 
forthcoming.


Chain Link Enclosure For Target Storage at Pistol Pits 

• Still pending. 


• Carl needs to do some prefab work before the fencing can be installed. 
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Thursday, May 26, 2022
Club Logo  

• Carol W has agreed to develop a digital logo prototype based on the discussions 
from the previous meeting before June 5.


NRA Women On Target Event  

• This event will take place on September 17, 2022. The Rio Vaqueros will be an In-
Name sponsor for the event.


• After some discussion we decided to add a long range rifle component to this event. 
We will have three or four 6mm and 6.5mm Creedmoor rifles set up on the rifle range. 
We will provide a couple of ROs to run this portion of the event. George Richards will 
procure the necessary ammo. 


• We will also be taking donation items to draw for door prizes.


• We will coordinate with George and Kari Richards as needed.


RSO Certification Course   

• Team Richards has cancelled this course (June 5) due to insufficient enrollment.


New Business


Bowling Pitch Match For June Fun Shoot 

• Carl indicated he would like to do a head to head bowling pin match for the June 
Pistol Fun Shoot. 


• Gary A will check to see if we have enough bowling pins in storage. 


• Carol W will approach the new owners of the Bowling Alley to see if they would be 
willing to donate or sell us for a small fee, their used pins. 


• An update will be posted to the website. riovaqueros.org


KYL Target Match for June Long Range Shoot 

• Mike Boyd has built a couple of KYL racks and will be setting them up for the June 
long range shoot at the rifle range. 


• An update will be posted to the website. riovaqueros.org


• No Long Range shoots in July and August. Too hot to set targets and no shade. see 
you in September. 
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Thursday, May 26, 2022

Meeting Adjourned


Carl McCleskey called for the meeting to be adjourned at 18:13. Gary Allen made a 
motion to adjourn, seconded by Jim Paxon. Motion carried. 


Respectfully submitted by Carol Whitney.
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