
Everything You Need From
Practice To The Field

Here at Howell To Sports our goal is to provide our customers with the best
products that we can find and our partnership with Grand Slam safety allows us
to do just that. Grand Slam has a variety of products that can help your practices
and games reach a new level.

Today we would like to introduce you to two of their products:
windscreens and batting cages

 

http://howelltosports.com
http://howelltosports.com/


Cherry Hill High School East, NJ

Windscreens for Sports and Construction Sites

▪ Multi-
functional
and
custom
built,
our
durable
privacy
fence
covers
act
as
banner
and
barrier
to
give
your
team
that
major
league
style.

http://howelltosports.com?link_list=3043171
https://www.coversports.com/product-category/browse-by-product/fence-coverswind-and-privacy-screens/?link_list=3043171


Whether
it’s
for
the
stadium
or
in
the
gymnasium,
we’ve
got
windscreens
to
fit
anything
from
simple
lettering
and
school
colors
to
full-
scale
graphics
and
logos.
Keep
the
action
on
the
field
with
custom
wind
and
privacy
screens
aimed
to
help
athletes
stay
focused
on



their
one
task
at
hand
—
winning.

▪ Our
sports
windscreens
are
suitable
for
all
activities
and
venues,
including
baseball
and
softball
fields,
as
well
as
tennis
courts.
We
offer
everything
from
tennis
mesh
windscreens
to
protective
screens
for
your
field
–
able
to
be
personalized
on



durable
vinyl
or
mesh
in
your
team’s
colors
and
emblazoned
with
your
logo.

▪ Keep
you
construction
project
under
wraps
with
construction
netting,
fence
screens,
banners
and
wraps.
With
our
attractive
construction
windscreens
you
can
advertise
what’s
coming
soon,
while
keeping
unsightly
construction
and
rubble
from
view.
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BATTING CAGES

SPECTO Net Batting Cages from Grand Slam Safety, LLC bring batting cages to
a new level. The cage’s recessed netting system keeps balls from rebounding
back toward the batting cage occupants allowing for greater safety of athlete and
coaches while reducing the likelihood of injury. These benefits and more—
including the ability to customize and reconfigure on the fly—have made our
batting cage nets for sale the premier batting practice solution throughout the US
and Asia.

Meanwhile, the tensioned bottom cable prevents balls from rolling under the
netting as well as preventing athletes from tripping. Our net batting cages also
boast recessed poles to allow for an exterior soft toss area. With SPECTO net
bagging cages you no longer have to cancel batting practice due to unfavorable

http://howelltosports.com?link_list=3043171
http://howelltosports.com?link_list=3043171
https://www.grandslamsafety.com/battting-cages?link_list=3043171


weather because our batting cage nets for sale work great inside, too!

All of our net batting cages also contain a “walk draw” center dividing net. This
feature allows for one cage to become two separate cages for versatility that
caters to your batting practice needs. All netting can be removed from the ground
level and the entire cage can be deconstructed, moved, and stored easily and
quickly. ​

Safety, customization to any size, accessories, and more make the SPECTO net
batting cage system the best batting cage net for sale on the market for you and
your players.

Outdoor Batting Cage

Indoor Batting Cage
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