
SURFSIDE NACHOS
Corn tortilla chips, cheese, tomato, 
green onions, jalapeño with a side of 
salsa and sour cream  9
Add chicken  2
Add seasoned ground beef  2

CHEESE CURDS
Hand battered Ellsworth white ched-
dar cheese curds with marinara  8

QUESADILLA
Choice of seasoned chicken or steak, 
bell peppers, onions and colby jack 
cheese served with salsa and sour 
cream  9

CHICKEN LETTUCE WRAPS
Diced grilled chicken breast, water 
chestnuts, carrots, green onions, 
crispy noodles and romaine lettuce 
with peanut sauce  12

BAVARIAN PRETZELS
Soft salted pretzels baked and served 
warm with choice of honey mustard 
or beer cheese  8

SURFSIDE CHIPS
White Diamond potatoes sliced fresh 
daily with homemade seasoned sour 
cream  5

ONION RINGS
Served with ranch dressing  6

PICKLE CHIPS
Hand breaded and served with ranch 
dressing  7

STEAK BITES*
Cooked to medium and served with 
a creamy horseradish sauce  12

SURFSIDE SHRIMP
Jumbo shrimp hand battered and 
lightly fried tossed in your choice of 
garlic parmesan, sweet chili or buffalo 
sauce  13

BUFFALO CHICKEN DIP
Oven baked buffalo chicken dip 
served warm with two soft baked 
pretzels  8 

BBQ BACON 
CHEDDAR CHICKEN
Grilled chicken breast, cheddar 
cheese, Pecanwood smoked bacon, 
BBQ sauce, lettuce, tomato and 
onion on brioche bun  13

ULTIMATE BLT
Pecanwood smoked bacon, tomato, 
leaf lettuce, tomato aioli on grilled 
sourdough  12

CHIPOTLE CHICKEN
Grilled Cajun chicken breast, fresh 
jalapeños, habanero jack cheese and 
chipotle mayo on brioche bun  13

BBQ PULLED PORK
Slow roasted pork, topped with BBQ 
sauce and crispy fried onions on a 
brioche bun  13

RUEBEN OR RACHEL
Corned beef or turkey, sauerkraut, 
Swiss, 1000 island dressing on 
marble rye  13

SOUTHERN FRIED CHICKEN
Hand breaded chicken breast, pickles 
and sweet and spicy sauce on 
brioche bun  13

CUBAN
Pulled pork, ham, habanero jack 
cheese, honey mustard, and pickles 
on a hoagie  13

TRIPLE DECKER CLUBHOUSE
Oven roasted turkey, Pecanwood 
smoked bacon, ham, lettuce, tomato 
and mayo on toasted sourdough  12

PRIME RIB FRENCH DIP
Sliced prime rib, Swiss cheese 
cheese on a hoagie roll served with 
au jus  14
Add peppers and onions  1

A P P E T I Z E R S

S A N D W I C H E S

T R A D I T I O N A L  W I N G S   12 H A N D  B R E A D E D  B O N E L E S S  W I N G S   11

Served with choice of Surfside chips, fresh greens, cottage cheese or coleslaw
Substitute waffle fries  1  •  Substitute onion rings  2  •  Substitute soup or side salad  3

DINNER SALAD  5

CAESAR SIDE SALAD  5

HOUSE COLESLAW  3

LOADED BAKED POTATO  5

HOUSE VEGETABLE  3

SURFSIDE CHIPS  3

HOMEMADE CORN CAKE  2

QUINOA BLEND  3

CUP OF SOUP  4

BOWL OF SOUP  6

FRESH BAKED COOKIE  2

DESSERTS  5

S I D E S

D R Y  R U B B E D : Whiskey Smoked or Cajun

S A U C E : Garlic Parmesan, Sweet Chili, Buffalo, Texas BBQ, Carolina Reaper, Korean BBQ, Mango Habanero



*Consuming raw or undercooked eggs, meat or fish may increase your risk of foodborne illness.

CHEESEBURGER*
Choice of American, Swiss, cheddar, 
crumbled blue cheese, or habanero 
jack with lettuce, tomato and onion  
12

HANGOVER*
American cheese, hash browns, 
Pecanwood smoked bacon and a 
fried egg  13

PRETZEL BURGER*
American cheese, beer cheese 
dipping sauce, lettuce, tomato, onion 
on a pretzel bun  13

PATTY MELT*
Swiss and American cheese, sautéed 
onion on marble rye  13

BLACK AND BLEU*
Cajun seasoning, crumbled bleu 
cheese, cheddar cheese and bacon 
bits  12

A-1 PEPPERCORN*
Habanero jack cheese, onion straws, 
A-1 and creamy peppercorn sauces  
12

TEXAS BBQ*
Pecanwood smoked bacon, BBQ 
sauce, cheddar cheese and crispy 
fried onions  13

DADDY MAC*
American cheese, lettuce, tomato, 
red onion and secret sauce  12

JALAPEÑO POPPER BURGER* 
Pecanwood smoked bacon, sweet 
chili cream cheese, sweet chili sauce 
and fresh jalapeños  13 

HOUSE SALAD
Mixed greens, romaine, tomatoes, 
carrots, shredded cheese and 
croutons  5

SPINACH SALAD
Fresh fruit, goat cheese and walnuts 
topped with a balsamic glaze  9

CLASSIC CAESAR
Chopped romaine, parmesan cheese 
and croutons tossed with a creamy 
homemade Caesar dressing  8

ICEBERG WEDGE
Crisp iceberg, Pecanwood smoked 
bacon, green onions, grape tomatoes, 
bleu cheese crumbles and blue 
cheese dressing  9

BUFFALO CHICKEN SALAD
Chopped romaine, cheddar jack 
cheese, tomatoes, Pecanwood 
smoked bacon, bleu cheese 
crumbles, tossed with ranch dressing 
topped with buffalo chicken breast  
12

TEQUILA LIME SALAD
Sautéed jumbo shrimp, chopped 
romaine, red onions, grape tomatoes, 
parmesan cheese tossed with lime 
vinaigrette  14

SOUTHWEST CHICKEN
Grilled chicken breast, romaine, 
cheddar jack cheese, grilled corn 
salsa, and tortilla strips tossed with 
Santa Fe ranch  12

MARGHERITA
Fresh mozzarella, roasted tomatoes, 
garlic, basil and balsamic drizzle  12

JALAPEÑO POPPER 
Cream cheese, mozzarella, fried 
jalapeños, Pecanwood smoked 
bacon, sweet chili sauce  12

PEPPERONI
Pepperoni, mozzarella and marinara 
11 // Add sausage  2

SAUSAGE & ROSEMARY
Italian sausage, mozzarella, red cream
sauce, roasted tomatoes, green 
onions and rosemary olive oil  12

KOREAN BBQ
Mixed bell peppers, red onion, 
mozzarella and Korean BBQ sauce  12

CHICKEN BACON RANCH
Chicken, ranch, Pecanwood smoked 
bacon, diced tomatoes, mozzarella 
and cheddar jack  12

ST. LOUIS RIBS
Texas BBQ sauce, waffle fries, 
homemade corncake and coleslaw  
½ rack 16 // full rack  24

SURFSIDE FISH & CHIPS
Fried sunfish, fries, coleslaw, 
homemade corncake and tartar sauce  
15

CHICKEN 
FETTUCCINE ALFREDO
Grilled chicken breast and fettuccine 
noodles tossed in Alfredo sauce 
served with a breadstick  14

JUMBO SHRIMP SKEWERS
Jumbo shrimp tossed in garlic butter 
and served with a blend of brown 
rice, quinoa and sautéed spinach and 
a homemade corncake  16

SHRIMP BASKET
Hand breaded jumbo shrimp, waffle 
fries, and coleslaw  16

SAUSAGE PENNE PASTA
Italian sausage, penne noodles, 
mushrooms, spinach, tomatoes and 
parmesan cheese in a red cream 
sauce served with a breadstick  15

SHRIMP PASTA
Sautéed jumbo shrimp, peppers, 
onions, mushrooms and penne 
noodles tossed in a lemon cream 
sauce  16

BLACKENED SALMON
Cajun seasoned Atlantic salmon, 
served with a blend of brown rice, 
quinoa and sautéed spinach and 
house vegetable  18

SIRLOIN STEAK*
8 ounce Certified Angus Beef top 
sirloin,  baked potato and coleslaw 18
Add shrimp skewer  6

CHICKEN STIR FRY 
Chicken breast, broccoli, sugar snap 
peas, carrots, water chestnuts 
sautéed in a Korean BBQ sauce 
served over white rice  16

CHICKEN PICCATA
Lightly breaded chicken breast, 
capers and fettuccine noodles in a 
lemon butter sauce served with a 
breadstick  15 

PETITE FILET*
6 ounce filet served with house 
vegetable and choice of potato  26
Add shrimp skewer  6

B U R G E R S
½ pound custom ground blend of top sirloin, chuck and brisket. Served with choice of Surfside chips, fresh greens, cottage 

cheese or coleslaw. Substitute waffle fries  1  •  Substitute onion rings  2  •  Substitute soup or side salad  3
Substitute gluten free bun  2

S A L A D S
Includes a breadstick  •  Add chicken  5  •  shrimp  6  •  salmon  6  •  steak  7

E N T R E E S

F L A T B R E A D S

Add soup, side caesar or house salad  3


