
Preserve cash flow

Asset finance allows you to unlock the value of your existing assets, such as
equipment, machinery, or even property, without depleting your cash
reserves. By using asset finance, you can retain your available working
capital for other crucial business needs, such as inventory purchase,
marketing campaigns, or expansion plans.

5 benefits 
of asset finance

Flexible repayments

With asset finance, you have the flexibility to choose repayment terms
that suit your cash flow patterns and business requirements. Whether
you prefer monthly, quarterly, or even seasonal instalments, asset finance
providers often offer customised repayment options tailored to your
unique circumstances, ensuring maximum flexibility and ease of
repayment.

Growth opportunities

Releasing working capital through asset finance provides you with an
opportunity to seize growth opportunities as they arise. Whether it's
investing in new equipment, expanding your production capacity, or
entering new markets; asset finance enables you to fund these initiatives
without slowing down your business's momentum.



Retain ownership & control

Asset finance allows you to access the funds you need while retaining
ownership and control over your valuable assets. Unlike other funding
options that might require sharing equity or giving up control, asset
finance enables you to maintain full ownership of your business while
utilizing your assets to drive growth.

Improves credit profile

By leveraging asset finance, you can potentially improve your business's
credit profile. Demonstrating responsible and timely repayment of asset
finance agreements can positively impact your credit history, making it
easier for you to access future funding opportunities on favourable terms.


