
The German Shepherd Puppy Palace Customer Interest 

Customer Name: 

Email Address: 

Preferred puppy gender: ☐ Male   ☐ Female   ☐ Undecided

Preferred color: ☐ Black   ☐ Sable   ☐ White    (Colors not guaranteed)

Please tell us what plan or need you might have for this dog: 

☐ Service Dog Work   ☐ Therapy Dog Work   ☐ Facility Dog   ☐ Agility   ☐ Family Pet   ☐ Companion

For Myself   ☐ Other (Please explain below)

Please tell me why you want a German Shepherd.  This is not a trick question.  Answers range from, I’ve 
always wanted one but never could before, to I want to breed.  This doesn’t determine whether or not you 
are approved for our puppies, it’s a question as to ascertain the level of knowledge you have on these 
dogs and the amount of information we need to give to you to ensure YOU WANT a dog of this breed.   I 
have customers who have owned GSDs their whole lives and know everything there is to know about 
them and I have customers who have never owned one and do not understand what is involved in owning 
them and I am a believer in knowledge and educating yourself on everything German Shepherd. 

Every puppy from any of my litters are raised to be assertive, high energy, and prepared for most 
environments.  These dogs require a lot of attention and time, as well as hours of activity.  They are not 
docile creatures and for the first 10 weeks of their lives are raised in a high energy and curiosity inspired 
environment.  If you cannot attain and maintain these goals please do not attempt to adopt one of my 
puppies.  Prior to all purchases, there is an extensive interview and knowledge gathering process on my 
behalf to ensure my dogs go to appropriate families. I also reserve the right to decline adoption at any 
time before or after receipt of the deposit.  If I determine a client is not acceptable at any time, and I 
cancel, all money received will be refunded.  In all other instances (i.e., Client Cancellations, False 
Pregnancies, Puppy deaths), deposits are non-refundable and that is not negotiable.  In the case of a 
false pregnancy or a puppy death while in my care, I will guarantee one from another litter.  I will have all 
customers sign on the Interest Letter, The Interview Application and on the Contract to ensure this is 
understood. 

I understand that any future deposit I leave on a puppy is not refundable under any circumstances unless 
the breeder terminates our agreement. 

Customer Name (Please print):        Date: 
Signature: 

NOTE:  Please scan this and text it to me at 310-428-9894 with a quick note that you would like to be put 
on my waiting list.   

Thank you for your interest!! 

Kimberly 

Phone Number:


