
 

Trap League Guidelines 

If you have questions for the Ranger officer or a Board member during shooting, please do not approach 
them if they are getting ready to shoot, are shooting or are scoring. Please wait until they are finished.  

Each team is required to help pull and score for other teams, clean up, and help reload the trap house. If 
you do not know how to disarm and reload the trap house safely, please find a range officer and they will 
give instructions.  

If a team starts their first line they must finish both lines on that day unless shooting is stopped on the 
account of weather/safety concerns. If shooting is stopped on account of weather/safety and there are no 
completed lines, the line will be shot over. Any completed lines will be carried over. If you have started a 
line, do your best to complete it unless called by the range officer.  

Power must be shut off on the controller in between rotations, each line, and during any interruptions to 
prevent wasting clays.  

Each round must be scored by a Crooked Creek Trap Club league member. Team members or subs 
assigned to that team cannot score for that team. Violation of this will require a meeting with the board. If 
they are a general sub and sub for multiple teams they can score for any team. A hit may be written as an " 
/ " or " X " and a miss must be written as an " O ".  

The score sheet must be filled out completely and signed by a team member to be valid.  

Failure to Fire – only two faults per line, F1, F2 can be marked on score sheet to keep track. A failure to fire 
is anytime a bird has been thrown but the shooter failed to shoot.  

Make up shooting will be allowed on a team's regular shooting night. If shooting more than one week that 
night, the second week must wait to be shot until all other teams have gotten their round in. You can also 
make-up on off weeks and on Sundays after paying shooters are done during the league season providing 
a Range Officer is present. You must bring your own scorer, who is a league member, when making up.  

If you would like to make up on a night that is not your regular shooting night, it will be allowed only if time 
permits, and you shoot after regular scheduled league shooting. All teams that regularly shoot on that night 
get first priority.  

• Only two "make-up" scores are allowed to be posted per day on Sundays.  

• Only one make up score during league nights.  

• Only one team score can be shot in advance.  

 

Eye and Ear protection must be worn at all times when on and near the trap field.  

Always treat firearms as if they were loaded.  

Keep all firearms pointed in a safe direction at all times.  



Firearms must be unloaded with action open when walking around the range.  

Firearms must be unloaded with action open when changing stations during shooting.  

Firearms must be left with action open until it is your turn to shoot.  

Only 1 gun pulled up at a time  

AR style shotguns may be used but you are only allowed to load one shell at a time, no use of magazines 
allowed.  

If you have any issues with your gun during shooting please stop, lower the barrel to the ground and alert 
the scorer/line officer so they may stop the line.  

No drinking alcoholic beverages or consumption of any substance that impairs ability to safely handle the 
gun prior to shooting.  

Please be careful when loading the callers onto the cart. The wires can be damaged causing the callers to 
not work. DO not feed them into the cart. Please see photo for example. 

 


