
Declarations of Righteousness by Faith in Christ

2 Corinthians 5:21 For He made Him who knew no sin to be sin for me, that I 
would  become the righteousness of God in Him.


Romans 5:19 By Jesus’ obedience I am made righteous.


Romans 5:17 I receive the abundance of grace and the free gift of 
righteousness, and I reign in life through the one man Jesus Christ.


Philippians 3:9  I am found in Him, not having my own righteousness, which is 
from the law, but the righteousness which is through faith in Christ, the 
righteousness which is from God by faith. 


Romans 1:16-17 I am not ashamed of the gospel of Christ, for it is the power of 
God to salvation for everyone who believes, for the Jew first and also for the 
Greek. For in it the righteousness of God is revealed from faith to faith; as it is 
written, “The just shall live by faith.” - I am just, and I live by faith!


Romans 4:5 I do not not work for it, but I believe on Him who justifies the 
ungodly, therefore, my faith is accounted for righteousness.


Romans 4:6 David describes my blessedness - because God has imputed to 
me righteousness apart from works:

“Blessed am I,  whose lawless deeds are forgiven!  
Whose sins are covered!

Blessed am I to whom the Lord shall not impute sin!


Romans 5:1 I have been justified by faith, and I have peace with God through 
my Lord Jesus Christ.


I Corinthians 15:34 I am awake to my righteousness in Christ, and I will not sin.


Galatians 3:11 I am not justified before God by the law, for “The righteous shall 
live by faith.”- I am righteous in Christ, and I live by fatih!


Romans 3:21  The righteousness of God apart from the law has been revealed 
to me, I am made righteous through faith in Jesus Christ.


Romans 3:24 I am justified freely by His grace through the redemption that is in 
Christ Jesus.




Declarations of Righteousness by Faith in Christ

Romans 4:20-22  I do not waver at the promise of God through unbelief, but I 
am strengthened in faith, giving glory to God, and I am fully convinced that what 
He promises He is also able to perform. And therefore “it is accounted to me for 
righteousness.”


Hebrews 10:38 I am His righteous one, I shall live by faith and will not draw 
back. God’s soul has pleasure in me! 


Genesis 15:6 I, like Abram, believe the Lord, and it is counted to me for 
righteousness. 

Galatians 2:16 I know I am not justified by the working of the law, but I am 
justified through faith in Jesus Christ, as I have believed in Him.


Galatians 2:20-21  I have been crucified with Christ; it is no longer I who live, but 
Christ lives in me; and the life which I now live in the flesh I live by faith in the 
Son of God, who loved me and gave Himself for me. I do not set aside the grace 
of God; for if righteousness comes through the law, then Christ died in vain.


