
Double Points

Earn Double Points every Tuesday at all Rituals 
locations. Points are doubled based on the total 
of your bill and do not double based on your 
membership status.

Bonus Points

Earn bonus points by completing our weekly 
and montlhy reward challenges. Earning bonus 
points is now easier and funner than ever. Be 
sure to stay posted to our page for extra bonus 
give aways and challenges.

Earning Points

You can now earn points from any one of our 
brands worldwide. The more you spend the 
more you earn! All branded apps can work and 
be used interchangeably across all our brands 
with a single profile and member number.



Points are earned for all online and instore 
puchases and are earned based on the total of 
your bill after all discounts and offers are applied.



Points are not earned for gift card purchases but 
will be earned when gift cards are used for 
payment.


Trinidad & Tobago 1 point for every $1

St. Lucia 2 points for every $1

St. Kitts & Nevis 2 points for every $1

Points per $ Spent

Redeeming Points

Redeem your points for delicious rewards and 
big savings from any of our brands worldwide.



Points can be redeemed on all online and 
instore purchases. 

Trinidad & Tobago

St. Lucia

St. Kitts & Nevis

20 points = $1 in 
redeemable value

Redemption Rate

A Rewards Program Like No Other!

How it Works

Welcome to Rewards by Global Brands. A one of 
a kind fully integrated Rewards, Gift and Order 
Online program. No other program is as 
powerful and as rewarding!



You can now earn and redeem points from any 
of our Brands worldwide. No other program 
gives you access to so many brands, concepts 
and countries with such ease and convenience!


