

KENNEDY HYDRANTS BIDS - OCTOBER 16, 2024/ For 2025 Purchases

COMPANY	5'0" hydrant	order 25	5'6" hydrant	order 25	6'0" hydrant	order 20	6'6" hydrant	order 2	7'0" hydrant	order 2	TOTAL BID
	per hydrant	total	per hydrant	total	per hydrant	total	per hydrant	total	per hydrant	total	
Blair Supply	3,420.00	85,500.00	3,495.00	87,375.00	3,565.00	71,300.00	3,645.00	7,290.00	3,715.00	7,430.00	258,895.00
Core and Main	3,384.82	84,620.50	3,459.95	86,498.75	3,535.09	70,701.80	3,610.23	7,220.46	3,685.36	7,370.72	256,412.23
FW Webb	3,530.90	88,272.50	3,609.27	90,231.75	3,687.65	73,753.00	3,766.03	7,532.06	3,844.41	7,688.82	267,478.13
Ferguson Waterworks	No Bid	0.00	No Bid	0.00	No Bid	0.00	No Bid	0.00	No Bid	0.00	0.00
EJ Prescott	No Bid	0.00	No Bid	0.00	No Bid	0.00	No Bid	0.00	No Bid	0.00	0.00
2024 Results											
Core and Main	3,247.28	81,182.00	3,319.36	82,984.00	3,391.44	67,828.80	3,463.53	6,927.06	3,535.61	7,071.22	245,993.08