

2025 GATE VALVE BIDS
October 16, 2024 for 2025 Purchases

Pratt Groundhog Butterfly MJ w/ Buried Operator Open Right Std. C504, Class 150B	Blair Supply	Core & Main	EJ Prescott	FERGUSON	FW Webb
16" - Qty. 4					
Per Unit	No Bid	3,507.54	3,690.00	No Bid	
Total	0.00	14,030.16	14,760.00	0.00	0.00
20" - Qty. 2					
Per Unit	No Bid	5,306.54	5,474.00	No Bid	
Total	0.00	10,613.08	10,948.00	0.00	0.00
24" - Qty. 2					
Per Unit	No Bid	7,386.94	7,587.00	No Bid	
Total	0.00	14,773.88	15,174.00	0.00	0.00
GRAND TOTAL	0.00	39,417.12	40,882.00	0.00	0.00

2024 RESULTS

Pratt Groundhog Butterfly MJ w/ Buried Operator Open Right Std. C504, Class 150B	Core & Main
16" - Qty. 4	
Per Unit	3,507.54
Total	14,030.16
20" - Qty. 2	
Per Unit	5,306.54
Total	10,613.08
24" - Qty. 2	
Per Unit	7,386.94
Total	14,773.88
GRAND TOTAL	39,417.12