TYTON JOINT DUCTILE IRON PIPE BIDS - OCTOBER 16, 2024 / For 2025 Purchases

PIPE BID PER FOOT
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COMPANY ipe ipe ? e 1ioe 1i2e 1iGe 2ioe 2i4e 3ioe TOTAL PIPE
PP order 260’ PP order 4,000 PP order 3,000 PP order 500 PP order 200’ PP order 60’ PP order 100 PP order 80’ PP order 80’ BID
per foot total per foot total per foot total per foot total per foot total per foot total per foot total per foot total per foot total
Blair Supply 37.70/ 9,802.00 28.60| 114,400.00 40.60| 121,800.00 53.30| 26,650.00 67.10| 13,420.00 97.10| 5,826.00 128.00| 12,800.00 160.00| 12,800.00 257.00| 20,560.00 338,058.00
F.W. Webb 37.61] 9,778.60 28.90/ 115,600.00 40.78| 122,340.00 53.45| 26,725.00 67.30| 13,460.00 95.58| 5,734.80 125.49| 12,549.00 157.35| 12,588.00 252.35| 20,188.00 338,963.40
Core and Main 36.78| 9,562.80 28.13| 112,520.00 39.70| 119,100.00 52.02| 26,010.00 65.52| 13,104.00 93.65| 5,619.00 122.96| 12,296.00 154.18| 12,334.40 247.43| 19,794.40 330,340.60
Ferguson No Bid 0.00| No Bid 0.00| No Bid 0.00| No Bid 0.00| No Bid 0.00| No Bid 0.00| No Bid 0.00| NoBid 0.00/ NoBid 0.00 0.00
EJ Prescott No Bid 0.00, No Bid 0.00/ No Bid 0.00| No Bid 0.00| No Bid 0.00| No Bid 0.00| No Bid 0.00| No Bid 0.00/ No Bid 0.00 0.00
2024 Results
F.W. Webb 35.85| 9,321.00 27.56| 88,192.00 38.90| 77,800.00 50.98| 25,490.00 64.20| 12,840.00 92.89| 5,573.40 121.97| 24,394.00 151.36| 12,108.80 242.71| 19,416.80 275,136.00
260 ft 3,200 ft 2,000 ft 500 ft 200 ft 60 ft 200 ft 80 ft 80 ft




