

2025 GATE VALVE BIDS
October 16, 2024 for 2025 Purchases

Ken-Seal #7571SS Mechanical Joint - Open Right	<u>Blair Supply</u>	<u>Core & Main</u>	<u>EJ Prescott</u>	<u>Ferguson Waterworks</u>	<u>FW Webb</u>
	4" - Qty. 6				
Per Unit	760.00	740.81	No Bid	No Bid	740.10
Total	4,560.00	4,444.86	0.00	0.00	4,440.60
6" - Qty. 65					
Per Unit	975.00	945.32	No Bid	No Bid	943.59
Total	63,375.00	61,445.80	0.00	0.00	61,333.35
8" - Qty. 35					
Per Unit	1,550.00	1,505.67	No Bid	No Bid	1,505.14
Total	54,250.00	52,698.45	0.00	0.00	52,679.90
10" - Qty. 2					
Per Unit	2,425.00	2,347.78	No Bid	No Bid	2,347.04
Total	4,850.00	4,695.56	0.00	0.00	4,694.08
12" - Qty. 4					
Per Unit	3,050.00	2,970.82	No Bid	No Bid	2,969.96
Total	12,200.00	11,883.28	0.00	0.00	11,879.84
GRAND TOTAL	139,235.00	135,167.95	0.00	0.00	135,027.77

2024 RESULTS

Ken-Seal #7571SS Mechanical Joint - Open Right	<u>FW Webb</u>
	4" - Qty. 10
Per Unit	711.41
Total	4,268.46
6" - Qty. 65	
Per Unit	907.81
Total	59,007.65
8" - Qty. 35	
Per Unit	1,445.92
Total	50,607.20

10" - Qty. 2	
Per Unit	2,254.62
Total	4,509.24
12" - Qty. 4	
Per Unit	2,852.93
Total	11,411.72
GRAND TOTAL	129,804.27