
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2504arafax 4"- Qty 5

Per Unit 1,075.00

Total 0.00 0.00 5,375.00 0.00 0.00

2506arafax 6"- Qty 5

Per Unit 1,380.00

Total 0.00 0.00 6,900.00 0.00 0.00

2508arafax 8"- Qty 5

Per Unit 2,240.00

Total 0.00 0.00 11,200.00 0.00 0.00

2510arafax 10"- Qty 5

Per Unit 3,470.00

Total 0.00 0.00 17,350.00 0.00 0.00

2512arafax 12"- Qty 5

Per Unit 4,370.00

Total 0.00 0.00 21,850.00 0.00 0.00

GRAND TOTAL 0.00 0.00 62,675.00 0.00 0.00

2504arafax 4"- Qty 10

Per Unit 1,062.00

Total 2,124.00

2506arafax 6"- Qty 65

Per Unit 1,356.00

Total 21,696.00

2508arafax 8"- Qty 15

Per Unit 2,158.00

Total 34,528.00

2510arafax 10"- Qty 2

Per Unit 3,364.00

Total 6,728.00

2512arafax 12"- Qty 4

Per Unit 4,258.00

Total 17,032.00

GRAND TOTAL 82,108.00

2025 RESULTS

American Flow 

Control  MJ Open 

Right  Alpha XL

 EJ Prescott

American Flow 

Control  MJ Open 
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OFFICIAL RESULTS

   2026 GATE VALVE BIDS                                                       

October 15, 2025 for 2026 Purchases

Blair Supply Core & Main  EJ Prescott Ferguson FW Webb




