

2025 GATE VALVE BIDS
October 16, 2024 for 2025 Purchases

American Flow Control MJ Open Right Alpha XL	<u>Blair Supply</u>	<u>Core & Main</u>	<u>EJ Prescott</u>	<u>Ferguson</u>	<u>FW Webb</u>
	2504arafax 4"- Qty 2				
Per Unit	No Bid	No Bid	1,062.00		
Total	0.00	0.00	2,124.00	0.00	0.00
2506arafax 6"- Qty 16					
Per Unit	No Bid	No Bid	1,356.00		
Total	0.00	0.00	21,696.00	0.00	0.00
2508arafax 8"- Qty 16					
Per Unit	No Bid	No Bid	2,158.00		
Total	0.00	0.00	34,528.00	0.00	0.00
2510arafax 10"- Qty 2					
Per Unit	No Bid	No Bid	3,364.00		
Total	0.00	0.00	6,728.00	0.00	0.00
2512arafax 12"- Qty 4					
Per Unit	No Bid	No Bid	4,258.00		
Total	0.00	0.00	17,032.00	0.00	0.00
GRAND TOTAL	0.00	0.00	82,108.00	0.00	0.00
American Flow Control R/W Series 2500 MJ Open Right NRS w/ spur gears	NO BID <u>Blair Supply</u>	NO BID <u>Core & Main</u>	<u>EJ Prescott</u>	NO BID <u>Ferguson</u>	<u>FW Webb</u>
16" - Qty. 2					
Per Unit	No Bid	No Bid	15,625.00		
Total	0.00	0.00	31,250.00	0.00	0.00
20" - Qty. 2					
Per Unit	No Bid	No Bid	27,441.00		
Total	0.00	0.00	54,882.00	0.00	0.00
24" - Qty. 2					
Per Unit	No Bid	No Bid	36,160.00		
Total	0.00	0.00	72,320.00	0.00	0.00
GRAND TOTAL	0.00	0.00	158,452.00	0.00	0.00
American Flow Control R/W Series 2500 MJ Open Right NRS w/ bevel gears	NO BID <u>Blair Supply</u>	NO BID <u>Core & Main</u>	<u>EJ Prescott</u>	NO BID <u>Ferguson</u>	<u>FW Webb</u>
16" - Qty. 2					
Per Unit	No Bid	No Bid	\$15,625.00		
Total	0.00	0.00	31,250.00	0.00	0.00
20" - Qty. 2					
Per Unit	No Bid	No Bid	\$27,441.00		
Total	0.00	0.00	54,882.00	0.00	0.00

24" - Qty. 2					
Per Unit	No Bid	No Bid	\$36,160.00		
Total	0.00	0.00	72,320.00	0.00	0.00
30" - Qty. 2					
Per Unit	No Bid	No Bid	48,274.00		
Total	0.00	0.00	96,548.00	0.00	0.00
GRAND TOTAL	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$255,000.00	\$0.00	\$0.00

2024 RESULTS

American Flow Control MJ Open Right Alpha XL	<u>EJ Prescott</u>	American Flow Control R/W Series 2500 MJ Open Right NRS	<u>EJ Prescott</u>
2504arafax 4"- Qty 10		16" - Qty. 2	
Per Unit	1,062.00	Per Unit	15,625.00
Total	6,372.00	Total	31,250.00
2506arafax 6"- Qty 65		20" - Qty. 2	
Per Unit	1,356.00	Per Unit	27,441.00
Total	88,140.00	Total	54,882.00
2508arafax 8"- Qty 15		24" - Qty. 2	
Per Unit	2,158.00	Per Unit	36,160.00
Total	32,370.00	Total	72,320.00
2510arafax 10"- Qty 2		GRAND TOTAL	158,452.00
Per Unit	3,364.00		
Total	6,728.00		
2512arafax 12"- Qty 4			
Per Unit	4,258.00		
Total	17,032.00		
GRAND TOTAL	150,642.00		
American Flow Control R/W Series 2500 MJ Open Right NRS w/ bevel gears	<u>EJ Prescott</u>		
16" - Qty. 2			
Per Unit	\$15,625.00		
Total	31,250.00		
20" - Qty. 2			
Per Unit	\$27,441.00		
Total	54,882.00		
24" - Qty. 2			
Per Unit	\$36,160.00		
Total	72,320.00		
30" - Qty. 2			
Per Unit	48,274.00		
Total	96,548.00		
GRAND TOTAL	\$255,000.00		