
2026 Results

HYDROFLUOROSILICIC 

ACID "HFS" PER GAL. 

(Flouride)
LIQUID CHLORINE 

1 TON CYLINDER

Liquid 

ORTHOPHOSPHATE PER 

GAL.

Liquid SODIUM 

HYDROXIDE (Caustic 

Soda)

Liquid SODIUM 

PERMANGANATE 1,000 

gal 

POLYHYDROXO-

SULFATOALUMINU

M CHLORIDE "PAC" 

PER GAL.

Amrex 5.830 No Bid No Bid 2.920 No Bid 6.520

Carus No Bid No Bid 5.940 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Coyne Chemicals No Bid No Bid 4.945 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Holland Company No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.220

JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. No Bid 2,187.00 No Bid 1.30 No Bid No Bid

Shannon Chemical Corp. No Bid No Bid 4.77 No Bid 12.37 No Bid

Slack Chemical Company 5.397 3,217.380 No Bid 1.847 13.950 3.880

HYDROFLUOSILICIC 

ACID "HFS" PER GAL.

LIQUID CHLORINE 

1 TON CYLINDER

ORTHOPHOSPHATE PER 

GAL.

SODIUM HYDROXIDE 

(Caustic Soda)

2017 Bid changed from 

330 gal to 1,000 gal of 

20%

POLYHYDROXO-

SULFATOALUMINU

M CHLORIDE "PAC" 

PER GAL.

2025 Results

Amrex 5.540 -- 

Coyne Chemicals -- -- 4.929 -- -- --

Holland Company -- -- -- -- -- 3.220

JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. -- 2,120.000 -- 1.420 -- --

Shannon Chemical Co. -- -- -- 11.230 --
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