
16" -  Qty. 2

Per Unit No Bid 3,849.76

Total 0.00 7,699.52 0.00 0.00 0.00

20" -  Qty. 2

Per Unit No Bid 5,079.14

Total 0.00 10,158.28 0.00 0.00 0.00

24" -  Qty. 2

Per Unit No Bid 7,173.86

Total 0.00 14,347.72 0.00 0.00 0.00

GRAND TOTAL 0.00 32,205.52 0.00 0.00 0.00

16" -  Qty. 2

Per Unit 9,490.00 9,145.11 No Bid

GRAND TOTAL 18,980.00 18,290.22 0.00 0.00 0.00

16" -  Qty. 2

Per Unit 1,240.00 11,927.60 No Bid

Total 2,480.00 23,855.20 0.00 0.00 0.00

20" -  Qty. 2

Per Unit 21,700.00 21,196.53 No Bid

Total 43,400.00 42,393.06 0.00 0.00 0.00

24" -  Qty. 2

Per Unit 30,100.00 29,330.52 No Bid

Total 60,200.00 58,661.04 0.00 0.00 0.00

GRAND TOTAL 106,080.00 124,909.30 0.00 0.00 0.00

16" -  Qty. 2

Per Unit 12,400.00 12,043.60 No Bid

Total 24,800.00 24,087.20 0.00 0.00 0.00

20" -  Qty. 2

Per Unit 22,000.00 21,441.93 No Bid

Total 44,000.00 42,883.86 0.00 0.00 0.00

EJ 

Prescott Ferguson FW Webb

FW Webb

KV R/W 7571SS MJ 

Open Right  Vertical 

Standard C515 Blair Supply Core & Main

EJ 

Prescott Ferguson 

2025 GATE VALVE BIDS                                                                                                            

October 16, 2024 for 2025 Purchases

KV R/W 7571SS MJ 

Open Right  

Horizontal Standard Blair Supply Core & Main

EJ 

Prescott Ferguson FW Webb

KV Butterfly Valves 

4500 MJ w/ Buried 

Oper. Open Right Blair Supply Core & Main

EJ 

Prescott Ferguson FW Webb

KV R/W 7571BMSS 

MJ Open Right 

Standard C515
Blair Supply Core & Main



24" -  Qty. 2

Per Unit 30,100.00 29,463.42 No Bid

Total 60,200.00 58,926.84 0.00 0.00 0.00

30" -  Qty. 2

Per Unit 40,250.00 39,195.98 No Bid

Total 80,500.00 78,391.96 0.00 0.00 0.00

GRAND TOTAL 209,500.00 204,289.86 0.00 0.00 0.00

16" -  Qty. 2

16" -  Qty. 2 Per Unit 8,808.57 16" -  Qty. 2

Per Unit 11,628.31

GRAND 

TOTAL 17,617.14 Per Unit 11,516.31

Total 23,256.62 Total 23,032.62

20" -  Qty. 2 20" -  Qty. 2

Per Unit 20,702.56 Per Unit 20,465.61

Total 41,405.12 Total 40,931.22

24" -  Qty. 2 24" -  Qty. 2

Per Unit 28,447.44 Per Unit 28,319.12

Total 56,894.88 Total 56,638.2430" -  Qty. 2 GRAND TOTAL 120,602.08
Per Unit 38,190.96

Total 76,381.92

GRAND TOTAL 197,938.54

Core & Main

2024 RESULTS

KV R/W 7571SS MJ 

Open Right  

Horizontal Standard 

C515 Core & Main

KV R/W 

7571BMSS MJ 

Core & 

Main
KV R/W 7571SS 

MJ Open Right  

Vertical 

Standard C515





16" - Qty. 2

Per Unit 3,732.34

Total 7,464.68

20" - Qty. 2

Per Unit 5,318.30

Total 10,636.60

24" - Qty. 2Per Unit 7,650.13

Total 15,300.26

GRAND TOTAL 33,401.54

KV Butterfly 4500 

MJ w/ Buried 

Operator Open 

Right Core & Main


