

DUCTILE IRON COMPACT FITTINGS OCTOBER 16, 2024 / For 2025 Purchases

Wedge Gland Restraints Mechanical Joint	Quantity	Blair Supply Unit Price	Core & Main Unit Price	F.W. Webb Unit Price	EJ Prescott	Ferguson Waterworks	TI Sales
4"	As needed	\$27.30	\$25.59	\$27.82	\$23.90	\$23.90	No Bid
6"	As needed	\$78.35	\$30.12	\$32.74	\$28.10	\$28.10	No Bid
8"	As needed	\$48.25	\$45.97	\$49.42	\$42.25	\$42.25	No Bid
10"	As needed	\$71.55	\$68.04	\$73.96	\$62.60	\$62.50	No Bid
12"	As needed	\$104.90	\$98.99	\$107.60	\$91.25	\$91.25	No Bid
16"	As needed	\$197.50	\$180.55	\$196.24	\$172.85	\$173.20	No Bid
20"	As needed	\$347.50	\$317.15	\$344.73	\$304.15	\$304.75	No Bid
24"	As needed	\$482.00	\$440.43	\$478.73	\$422.30	\$423.20	No Bid
30"	As needed	\$1,180.00	\$1,007.96	\$1,095.61	\$1,066.25	\$1,068.50	No Bid
TOTALS		\$2,537.35	\$2,214.80	\$2,406.85	\$2,213.65	\$2,217.65	\$0.00
Solid Sleeve Coupling Mechanical Joint	Quantity	Blair Supply Unit Price	Core & Main Unit Price	F.W. Webb Unit Price	EJ Prescott	Ferguson Waterworks	TI Sales
4"	As needed	\$62.00	\$58.50	\$57.26	\$56.65	\$56.70	No Bid
6"	As needed	\$104.00	\$98.00	\$95.92	\$94.90	\$95.00	No Bid
8"	As needed	\$167.00	\$157.50	\$154.15	\$152.50	\$152.50	No Bid
10"	As needed	\$200.00	\$188.50	\$184.49	\$182.55	\$182.50	No Bid
12"	As needed	\$269.00	\$253.50	\$248.11	\$245.50	\$246.00	No Bid
16"	As needed	\$515.00	\$484.50	\$474.19	\$469.20	\$470.15	No Bid
20"	As needed	\$1,225.00	\$771.50	\$755.09	\$747.15	\$748.70	No Bid
24"	As needed	\$1,070.00	\$1,015.50	\$993.89	\$983.40	\$985.50	No Bid
30"	As needed	\$2,260.00	\$2,126.50	\$2,081.26	\$2,059.35	\$2,063.70	No Bid
TOTALS		\$5,872.00	\$5,154.00	\$5,044.36	\$4,991.20	\$5,000.75	\$0.00
45 Degree Bend Mechanical Joint	Quantity	Blair Supply Unit Price	Core & Main Unit Price	F.W. Webb Unit Price	EJ Prescott	Ferguson Waterworks	TI Sales
4"	As needed	\$59.00	\$55.00	\$53.83	\$53.25	\$53.35	No Bid
6"	As needed	\$93.00	\$87.50	\$85.64	\$84.75	\$84.75	No Bid
8"	As needed	\$135.00	\$127.50	\$124.79	\$123.40	\$123.50	No Bid
10"	As needed	\$194.00	\$184.00	\$180.09	\$178.20	\$178.25	No Bid
12"	As needed	\$292.00	\$275.00	\$269.15	\$266.30	\$266.50	No Bid
16"	As needed	\$575.00	\$538.00	\$526.55	\$521.00	\$522.00	No Bid
20"	As needed	\$1,820.00	\$849.50	\$831.43	\$822.65	\$822.00	No Bid
TOTALS		\$3,168.00	\$2,116.50	\$2,071.48	\$2,049.55	\$2,050.35	\$0.00

22 1/2" Degree Bend Mechanical Joint	Quantity		Blair Supply Unit Price		Core & Main Unit Price		F.W. Webb Unit Price		EJ Prescott		Ferguson Waterworks		TI Sales
4"	As needed		\$55.00		\$52.00		\$50.89		\$50.35		\$50.45		No Bid
6"	As needed		\$85.00		\$79.50		\$77.81		\$77.00		\$77.00		No Bid
8"	As needed		\$131.00		\$124.50		\$121.85		\$120.55		\$120.50		No Bid
10"	As needed		\$194.00		\$183.50		\$179.60		\$177.70		\$178.05		No Bid
12"	As needed		\$255.00		\$240.50		\$235.38		\$232.90		\$233.40		No Bid
16"	As needed		\$550.00		\$516.00		\$505.02		\$499.70		\$500.60		No Bid
20"	As needed		\$2,225.00		\$887.50		\$868.63		\$859.45		\$861.20		No Bid
TOTALS			\$3,495.00		\$2,083.50		\$2,039.18		\$2,017.65		\$2,021.20		\$0.00
11 1/4" Degree Bend Mechanical Joint	Quantity		Blair Supply Unit Price		Core & Main Unit Price		F.W. Webb Unit Price		EJ Prescott		Ferguson Waterworks		TI Sales
4"	As needed		\$54.00		\$50.00		\$48.94		\$48.40		\$48.25		No Bid
6"	As needed		\$89.00		\$83.50		\$81.72		\$80.85		\$81.00		No Bid
8"	As needed		\$119.00		\$113.00		\$110.60		\$109.40		\$109.60		No Bid
10"	As needed		\$187.00		\$182.50		\$178.62		\$176.75		\$177.00		No Bid
12"	As needed		\$240.00		\$225.50		\$220.70		\$218.30		\$218.70		No Bid
16"	As needed		\$580.00		\$546.00		\$534.38		\$528.75		\$529.75		No Bid
20"	As needed		\$889.00		\$836.00		\$818.21		\$809.60		\$811.00		No Bid
TOTALS			\$2,158.00		\$2,036.50		\$1,993.17		\$1,972.05		\$1,975.30		\$0.00
"Field Lok" Gaskets AWWA C111/A21.11 "Gripper Gasket" or equal	Quantity		Blair Supply Unit Price		Core & Main Unit Price		F.W. Webb Unit Price		EJ Prescott		Ferguson Waterworks		TI Sales
6"	As needed		\$80.00		\$83.71		\$100.80		\$56.15		No Bid		No Bid
8"	As needed		No Bid		\$112.78		\$136.50		\$75.65		No Bid		No Bid
TOTALS			\$80.00		\$196.49		\$237.30		\$131.80		\$0.00		\$0.00
Hymax Style Couplings (Standard)	Quantity		Blair Supply Unit Price		Core & Main Unit Price		F.W. Webb Unit Price		EJ Prescott		Ferguson Waterworks		TI Sales
4"	As needed		\$239.00		\$207.00		\$220.04		\$228.80		\$212.25		No Bid
6"	As needed		\$316.00		\$275.00		\$291.41		\$303.05		\$281.05		No Bid
8"	As needed		\$357.00		\$310.00		\$329.01		\$342.15		\$317.30		No Bid
10"	As needed		\$485.00		\$399.00		\$447.52		\$440.15		\$408.20		No Bid
12"	As needed		\$649.00		\$470.00		\$499.57		\$597.65		\$481.85		No Bid
16"	As needed		\$1,485.00		\$1,398.80		\$1,368.31		\$1,368.30		\$1,368.30		No Bid
20"	As needed		\$1,890.00		\$1,777.19		\$1,738.45		\$1,738.45		\$1,742.00		No Bid

