OFFICIAL RESULTS
2026 GATE VALVE BIDS
October 15, 2025 for 2026 Purchases

Ken-Seal Core & EJ Ferguson
#7571SS Blair Supply Main Prescott | Waterworks | FW Webb
Mechanical
Joint - Open No Bid No Bid
Right
4" - Qty.10
Per Unit 827.00 764.33 762.50
Total 8,270.00 7,643.30 0.00 0.00 7,625.00
6" - Qty. 60
Per Unit 1,055.00 975.33 972.45
Total 63,300.00 58,519.80 0.00 0.00 58,347.00
8" - Qty. 30
Per Unit 1,679.00 1,553.47 1,547.70
Total 50,370.00 46,604.10 0.00 0.00 46,431.00
10" - Qty.15
Per Unit 2,619.00 2,422.32 2,412.20
Total 39,285.00 36,334.80 0.00 0.00 36,183.00
12" - Qty. 15
Per Unit 3,314.00 3,065.13 3,051.80
Total 49,710.00 45,976.95 0.00 0.00 45,777.00
GRAND TOTAL 210,935.00( 195,078.95 0.00 0.00| 194,363.00
KV Butterfly 4500
MJ w/ Buried Core & EJ Ferguson

Operator Open | Blair Supply Main Prescott | Waterworks | FW Webb
16" - Qty. 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Per Unit 5,518.80 5,510.00
Total 0.00 11,037.60 0.00 0.00 11,020.00
20" - Qty. 5
Per Unit 7,238.10 7,225.00
Total 0.00 36,190.50 0.00 0.00 36,125.00
24" - Qty. 2
Per Unit 10,170.43 10,150.00
Total 0.00 20,340.86 0.00 0.00 20,300.00
GRAND TOTAL 0.00| 67,568.96 0.00 0.00| 67,445.00




2025 RESULTS

KV Butterfly 4500

MJ w/ Buried
Operator Open
Right
Core &
Main
16" - Qty. 2
Per Unit 3,849.76
Total 7,699.52
20" - Qty. 2
Per Unit 5,079.14
Total 10,158.28
24" - Qty. 2
Per Unit 7,173.86
Total 14,347.72
GRAND TOTAL 32,205.52

Ken-Seal
#7571SS
Mechanical
Joint - Open
Right FW Webb
4" - Qty. 10
Per Unit 740.10
Total 4,440.60
6" - Qty. 65
Per Unit 943.59
Total 61,333.35
8" - Qty. 35
Per Unit 1,505.14
Total 52,679.90
10" - Qty. 2
Per Unit 2,347.04
Total 4,694.08
12" - Qty. 4
Per Unit 2,969.96
Total 11,879.84
GRAND TOTAL 135,027.77






