
Remote Learning Plan for  
 6th Grade  

May 18 - May 22, 2020 
Breaking News!​ Please check out what you need to know for your assignments this week by watching a video 
found here: ​https://prezi.com/v/gtpfyggtgby7/ 
 

 Monday Wednesday Friday 

Reading 
 
Students, 
Still miss you!! 
 
You can 
contact me via 
email at 
sdean@stadal
bertschool.org  
with any 
question or 
concerns.  

1.Get a notebook and a 
pencil.  Watch and take 
notes on hyperbole at the 
two links below: 
https://youtu.be/VajtW0Ww
mjo 
and 
https://www.youtube.com/w
atch?v=kuzWLDWm6Zs 
2.Read the poem in Google 
Classroom.  Highlight the 
hyperbole.  One example is 
highlighted for you. 
 
 
Due on Wednesday at 
8:00AM 
 

1.Watch the video and take 
notes on writing crafts at the 
link below: 
https://youtu.be/avr3msfYtqI 
 
2.Complete the assignment 
in Google Classroom to 
practice using these two 
crafts: onomatopoeia and 
alliteration 
 
 
Due on Friday at 8:00AM 

Complete the graphic 
organizer in Google 
Classroom.  You will 
describe the image of the 
messy locker using the 
writing crafts indicated. 
 
Due on Sunday 

Math (Miles) 
 
Please email 
me with any 
questions 
amiles@stadal
bertschool.org 
 
Read through 
directions 
multiple times 
and complete 
your work by 
the due dates 
listed here. 
 
You’ve got this! 

Review important skills 
from last week by 
completing the IXL links 
posted on Google 
Classroom. Then, complete 
the word problem on 
Google Classroom beneath 
the IXL links. Send Mr. 
Miles a picture of your work 
from this problem through 
email. This assignment is 
due on Wednesday 5/20 by 
8 AM at the latest. 
 
 
 
 
 

Complete p. 378-379 in your 
textbook. If you do not have 
your textbook send an email 
to Mr. Miles to get a picture 
of the pages Complete your 
work in your textbook or on 
looseleaf. Send a picture of 
your work to Mr. Miles. This 
assignment is due on Friday 
5/22 by 8 AM at the latest. 

Complete p. 380-381 in your 
textbook. If you do not have 
your textbook send an email 
to Mr. Miles to get a picture 
of the pages Complete your 
work in your textbook or on 
looseleaf. Send a picture of 
your work to Mr. Miles. This 
assignment is due on 
Sunday 5/24 by 5 PM at the 
latest. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Math (Probst) 
 

For lesson 7.5, Represent 
Solid Figures Using Nets, 

There will be a video link 
posted on Google 

Watch the video posted on 
Google Classroom and take 
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Hello! I hope 
you are all 
doing great! 
Lprobst@stada
lbertschool.org
Please email 
me if you are 
having trouble 
accessing or 
have any 
questions. 
Make sure to 
show your 
work, write 
your name and 
title at the top 
and be neat. :) 

Read 
instructions 
very carefully 
here and on 
Google 
Classroom. 

 

Social Studies 

I hope you are 
doing great! 

Hello! Please 
make sure you 
email me if you 
have any 
questions. 

Lprobst@stada
lbertschool.org 

you will take notes in your 
notebook over a couple of 
videos that are posted on 
Google Classroom.  Also, 
take notes over pages 414 - 
415. 
Homework - pages 416 - 
417, #5 - 17 all. 
Take a clear picture (make 
sure it is clearly visible 
before you send) and 
submit to me by 
Wednesday, 5/20. 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
For this week, you will be 
given a choice board.  You 
will choose one way to 
create a primary source for 
future historians about what 
is happening now.  Think 
about how things have 
changed because of this 
pandemic, the Covid 19, 
and tell about your 
experience.  How to 
present your information is 
given in a list of choices 
posted on Google 
Classroom.  Choose one 
and send a picture of your 
finished product to me by 
Sunday, May 24​th​. 
 

Classroom for 7.5 Find 
Surface Areas of Prisms. 
Take notes as you watch. 
Also, go over pages 424 - 
425 and take notes.  For 
homework, complete pages 
426 - 427, #1 and 5 - 14 all. 
Submit to me by Friday 5/22. 
 

notes.  Also, take notes over 
pages 430 - 431, 7.7 Find 
Surface Areas of Pyramids. 
Homework: Page 432 - 433, 
#4 - 10. 
Submit to me by Sunday, 
May 24th, 5:00 pm. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Fine Arts Music Lesson Plan K-8 
https://youtu.be/EMNU3pFr
COQ 
May 18 Frere Jacques  
1. Melodic Contour 

Religion (optional):  
Hey everyone! Still missing 
and praying for all of you! 
 
This week, let’s watch a 
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2.  A round 
3. Ostinato 
https://youtu.be/EMNU3pFr
COQ 

video about a saint who is a 
little bit different than many 
other saints—​Saint Isidore​! 

 
I won’t spoil ​how​ this saint is 
different from other saints, 
though! Watch this video to 
find out: 
https://vimeo.com/41775110
4 
(You might notice a cameo 
appearance from another 
saint we studied!) 
 
When you think you’ve 
figured it out, send me an 
email at 
nmunsen@stadalbertschool.
org​ telling me how you think 
this saint is different from 
many other saints. 
 
Saint Isidore, pray for us! 
 
In Christ, 
Mr. Munsen  
 
P.S. If you want to read 
more about Saint Isidore, 
check out this link: 
https://www.loyolapress.com
/catholic-resources/saints/sai
nts-stories-for-all-ages/saint-i
sidore-the-farmer/ 

Other 
  

SSR (optional): ​Read for 
20 minutes each day.  

(optional​) Science: Log on to 
your science page on 
Google Classroom this 

Tech (optional): ​Ask a 
sibling, cousin, or friend to 
race against you on nitro 
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Wednesday for the 
directions for this week’s 
engineering challenge! 

type. 
https://www.nitrotype.com/ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

https://www.nitrotype.com/

