
 

Ashley Smith 

301-693-6852  

ashley.n.artist1@gmail.com  

 

Private Art Lessons: $250 each month, 1 hour, once a week.  

Choices: Drawing, Watercolor, Acrylic, Charcoal, and Pastel 

For a Private Art Lesson, Ashley will travel to your students’ provided location with her 
supplies. Available only for students within 1 hour of Frederick, otherwise please choose 
the “private online art lesson”. 

Ashley will start with an introductory class to assess where the client lands in skill. From 
there, if you choose to continue, she will build each class around the client to 
incorporate fun, imagination and build the students’ skill sets. She will happily answer 
any questions, and give recommendations on favorite tools. 

 

Private Online Art Lessons: $150 each month, 1 hour, once a week. 

Choices: Drawing, Watercolor, Acrylic, Charcoal, and Pastel 

For a Private Online Art Lesson, Ashley will set up a Zoom call with the client.  

Ashley will start with an introductory class to assess where the client lands in skill. From 
there, if you choose to continue, she will build each class around the client to 
incorporate fun, imagination and build the students’ skill sets. She will happily answer 
any questions, and give recommendations on favorite tools. 

 

Group Art Lessons: $200 each month, 2 hours, once a week. 

Group Syllabus 

Experience art instructions with our In Person Group Art Class. Work in a group with a 
skilled instructor, Ashley Smith, to enhance your creativity and hone your skills. In 
Person. The group must be no larger than 6. Location will be announced a week before 
classes will start. 

mailto:ashley.n.artist1@gmail.com


 

 

Online Group Art Lessons: $150 each month, 2 hours, once a week. 

Group Syllabus 

Experience art instructions with our Online Group Art Class. Work with a skilled 
instructor, Ashley Smith, to enhance your creativity and hone your skills. The group 
must be no bigger than 6 students. 

 

Homeschool Art Classes In Person (Group): $100 each month, 2 hours, once a week. 

Group Syllabus 

Join our Homeschool Art Classes for instruction by a professional Art Teacher, Ashley 
Smith. Enhance creativity and artistic skills with hands-on guidance. Location will be 
announced a week before classes will start. 

 

Foster Care Art Classes In Person (Group): $100 each month, 2 hours, once a week. 

Group Syllabus 

Join our Art Classes as we explore creativity through art. Learn new skills and 
techniques while connecting with others in a supportive environment. 

This class is for those who are in the beginning stages and experienced stages of 
fostering. Use this as a way to connect with your foster child and others who are going 
through the same experiences. Location will be announced a week before classes will 
start. 

 

Mommy and Me Art Classes In Person (Group/Private): $100 each month, 2 hours, 
once a week. 

Group Syllabus 

Join Our Mommy and Me Art Classes as Ashley provides a creative and bonding 
experience for mothers and their children, fostering artistic expression and quality time 
together. 

 

 


