
A-1 Refrigeration  

 A-­1 Refrigeration, Inc. has been the leader in commercial refrigeration and 
 HVAC in Lincoln and the surrounding area since 1940. They have been 
 offering their valued customers 24 hour service 7 days a week for 80 years. If 
 you are looking for quality service by trained technicians, then give A-1 a call 
 today! 

Advance Auto Parts   
 
Advance Auto Parts is a national parts store chain with has five locations in 
the Lincoln area. They have free in store or curbside pickup plus free delivery 
available in select markets. You can accumulate points on every purchase 
and redeem them anytime for rewards. They also offer battery testing and 
installation, oil recycling, wiper installation, approved professional to repair 
any problem you have!  

2021 REBELS Car Show Sponsors 
A HUGE THANK YOU to our valued Sponsors who contribute money, door prizes, material for the Car Show 

Goodie Bags, and the countless other ways they support the REBELS Auto Club. We couldn’t do it without 

you! Please consider shopping at these fine businesses.   

Our Sponsors are listed alphabetically. Scroll down, or If they have a website, you can learn even more about 

each business by Clicking on their Logo: 

http://www.a-1refrigeration.com/
https://www.advanceautoparts.com/


Alloy Wheel Repair Specialists (Lincoln & Omaha)  
  
 Alloy Wheel Repair Specialists is the world's largest provider of alloy wheel 
 refinishing, straightening, custom coloring, remanufacturing, OEM 
 replacements and more! They do high quality alloy wheel repair, can custom 
 color your wheel, and provide OEM replacements. From minor repair to full 
 restoration, they offer complete repair for wheels with curb rash, bends, 
 corrosion and small cracks. They also offer select custom coloring services and 
 OEM replacements for wheels that are damaged beyond repair. They offer a 
 free lifetime warranty on workmanship. Bottom line, Alloy Wheel Repair 
 Specialists can make your scratched, gouged, bent wheels LOOK LIKE NEW!  

Air Cowboy LLC Automobiles (P.J. Shaw) 
   

 Air Cowboy Collectible Cars at Second and Main streets in Hickman at the 
 former gas station location. The car and plane dealership features classic 
 cars, and they are an aircraft dealer with plans to renovate the property.  

Arthritis Center of Lincoln  

The physicians and staff of the Arthritis Center of Lincoln, are focused on 

providing compassionate, comprehensive care, and effective innovative 

therapies to those facing musculoskeletal illness. They focus on patient 

comfort, providing a wide variety of tests, therapies and clinical trials through 

their on-site laboratory. 

A Street Auto Parts (NAPA, Lincoln & Tecumseh  
 

A Street Auto Parts is your NAPA AUTO PARTS in Lincoln, and the source for 

quality auto parts for your car or truck. Use their NAPA ‘Know How’ to help 

you find the right battery, brakes, filters, headlights, wipers or other parts you 

need to get your job done. They also stock tools, equipment and many other 

items for cars, heavy duty trucks, marine, AND farm equipment. You can also 

order parts online, and your online orders are available for in-store or 

curbside pickup. Your A Street Auto Parts NAPA AUTO PARTS team looks 

forward to serving you today! 

Auto Body Supply  
 
Auto Body Supply is the area’s leading supplier of paint, refinishing supplies 
and equipment for fleets, manufacturing and collision repair businesses.  They 
do more than just sell paint, they also partner with our customers to assist 
them in improving their business with programs from PPG. With 2 PPG 
Certified Technical Representatives and a PPG Commercial Certified Tech 
Representative on staff, Auto Body Supply provides technical support, second 
to none. Auto Body Supply’s exclusive & rigorous training certification 
programs are designed to identify and certify individuals with the most 
advanced refinish technology knowledge and skill sets in the industry. 

https://www.awrswheelrepair.com/
https://www.napaonline.com/stores/ne/lincoln/4003-a-st
http://www.autobodysupplylincoln.com/


Auto Connection   
  

 Auto Connection is a family-owned and family-operated Auto Repair shop 
 conveniently located in Lincoln, Nebraska. They have been recognized as one 
 of the top car repair shops in Lincoln. Their focus on great customer service 
 with every repair they complete has set them apart from the competition just 
 as much as their dedication to the highest quality of Auto Repairs. Whether 
 you call or stop into their shop, you will always be greeted by a friendly 
 employee or Mechanic whose only goal is to meet your needs. They use only 
 the highest quality parts so that your vehicle will perform just like new when 
 you leave their shop. The mechanics at Auto Connection have been exceeding 

Automotive Services, Inc. 1730 Adams  (No Website) 
  

 Automotive Services, Inc. offers complete automotive repair for foreign and 

 domestic autos. They are one of the best General Automotive repair 

 businesses in Lincoln for timing belt replacement, wheel alignment and 

 balancing services, and are located at 1730 Adams Street. They are a BBB 

 Accredited Business offering 24/7 Support. Special features include state-of-

 the-art equipment, convenient mobile services, quick turnaround, and 24/7 

 roadside assistance. 

Auto Sounds of Lincoln 4720 O Street   
  
 Auto Sounds of Lincoln makes your dreams a reality! Whether there is a 
 luxury you need or you are just driving by, they invite you in to meet your 
 private salesmen, personal installers, and new friends! Come into your ‘home 
 away from home,’ and experience a motion picture of brilliance that becomes 
 life before your eyes. You will find that you can do more than just hear the 
 music you are surrounded with... you can finally listen.   

Carpetland  
Carpet Land has the largest selection of in-stock carpet inventory in a 10-state 
region. You will find high quality, low priced products in the store every day. 
The incredible buying power at Carpet Land allows them to deliver the lowest 
prices in Nebraska. They have free estimates, 0% financing options, and 
professional flooring installation available every day. The business has been 
family-owned and operated for over 35 years with three convenient locations 
in Lincoln, Omaha and Sioux Falls. Their goal is to provide the largest selection 
of in-stock flooring at discounted prices for their customers. Along with 
Nebraska’s largest in-stock carpet inventory, they also carry large amounts 
of wood, vinyl plank, tile, laminate, area rugs, and room size remnants. Carpet 
Land’s FREE estimates and quality installation make them a great choice for 
flooring! They are a premier dealer for Shaw, Mohawk, Floorscapes, Karastan, 
Masland, Fabrica, and Bruce Hardwoods. 

https://www.autorepairlincolnne.com/
http://www.autosoundsoflincoln.com/
https://carpetlandonline.com/


CeeJay’s Treats (No Website) 
 

CeeJay's Treats is owned by Chris and James Schuerman. They will travel to 

your event with their concession trailer, and make mouthwatering food you 

usually can’t find anywhere else. They offer different items depending on 

what is needed for each particular event. Sometimes people want funnel 

cakes with a variety of toppings, fried twinkies, fried candy bars, fried Oreos, 

and lemonade, iced tea or water. They even offer a monster funnel cake, and 

sometimes make Cinnamon roasted nuts, cotton candy, popcorn, hand cut 

fries, ribbon fries, burgers, hot dogs, phillies, and biscuits and gravy. CeeJay's 

Treats hopes to see you at your next event. 

College View Auto Sales  
 

College View Auto Sales was established in 2005 as a family owned and 

operated business of the College View area in south Lincoln, NE.  They take 

great pride in providing a wide variety of late model used cars, trucks and vans 

in the $3000 to $20,000 price range. All vehicles are inspected and 

conditioned to provide their customers with a true turn key and drive away 

satisfying experience. They are also happy to introduce financing 

options.  Working with a large number of Credit Unions and other lending 

institutions, they are sure to have your financing needs covered. Whether you 

are in a new or recovering credit situation, or simply looking for competitive 

loan rates to promote your next purchase, College View Auto Sales can help 

you!    

College View Barber Shop (No Website) 

Come have a seat, watch the game, and get a great hair cut! College View 

Barbers are great for professional cutting, trimming, grooming, and fading 

your hair just the way you want. While barbers have traditionally been known 

for only cutting men's hair, College View Barbers cut lady's hair as well. If you 

are looking for a great place to get your hair cut or beard groomed, visit 

College View Barbers on 48th and Calvert in Lincoln.  College View Barbers is a 

great ‘Old School’ Barber Shop. This is a Man's Place. No haircuts for tattooed 

teenage girls with pink hair. Just 2 very experienced barbers. There is not much 

left to remind older guys of their youth, but this is a great living memory. Call 

Warren or Gary at 402-617-6713 for an appointment, Tuesday thru Saturday. 

CPR (Cell Phone Repair)  
 

CPR® Stores are so much more than cell phone repair First and foremost, 

they are problem solvers. When you come to CPR with an electronic device 

issue, they have the technical aptitude and experience to repair it. Beyond 

smartphones, they specialize in a wide variety of electronic device repairs, 

including computers, laptops, game consoles, cameras, mp3 players, and 

much more. They strive to create solutions and continue to lead the wireless 

repair industry as the experts in fast, efficient repairs. CPR® Stores has grown 

tremendously since our first walk-in cell phone repair shop in Orlando, Florida 

in 1997 but their commitment to local service has not changed. They 

continue to provide local repair solutions to schools, businesses, and 

consumers in communities across the globe. As their national and 

international footprint grows, they remain the ‘go-to guys’ for electronic 

device repairs and hope to serve you at their Lincoln location at South Street 

and Capital Parkway. 

http://www.collegeviewauto.com/
https://www.cellphonerepair.com/lincoln-ne/


C/T Transport, Inc. (No Website) 

C/T Transport has two trucks and three refrigerated trailers. The company is 

owned and operated by Barry and Leslie Simons. Barry and son Cody do the 

driving, transporting food products like meats and produce nationwide.   

Erickson Automotive  

Erickson Automotive offers complete automotive service, including brakes, 

transmissions, engine repair, tune up, air conditioner and heat, electrical and 

computer repair. Conveniently located at 1944 SW 5th Street, they are open 

from 7:30 AM to 5:30 PM, Monday through Friday. Erickson Automotive 

repairs most vehicles including domestic and foreign.  

Firehouse Subs   
 

Are you hungry? Visit Firehouse Subs restaurant in Lincoln, Nebraska. 

Founded by Firemen, Firehouse Subs sandwich shop specializes in hot subs 

made with premium meats and cheeses, steamed to perfection, then piled 

high on a toasted private recipe sub roll.  Their menu will surely satisfy your 

appetite, and catering is available. Proceeds from every meal also help local 

firefighters. People come back when they’re treated well and fed well, with 

the best meats, cheeses, and toppings they can find. A good example is 

Firehouse Subs Hook & Ladder® Sub with Virginia honey ham, smoked turkey 

breast, and melted Monterey Jack. Unlike other sub places, Firehouse Subs 

steam their meats and cheeses, releasing a rush of flavors, and then stuff a 

serving that’s way over code on one of their toasted private-recipe sub rolls. 

It’s a winning combination that satisfies ravenous appetites and the value-

conscious alike. 

Firestone Complete Auto Care 
   
 

 Firestone Complete Auto Care has been providing quality service & auto 
 repair for over 90 years. Squeaky brakes, troubling dashboard lights, or TPMS 
 light, they will get to the bottom of it. Turn to your neighborhood Firestone 
 Complete Auto Care at 300 N 66th St for all your vehicle maintenance. You 
 can depend on their trained technicians to provide quality auto repair and 
 service, plus oil changes, brake services, maintenance, car batteries, engine 
 tune-ups, alignment, and much more. They care about every hose and gasket 
 in your car or truck, but they also care about you and your budget. That 
 means the only repairs and services they will recommend are ones that they 
 truly believe you need. Their Triple Promise Guarantee means that your car 
 will be fixed right, priced right, done right, and on time. And, with 1,700 
 Firestone Complete Auto Care shops across the country, you are always close 
 to vehicle maintenance and car repair you can trust. 

http://www.eriksenautomotive.com/
https://www.firehousesubs.com/locations/ne/east-park-plaza/
https://local.firestonecompleteautocare.com/nebraska/lincoln/300-n-66th-st/


General Excavating   
 

As one of the area’s leading construction firms, General Excavating of Lincoln 

looks forward to helping you complete your project. The company is an 

underground utility contractor in Lincoln, Nebraska, entering their fourth 

decade They are a leader in utility construction because of their commitment 

to ensure that high-quality work is completed in a cost-effective and timely 

manner.  General Excavating has a wealth of experience in navigating the 

challenges of difficult underground utility construction projects. It begins with 

their willingness to get involved early with preconstruction services to assist 

you in identifying the options available. Their project managers look for 

solutions to keep the work moving forward. This attitude and their 

unwavering commitment to safety has led to their involvement as a key trade 

partner on a variety of infrastructure projects for data centers, commercial, 

industrial, retail, and residential developments.  Get your next project off to a 

great start and let General Excavating be your underground partner.  

John Henry’s Plumbing, Heating & Air 
 

If you are looking for a fast, reliable plumber or HVAC technician in Lincoln. 
call your local experts at John Henry’s to discuss your plumbing and HVAC 
needs and to schedule an immediate appointment. Whether you need drain 
cleaning, sewer line repairs, water heater replacements, or air conditioner 
repair,  John Henry’s full-service plumbing and HVAC company has you 
covered. Every member of their licensed team has years of experience solving 
plumbing problems just like yours. The team at John Henry’s will quickly and 
accurately diagnose the source of your problem and eliminate it right away. Set 
your mind at ease knowing that they will deliver red carpet service by arriving 
on time, respecting your property, and providing you with the peace of mind 
you deserve. Problems can happen when you least expect them. The last thing 
you need to worry about is whether or not you are choosing the right company 
to work with. Scheduling an appointment with John Henry’s means a licensed 
technician will arrive at your door on time, in uniform, and with the tools and 
knowledge needed to get the job done properly.  

Kitchen Tune-up (402) 890-4947)  
 

A kitchen should be a functional space, but also one you enjoy cooking and 

living in each day. Kitchen Tune-Up can help you make your kitchen just as 

you want it - a welcoming, serene, and stylish place. No matter the level or 

complexity of your kitchen remodel, they are there to help. If your wood 

cabinets look stained, scuffed or worn, the Original Tune-Up restores them to 

a like-new finish, usually in less than one day. Their unique process 

reconditions the wood, deep cleaning to remove built-up grime and grease, 

then touching up the color and finish. They rejuvenate dried-out wood and 

bring dirt-dulled cabinets back to beautiful life. They also can provide, new 

cabinets and counter tops.  

Lane’s Auto Service and Tires, Wahoo, NE  
 

Lane’s Auto Service and Tires provides complete auto repair, including A/C 
and heat, alignment, batteries, brakes and clutches, differentials, electrical, 
engines, fuel pump, head lights and tail lights, tire mount and balancing, Oil 
Changes, timing Belt, Tire repair and replacement, Tire pressure monitor 
sensor, Transmissions, Tune-up, Bumper to Bumper automotive repair, and 
more. Contact Lane’s Auto Service and Tires with any questions regarding 
your car and/or truck needs.  

https://generalexcavating.com/
https://www.jhlincoln.com/
https://kitchentuneup.com/
https://lanesautoandtire.com/


Midlands Packaging Corporation   
 

Midlands Packaging primarily produces folding cartons, corrugated 

containers, and thermoformed plastics. Their goal is to provide you with the 

service you deserve and design an innovative and functional carton that 

meets your standards for quality. After 49 years Midlands Packaging is still 

locally owned and operated in Lincoln, Nebraska with Sales Offices in: Dallas, 

TX, Denver, CO, Kansas City, MO, Minneapolis, MN, Omaha, NE, St Louis, MO, 

and Sioux City, IA. Their design department uses Computer Aided Design 

(CAD) to develop unique and effective folding cartons, corrugated boxes, and 

thermoformed plastics design solutions. With an in-house die shop, Midlands 

Packaging creates state-of-the-art tooling for folding carton and corrugated 

production. And because their die shop is all in house, turn-around time is 

much quicker and more efficient. Midlands Packaging’s overall goal is to 

maintain their status as the quality leader in the packaging industry. They 

sincerely believe that excellent customer service support is a vital component 

of success and they are committed to satisfying their customers. 

Midtown Body & Paint  
 

Midtown Body & Paint specializes in auto body paint, collision, and 

framework repair. They take pride in their work and always provide high-

quality repairs and service that develops lasting relationships. Some say that 

they are the shop where "people wreck their cars just to see them!" On a 

serious note, Midtown Body & Paint is there from start to finish. Never been 

in an accident before? Have insurance questions? Midtown Body & Paint is 

there to help!  Their repair process is straightforward, thorough, and backed 

by friendly experts who will walk you through the entire process. Their 

specialties include collision repair, frame repair, full paint service, paintless 

dent repair, and glass replacement. Visit Midtown Body & Paint at 332 S 

Antelope Valley Pkwy in Lincoln. 

Mulligans http://mulligansgp.com/  
 

At Mulligans Grill & Pub and Outside Tropical Island, you can enjoy 

drinks and grill favorites inside or outside in an upbeat, comfortable 

setting. Relax outside in Mulligans Jamaican Tropical Island Area. 

Stop by for Late Night Drinks until 2:00 a.m. on Thursday through 

Saturday. Here is a great way to escape the Office for Lunch: 

Mulligans Grill & Pub is open every day at 11:00 AM. You can catch 

all your favorite teams on the numerous flat screen TVs inside AND 

outside, with special Major League Baseball, NFL Sunday Ticket, and 

ESPN Game Plan Packages. And reserve the Party Room for your 

after work get together or next celebration! Mulligans Grill & Pub hs 

been completely remodeled! They are conveniently located at the 

West end of the strip mall at 5500 Old Cheney Road in Lincoln.  

https://www.midlandspkg.com/
http://www.midtownbodyandpaint.com/
http://mulligansgp.com/
http://mulligansgp.com/


Parkway 66  
 
With over three decades of experience in the auto industry, the team at 
Parkway 66 Service can handle all your major and minor auto repair needs. 
They have been providing exceptional auto services throughout Lincoln for 
over three decades. From brake service to auto heating and air conditioner 
repair service, Parkway 66 has complete automotive services for any foreign 
or domestic vehicle. All repairs, maintenance and diagnostic services are 
performed by Parkway 66’s ASE - Certified Auto technicians, All auto repairs, 
maintenance, and diagnostic services are performed by our trained and 
experienced ASE-certified technicians. Your complete satisfaction is top 
priority, which is why Parkway 66 provides GUARANTEES on all workmanship 
and WARRANTIES on their auto repair services. Parkway 66 is open for your 
convenience until 8:00 PM from Monday to Saturday. All auto services are 
available 6 days a week. Give them a call today to schedule your service 
appointment. 

Press Box  
 

The Press Box opened November 2010, and is owned and managed by a 

Lincoln family. They take pride in being family-friendly and getting to know 

their customers while serving food and drinks that will satisfy your palate and 

your wallet. They have 20 HDTVs placed around the room so you can enjoy 

watching several sporting events at the same time. You can also have a good 

time playing pool, shuffleboard, golden tee, or Big Red Keno. The Press Box 

offers a wide variety of delicious dishes for lunch, dinner and Sunday 

breakfast. They appreciate their customers, and will work hard to make your 

visit memorable.  

Redshaw Paint and Supply   
 

Redshaw Paint and Supply was stablished in 1953, and Incorporated in 

Nebraska in 1995. The Company carries a complete line of automotive 

paint and body supplies specializing in Automotive, Commercial, 

Industrial, and Aviation Refinishing products from refinish industry 

leaders such as Axalta, Spies Hecker and Nason. Honesty, hard work, 

and superior products and service have been the driving force of 

Redshaw Paint Supply. Their primary goal is to provide customers with 

products and services that meet, and exceed expectations, distribute 

quality automotive, industrial, aviation and fleet finishes, and provide 

technical and paint and supply services that add value. 

https://www.parkway66lincoln.com/
https://www.pressboxlincoln.com/home
http://www.redshawpaint.com/


Restore-A-Muscle Car  
 

Restore a Muscle Car originated in 2005 as a shop that would bring back 
‘classic muscle’ but to a new level of restoration. They currently have a 
growing staff of over 15 full-time employees that work very hard each day on 
a variety of projects underway. Each member of the team has years of 
experience in their field which makes them more than qualified to handle the 
tasks they are faced with. Restore a Muscle Car works together with their 
customers to create an enjoyable and exciting restoration experience. Simply 
put, the company strives to be the very best at what they do! Their reputation 
over the years has proven itself time and time again. They have clients from 
every state in the nation, as well as Canada, and many other countries. They 
have several “repeat” customers bringing back their 2nd and even 3rd 
vehicles for restoration. They enjoy the process of taking a classic muscle car 
through all the necessary stages of restoration to bring it back to life, and 
keeping customers involved each step of the way is very important. The shop 
is available for tours during the week or on weekends by special appointment. 
Restore a Muscle Car loves and encourages customers to visit their shop and 
see their restoration process ‘live’. They are located only 15 minutes from the 
Lincoln Airport and about 45 minutes from the Omaha Airport. 

Rocket Car Wash   
 

Rocket Car Wash can save you time and money with their Unlimited Wash 

Club. Simply sign up for a monthly membership and whichever package you 

want and receive unlimited washes! Your credit card will be automatically 

charged each month unless you cancel. You can bypass the pay booth, and 

there is no commitment so you can cancel any time. Rocket Carwash has 

locations on O Street and 48th and Leighton in Lincoln, but your membership 

is good at Rocket Carwash locations nationwide.  

SCCA Nebraska Region https://nrscca.com/  
 

The Nebraska Region Sports Car Club of America (NRSCCA) is a group of sports 
car enthusiasts who are involved in Autocross/Solo, RallyCross, Road Rally, 
and Road Racing.  The group also works as Race Officials in hundreds of 
motorsports events each year. Founded in 1954, NRSCCA is Region Number 48 
of the Sports Car Club of America, Inc. SCCA currently has its headquarters in 
Topeka, Kansas. Headquartered in Omaha, the Nebraska Region extends across 
the state and also includes five counties in western Iowa. Nebraska Region is a 
part of the Midwest Division (MiDiv), which includes 14 other Regions. The 
Nebraska Region averages around 300 members. Membership, although 
encouraged, is NOT required in order to participate in NRSCCA events. The 
SCCA Nationals are held right here in Lincoln at Airpark on the West side of the 
Lincoln Airport in early September. It is a big deal for Lincoln, with over several 
thousand cars from all over the USA competing! 

https://rocketcarwash.com/
https://nrscca.com/
https://nrscca.com/
https://www.restoreamusclecar.com/


Stephenson Truck Repair https://www.stephensonrepair.com/  
 

Stephenson Truck Repair originally purchased a building 4201 Industrial 
Avenue in Lincoln. There wasn’t enough room for both the mechanical and 
body shops, so they built an additional building on the property to house the 
body shop. Dick and Vicki continue to work at Stephenson Truck Repair, and 
their two sons are also very actively involved in the business. Joel oversees 
the mechanical shop, as foreman and Adam manages the body shop, as 
foreman. Stephenson Truck Repair performs mechanical and body repair on 
all types of vehicles. They specialize in Truck (light, medium and heavy duty) 
and Motor Home (RV) repairs, but work on many other types of vehicles and 
equipment as well. The company is versatile and can do just about anything! 
They have a lot of fleet customers, as well as loyal motor home customers, 
who have been known to plan their trips to include a visit to their Lincoln 
shop. Stephenson Truck Repair is also a warranty service provider for many 
chassis companies as well as an exclusive regional distributor for several 
vehicle related products. They are a family-owned and operated company, 
serving Lincoln and the surrounding communities since 1966. Give 
Stephenson Truck Repair a try and you will be amazed at what they can do 
for you! 

Schmit Automotive   
 

Schmit Automotive Inc. is a full-service, family owned auto and light truck 

repair service center that was established in 1988 by Mark Schmit. They have 

been at their current location since 2005. They are conveniently located on 

right Highway 6 in Waverly, Nebraska. Schmit Automotive mechanics have 

over 50 years of combined experience. At Schmit Automotive, they use parts 

that are equal to or exceed the standards of those parts originally used by the 

manufacturer. 

Schmit Automotive will strive to make every vehicle in our area safe and 

reliable in an honest and timely manner. They look forward to working on 

your vehicle. 

Sherwin Williams https://www.sherwin-williams.com  
The Sherwin-Williams Company is a global leader in coatings, bringing color to 

the world for more than 150 years. The company delivers the best in paint and 

coatings products to the world. Every day, more than 60,000 employees provide 

the energy and experience to build a track record of success to innovate and 

grow in new and exciting ways. The company offers industry-leading innovation, 

value-added service and expertise, and differentiated distribution to their 

growing base of professional, industrial, commercial and consumer 

customers. Sherwin-Williams has one of the industry’s most recognized portfolios 

of branded and private-label products. Sherwin-Williams® branded products are 

sold exclusively through a chain of more than 4,438 company operated stores 

and facilities in the United States, Canada, the Caribbean and Latin America. 

The Sherwin-Williams Paint Stores in Lincoln have exceptional quality 

interior paint, exterior paint, paint equipment and paint supplies, concrete 

stain, and wood stain to bring your ideas to life. If you have painting 

Questions, you can get your answers quickly at any one of the three Lincoln 

stores. Sherwin-Williams products are also sold through leading mass 

merchandisers, home centers, independent paint dealers, hardware stores, 

automotive retailers, and industrial distributors across North America and in 

parts of Europe, China, Australia and New Zealand. They also supply a broad 

range of highly engineered solutions for the construction, industrial, packaging 

and transportation markets in more than 120 countries around the world. 

https://www.stephensonrepair.com/
https://www.stephensonrepair.com/
http://schmitauto.com/
https://www.sherwin-williams.com


S&J Fabrication (No Website)  

S&J Fabrication is our Prime Sponsor for 2021. The company works on all 

types of race cars, providing restoration, repair or a complete build - 

whatever you need! In addition, they creates and make Tee shirts and caps, 

and provide trophies for various car shows. If you need Tee shirts or 

trophies for your club or organization, Call Sean or Jim at (402) 890-0294.  

S&J Fabrication 

Spectrum Paints   
 
Spectrum Paint is the largest independent paint dealer in the nation with over 
80 paint stores in eight states. Established in 1986, growth over the past three 
decades is a testament to their commitment to be the leading supplier of 
architectural, commercial and industrial coatings. For over 30 years, Spectrum 
Paint has been providing professionals and homeowners with top quality 
products, competitive prices and the best possible service. They strive to offer 
the flexibility and response time of a small company and still offer customers a 
broader and more complete product offering than any “company” owned 
store or home center. Being independent means the freedom to bring the 
best product to a customer, regardless of who makes it. The company has had 
consistent growth over the past three decades, which is a testament to their 
commitment to be a leading supplier of architectural, commercial and 
industrial coatings. Spectrum Paint carries Benjamin Moore and PPG Paints in 
addition to Spec-Pro® and Spec-One® (their private label contractor and 
premium paint lines). They also distribute lacquers, stains and specialty 
coatings from other manufacturers in order to provide customers the 
broadest and most complete offering of paint and related products. Spectrum 
Paint’s independence allows them to create custom solutions and quick 
response times while providing best in class customer service. 

Star City Motor Sports https://starcitymotorsports.com/  
 

Visit Star City Motor Sports locally-owned, multi-line dealership in Lincoln and 

experience top-notch service, no matter what you are visiting for. Shop their 

expansive inventory of new and used Kawasaki, Can-Am, Polaris, Yamaha,  

Honda, Suzuki, SeaDoo, Mahindra and Triton products. Star City Motor Sports 

is your one-stop shop for every powersport need you may have, and that 

includes after-sale services, like vehicle repairs, parts, tires and more. Visit 

Star City Motor Sports for a first-class powersport-buying experience. They 

are conveniently located at 6600 N 27th St (27th & i-80) in Lincoln. 

https://spectrumpaint.com/
https://starcitymotorsports.com/
https://starcitymotorsports.com/Vehicle/Inventory?SortBy=0&SortOrder=0&pageSize=21&pageNum=1&SelectedMakeDivisions=Can-Am&RemoveAllFilters=false
https://starcitymotorsports.com/Vehicle/Inventory?SortBy=0&SortOrder=0&pageSize=21&pageNum=1&SelectedMakeDivisions=Honda&RemoveAllFilters=false
https://starcitymotorsports.com/Vehicle/Inventory?SortBy=0&SortOrder=0&pageSize=21&pageNum=1&RemoveAllFilters=false
https://starcitymotorsports.com/Vehicle/Inventory?SortBy=0&SortOrder=0&pageSize=21&pageNum=1&SelectedMakeDivisions=Honda&RemoveAllFilters=false
https://starcitymotorsports.com/Vehicle/Inventory?SortBy=0&SortOrder=0&pageSize=21&pageNum=1&RemoveAllFilters=false
https://starcitymotorsports.com/Parts-Department
https://starcitymotorsports.com/


Tan Aire Pumping, Sewer & Drain (No Website) 

Tan Aire Pumping, Sewer & Drain was founded in 2013 and is locally owned. 
The company specializes in Plumbing Drain & Waste Line Cleaning, Portable 
Toilet Rental. They provide Inspection, Cleaning and Repair Service  for 
Sewers, Drains, Tanning Salons, Septic Tanks, Portable Toilets, Backflow 
Preventers, Bathtubs, Conventional Electric Water Heaters, Conventional Gas 
Water Heaters, Frozen Pipes, Hydro Jetting, Lead Pipes, Plumbing Fixtures, 
Leak Detection, Re-Piping, Shower and Sinks, Tankless Electric and Gas Water 
Heaters, Toilets, Trenchless Underground Pipe Replacement, Walk-in 
Bathtubs, Water Heaters, Water Leak Detection, Water Lines and Mains, and 
Water Softeners, and Purification Systems.  

Tico’s   
 

Tico's Restaurant & Tequila Bar is located in downtown Lincoln since 1976, 
and have been serving Mexican food along with their famous margaritas to 
customers for over 40 years. Lincolnites keep coming back for consistently 
great menu favorites such as the Ticoritto, Chile Rellenos, and Chicken and 
Cream Cheese Enchiladas. Tico's is open for lunch, dinner or Sunday brunch! 
Tico's has Take Out and Catering options available to feed any size crowd. A 
carry out entrance is available for those looking to pick up dinner to-go. And 
don't forget about Happy Hour! Every weekday from 4pm to 7pm, Tico's has 
great drink specials and delicious seasoned chips and salsa! They welcome 
reservations of any size! The dining room has separated areas for 
accommodating many smaller groups with a moderate amount of privacy. For 
larger parties, ask about their Loft which features a large screen TV for 
enjoying sporting events with friends or hosting a business lunch. The Loft 
provides a great location to train staff or watch the Huskers, and buffet 
options are available.    

T.O. Hass Tire & Auto  
 
T.O. Haas Tire & Auto has dozens of locations, serving communities all over 
Nebraska including Lincoln, Omaha, Norfolk, Beatrice, Tecumseh, Fairbury, 
Aurora, Central City, St Paul, Lexington, North Platte, Ogallala, and Imperial. 
They also serve the Kansas area with stores in Junction City, Hutchinson, and 
Medicine Lodge. And, you can find them in Southeast Iowa in the city of 
Keokuk. T.O. Haas Tire sells Michelin, BF Goodrich, Uniroyal, Bridgestone, 
Firestone, Goodyear, Kumho, Nitto, Nexen, Hankook, Mickey Thompson, 
Timberland, Dick Cepek, General, Continental, Pro Meter, Trazano, Durun, 
and many other tire brands for cars, pickups, SUV’s, tractors, trailers, ATV’s, 
pivot irrigation systems and more. In addition to tires, wheels and batteries, 
T.O. Haas Tire & Auto performs many automotive services including oil 
changes, alignments, brakes, exhaust, shocks, struts, cooling systems, 
transmission fluid flush and more. They employ ASE-Certified Technicians to 
keep customer vehicles riding and running their best. 

https://www.ticosoflincoln.com/
https://www.tohaastire.com/


Tuffy Auto Service Centers  
  

Tuffy Tire & Auto Service Center Lincoln is a complete Automotive Repair and 
Tire Center, specializing in all auto repair and tire needs. Their certified 
technicians provide expert service in auto repair & service, brake repair & 
service, exhaust systems, transmission service, fluid service, steering and 
suspension issues, NEW tires and preventive auto maintenance. Tuffy Tire & 
Auto Service Center Lincoln services most makes and models, foreign and 
domestic, cars and light trucks. Conveniently located in Lincoln, they also have 
customers from nearby Hickman, Bennett, Crete, Seward, Milford and Wilber, 
in NE. You can trust their technicians with your next wheel alignment, tire 
rotation, oil change, engine repair, steering and suspension repairs, 
computerized diagnostics, lifetime warrantied brakes, shocks, and exhaust. 
They will even recycle your used oil! On their website you will find great 
coupon specials which update each quarter. And don't forget to sign up for 
their monthly eSpecial offers, with exclusive auto repair deals for customers 
with email. To get a quote for auto service needs, simply fill out the Request a 
Quote form and one of their service advisors will get back to you within 24 
hours. Tuffy Tire & Auto Service Center Lincoln looks forward to servicing 
your car or truck! You can follow them on Facebook at ‘Tuffy Auto Service 
Center.’ Tuffy Tire & Auto Service Center Lincoln is proud of their Better 
Business Bureau A+ rating. 

Ultimate Diesel Performance (No Website) 

 
Ultimate Diesel Performance, operates an Automotive Repair Shop, and is 
located at 6520 North 56th Street in Lincoln, since 2016. They specialize in all 
types olf diesel engines, including Cummins, and GM Duramax. They have 
access to Edge, Bullydog, Sct, Efi, Ez Lynk, TS, Airdog, Fass, Fuel Lab, Mbrp, 
Magnaflow, AFE, S&B, Isspro, Autometer, Sota, and many other diesel truck 
parts. Ultimate Diesel Performance can get almost any truck accessory that is 
on the market, like Tonneau covers, grill guards, lifts, wheels, hitches, floor 
mats, bug guards, mud flaps, gauges, steps, tuners, exhaust, light bars and 
more. They have training and diagnostic equipment, to repair diesel pickups 
right, the first time, including special scan tools and diagnostic equipment for 
Ford, Dodge, Chevy, Cummins and Bosch Diesels. Trained technicians can 

Wolfgang Auto Service, LLC (No Website) 

Wolfgang Auto Service is an auto repair service, located at 3177 South Street 

in Lincoln. They specialize in providing auto services including brakes, heating 

and air conditioner, for all kinds of automotive vehicles. Repairs, maintenance 

and diagnostic services are performed by Wolfgang Auto Service trained 

technicians with years of experience. Your complete satisfaction is a priority, 

and is why Wolfgang Auto Service guarantees workmanship on their auto 

repair services.  

https://www.tuffylincoln.com/

