
COLEMANVILLE UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 

“To Love Others as God Loves Us” 

Rev. Manuel P. Cruz, Jr. 

Ellen Peifer, Hymn Leader 

Jill Kelley, Pianist  

The 8:40 a.m. service order is as follows: 

Announcements                                                            Eric Peifer            

Prelude                               “King of Kings”                        WT 

Bringing in the Light of Christ                                              

+Choral Introit           “Change My Heart, O God” 

Welcome                                                                    Pastor Manny 

Opening Prayer                                           Pastor Manny 

+Hymn                  “Come, Christians, Join to Sing”          p.158 

The Passing of the Peace  

Special Music                  “Awesome God”                         WT 

+Hymn                  “Break Thou the Bread of Life”            p.599  

Morning Prayer:                                          Pastor Manny                        
     Pastoral Prayer  
     Lord’s Prayer  
Scripture Reading          John 6:1-21 (pg.90)             Eric Peifer 

Message                  “Miracles for the Good Life"       

+Offering: Doxology                                                   Pastor Manny                                               
                 Prayer                                                                  
+Closing Hymn       “Take My Life, and Let It Be”            p.399 
+Benediction                                                              Pastor Manny     
+Choral Blessing       “The Trees of the Field” 

+Follow the Light of Christ                                                  
+Postlude          

(+) Stand or remain seated if it helps you to worship better. 

“Our Worship Together Has Ended/The Service Begins” 

Offering plates are in the rear of the sanctuary to receive our gifts, 
tithes, and offerings. 

Greeters: Arlene Warfel & Gwen Caller 

Scripture for next week: John 6:24-35   

Please inform Pastor Manny of anyone needing prayer, visitation, or 
recognition. His phone number is 1(908)590-3288.  Pastor Manny will 

be in the office on Tuesdays from 9:30 am until 2:30 pm. Pastor 
Manny’s e-mail address is manpcruz@yahoo.com 

Mission and Ministry 

Assistance Needed: If you have any interest in assisting in the 
following positions during the Sunday worship service, please contact 
the person in parentheses:  acolyte (Doug Rankin); assisting with 
communion during the service, greeters, announcements, and scripture 
readers (Jill Kelley); computer (Donna Eshleman) and sound system 
(Steve Peifer).   

175th Anniversary - Anniversary memorabilia items and apparel are 
available to order now.  Items are on display in the church narthex.  
Please take time to review the selection, if interested. 

New Contact person for UWF Card Ministry: Anyone in need of a card 
contact Jill Kellenberger at (717)847-2147. 

July 29th – August 9th Rawlinsville Camp Meeting - You’re welcome to 
come visit us! Evangelistic services are held in the Tabernacle at 7:30 
p.m. Camp Evangelists will be Rev. Nick Spurgeon July 29 – Aug. 4 and 
Rev. Tim Valentino Aug. 5 – 10 

For more information on Rawlinsville Camp Meeting go to 
www.rawlinsvillecamp.com 

Wedding Photos – If you have wedding photos of yourself or other 
family members to share for the 175th anniversary, please have it turned 
in to Sue Rineer by September 1st. Call Sue at (717)872-4334 if you 
have any questions. 

There will be an orange box in the Narthex for you to drop your 175th 
response cards in. They are due by October 1st. 

The Penny Jar is located on the table in the Narthex. Funds collected 
through September will go to the Conestoga Food Bank. 

Sunday School - All Sunday School classes will resume on Sept. 8. 

Special Music -- Looking for soloists, duets, trios, groups, etc, for 
Special Music for the Sunday worship service from now through 
September 8th.  Please see or contact Jill Kelley (717-872-2552) or 
Ellen Peifer (717-284-4857).  Thank you!  



Scripture readers – Please sign up in the narthex for scripture/ 
announcement readers, greeters, or communion helpers in upcoming 
worship services. Thank you. 

August 17th - 8 am Cantaloupe Café - Continental breakfast will be 
provided. 

August 18th 2 - 4 pm.  Come join us at Colemanville for the Blessing of 
the Backpacks. Bring your backpack as each child will take home some 
school supplies and have it blessed by Pastor Manny.  We will also have 
fun games and a -Make Your Own- Ice Cream Sundae bar.  

We will be using the local schools' recommended supply lists. 
Please let us know how many will be attending and the grade levels of 
the children by calling the church office at (717)872-7951 or email at 
colemanvilleumc@outlook.com Hope to see you then! 

Meetings 

July 30th 6:30 pm – Worship Committee Meeting 

August 13th 6:30 pm – Trustee Meeting 

August 20th 4 pm – Outreach Meeting 

August 20th 6:30 pm – Church Council Meeting 

Fundraisers 

Community 

Conestoga Food Bank – Items needed:  Instant Oatmeal, Syrup, 
Flavored Rice, Flavored Noodles, Flavored Potatoes, Canned Potatoes, 
Hearty/Creamed Soups, Ravioli, Canned Chicken, Canned Fruit (Mixed, 
Peaches, Pears), Jell-O, Pudding, Brownie Mix, Cookie Mix, Canned 
Cream Corn, Canned Mixed Vegetables, NO GREEN BEANS!! Please 
no expired items, they cannot be accepted. 

Millersville Area Meals On Wheels is looking for someone to deliver 
meals in the southern end on Fridays. There are 5 stops in the 
Pequea/Holtwood area.  The route takes approximately 45 minutes and 
you would be picking up the meals at Marticville Middle School at 11:00 
AM. If interested please call Meals On Wheels at 717-872-2415 or email 
for information to office@mamow.org 
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