
Vineyards

Winemaking

Food Pairing

100% chardonnay from cool
climate vineyards in the Edna
Valley of San Luis Obispo
County

20% of the wine was barrel
fermented in neutral oak barrels
and then blended with
Chardonnay that was
fermented in temperature
controlled stainless steel tanks

Great with seared scallops or
grilled fish

Vineyards

Winemaking

Food Pairing

96% Cabernet Sauvignon, 2%
Malbec, 2% Petite Verdot, all
from the Estrella District of Paso
Robles

Cold soaked, fermented, and
punched down in open top bins
and then racked to American
oak barrels for 10 months

Anything with grill marks like
steaks and burgers 

Veteran Owned/ Veteran Made
John Michael Wines

CABERNET SAUVIGNON

CHARDONNAY

VINEYARDSQUADRON.COM

Navy Veterans John Burke &
Leon Tackitt produce wines
out of Paso Robles, California.
Two Vessels Wines are a
tribute to John’s shipmates
aboard USS Tattnall DDG-19
and USS Wadsworth FFG-9


